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. Nivitha (LKK Auto)

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan®@Ikkauto.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 17 April 2019 7:17 PM

To: assignments

Cc: Admin A; Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

Subject: FW: Our Ref: YP 7085D (wk) PRE-REPAIR SURVEY NOTICE ACCIDENT INVOLVING
YP 7085D & XD 8573E ALONG BARTLEY ROAD ON 10 APRIL 2019 *** |kk ref:
CC4/ASM19006568/eb3

Attachments: 20190416174513065 pdf

URGENT

Hi Nivitha

TP change wksp. ‘(

Please arrange PRI,

Thank you.

Best Regards,
Mei Kwan | Admin
LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com | fax: 67414108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #¥02-25 | S(408953)

From: Weng Kit <wengkit@chiaarul.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 16 April, 2019 5:47 PM

To: 5G AXA Insurance SM AXA SGP - Motor Survey <motor.survey@axa.com.sg>

Cc: 'Jerone' <jerone@chiaarul.com>

Subject: Our Ref: YP 7085D (wk) PRE-REPAIR SURVEY NOTICE ACCIDENT INVOLVING YP 7085D & XD 8573F ALONG
BARTLEY ROAD ON 10 APRIL 2019

Dear Sirs,

We refer to the above matter.

Altached is a copy of our pre-repair survey notice dated 16 April 2019 for your attention.
Best Regards,

Weng Kit (Mr.)

Paralegal

M/s Chia S Arul LLC

151 Chin Swee Road

#03-09 Manhattan House

Singapore 169876

Tel: (65) 6733 4647 Fax: (65) 6733 8183

This e-mail is from M/s Chia S Arul LLC, a firm of Advocates and Solicitors in Singapore, and is intended
solely for the named addressee. It contains confidential and /or legally privileged information. If the e-mail
has reached you in error, please delete the e-mail immediately and inform us of the error. You may contact
us at info@chiaarul.com. Internet communications cannot be guaranteed to be secured or error-free as
infermation could be intercepted, corrupted, lost, arrive late or contain viruses. The sender therefore does

1



not accept liability for any errors or omissions in the context of this message which arise as a result of
. Internet transmission.



CHIA § ARUL LLC

ADVOCATES & SOLICITORS
UEN 201330708H

ARULCHELYAN 5 « A, RAYIDASS

OueRef:  YP 7085D (wk)

YourRef 1 Top be advised

16 April 2019 .
AXA Insurance Singapore Pte Ltd BY EMAIL ONLY
Dear Sirs,

RE: PROPERTY DAMAGE CLAIM
CLAIMANT __ :  SUNNY RECOVERY PTE LTD
ACCIDENT INVOLVING YP 7085D & XD 8573E ALONG BARTLEY ROAD ON
10 APRIL 2019

PRE-REPAIR SURVEY NOTICE

1. We act for Sunny Recovery Pte Lid, the owner of motor vehicle no. YP 7085D
which was involved in the aforesaid accident.

2 We hereby in compliance with the Pre-Action Protocol for Non-Injury Motor
Accident Claims, Appendix C of the State Courls Practice Directions Amendment
No. 1 of 2016 ("the NIMA Protocol”) give you NOTICE that we are claiming
against your insured motor vehicle no. XD 8573E for damages, costs and
disbursements as a result of your insured driver's negligence.

3. Please let us know if you wish to conduct a pre-repair survey on our client's motor
vehicle at;
Workshop | Ace Autolution
Address | 13 Kaki Bukit Road 4 #03 — 29 Bartley Biz Centre

Singapore 417807

| Contact Person | Ms. Anna / Ms. Shu Wen (6844 1184)

4. Pursuant to paragraph 2.3 of the NIMA Protocol, in the event we do not receive
your response within next two (2) working days (excluding any Saturday,
Sunday or public holiday), our client will instruct the workshop to commence

appraisal an to the damaged motor vehicle without further reference to

S
v

M EWELE ROADL « #03-009

N HOUSE » SINGATORE 169876

¢ (65) 6733 BI18Y (not for Service of Court documents)
EMAIL ¢ info@chinarul.com

TEL



> Back to OneMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Owner 1D Type: Company
Owner ID: 170G
R R e L s e s
Wehicle Mo.: YP70BSD
Wehicle to be Exported: Yes
Intended Deregistration Date: 18 Apr 20179
Wehicle Make: ISUZU
Vehicle Model: MHRBSAUE4A R1
Primary Colour; Blue
Manufacturing Year: 2017
Engine Mo.: 4)11382211
Chassis No.: JAANHRBSEHT 100273
Maximum Power Output: .
Open Market Value: $28,822.00
Original Registration Date: 28 Jul 2017
First Registration Date: 28 Jul 2017
Transfer Count: 1
Actual ARF Paid: $1.442.00
AT R N AR AT £ D oS S L e A S R = AR I R bk Sl A AP AT e Secls |
PARF Eligibility: Mo
PARF Eligibility Expiry Date: -
PARF Rebate Amount: $0.00
S TIN5 (02 T P DT P ST e = S T s < O AN 5 SO 5 ST MR T R e Wt |
COE Expiry Date: 27 Jul 2027
COE Category: C - Goods Vehicle & Bus
COE Period(Years): 10
POP Paid: $17.9463.00
COE Rebate Amount: $14.370.00
Total Rebate Amount: $14,370.00

The information contained herein is correct as at 18 Apr 2019

OK



51 UBTAYE 1, #01-25 PAYA UBLINDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : (065) 62563561 FAX : (065) 62564315

11 July, 2019

CHSE& CPTELTD

55 SERANGOON NORTH AVENUE 4
#08-08

SINGAPORE 555859

Dear Sir/f Mdm

OUR REF : CCA/ASMI19006569/Awb3 // S9MOLIWS

YOUR REF : XD 8573E

ACCIDENT INVOLVING XD 8573E / YP T085D AND OTHERS ALONG/AT BARTLEY
ROAD ON 10/04/2019

We refer 1o the above subject matter. We write to inform you that we are the loss adjuster appointed
by your motor insurer, AXA Insurance Pte Ltd to deal with the third party claim against your policy.

We have received a third party claim(s) from ACE AUTOLUTION PTE LTD acting on behalf of the
owner of YP 70850 against your motor insurance policy.

Pursuant to the above said accident wherein you and/or your authorized driver had amongst other
information given us your version of how the accident had occurred, we as the appointed agent of
your insurers shall proceed to negotiate for an amicable settlement with third party claimant.

Please be informed that your No Claim Discount (NCD) may be affected as a result of the claim
against your policy.

As Insurers, they shall proceed to deal with the claim(s) subject to the merits of the case and
according to the rights afforded under the policy. Should you not be seeking the protection of your
policy and seek to take conduct of third party claim(s) arising from this incident, at your own cost and
defence, please reply to us within 7 days from the date of this letter. You intent must be formally
expressed to AXA and acknowledged by AXA.

Your full co-operation in the handling of the claim is required and kindly submit the following to
vivianlau@lkkauto.com within 7 days from the date of this letter if not provided at our reporting

centre. The list below is not all inclusive and further document may be required:

= Police report, Police Investigation result, appeal against the Traffic Police offence and status
(if any)

Driver's driving license or foreign driving license (if any)

Coloured photographs of accident scene (if any)

Coloured photographs of damage to all vehicles involved (If any)

Copy of the letter of authorization

Video footage of accident (if any)

Statement and/or police report from independent witness{es) (if any)

If you or your passenger(s) are filing a claim against any of the involved Third Party(s), you
are to keep us informed of your legal representative(s) and the status of the claim.



To protect your interest(s) in the handling of this claim, please do not discuss liability with any of the
Third Party(s) and/or their legal representatives, or make any compromise or settlement without our
prior knowledge and consent. If you receive any correspondence or legal document such as a Writ of
Summaons in connection with this accident, please forward it to us immediately. You may email it to
cst@axa.com.sg or deliver it by hand to AXA Customer Care Centre.

This letter should not be regarded as a waiver by AXA of their rights to repudiate any claim because
of any breach of policy terms and conditions you and/or your authorised driver may have committed,

In the event of receiving and handling of any third party injury claim(s), we shall keep you informed
of the final indemnity upon conclusion of the matter(s).

If you need any clarification, please do not hesitate to contact as at Ms Vivian Lau
(LKK Handler) 6841 B625 or vivianlau@lkkauto.com Please quote our claim reference when you
contact us that we can assist you more effectively.

Yours sincerely,

Vi Lau
Case Handler
DID: 6841 8625
FAX: 6741 4108

Email: vivianlau@ kkaulo.com

cc AXA INSURANCE PTE LTD
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933

TEL: B256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. Moc 189607196R GST Reg. Mo, 19-9807188-R Page No.:1 of 1

PRE-REPAIR INSPECTION REPORT

AXA INSURANCE PTE LTD

Ref: CEIASMI9006568/Apb3s2

8 SHENTON WAY #24-01 AXA TOWERSINGAPORE Date:  05-11-2019 I‘Imlmlu""H MII
068811
ATTN: XINYOU Code: ASM
1. Policy Particulars :- (THIRD PARTY CLAIM)
Insured Veh. XD BETIE Veh. Inspected YP 70850
Policy No. CHNBase1s Coverage (3) 0.00
Claim No. SIMO1IWS Excess (§) 0.00
Assign From KINYOU Assign Date 23042019
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model 1SUZU NHRES c.C 2999
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. xm7
Chassis No. JAANHRBSEHTI00273 Colour GREEN
Odometer BO9E1 KM Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification MIL
General GOOD
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre [195R15 OHTSU & mm
L/H Front Tyre |195R15 OHTSU & mm
R/H Rear Tyre |[195R15 OHTSU & mm
L/H Rear Tyre |195R15 OHTSU & mm
4. Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE FRONT AND REAR PORTION. =111 1]
3. General Information
Accident Date  10/04/2019 Inspect Date [ Time 18042019 (12:14 PM )
Survey held at ACE AUTOLUTION PTE LTD
13 KAKI BUKIT ROAD 4 #03-20 BARTLEY BIZ CENTRE SINGAPORE 417807
5a. Remarks
A) THE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A "WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
B) THE REPAIR ESTIMATE WAS NOT PRESENTED AT THE TIME OF INSPECTION.
THE REPAIRER WAS TOLD TO PREPARE THE ESTIMATE.
C) ENCLOSED PLEASE FIND DAMAGED VEHICLE PHOTOGRAPHS,
D}yTHE ESTIMATED REPAIR COST OF THE DAMAGED WEHICLE IS IN THE REGION OF $32 000-535,000
5h. Estimate Days of Repair

ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR: 21 Working Days

Report Ref Mo, CS3/ASM19006565/Apb3s2

Inspected By

SR

ADRIAN LING WAI PING

B.Eng AMSOE AMIRTE AMSAE-A M. MATAI

Licensed Appraiser

{

K.K.LAU CPT{RET)

REGD Auto Consultant-SAE, Licensed Appraiser

DISCLAIMER OF LIABILITY TD THIRD PARTIES:- This Report i made solely for the use and berefit of the Client named on the front page of this Report.
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BEng(Hons),B.Bus, MBA PEng, PE, MinstAEA MASME MIRTE



