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Your ref: To Be Advised
Our ref: CCHEQN 9006560/ Keb3 Dane: 08.05.2019

The Motor Claims Department
M/s EQ INSURANCE COMPANY LTD

Dear SirMadam,
PRELIMINARY ADVICE OF VEHICLE NO, SGGAYSH
We refer to the above malter.

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the wbove mentioned vehicle on 06052019

at the premses of M/s _Lai Huat ( Meng Kee) Motor Pre Ltd and have the following to repon:-
Waorkshop Estimate Amount : 55 4.013.00

Revised Estimate Amount ] 3,733.00

“Check” ltems Amount : 5% -

Marker Value : 5% -

LTA Reimbursement Valige 1 8% -

Nett Vilue (5% -

Deseription of Damage:

-
The vehicle sustained damages at the - E = j |
/5 Body e —

o —

Comments/Present Status:
Daimages Consistenl
Estimated normal period for repairs: 4 days

Yours faithfully,

KENNETH KONG
Licensed Appraiser
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" Catherine Chung (LKK Auto)

From: Janet Tan <janettan@eqinsurance.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, 12 April, 2019 1:43 PM

To: assignments

Cc "Admin A’

Subject: FW: olUR REF: DM19HO01015/)T:Request for Survey - Your Ref: SFW 8999Z / Our
Ref: SGG 295X (Date of Accident: 06.04.2019)

Attachments: 12042019114954 pdf, SAS2581281 pdf

Dear all,

Please attend to the PRS. Preen - jﬂm)

Direct settle if possible upon liability clearance. Titve 1_5‘!41).“-.

Regards, V., UL

Janet Tan E - ‘/

Senior Executive | Claims

egnsurance

Lrt'l— L (.-}ir g .f..l .r__.\-_J,

EQ Insurance Company Limited

5 Maxwell Road #17-00 Tower Block MND Complex Singapore 069110
did 65 6496 9032 | tel 65 6223 9433 ext 032 | fax 65 6223 4190
Wiww.eginsurance.com.sg

* & Member of Cityine (ﬁ__h_

Privileged/Confidential information may be contained in this message. If you are not the intended recipient, please notify t}

From: Jenny Lim [mailto:jenny.lim@laihuat.com.sg)

Sent: Friday, April 12, 2015 1:36 PM

To: Janet Tan <janet.tan@eqinsurance.com.sg>

Subject: RE: oUR REF: DM19HO01015/JT:Request for Survey - Your Ref: SFW 89992 / Our Ref: SGG 295X (Date of
Accident: 06.04.2019)

Dear Janst

Flease arrange LKK 1o survey.
Thank you.

Kind regards.

Jenny Lim

for LAl HUAT (MENG KEE) MOTOR PTE LTD
160 Sin Ming Drive

#04-01, #04-02 & #07-03

Sin Ming Autocity

Singapore 575722

Tel: 64538110



Fax: 64598267

From: Janet Tan [mailto:janet.tan@eqinsurance.com.sg]

Sent: Friday, 12 April, 2019 1:12 PM

To: Jenny Lim

Subject: oUR REF: DM19HO01015/JT:Request for Survey - Your Ref: SFW 89992 / Our Ref: SGG 295X (Date of
Accident: 06.04.2019)

Without Prejudice
Save As To Costs

Dear Jenny

For pre repair survey request, please email to egiprs@eaqinsurance.com.sg

We shall be appointing our surveyor to attend to the pre-repair survey of your client’s vehicle.

Below is a list of motor surveyors in our panel. Please revert within 2 working days if you agree or have any
objections to the appointment of any of the motor surveyors. If we do not hear from you, you are deemed to have
agreed to the appointment of any of the motor surveyors listed by us. Alternatively, please specify one or more of
our proposed mator surveyors to the said assignment.

1) AJAX Inspection Services Pte Ltd 2) Automobile Inspection Services Pte Ltd
Tel: 6255 D808 Tel: 6286 D155
Fax: BB49 9155 Fax: 6284 1539

Contact Person: Sophia

3) LBS Automotive Appraisal Pte Ltd 4) Priority Services
L.B.S. Auto Consultants Pte Ltd Tel: 62934822
Tel: 62B1 6690 / 62B32866 Fax: 62963283
Fax: 6281 8748 Contact Person: Sharon

Contact Person: Amy/ Grace

5) RT Appraisal Pte Ltd 6) LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Tel: 67486076 Tel: 6256-3561
Fax: 67480361 Fax: 6741-4108

Contact Person: Elson/Elgene

7) Kelvin Automotive Appraising Services 8) Automotive Appraiser & Surveying
Tel: 81825263 Services
Fax: 67461148 Tel: 96623655
Contact Person: Kelvin Fax: 67655662

Contact Person: Mr Chee

9) JP Knights Pte Ltd 10) Appraisals Associates Pte Ltd
Tel: 83450068 Tel : 67472822
Fax: 63445328 Fax: 67470070

11) Infiniti Appraisal Service
Tel : 96684818/90099001




| Fax: 64587432 | |

If you object to all the motor surveyors as proposed by us, please provide a list of at least 10 motor surveyors whom
you consider as suitable to appoint for our consideration, We shall revert to you within 2 working days.

Meanwhile, we reserve our rights on Post-Repair Inspection, kindly contact us or our appointed surveyor before you
return your client's vehicle to him/her.

Regards,

Janet Tan
Senior Executive | Claims

eéinsuronce

L'\-t- (e (;"‘-—1 --Frt-'r”ﬂ‘r

EQ Insurance Company Limited
5 Maxwell Road #17-00 Tower Block MND Complex Singapore 069110
did 65 6496 9032 | tel 65 6223 9433 ext 032 | fax 65 6223 4190

www.eginsurance.com.sg

."A.l.‘.--r-lr- of Citvytate @_'—"__

Privileged/Confidentiol information may be contained in this message. If you are not the intended recipient, please notify t!

From: Jenny Lim [mailto:jenny.lim@laihuat.com.sg]

Sent: Friday, April 12, 2019 11:55 AM

To: EQI PRS <EQIPRS in nce., SE>

Subject: Request for Survey - Your Ref: SFW B995Z / Our Ref: SGG 295X (Date of Accident: 06.04.2019)

Dear Sir

We refer to the above matter.

Please can you arrange to survey our client's vehicle no. SGG 295X7
Supporting documents are enclosed for your reference

Thank you.

Kind regards.

Jenny Lim

for LAl HUAT (MENG KEE) MOTOR PTELTD
160 Sin Ming Drive

#04-01, #04-02 & #07-03

Sin Ming Autocity

Singapore 575722

Tel: 64538110

Fax: 64596267



Asher Snﬂ (LKKAuto) o ——————————————

From: Janet Tan <janet.tan@eginsurance.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 2 May 2019 9:16 AM

To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

Ce: Shu Pei (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: oUR REF: DM19HO01015/IT:Request for Survey - Your Ref: SFW 8999Z / Our Ref:
SGG 295X (Date of Accident 06.04.2019)

Follow Up Flag: Follow up

Flag Status: Completed

Dear Asher

Please proceed to reject claim based on your view.

Regards,

lanet Tan
Senior Executive | Claims

eéjnsuronc

LA A T“-ll'l-{‘
[

EQ Insurance Company Limited
5 Maxwel| Road #17-00 Tower Block MND Complex Singapore 069110
did 65 6496 9032 | tel 65 6223 9433 ext 032 | fax 65 6223 4190

www. eginsurance.com.sg

o>
* s Alpesingr of € oy tame

Privileged/Confidential information moy be contained in this message. |f you are not the intended recipient, please notify the sem

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) [mailto:AsherSng@Ikkauto,com)

Sent: Thursday, May 2, 2019 9:11 AM

To: lanet Tan <janet.tan@eqinsurance.com.sg>; loel Goh <joel goh@eqinsurance.com.sg>

Cc: Shu Pel (LKKAuto) <shupei@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Re: oUR REF: DM19HO01015/IT:Request for Suryey - Your Ref: SFW 89997 [/ Our Ref: SGG 295X (Date of
Accident: 06.04.2019)

Hi Janet,
We refer to the email below.

Please confirm llability is down on third party or insured, process direct settlement or reject third party claim.



Based on the video footage it clearly show that insured is making a left turn within its own lane, third party overtake the
parked vehicle against the traffic flow towards the the junction should be extra caution.

In view of about we are of the opinion that the liability is not in third party favor.
We seek your approval to reject third party claim.

Kindly let us have your approval / Instruction If any..

10. | {b) NeW | Vehicle X — Tuming into Main
) Road 100% | 0%
Vehicle Y - Tumning into Minor
Road
‘\,‘ ( Reason: Vehicle from minor
road should exercise greater
i s

Thank You.

Beit Regarh

Asher Sng | Cose Handles

LEK Avto Comuttants Phe Lid

chone: 48414051 | emoil gshenng@lkkguto com | hax 4741-2108
Bk 51, Paye Ut industrial Pork, Ubs Averue |, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Shu Pei [LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, April 30, 2019 5:09 PM

To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

Subject: FW: oUR REF: DM19H001015/1T:Request for Survey - Your Ref: SFW 89992 / Our Ref: SGG 295X (Date of
Accident: 06.04.2019)

Best Regards,
Shu Pei| Admin
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6366-0055 | emall: shupel@|kkauto com | faxc 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubl industrial Park, Ubl Avenue 1, #02.25 | 5408533)

From: Janet Tan <janet.tan@eginsurance.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, 29 April 2019 1:31 PM

To: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: oUR REF: DM19HO01015/JT:Request for Survey - Your Ref: SFW 89992 / Our Ref: GG 295X (Date of
Accident: 06.04.2019)



Dear all,

Attach video footage from third party,
Liabllity s down on third party.

Please proceed with direct settiement.

Regards,

Janet Tan
Senlor Executive | Claims

ec'.insurance

L N :-r*t e q:-l\.ﬂpdr

EQ Insurance Company Limited

5 Maxwell Road #17-00 Tower Block MND Complex Singapore 069110
did 65 6496 9032 | tel 65 6223 9433 ext 032 | fax 65 6223 4190
wiww.eqinsurance. com.sg

J‘Awrﬂ'[ﬂ"“l“ @_).

Privileged/Confidential information may be contained in this message. If you are not the intended recipient, please notify the seni

From: Janet Tan
Sent: Friday, April 12, 2019 1:43 PM
To: assignments <assignments@|kkauto com>

Cc: 'Admin A' <admin-a@|kkauto.com>
Subject: FW: oUR REF: DM19HO01015/1T:Request for Survey - Your Ref: SFW B999Z / Qur Ref: 5GG 295X (Date of
Accident: 06.04.2019)

Dear all,

Please attend to the PRS.
Direct settle if possible upon liability clearance.

Regards,

Janet Tan
Senior Executive | Claims

egnsurance

b TR i?'""_" Traed

EQ Insurance Company Limited
5 Maxwell Road #17-00 Tower Block MND Complex Singapore 069110

k|



did 65 5496 9032 | tel 65 6223 9433 ext 032 | fax 65 6223 4190
WWW. eQinsurance.com.sg.

L
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Privileged/Confidential information may be contained in this message. If you are not the intended recipient, please notify the sen

From: lenny Lim [mailte:jenny.li laihuat.co

Sent: Friday, April 12, 2015 1:36 PM

To: Janet Tan <janet.tan@eqinsurance.com.sg>

Subject: AE: oUR REF: DM19H0O01015/IT:Request for Survey - Your Ref: SFW 89992 / Our Ref: SGG 295X [Date of
Accident: 06.04.2019)

Dear Janet

Please arrange LKK lo survey.
Thank you.

Kind regards,

Jenny Lim

for LAl HUAT (MENG KEE) MOTOR PTE LTD
160 Sin Ming Drive

#04-01, #04-02 & #07-03

Sin Ming Autocity

Singapore 575722

Tel: 64538110

Fax: 64596267

From: Janet Tan [mailto:: Teq)

Sent: Friday, 12 April, 2019 1 12 PM

To: Jenny Lim

Subject: oUR REF: DM19HOD1015/1T:Request for Survey - Your Ref: SFW 89997 / Our Ref: SGG 295X (Date of
Accident: 06.04,2019)

Without Prejudice
Save As To Costs

Dear Jenny

For pre repair survey request, please email to egiprs{@eginsurance.com.sg

We shall be appointing our surveyor to attend to the pre-repair survey of your client’s vehicle.

Below is a list of motor surveyors in our panel. Please revert within 2 working davs if you agree or have any
objections to the appointment of any of the motor surveyors. If we do not hear from you, you are deemed to

have agreed to the appointment of any of the motor surveyors listed by us, Alternatively, please specify one or
more of our proposed motor surveyors to the said assignment.

1) AJAX Inspection Services Pte Ltd 2] Automobile Inspection Services Pte Ltd
Tel: 6255 0808 Tel: 6286 0155




Fax: 68499155 Fax: 6284 1539
Contact Person: Sophia

3) LBS Automotive Appraisal Pte Ltd 4) Priority Services

Tel: 52934822

L.B.S. Auto Consultants Pte Ltd Fax: 62963283

Contact Person: Sharon
Tel: 6281 6690 / 62832866

Fax: 6281 B748

Contact Person: Amy/ Grace

5) RT Appraisal Pte Ltd 6) LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Tel: 6256-3561
Tel: 67486076 Fax: 6741-4108

Fax: 67480361

Contact Person: Elson/Elgene

7) Kelvin Automotive Appraising Services 8) Automotive Appraiser & Surveying
Tel: 81825263 Services
Fax: 67461148 Tel: 96623655
Contact Person: Kelvin Fax: 67655662

Contact Person: Mr Chee

9} P Knights Pte Ltd 10) Appraisals Associates Pte Ltd
Tel: 63450068 Tel : 67472822
Fax: 63445328 Fax: 67470070

11) Infiniti Appraisal Service

Tel : 96684818/90095001
Fax 64587432

If you object to all the motor surveyors as proposed by us, please provide a list of at least 10 motor surveyors
whom you consider as suitable to appoint for our consideration. We shall revert to you within 2 working days.

Meanwhile, we reserve our rights on Post-Repair Inspection, kindly contact us or our appointed surveyor before you
return your client's vehicle to him/her.

Regards,



Janet Tan
Senior Executive | Claims

eqnsurance

" 4-?-"—

EQ Insurance Company Limited
5 Maxwell Road #17-00 Tower Block MND Complex Singapore 069110
did 65 6496 9032 | tel 656223 9433 ext 032 | fax 656223 4190

WWW eqinsurance.com.sg.

‘l.i-wdlluuw @———}‘

Privileged/Confidential information may be contained in this message. if you are not the intended reciplent, please notify the sem

From: Jenny Lim [mailto:jenny.lim@laihuat.com.sg)
Sent: Friday, April 12, 2019 11:55 AM
To: EQI PRS <EQIPRS insurance. >

Subject: Request for Survey - Your Ref: SFW B999Z / Our Ref: 5GG 295X (Date of Accident: 06.04.2019)

Dear Sir

We rafer to the above matter.

Flease can you arrange to survey our client’s vehicle no. SGG 295X7
Supporting documents are enclosed for your reference.

Thank you.

Kind regards.

Jenny Lim

for LAl HUAT (MENG KEE) MOTOR PTELTD
160 Sin Ming Drive

#04-01, #04-02 & #07-03

Sin Ming Autocity

Singapore 575722

Tel: 4538110

Fax: 64506267



Asher Snﬂ (LHKAutn!

From: Asher 5ng (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 10 May 2019 1:00 PM
To: Jenny Lim

Subject: RE: Video Footage - SGG 295X
Attachments: Ol SKETCH PLAN.pdf

Your Ref: SGG 295X
Our Ref: CC4/EQI19006560/Keb3

WITHOUT PREJUDICE”
SAVEAS TO COSTS

Hi Sir/Mdm,

We refer to the above matter.

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SGG 295X AND SFW 8999Z ON 06/04/2019

We attached here with a copy of our insured's accident statement for your easy reference,

Our principal has reiterated that the accident was caused due to the entire negligence of your client overtake the parked
vehicle against the traffic flow to exit the minor road collided with our insured making a left turn within its own lane.

We are of the opinion that liability is not in your client's favor.

Under such a circumstances, we regret to inform you that we have our principal instruction to deny liability and unable
to look into your client’s claim,

10. | ) N&W | Viehicle X - Tuming info Main
Vehicle Y - Tuming info Menor
Road

100% | 0%

Reason: Vehlick from minor
‘ road should exercise greater

Thank You.

eyt Regards
Asher Sng | Cose Handler
LEE Aulo Consullants Ple Lid

phone: 484 1-4051 | emall: gshenna@lkkoulio.com | fox: &741-4108
Bk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Fork, Ubl Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)



Fram: Jenny Lim <jenny.lim@laihuat.com.sg>
Sent: Monday, 29 April 2019 12:29 PM

To: Janet Tan <janet.tan@eqinsurance.com.sg>
Subject: Video Footage - 5GG 295X
Importance: High

Dear Janet
Please find enclosed the video footage for your kind attention.

Your client report is inconsistent with the video. Your insured is not speaking the truth. Secondly this is a residential area
with cars parking on the road,

Both driver are neighbours knowing that care had to be given when turning as car coming out/exiting has to change lane
as there are parked cars all the time.

When your insured turned left abruptly without stopping or slowing down (at the point of turning). He did not check for
oncoming traffic on both lanes (due to parked vehicles outside their houses before make the turn).

It is common understanding for all drivers to drive with care and to give way (due to parked vehicles) in such residential
area. Our driver has to encroach into the other lane as there was parked vehicle. Our client's did drive back into his
lane and stopped when your insured hit onto our client's vehicle.

Flease kindly look into this matter and revert.
Thank you,
Kind regards.

Jenny Lim

for LAl HUAT (MENG KEE) MOTOR PTE LTD
160 Sin Ming Drive

#04-01, #04-02 & #07-03

Sin Ming Autocity

Singapore 575722

Tel: 64538110

Fax: 64596267

Total Contral Panel Login

To: janet.tan@eginsurance com.sg Remoye this sender from my allow list
From: jenny.lim®ialhuat.com.s8

You received this message because the sender is an your aflow list.



LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408833

TEL: 6255 3581 FAX 6256 4315

Reg. No: 188607188R GS5T Rag. No. 18-9607188-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automoblie

EQ INSURANCE COMPANY LTD

5 MAXWELL ROAD

Ref . CC4/EQI19006560/Keb3q2

#17-00 TOWER BLOCK Date: 28-05-2018
MND COMPLEXSINGAPORE 069110
Code: EQI
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SFW 89992 Veh. Inspected SGG 295X -
Policy No. DMPPHQ18-001166 Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. DMI9HO0015AJT Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From JANET TAN Assign Date 12/04/2018
2) Nehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model B.M.W. 328I (A) c.c 1087
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2014
Chassis No. WBA3AS2080F 360678 Colour METALLIC LIGHT BLUE
Odometer 89630 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification STANDARD ALLOY RIM
General GOOD
3 Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |225/45Z R18 MICHELIN 4 mm P
L/H Front Tyre |225/45Z R18 MICHELIN 4 mm
R/H Rear Tyre |255/40 R18 MICHELIN & mm
L/H Rear Tyre |255/40 R18 MICHELIN & mm
4, Description of Damages

THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE Q/S BODY,

DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.

5. General Information
Accident Date  06/04/2019 - Inspection Date 08/05/2018 -
Survey held at LAl HUAT {(MENG KEE) MOTOR PTE LTD
160 SIN MING DRIVE #04-01/02

SIN MING AUTOCITY
SINGAPORE 575722

S5a. Remarks

A)THE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS
B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.

5b. Estimate Days of Repair

ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR: 4 Working Days




’ VV LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Al MR 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Singapore 408833
’#_‘ TEL! 6256 3561 FAX: B256 4315
Rag. Mo 199607188R GST Reg, No. 18-9607168-R Page No. 1 of 1
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SGG 295X
- S Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Condition .-~ “F%rﬂ | A{‘:{
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|FRONT DOOR RH (WCP) BENT 810.00 810.00
1|FRONT DOOR WEATHERSTRIP RH (WCP) NECESSARY 105.00 105.00
1|REAR DOOR RH (WCP) BENT 1,200.00 1,200.00
1|REAR DOOR WEATHERSTRIP RH (WCP) NECESSARY 105.00 105.00
COST PLUS 16% 333.00 333.00
2,.553.00 2,553.00
LABOUR
TO CHECK /ERASE FAULT CODES 80.00 80.00
TO APPLY ANTI RUST CHEMICAL 80.00 50.00
TO STRAIGHTEN BODY . TO DISMANTLE +RENEW ABOVE 500.00 440.00
PARTS
TO SPRAY PAINT, 800.00 600,00
1,460.00 1.180.00
GRAND TOTAL _ 4,013.00 . 3,733.00
| RECOMMENDED COST OF REPAIRS [ I [ 3733.00]

Report Ref No. CC4/EQI19006560/Keb3q2
L

Y 494

KONG SENG CHEONG
Licensed Appralsar

DISTLAINMER OF LIABILITY TO THERD PARTIES - This Rapor I8 mads solsly for the use snd benefl of B Clienl named on the fronl page of this Repan




Joanne Lee !I.Kl{ Autnz

From: Joanne Lee [LKK Auto) <reporti@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Friday, 31 May 2019 2:50 PM

To: janettan@eqginsurance.com.sg’

Cc: ‘ashersng@lkkauto.com'

Subject: TP Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SFW 8999Z (OI) and SGG 295X (TP) on
06/04/2019

Attachments: EMAIL pdf; LKK REPORT & PHOTO,pdf

Dear SirMadam,

We refer to the above matter.
Please be informed that we have rejected TP claim. (see attached)

We enclose herewith our without prejudice report and relevant documents for your necessary action please.

Thank you,

Best Regards,

JOANNE | Reports

LKK Auto Consultants Pte.Ltd.

Phone: 6256-3561 Ext.111 Fax: 6741-4108 emall: repori@lkkauto.com
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #01-25 Singapore 408933
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