8/5/2020 Mail - Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) - Outlook

RE: SKK3156B & PC1557Z doa 9/4/19 *** LKK REF: CC4/ASM19006510/Apa3

Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh@lkkauto.com>
Thu 10/10/2019 4:52 PM

To: chan pick yuen <chris_chanbebe@hotmail.com>; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ilkkauto.com>
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh@lkkauto.com>

0 2 attachments (2 MB)
LOA INVOICE.PDF; GIA REPORT - SKK 3156 B.PDF;

Without Prejudice

Dear Chris,

We refer to your below email and the contents were noted.

Please be informed that this matter is handled by Ms Hsiao Tong, and she will get back to you for an update/offer in due course.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
F EFES 2v.

SRR W Spve the Farthe Print only when necessary-

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an unintended recipient
is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not read this e-mail or any attached items.
Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and
any copies thereof. Thank you.

From: chan pick yuen [mailto:chris_chanbebe@hotmail.com]

Sent: Thursday, 10 October, 2019 4:50 PM

To: Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: Re: SKK3156B & PC1557Z doa 9/4/19 *** LKK REF: CC4/ASM19006510/Aha3
Dear Vic,

Enclosed is our client's invoice & LOA .

As request following :

1.RC $ 7700 ( AS AGREED 0O
2. Lou $900 ( $100 - luxury car Mercedes X 9 DAYS - 7 days recommend + 1 day waiting PRS + 1 day weekend )
@ 100% ( direct from behind - front & rear video whatadd to Ms Hsiao Tong )
Total $ 8600/-.
Please let us have your offer soon . Thanks
Regards,

Chris Chan Pick Yuen
Ho Beng Trading

https://outlook.office.com/mail/deeplink?version=2020072701.10&popoutv2=1
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From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Thursday, April 11, 2019 7:45 PM

To: chan pick yuen <chris_chanbebe@hotmail.com>

Cc: Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh@Ilkkauto.com>; CS A Team <cs-a@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: SKK3156B & PC1557Z doa 9/4/19 *** LKK REF: CC4/ASM19006510/Aha3

‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE’
SAVE AS TO COSTS

Dear Sir / Madam,
We refer to the above matter.

Please be informed that we are currently pending verification for direct settlement.

Please provide us evidence i.e. video/ scene photo.
Kindly note that for liability, claim negotiation and settlement, please contact Vic at 6841 2096.
Our respective case handler will look into the matter and revert to you in due course.

To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@]lkkauto.com | fax: 67414108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: chan pick yuen <chris_chanbebe@hotmail.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 10 April, 2019 4:51 PM

To: SG AXA Insurance SM AXA SGP - Motor Survey <motor.survey@axa.com.sg>
Cc: KUMAR Shailendra <shailendra.kumar@axa.com.sg>

Subject: SKK3156B & PC1557Z doa 9/4/19

Dear Sir / Mdm ,

Enclosed is GIA .

Please let us have your 10 name list of surveyor to survey our clients:SKK3156B . Thanks

Best Regards
Chris Chan

Ho Beng Trading
Hp:92712214

Get Outlook for iOS

l Virus-free. www.avg.com
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LETTER OF AUTHORISATION

HO BENG TRADING
BLOCK 3020A UBI
ROAD 1 #01-33
SINGAPORE 408714

Dear Sir,

aly[1a & |9: 2oh S

Accident on

Involving Vehicle Nos QKKB ’\S—G—B g‘ PC. l S’\S? 2

Lo 2. Tog, Yeyoh 0 P (Taas )

Along

' kk S7CR
| /We.the registered owner /driver of vehicle registration no: k ‘ v ('7 /

have involved in the above accident.

I/We hereby authorize M/S HO BENG TRADING  to commence repairs.of the said vehicle
forthwith.

I/We agree to assign the whole proceeds of my/our comprehensive/third party claim to you and our
solicitors _ to act on my/our behalf in respect of the above
matter.And if applicable,my/our solicitors shall accept this as my/our irrevocable authority to pay

the amount as-deemed compensated direct to you after deduction of their costs ona Solicitor and
client basis. '

I/We undertake to co-operate fully with you and our solicitors to ensure that claim is successful.

I/We also authorize you to sign all discharge vouchers/indemnity forms and all necessary papers in
relation with the above claim in my/our absence.

Your kind co-operation in this matter will be much appreciated.
Thank you. )

Yours truly.

A

“Owhner's Signature
(Company's stamp if app_licable)

Name: Cr\kw 'Z'Q’nm
NRIC No: 8?00;8 %4;

11/04/2019

Date:




AXA THIRD PARTY DIRECT SETTLEMENT

< pespored Licaifily o ke fifed ooy for choin coSEsions and for coses where BOLA Gors nOl QY
¥ W

“vehige No: R S ~_ PC 15577 linsdveh) |
| _ 3 3 SKK 2156 (TP veh] | Model: Mercedes Benz BZ0D (1585cc)
_Date of Accident/ Time: L 09042018 1
3 - ]
5 =, dsvsats ~ pes day |
- N daysat s perday |
5 .
: g i
final settiement Som {Global Sum) & 3750.00
payee Name : Ho Beng Trading ' — g ia 4'
t= Thizd Party workehop GLA Repistered? | 1 YES iXi w0 Wiy indirate belnw]
Tat s den G'A_ﬁégii;trrEE Workshap: Ag--'cvr-.", iia ::-'.:'.w.- _ ﬂ._t _4’%_ ‘IE o
T = GiA Romstered Workshop: EOLA Apmicabie: Yesf No  BOLA Soenario Not
SoLA Liatiey _KsE) Aszeseed Liability 171 __ _ (%&b l

1. PLEASE EXPRESSLY RESERVE YOUR CLIENT™S RIGHTS IF SO REQUIRED 1N THIS SETTLEMENT DOCUMENT.

2. THIS SETTLEMENT IS ON A WITHOUT PREIUDICE BASIS AND SHOULD NOT CONSTRUED AS AN ADAISSION OF

LIABILITY ON AXA AND THEIR CLIENT/TORTFEASOR IN ANY PAANNER WHATSOEVER.

3. AMA RESERVES THEIR RIGHTS UNDER THE POLICY TERRAS £ CONDITIONS AS WELL AS THEIR RIGHTSIN LAW.

Only applcable 1o rental claims - &l dosument aré 1o be submited with this settlement confimation. In the event rental
agreemeant [ invoices are ol received within 7 days of this signed ConfiTmanon, W= will autnmatically revert to foss of use daim

ger the HIML rases

wWedl canfirmed that this is a full and final setiemnent that we and of our chenl have/nad/nas agamst you [AKA and thiir

poucyhaider/authorised drives rarifeasad] for any and all lostes {pastfpresentfiuture] aring frarm this acrident

Wi confismed that we have the suthority of our client to act for and on thea ehalf in this accident.

-

2\ o

sgnatuse of workshap representatnve 4
Mame of Represeniatng:

'3"8:;/ 1 %2?2@ %3

=41 BSE F\
e«nj Mame ot Wi chan [k yus

warme of AXA'S sunmeysr fRepresenialives

' 05/11/2020

rames Pe Lt (Dompany Seg. Mo I950ESTIM)
52401 AXA Tooer SinEapose 055317
enire #01-Z1

g +E5 SRR AREE - SNACHM.SE

e SignauVe of innes | Workshop stamp (i applicasie}



2017

HO BENG TRADING

Block 3020A Ubi Road 1 # 01-33 Singapore 408714
HP: 92712214

INVOICE

CHEW RENA Date: 10" October 17
Blk 3020A #01-33

Ubi Road 1

Singapore 408714

Accident date: 09" APRIL 2019
Final Bill For Vehicle No: SKK3156B MERCEDES -BENZ B200-1.6 A (2013)

Descriptions AMOUNT
JLump Sum repair cost as recommended by $7,700.00

'LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD

Surveyor : Mr Adrian Ling

TotaJ $7,700.00

S/DLRS: SEVEN THOUSAND SEVEN HUNDRED ONLY

Page 409
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” wNw wwm Consultants
dhed il W& B Pte Ltd

SLUBIAVE 1, #01-25 PAYA UBI INDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : (065) 62563561 FAX : (065) 62564315

8 MAY 2019

POO SEE YEOW BUS SERVICES PTE LTD
25A HILLVIEW AVENUE

#05-12 GLENDALE PARK

SINGAPORE 669617

Dear Sir/ Mdm,

OUR REF : CC4/ASM19006510/Aha3

YOUR REF :SKK3156B
ACCIDENT INVOLVING PC1557Z AND SKK3156B ALONG THOMSON FLYOVER

TOWARDS PIE ON 09/04/2019

We refer to the above subject matter. We write to inform you that we are the loss adjuster
appointed by your motor insurer, AXA Insurance Singapore Pte Ltd to deal with the third
party claim against your policy.

We have received a claim from PROGRESSIVE CAR CARE PTE LTD acting on behalf of
the owner of SKK3156B against your motor insurance policy.

Based on the accident report and accident scenario, we are of the opinion that this is a
conflicting version based on words against each driver unless one can prove otherwise.

Please be informed that your No Claim Discount (NCD — if applicable) may be affected as
a result of the claim against your policy. We also wish to advise that there is an excess of

$$2,000.00 in accordance to your policy.

Our principal, AXA shall keep you informed of when to make the excess payment, which
cheque is to be made in favor of “AXA Insurance Pte Ltd”. Please indicate your vehicle
registration number and the date of accident on the back of the cheque.

We shall proceed to deal with the claim(s) subject to the merits of the case and according
to the rights afforded under the policy. Should you not be seeking the protection of your
policy and seek to take conduct of third party claim(s) arising from this incident, at your
own cost and defence, please reply to us within 10 days from the date of this letter. Your
intent must be formally expressed to us and acknowledged by us.

Your full co-operation in the handling of the claim is required and kindly submit the
following to khanchna@lkkauto.com within 10 days from the date of this letter if not
provided at our reporting centre. The list below is not all inclusive and further

document may be required:

 Police report, Police Investigation result, appeal against the Traffic Police offence
and status (if any)

* Driver's driving license or foreign driving license (if any)
Coloured photographs of accident scene (if any)

* Coloured photographs of damage to all vehicles involved (If any)



- - Consultants
F = W Y Pte Ltd

! V.'r{’ Aufo

51 UBLAVE 1, #01-25 PAYA UBI INDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : (065) 62563561 FAX : (065) 62564315

¢ Video footage of accident (if any)

» Statement and/or police report from independent witness(es) (if any)

» If you or your passenger(s) are filing a claim against any of the involved Third
Party(s), you are to keep us informed of your legal representative(s) and the
status of the claim

To protect your interest(s) in the handling of this claim, please do not discuss liability with
any of the Third Party(s) and/or their legal representatives, or make any compromise or
settlement without AXA’s prior knowledge and consent.

This letter should not be regarded as a waiver by AXA of their rights to repudiate any
claim because of any breach of policy terms and conditions you and/or your authorised
driver may have committed.

In the event of receiving and handling of any third party injury claim(s), AXA shall keep
you informed of the final indemnity upon conclusion of the matter(s).

If you need any clarification, please do not hesitate to contact us at 6841 2360 or email us

at khanchna@lkkauto.com.

Please quote the claim reference when you contact us that we can assist you more
effectively.

Yours sincerely

KHANCHNA
Case Handler
DID: 6841 2360
FAX: 6741 4108

Email: khanchna@lkkauto.com

c.c.  AXA Insurance Singapore Pte Ltd (AXA)
(Motor Claims Dept)



