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> Back to OneMotoring

PARFNFE Ranats Frmune

_ Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars
Owner ID Type:

Owner 1D:

Vehicle Details

Vehicle No.:

Vehicle to be Exported:
Intended Deregistration Date:
Vehicle Make:

Vehicle Model:

Primary Colour;
Manufacturing Year:

Engine No.:

Chassis No.:

Maximum Power Output:
Open Market Value:

Original Registration Date:
First Registration Date:
Transfer Count:

Actual ARF Paid:

Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility:

FPARF Eligibility Expiry Date:
FARF Rebate Amount;
Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date:

COE Category:

COE Period(Years):

QP Paid:

COE Rebate Amount:

Total Rebate Amount:

Singapore NRIC
9338H

SIW44775

No

15 Apr 2019

K&

CERATO K3 1.6A
Grey

2017
G4FGGH641704
KNAFX411MH5720676
95.3 kW (127 bhp)
$13,109.00

02 May 2017

02 May 2017

0

$13.109.00

Yes
01 May 2027
£9,831.00

01 May 2027

A - Carup to 1600cc & 97kW (130bhp)

10

$52,000.00
$41,830.00
$51,661.00

The information contained herein is correct as at 15 Apr 2019

NTPS.{¥T1.Ma. gOV.Sg/TaNVIVBLTION enquIreMEDaTE gy FUDICOaTOrE LIS reqInpUT fFUNG | IUN_IUSFUSuauug ) |

1



Jia Le (LKK Auto)

————————————————————————————————————————————————— e ——

From: Jia Le (LKK Auto)

Sent: Tuesday, 5 November 2019 12:43 PM

To: Loh, Chee-Heng

Subject: Your ref 132400926756 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLZ5183T AND S/W4477S ON
06/04/2019)

Dear Chee Heng,
TP workshop informed that their client did not send the car to repair and they have closed the file on their end.

We will proceed to clase and submit W/P report.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Chan Jia Le | Case Handler

LEKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6749 5792 | email: Jigle@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubl Avenue 1, #o2-25 | S{408933)



Jia Le (LKK Auto) e ——

From: jouis <jouis@jinauto.comsg>

Sent: Wednesday, 2 October 2019 12:44 PM

To: Jia Le (LKK Auto]

Subject: RE: SIWA4477S THIRD PARTY CLAIM AGAINST SLZ5183T ACCIDENT ON 06/4/2019

*** LKK REF CC6/AIG19006432/HB3

Without Prejudice

Dear lia Le

We have not repair the car.

Thank you & Best Regards,
louls Seow

lin Auto Services Pte Ltd

Blk 14 #01-412 Defu Lane 10
Singapore 539195,

Tel . (65) 62898126
Fax : (B5) 62870590
Email : jouls@jinauto.com.s

From: Jia Le [LKK Auto) [mailtoJiale@lkkauto.com)

Sent: Wednesday, 2 October 2019 12:32 PM

To: jouis <jouis@)inauto.com.sg>

Subject: RE: SJW44775 THIRD PARTY CLAIM AGAINST SLZ5183T ACCIDENT ON 06/4/2019 *** LKK REF:
CCH/AIG19006432/HB3

Without Prejudice
Dear Jouis,
Kindly let us have a copy of LOD for our necessary actlon.

Thank you.

Best Repards,

Chan Jin Le | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6749 5792 | email: Jinle@lkkaunto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue i, #02-25 | S{408031)

From: Jia Le (LKK Auto)

Sent: Monday, 23 September 2019 5:30 PM

To: jouls

Subject: RE: SJW44775 THIRD PARTY CLAIM AGAINST S5LZ5183T ACCIDENT ON 06/4/2019 *** LKK REF:
CCh/AIG19006432/HB3



Without Prejudice

Dear Jouis,

We propose settlement at 50% as both parties were changing lane.
Kindly let us have the LOD for our necessary action,

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Chan Jin Le | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6740 5792 | email: Jinle@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51. Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #o2-25 | S{408933)

From: Jia Le [LKK Auto)
Sent: Tuesday, 27 August 2019 9:50 AM

To: jouls
Subject: RE: S/W44775 THIRD PARTY CLAIM AGAINST SLZ5183T ACCIDENT ON 06/4/2019 *** LKK REF:
CCR/AIG19006432/HE3

Without Prejudice
Dear louls,
Kindly let us have a copy of LOD for our necessary action.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Carlor Chan | Case Handler

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6749 5792 | email: Jiale@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubl Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: lia Le [LKK Auto)

Sent: Friday, 2 August 2019 2:06 PM

To: jouls

Subject: RE: SIW44775 THIRD PARTY CLAIM AGAINST SLZ5183T ACCIDENT ON 06/4/2019 *** LKK REF:
CCB/AIG19006432/HB3

Without Prejudice

Dear Jouis,

We propose settlement at 50% as both parties were changing lane.

Kindly let us have the LOD for our necessary action.

Thank you.

Best Regands,



Carlor Chan | Case Handler

LEKK Auto Consultants Ple Lid

Phone: 6749 5792 | email: Jinle@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubl Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Vic (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 12 April, 2019 11:16 AM

To: jouls

Cc: Admin A; Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: S/W44775 THIRD PARTY CLAIM AGAINST SLZ5183T ACCIDENT ON 06/4/2019 *** LKK REF:
CCh/AIG19006432/HB3

Without Prejudice
Dear louls,
We refer to your below emall.

Please be informed that we are requesting for video footage from our Insured and will get back to you on the liability
the soonest time.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler

LEKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6841-2006 | email: viealpeh@lkkauto.com | fux: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(4080933)

¥ LSE”r oo

S————

SIS ST Shve the Earthe Print only when necessary-

This e-mail contain canfidential and privileged matenal, and are for the sole use of the intended reciplent. Uise or distribution by an
unintended recipient 15 prohibited. and may be a violation of law If you belleve thal yeu received this &-mail In emar, please do nol
read this e-mall or any attached Items. Please delete the e-mall and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and infarm the
sender that you have deleled (he 2-mall, all attachments and any copies thereal Thank you

Fram: jouis [maillto:jouis@|inau

Sent: Friday, 12 April, 2019 10:43 AM

To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto); Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: SJW44775 THIRD PARTY CLAIM AGAINST 5L25183T ACCIDENT ON 06/4/2019 *** LKK REF:
CCH/AIG19006432/HB3

Without Prejudice

Dear Vic,

Can we do direct settlement on 50/50 both parties changing lane?
Thank you & Best Regards,

louis Seow
lin Auto Services Pte Ltd



Blk 14 #01-412 Defu Lane 10
Singapore 539195,

Tel : (65) 62898126
Fax (65) 62870590
Emall : jouis@|inauto.com.sg

From: Mei Kwan [LKKAuto) [mailto:Melkwan®@lkkauto.com
Sent: Friday, 12 April 2019 10:24 AM
To: jouis <jpuis{@|inauto.com.sg>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>; Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh@|kkauto.com>; C5 A Team <cs-a@lkkauto.coms>
Subject: RE: SJW44775 THIRD PARTY CLAIM AGAINST 5LZ5183T ACCIDENT ON 06/4/2019 *** LKK REF:
CCe/AIG19006432/HBE3

‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE"
SAVEAS TO COSTS

Dear Sir / Madam,

We refer to the above matter.

Please be informed 01 has reported. Please refer to the below O1's sketch plan and statement.
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.
Please provide us evidence Le. video/ scene photo.

Please note that for liability, claim negotiation and settlement, please contact ViGatBaSNE006:
Our respective case handler will look into the matter and revert to you in due course.

To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned.

Thank vou.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phoni 6366 0055 | email: MelEwan@kkauto.com | fax: 67414108
Blk 51, Payn Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1. #o2-25 | S(40B0933)

From: jouls <jouls@finauto.com.sg>
Sent: Friday, 12 April, 2019 10:02 AM



To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@|kkauto.com>
Subject: RE: SJWa477S THIRD PARTY CLAIM AGAINST SLZ5183T ACCIDENT ON 06/4/2019

Dear Mei Kwan ,

5L75183T reported ?

Thank you & Best Regards,
Jouis Seow

Jin Auto Services Pte Ltd

Blk 14 #01-412 Defu Lane 10
Singapore 539195,

Tel :(65) 62898126
Fax  :(B5) 62870550

Email : jouis@|inauto.com.sg

From: jouls [mailto:jouls@jinauto.com.sg)
Sent: Wednesday, 10 April 2019 3:59 PM

To: 'Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)' <Meikwan@lkkauto.com»
Subject: FW;: SIW44775 THIRD PARTY CLAIM AGAINST SLZ5183T ACCIDENT ON 06/4/2019

Without Prejudice

Dear Mei Kwan

FW: SJW4477S THIRD PARTY CLAIM AGAINST SLZ5183T ACCIDENT ON 06/4/2019
We are assisting owner of SIW4477S handling his third party claim

recovery against SLZ5183T ( YOUR INSURED ).

Have your insured reported, kindly establish liability for this case .

Thank you & Best Regards,
louis Seow

Jin Auto Services Pte Ltd

Blk 14 #01-412 Defu Lane 10
Singapore 539195,

Tel  :(65) 62898126
Fax :(65) 62870590

Email : jouis@]inauto.com.sg
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31 UKIAVE 1, 20025 PAYA UBLINDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPURE 408933 TEL : (U65) 62563561 FAX : (D03) 1564315

Our Ref: CC6/AIG19006432/Uhb3
16 APRIL 2019

TAN BOON PIN

APT BLK 171 LORONG | TOA PAYOH
#20-1152

SINGAPORE 310171

Dear Sir/Madam,
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLZS183T AND SJW4477S ON 06/04/2019

We refer 1o the above accident where we are acting for AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Lid to resolve
the claim against vou and/or your authorized driver under the Auto Insurance policy taken up with
them,

We have received a claim from SIW4477S against your motor insurance policy.

Both parties involved have given conflict of version. Based on the circumstances of accident and both
parties damage profile, there is no conclusive evidence to substantiste either's parties version.
Pursuant 1o the above said accident wherein you and/or your authorized driver had amongst other
information given us your version of how the accident had occurred, we as the appointed agent of
your insurers shall proceed to negotiate for an amicable settlement with third party claimant.

If you have evidence/information 1o proof that we should not settle the third party claim, kindly let us
have them in writing within the next 10 days ie. by 29/04/2019, after we shall proceed with
negotiation with Third Party claimant on the without prejudice basis and any settlement should not
bind any claims whatsoever by vouw'your driver against the other party's insurer arising from this
particular accident.

Please note that your No-Claim Discount (NCD) (if any) will be affected and reduced by 30% (20%
for commercial vehicles) upon next renewal due to this Third Party claim. However, if your policy
has a NCD protector feature, it will be deemed utilized for this claim and your NCD will be protected.

Please call us if you have further queries.

Yours faithfully,

|
KHANCHNA
Case Handler
DID: 6841 2360
FAX: 6741 4108
Email: vicalpeh/@lkkauto.com

ce  AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Pre Ltd
(Muotor Claims Dept)
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‘ & 11 Apr 20189 &g 019 -rHTI:I.III |58725.00 m
in ¥
_tontag | Ecit adi mpt | e esmmanes | | _view s | Conca Case |

CLAIM SUBFOLDER DETAILS [Created by adjuster]

Ingared: TAN BOON PIN, 10: S14626340
B yep: | TAM BOON ANN,  1D: 51429338H
. | DéfDa 2019 14:00 - 5%

Nor RS sawaaz?S Dote of LOSK | 133 pontig and 4 Days From LTA Reg Date (Man Yr)]
Clim Typa: | TP / 132400926756 Foucw/Caver | 1800050270 (Comprohensive) I
Vehicie Rag, ey
No sLrs1s3T Polcy o . | 509314047
[Insured)

Excess:

| Repairer: J_lnml-'li-"ltl.tﬂ (Defu) Bik 14 Defu Lans 10, lﬂl-‘lﬂ.l':i-ll, 539195 Defu Lane - Tel: 6259 B126
Handling |4 4e asia Pacific Insurance Pie. Lt (Express) - Tel: 65-8419-3000 .. [Handled by Lok, Chee-Heng] Chee-Heng Loh@alg.com

m‘ NTUC Income Insurance Co-operative Ltd (HG) - Tel
Adljuster: LXK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) - Tel: 6356-3561 . [Handied by MARCUS CHUA] ... [Final Rpt dus 23/04/2019]
ASSOCIATED MAIL RECEIVED Wiew Ml | Compase Case Mail |

There are no mail for this cose.

ALL ASSOCIATED TASKS™ View Al | Searcn Tawks | Cresis New Task | Complete |

Due Date  Priority Type  Task Group Subject  Handier Assigned By Complezed On Created On ~ Done?
No results;

https:/singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=... 13/11/2019
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Claim Documents

*5IW44775 (13240092675G)
[5LZ5183T]
™

TAN BOON ANN
Apr 6 2019 2:55PM
[TAN BOON PIN]
Jin Auto Services Pte Ltd

|Video 1 per i~ &
(o |Finslized On | LKK Auto Consultants Pts Ltd (HQ) - Thumbnail | Print
1 |26/04/19 13:48 | Video - Accident Lond MP4
Photos/images e TG
[Ne | Rulabel/Reorder | LKX Auto Consultants Pte Lid (HQ) Thumbnail | Print
1 |1304/19 14:08 | Odemeter Reading 0| wawc || A
7 |13/04/1% 14108 | Chassls Number 0| wdws | &
3 |13/04/19 14:05 | General View B | esws | &
& |13/04/19 1409 | General View 0 leews | B
§ |13/04/1914:058 | General View @ | weaws | B
6 |11/04/19 14:09 | General View @ | caaws | B
7 |1/04/19 14:00 | General View 0| s | B
B 13/04/19 14:05 | General View —— 0| dws B
§  |13/04/19 14:08 | Ganeral View 0| ades B
10 |13/04/1% 14:08 | General View Q| wers | B
11 |13/04/19 14:08 | General View 0| wans | &
12 [1w0e/19 1408 | General View 0| waawe | A
13 | 13/04/19 14:09 Goners! View 0| toedws | A
14 |1/04/19 14:08 | Genersl View Q| waws | B
15 [13/04/19 1405 | General View 0| wers B
16 |13/04/19 14:08 | General View 0| wsaws | &
117 |13/04/19 14:00 General View 0| tadiec | A
18| 104/19 14:08 | Geners! View Q| ews B
19 |13/04/1914:08 | General View O | v | B
20 |13/04/19 14:09 | General View B | waws | M
|21 |19/04/19 14:08 | General View 0| wars | B
|22 |1wo4/19 14:08 | General View 0| wawe |
Decumentation tperpsge  v]| B4
Mo | Relabel/Reorder | LKK Auto Consultants Pte Litd [HQ) Thumbnall | Print
1 11704719 1240 TP GIA REPORT Load PDF
2 |moee1e1 [LETTER TOOI Load PDF
Mo | Finslaed On A1G Asln Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd, (SG) Thumbnall | Print
1 [1304/19 05118 | O GIA REPORT ) | tosavor
Documents Checklist
DOCUMENTS CHECKLIST -

Reset | Save | Print
There are no document checklists configured.

Our Cheekist Remarks - LKX Auto Consultants Pie Ltd (HG)
]
W
Show Remarks To: L] Handling Insurer
Fotd. Remial e peepln uniesd yed ihce | 1D pihe® pefien
hitps://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRdoc&fuseaction=dsp... 13/11/2019
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Adjuster Report

Page 1 of 3

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd coregne tsssoriser)
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubl Industrial Park

Singapore 408933

Tel: 6256-3581 Fax: 6844-8805 Email: sur@ikkauto.com;assignments@ikkauto.com

VEHICLE DAMAGE INSPECTION REPORT

Our File No: CCB/AIG19006432/UDB3G2
Date: 131112018

REFERENCE

Handling Insurer. AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Ple. Lid.  Policy No:

Claimant

1800050270

Vehicle No : SJW4477S Insured Vehicle No : SLZ5183T
Date of Loss: DB/04/2018 Nature of Claim: TP Claim No: 132400826756
DESCRIPTION & IDENTIFICATION OF VEHICLE
Reg No. SJW44TTS
Make & Model: KIA CERATD K3, 1.6 (A) Engine No: GAFGGHB41704
Reg. Date: 02/05/2017 (Man. Year: 2017) Chassis No. KNAFX411MH5720678
Calour: Grey Odometer 85038 km
Engine Capacity: 1591 cc
Market Value/New Car NIA
Price
Sum Insured (S$) Market Value/New Car Price
CONDITION OF VEHICLE AT THE TIME OF SURVEY
General Condition: Steering (Serviceable): Yes Foolbrake (Serviceable): Yes
Handbrake (Serviceable): Yes Engine Modification: Mo  Pre-accident Condition:
CONDITION OF TYRES
Front Tyre Size: 205/55 R16 Rear Tyre Size: 205/55 R16
Front Left Side: Pirelli ¥ mm Rear Lefi Side Piralli 7 mm
Front Right Side: Pirelli 7 mm Rear Right Side: Pirelli 7 mm
The above valtas represant ihe reraining fyre reads depth
/COST OF CLAIMS - Repairer's Adjuster's Difference  Diff %]
Parts 0.00 0.00 0.00
Miscellaneous ltems 0.00 0.00 0.00
Labour 1,135.00 725.00 410.00 36.12
Paintwork Labour 0.00 0.00 0.00
Towing 0.00 0.00 0.00
Gross Total (S§) 1,135.00 725.00 410.00 36.12
+ GST 7.00/7.00% (S%) 78.45 50.75 23.70 36.12
Nett Amount (S§) 1,214.45 T75.75 438.70 36.12
Global Sum Settlement (S§) 0.00
INSPECTION
Date of Assignmant: 12/0472018
Dale Inspected: 12/04/2018 Inspecled Al Jin Auto Services Ple Ltd (Defu)
Elk 14 Defu Lane 10, #01-410/412
Singapore 539195
Estimated Period of Repair: 3.0 days
Adjuster: MARCUS CHUA Manager: CHAN JIA LE

NOTE This repart repreaants our findings af the time and place of inspection stated herein. Such inspoction has been canisd oul lo Ihe bast of our
knowiedge and ability but any offver hability under any clfier circumstances if harely sxpressly srciuded
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REPAIR DETAILS
Recommended Parts
No. Qty PartNe. Particulars Condition  Repairer's  Amount
1 1 *FRONT BUMPER [NPA) Distorted 0.00F “~F
2 10 *FRONT BUMPER CLIPS (NPA) MNecessary D.00F =F
3 1 *FRONT BUMPER SPONGE [NPA) *Check 0.00F =
4 1 *FRONT BUMPER RH SIDE RETAINER [NPA) Bant 0.00F *F
5 1 *FRONT BUMPER RH FOG LAMP (NPA) Cracked 0.00F =F
6 1 *FRONT BUMPER RH FOG LAMP COVER (NPA) Twisted 0.00F =F
7 1 *FRONT BUMPER REINFORCEMENT (NPA) *Check 0.00F = F
8 1 *FRONT RH FENDER (NPA) Repair 0.00F *.F
9 1 *FRONT RH HEADLAMP (NPA) Scratched D.00F o
F=Franchise pan

Total Parts (5%) 0.00 0.00

Report was unsubmitted during this print-out |
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Recommended Miscellaneous Items
There are no new miscellanecus items selected.

Recommended Labour

Page 3 of 3

No Particulars Lab.Type Repairer's Amount

Labour lloms

1 SPRAY PAINT New 550.00 400.00

2 LABOUR CHARGE MNew 480.00 300.00

3  WIRING New 25.00 25.00

4 TUFF KOTE New B0.00 0.00
Gross Labour Cost (S5) 1,135.00 725.00

Report was unsubmitted during this print-out.

< END OF ESTIMATES >
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