Vic (LKKAuto)

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)
Sent: Monday, 16 September, 2019 1:09 PM
To: Vic (LKKAuto)
Subject: FW: SMG5742T & SMG5742T DOA 08.04.2019 *** LKK REF: CC6/A1G19006421/Aha3
Attachments: INVOICE LOA.pdf; video-output-D9994D93-112E-413A-8BA8-BFODEFDA941A.mov
‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE’

SAVE AS TO COSTS

Dear Sir / Madam,

Thank you for your email.

Our respective case handler will look into the matter and get back to you in due course.
Hi

Kindly assist.

To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com | fax: 67414108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 19 August, 2019 11:07 AM

To: chan pick yuen <chris_chanbebe@hotmail.com>

Cc: Shu Pei (LKKAuto) <shupei@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SMG5742T & SMG5742T DOA 08.04.2019 *** LKK REF: CC6/A1G19006421/Aha3

‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE’
SAVE AS TO COSTS

Dear Sir / Madam,

Thank you for your email.

Our respective case handler will look into the matter and get back to you in due course.
Hi Vic,

Kindly assist.

To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned.

Thank you.



Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com | fax: 67414108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: chan pick yuen <chris _chanbebe@hotmail.com>

Sent: Monday, 19 August, 2019 10:52 AM

To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@I|kkauto.com>

Cc: Shu Pei (LKKAuto) <shupei@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>
Subject: Fw: SMG5742T & SMG5742T DOA 08.04.2019

Dear Sir / Mdm,

Enclosed is our client's invoice & LOA .
Please advise OIC & claim number .
As request :

1. RC $1872.50 ($1750 + 7% GST )

2. Loss of use $300 ( S60 x 5 days - 4 days recommend + 1 day waiting PRS
@ 100% ( video camera)
Total $2172.50

Please let us have your offer soon . Thanks

Regards,

Chris Chan Pick Yuen

Green Forest Automobile Pte Ltd
HP: 92712214
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