- b ) H kﬁ o Bl hese
CASE OWNER: L | CCJJJ' mh‘}gﬂﬂ \{ FLJ' '} \M
o B I h'h'lllh q {
— M DOol: ‘ [l P {Lf' B
Regisiered in Mermmen: ?
Vre-ussign / CCU / FTE QLF ,.5
Insured Viehicle No. i34 ‘l'ﬁk }j Cluim Mo
Mame af Insured JrlHTu 1 H’V\M Palicy No
Insared Tel No HP Make / Mode] -
Fxcews See 11 ;S5 DOA: I [ H’ﬁ Place of Accident :
I3 driver the owner? { @, I HND ) Mature of Accident ~\ .
If NO, Driver Name | Age 01 GIA REPORT: @:m . TP GIA REPORT/YES /N0
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Final Lishility % o0 (Agroed / Assessed) BOLA SNNo. - 1% [IINO or B 28, Ass. Lia: A
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Lass of Lise (LOUY: S8 1.5; v .m wx b Ii_ll:l' Wl 5 m
Loss of lticame (LOI}: 5% 2 ] nd LMLl
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rapalr at the time of Inspection.

Bal or Markat Vajus:
IDAC Azoioant Rport
GIA | PR Seen:
Esl. Rapairs ‘
Lum Sum'
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'SIN HWEE MOTOR PTE LTD

**% Main Workshop ***

r

Y

ESTIMATE

: | DATE 9/42019 |
Blk 3023A Ubi Road 1 #01-39 S{408717) !
1 Kaki Bukit Avenue 6, #01-25 S(417883) :
REG NO: 201327079M MAKE: A
MODEL CERATO
LEONG LAl PENG
' ' TPALY
ol KA
QUANTITY DESCRIPTION UNIT AMOUNT
e = - £ 4 —
1 PC REAR BUMPER 224+ THRAT 76847
1 PC REAR BUMPER LOWER GARNISH fe L 387.12 38712~
| PC REINFORCEMENT 28 358.31 35831 ‘&_,
I PC END PANEL 349 84 34984
I PC END PANEL TOP GARNISH 24 LB 9 ®7 §7.20 §729%
| PC WEATHER STRIP 2+ =~ . 121.44 121.44 %
I PC BOOTLID B d 265874 974.54 974.54 =
I PC CERATO LOGO 35.74 3574
| PC KIA LOGO (o i7.56 37.56
SUBTOTAL 3.120.31
LESS 10M LESS 10% ~10.00% -312.03
I SET REVERSE SENSOR ~ @—yd! 280,00 2y S
TO SUPPLY FITTINGS AND INSTALL REVERSE SENSOR 60,00 G0
TO REPLACE END PANEL INCLUDE KNOCKING AND WELDING Uo
TO IINSTALL AND ALIGN AFFECTED PARTS TO SYSMETRICAL SPEC 50,00 950:00 2
- :m'mgu BOOTLID MECHANISMS. TRIMS AND FITTINGS TO NEW I 7&;{] 150.00 150,00 &
TO REMOVE AND REFIX INNER TRIMS AND BOARDS TO FAUCILITATE &
REPAIR WORK 150.00 156600 5
- TO SPRAY PAINT END PANEL, REAR BUMPER AND BOOTLID, 850,00 85000 00"
TO SUPPLY AND TUFF KOTE AFFECTED PARTS 800,00 st B O
TO CARRY OUT WIRE CHECKING 100.00 10600 3 5
LK" Aits C henre ni 'j A i |
S Repaier o th olowing Ao (- Total 408,
sTor b =5 TE
o To 0 g [ (e 3880
b . ‘-I$ 03 /v4//5
& Third g T s’ banm
L o m L B ag 177'
- 1t veyes and
§ 1 IR
A b e gl 1y R guge
Tel: 6745 5783

Email: sinhweemo L

Fﬁ: 67449582

Website: www.sinhweemotor.com

TOTAL

§5.428.28




Poh Kin (LKKAuto)

#

From: Khim Goh <sinhweemotor@gmail. com=

Sent: Monday, 17 June 2019 5:18 PM

To: Poh Kin (LKKAuto)

Subject: Re: Accident on 03/04/19 involve SLP790B and SLF3913Y
Ok,

Please kindly forward us the DV.
Thanks
On Mon, Jun 17, 2019 at 3:31 PM Poh Kin (LKKAuto) <pohkin/@/lkkauto.com> wrote:

"Without Prejudice"

“save As To Costs”

Our Ref: CC4/AIG19006420/Afa3
Your Ref: SLP 790B

Dear Khim,

We refer to the above matter.

Purely towards an amicable settlement and without admission of liability to our Insured’s part, we offer
settlement at global sum of $ 3,910.00(all in] on this matter.

Kindly confirm acceptance on this matter.

Your prompt reply will be very much appreciated.



Poh Kin (LKKAuto)

#

From: Poh Kin [LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 17 June 2019 3:31 PM

To: Khim Goh

Cc: Admin A

Subject: RE: Accident on 03/04/19 involve SLP790B and SLF3913Y

"Without Prejudice”
“Save As To Costs”

Our Ref: CC4/AIG19006420/Afa3
Your Ref: SLP 790B

Dear Khim,
We refer to the above matter.

Purely towards an amicable settlement and without admission of liability to our Insured’s part, we offer
settlement at global sum of § 3,910.00(all in) on this matter.

Kindly confirm acceptance on this matter.

Your prompt reply will be very much appreciated.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the scle
intention of resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability,
whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by elther party that will materially
affectfinfluence on the issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation
terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,
Poh Kin, Chong (Mr) | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2132 | email: pohkin@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

¥ RS o
AeSRER T Sve bhe Earthe Print only when pecessary:

This &-mail contain confidential and privileged materal, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. Il you believe that you received this e-maill in error, please do nol
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the
sender that you have deleied the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you

From: Khim Goh [mailto:sinhweemotor@gmail.com]

Sent: Friday, 7 June 2019 2:12 PM

To: Poh Kin (LKKAuto) <pohkin@|kkauto.com=

Subject: Accident on 03/04/19 involve SLP7908B and SLF3913Y

1



Poh Kin (LKKAuto)

e ——————————————————————————————————————————— e ———————————————

From: Khim Goh <sinhweemotor@gmail. com>

Sent: Friday, 7 June 2019 2:12 PM

To: Poh Kin (LKKAUto)

Subject: Accident on 03/04/19 involve SLF7908 and SLF3913Y
Attachments: SLPT90B. pdf

Dear Poh Kin,

Our client requested us to claim the following :-

1) Cost Of Repair $ 3550.00
2) Loss of Rental 5 600,00 ($100.00 x & days)
3)LTA Fee $ 745

Total amount 5415745

Please kindly refer to the atiachment and get back to us soon

Thanks

Warmest Regards

Sine Hwee Motor Pre Lid

Khim Hp : 9766 6672

Tel: 6745 5783 Fax : 6744 9582
E-mail: sinhweemotor@gmail.com
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Our Ref: CCO/AIG19006420/Afad

08 JUNE 2019

HOW TI HWEI

3 WEST COAST WALK
#05-05

SINGAPORE 127140

Dear SiryMadam,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLF 3913Y/ SLP 790B / OTHERS ON 03/04/2019
ALONG /AT AYE BEFORE NORMANTON PARK

We refer to the above accident where we are acting for AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte
Ltd to resolve the claim against you and/or your authorized driver under the Auto

Insurance policy taken up with them.

Pursuant to the above said accident wherein you and/or your authorized driver had
amongst other information given us your version of how the accident had occurred, we as
the appointed agent of your insurers shall proceed to negotiate for an amicable settlement
with third party claimant.

Should you however wish to further discuss on the matier prior to our negotiations and
settlement, please contact us within 10 days from the date of this letter.

You are aware that your No-Claim Discount (NCD - if applicable) will be with held for
the time being. Pending for final allocation of liability in settlement by our principal AlG
Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Lid.

Please call us if you have further queries.

Yours faithfully,

A
V4
sl &
o . Chong
Case IIIl}andlcr
DID: 6841 2132
FAX: 6741 4108
Email: pohkin@lkkauto.com

cc.  AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pre Lid
(Motor Claims Dept)

81 UBLAVE 1, #01-25 PAYA UBLINDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : (065) 62563561 FAX : (065) 67414108
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| #lsa hemsby authorisa that the agreed sefllement sum be made in favour of my representatve , M

_Sin Hwea Motor P Lid and the sald pryment be forwarded fo them as Null and final

dischamge of my ciaim.

Nt A freoe Lguscn P )0
| heraby exonarate the and / or Melr insured andior
..--:' rrﬂ. £
drver of vehicia numbar - from any (abilty sfer payment of any clalm o my authorsed
Aol
Owners Bignature © g
Full Name LFe~fy L0y PE0G
~ 10950
Nrie Mo - =

Dwtn ' 'F-:;JII"*:r'{E




ELEASE VO
acific - Party Cl

“We/l, Sin_Hwee Motor Pte Ltd (“the workshop™) hereby confirm that we/l have reached an
agreement with the appointed surveyor of AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pre Lud LKK AUTO
CONSULTANTS PTE LTD (name of surveyor) with respect to the amount claimed for $53.910.00
(Gilobal Sum) for vehicle no. SLP 7908 that was demaged pursuant to the accident which occurred

on 03/04/2019 (date) along AYE (location) involving vehicle no/s SLF 3913Y. This is pursuant to
the inspection conducted on 09/04/2019 (daie) at “the workshop™.

We/l confirm that we/l are/am authorized by the owner LEONG LAl PENG (“the third party
claimant™) of vehicle no. SLP 790B make the claim as set out in the above paragraph and we/l have
full authority to settle the matter on his her behalf in a manner that we/l deem fit. We'l enclose herein
the letter of authority given by “the third party claimant™.

We/l further confirm that we/l will indemnify AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Lid for all damages,
loss and/or expense that they will or have already incurred in the event that “the third party claimant™
after the above said agreement lodges a further claim against the former for any loss and expenses
suffered pertaining 1o costs of repairs and/or rental and/or loss of use pursuant to the damage to SLP
7908 (vehicle no.) as a result of the accident. '

We/l confirm that the agreement reached above is in full and final settlement of any claim of “the
third party claimant™ pursuant 1o the accident and that further this settlement is reached on a without
prejudice and without admission of hability basis.

This agreement is subject to the application of Singapore law and the Singapore Courts have
exclusive jurisdiction over any dispute arising out of the same.

-

. o
Dated this (day) of Jant (month) 20_"_ (year)

@

Signed by appointed surveyor " Signed W workshop” (with chop)




SIN HWEE MOTOR PTE LTD Invoice
GST cancelled with effect from 01 Apr 17 TR —
*** Main Workshop ***
Blk 3023A Ubi Road 1 #01-59 S(408717) s — .
**¢ Spray Paint Workshop @ Autobay ***
1 Kaki Bukit Avenue 6, #01-25 S(417883) VEHICLE N SLP 7908
MAKE: KIA
LEONG LAI PENG s ——
REF NO:
arty DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE AMOUNT
- LUMP SUM 3,550.00 3,550.00
Tel: 67455783 : 67449582
Email: sinh il.com
Website: www. weemotor.com
TOTAL:. $£3,550.00




482010 Heceipt
> Back to OneMotoring

Land Tmnspoanuhnﬁty

Land Transpont Authority

10 Sin Ming Drive

Singapore STSTO1

GST Regiatration No. : M4-0008529-2

Print Data/Tim : 08 Apr 2019/ 12:08:51
Receip! Date/Time : 08 Apr 2018 / 12:08:51

Tax Invoice/Recelpt
Receipl No. : ITNET-D0000-120408-001305
Pravious Rasceipl No. :
SN itemn Description/ Amount GsT Amount
Businsss Transaction Refersnce Before Amount After GST
No. GST (83) (8%) (8%)
Rasult of Insurance Enguiry - SLF3813Y
As al 03 Apr 2018/18:00:00
Insurance Co: AIG ASIA PACIFIC INSURANCE PTE. LTD.
1 insursnce Enquiry - SLF3913Y
Enguiry Fes T.00 0.40 TAR
20190408120559991354
Bub-Total T.00 049 TAR
Total Befors Rounding T.00 049 TAR
Rounding Differsnce 0,04
Total Amount Payable 745
Pakd By
Dirsct Dabit: sNETS Debit
20190408120810751 748
{intemat Banking)
Tolal TAS
Cash Changs 0.00
Tendered Amount T.45
Excess Rafundable Armount 0.00
THANK YOU AND HAVE A NICE DAY

Pleass snsure that all payments to the Authority are good and promptly settied by the payment service
provider [ financlal institution. Otherwise, the transaction and recsipt ls considered vold and late fee

may apply.

UTERH AT L. GO, B TLR VT BCDONY CONMpIS - Iy TN LN, | LN iU T 30T 1

n



Merimen e-Claims Page 1 of |

.««.CLAIM SUBFOLDER...(Pending for Survey Report)

|CLAIM SUBFOLDER TRACKING

|

| Case | Wotified Est Submittad | Ad) Assigred Ad) Rpt Ad] Submitted  |Ins Auth'ed | Status |
I 1 T T

e [1s Apr 2019 .Igg:;grzn:i $$3,550.00 $33,550.00 !Hnﬂnnhriwm |

IM . I Edit Ad) Aigt | Edit Estimates | | view 2o | _ 1) Cancel Case | |

|CLAIM SUBFOLDER DETAILS
[insured: | HOW TT HWET, 1D 570189561
[P |LEONG LAI PENG, [D: 51340990)

| Clabmant:

| vehicie Reg | 03/04/2001 1B:00 - :59

[H-u _ " SLPT790B Date of Loss: |[193 Months and 11771 Days From LTA Reg Date (Man
L ¥ril

Claim Type: | TP / 096863125356 i

Policy No.
SLF3913Y {Claimant): 170000831301

Excess:
Sin Hwes Motor Pie Ltd (HQ) Bik 30214, Ubi Road 1, #01-59, 808717 Ll - Tel: 67455783

AlIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd. (Express) - Tei: 65-541%-3000 ... [Handied by Foo, Chit Yan] Cnityan. Foo@aig.com

AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd. (SG) - Tel: £5-6419-3000
LKK Aute Consultants Pte Litd (HQ) - Tel: 61563561 ... [Handled by ADRIAN LING] ... [Final Rpt due 22/04/2019]
/ASSOCIATED MAIL RECEIVED View All |  Compose Case Mail |
AIG_SG (10/06/2019); Re: confllcting DOA
AIG_S5G (13/05/2019); conflicting DOA

AIG_SG (11/04/2015): Conflicting DDA
« AIG_SG(11/047201%9): Mo Policy Found

[ALL ASSOCIATED TASKES view All | Search Tasus | Cremte new Task | _compete |

Due Date  Priority Type  Task Group Subject  Handler Assigned By Completed On Created On Done?
| N results

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=dsp_... 27/6/2019



Merimen e-Claims Page 1 of 2
Claim Documents
*SLP7908B (09688312535G)
[SLF3913Y]
™
LEONG LAI PENG
Apr 3 2001 6:00PM
[HOW TI HWE1]
Sin Hwee Motor Pte Ltd
upioed Oocuments | Upioad Protes |  Compose dew Letter | Upioad video | _upload Audio_| View [View in Browser | v
\Letters/Correspondences - 1 per page E[' “
(o[ Finalized On LKM Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) Thumbnail | Print
1 l(oram) Third Party Express Settlement - Payment Breakdown O e
PTnG-um-un Yperpage v M
No |Relabel/Recrder | LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) Thumbrail | Print
1030619 17129 | Genaral View 0D s | A
2 03/06/1917:29 | General View 0 | Lasws | A
3 0306/1917:29 | General View O | Laaws | &
4 |03/D6/19 1729 | General View © | taws | A
s |03/06/19 17:29 | Genersl View O iwowrs | &
E | DI/D6/1917:29 | General View O eaws | A
7 0W06/1917:29 | General View D | wiws | A
§ 03/06/1917:29  General View 0 | =dirs |
8 |D3/D6/19 17:29 Genaral View D | iowsws | A
10 |03/06/19 17:29 General View B ladws | 4
1L (03/06/19 17:29 | General View 0 | ilsdws | A
12 030619 17:29 | Genersl View Q| waows | A
13 |03/06/19 17:29 | General View O | weows | B
14 |03/06/19 17:20 | Ganeral View 0D itesws | 4
1S |oypipeanie | @sneet View 1 @ | Lexs |6
16 |03/D6/19 17:29 | Genersl View 0 v || FA
17 |03/06/19 17:29 | Genaral View 0 iLwdws | (A
18 03/06/19 17129 | Genaral View 0 | aaws | A
19 030619 17:29 | General View © | laaws | B
10 |03/06/19 17:20 | Genersl View O | aws | A
21 |03/D6S19 17:29 General View 0 | loades | A
22 |03/06/19 17129 | Ganeral View O | Ladws | B
23 |03/06/19 17:20 | General View 0 =dws | H
24 |03/06/19 17:29 | General View 0| Ladiec | (A
25 |03/06/19 17129 | General View D | Lwiws | A
6 |0306/19 17:29 | Genaral View 0 | Lmdies | 4
27 03/06/19 1729 | General View O | wacws | 4
28 |0306/19 17:30 | Reinspection Photo 0 | Ladws | & |
29 03/06/1% 17:30 | Reinspection Phote 0| =iws | A
30 |03/06/19 17:30 | Reinspection Photo D | aaws | A
a1 |03/06/19 17:30 | Reinspection Photo 0| wwaws | A
12 |p3/06/19 17:30 | Reinspection Phata 0D | teades | A
13 |03/06/19 17:30 | Reinspection Phota 0| tcadrs | A
M| 00619 17:30 Relnspaction Phaoto 0 | Losdirs

https://singapore. merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRdoc&fuseaction=dsp_doc... 27/6/2019



Merimen e-Claims

Page 2 of 2

il.-‘lhrl.f Correspondences 1 per page ¥, |
{No | Finaized On LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) Thumbnail| Print
i)
'35 |0306/1917:30 | Reinspection Photo © | taws | B2
36 |D3/06/19 17:30 | Reinspection Photo 0 Ladwes | (A
37 |03/06/19 17:30 | Reinspection Phote 0! teatrs | A
38 |03/06/19 17:30 | Reinspection Photo 0| adws | A
139 |03/06/19 17:30 | Reinspection Photo 0 | tcgws | A
|40 |D3/06/19 17130 Reinspection Photo 0| tadies | A
|41 01/06/19 1730 | Relnspection Phote 0| tcads | A
42 03/06/19 1730 Reinspection Photo ©  acws |
jr_u_u |03/06/19 17:30 | Reinspection Photo O | trs o
44| 006/19 1730 | Reinspection Photo 0 | o | A
45 03/08/1917:30 | Reinspection Photo O | acwes A
46 |03/06/19 17:30 Reinspection Photo D | waaws | A
47 | 03/06/19 17:30 Reinspection Photo D | eadws | 4
(48 03/06/1917:30 | Relnspection Photo 0 | oazwc | A
| Dacumentation 1 per page | & |
o Relsbel/Reorder | LKK Auto Consultants Ple Ltd (HQ) Thumbnall| Print|
1 13/04/1% 14:22 | TP GIA REPORT 0 | Loadpo
2 |03/06/19 17:37 | TP ESTIMATE © | toagror |
3 |07/08/1911:30  |LETTERTO OI 0 | osaroF
4 |27/06/13 0B:55 | WORKSHOP INVOICE Load POF
|5 [27/06/1% 08:58 | AUTHORISATION TO ACT FORM Load POF
& | 27/D6/19 DB:59 Release Voucher Lbad PDF
7 |22/06/19 08:55 | LTA SEARCH 0 | LoadroF
No | Finalized On AIG Asla Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd. (5G) Thumbaall | Print
1 [13/04/19 13:42 | O GIA REPORT [ TG ]
Documents Checklist
| DOCUMENTS CHECKLIST Reset | save | erm |
| Thare are no document checkists configured,
Our Checklist Remarks - LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid [HGQ)
L]
W
Show Remarks To: L Handling Insurer
Nite Aswidcsi a8 vlle uiisss pou show 4 o other parbes.
https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRdoc&fuseaction=dsp_doc... 27/6/2019
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Preview
NOTE: TO BE COMPLETED BY SURVEYOR TEAM
THIRD PARTY EXPRESS SETTLEMENT
(PAYMENT BREAKDOWN)
|Vuhl=llr No: SLF3913Y (Insd veh) Model: FORTE K3 1.6 [A)
SLPT90B (TP veh)
| Date of Accident: |03/04/2001
Global Sum Settlement | - | [X] Yes | [ 1 No
Repair Estimate $ 5,428 28
Final Repair Cosl - 3.910.00
Loss of Use - 6.00 days at 580,00 per day
Rental (if any) s days
LTA / GIA Search Fee $
Others: 5
$
Final Settlement Sum (Global Sum) 3 3.910.00

Is Third Party Workshop GIA Registered? [ 1 ¥YES [X ] NO (Kindyndicate
below)

A} For Non GlA Registered Workshop: Agreed Liability 100 (%)
BOLA Applicable: Yes/ No BOLA Scenario No:

B) For GIA Registered Workshop:

BOLA Liability: (%) Assessed Liability (*): 0 (%)

* Assessed Liability to be filled only for chain collisions and for cases wherse BOLA does nol apply.
Remarks

Payment Instruction: Payee's Breakdown

1) | Sin Hwee Motor Pie Lid - 3.910.00
2) 5
3) $
27 Jun
JOANNE LEE KHANG MIN .ﬂ
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid Date

Please attach all the supporting documents to the form.
(Final Repair Bill; Rental Invoice; Release Voucher; Authorisation to Act; Survey Report; Medical
Report/ BIIl (if any)
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd coreg e 1sse07198m

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubl Industrial Park
Singapore 408833
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Tel: 6256-3561 Fax: 6844-B805 Email: sur@lkkauto com;assignments@|kkauto.com

VEHICLE DAMAGE INSPECTION REPORT

Our File No: CCB/AIG18008420/AFA30Q2

Date: 27/068/2019
REFERENCE
Handling Insurer: AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Ple. Lid.  Paolicy No:
Dlsiment Vanicls s1.p7e08 Insured Vehicle No :  SLF3913Y
Date of Loss 03/Darz001 Mature of Claim: TP Claim No: 0868831253506
DESCRIFTION & IDENTIFICATION OF Hi
Reg No: SLPTI0B
Make & Model: KIA FORTE K3, 1.8 (A) Engine No: G4FGGHAS4800
Reg. Dale: 25/052017 (Man, Year: 2018) Chassis No; KNAFX411MH5676364
Colour. Black Odometer: 21274 km
Engine Capacity. 1581 cc
Market Value/New Car Price: N/&
Sum Insured (S5): Markel Value/New Car Price
ITION OF I T THE T F Y
General Condition: Steering (Serviceable); Yes Footbrake (Serviceable), Yes
Handbrake (Serviceable). Yes Engine Modification No  Pre-accident Condition:
CONDITION OF TYRES
Front Tyre Size: 205/55 R16 Rear Tyre Size: 205/55 R16
Front Left Side: Nexen 6 mm Rear Left Side Nexen 6 mm
Front Right Side: Nexen 6 mm Rear Right Side: Nexen 6 mm
The abowe valbes regresant Me remaining e reads depih
COST OF CLAIMS Repairer's Adjuster's Difference  Diff %/
Parts 3,088.28 2,808.98 188.30 6.13
Miscellaneous ltems 0.00 0.00 0.00
Labaour 2,340.00 1.580.00 780.00 32.48
Faintwork Labour 0.00 0.00 0.00
Towing 0.00 0.00 0.00
Calculated Gross Total (S5) 5428.28 4.478.98 84930 17.48
Approved Total (Overridden) (S§) 3,550.00
Nett Amount (SS) 5428.28 3,550.00 1,878.28 3480
+ Loss of Use (6.0 x $§60.00/day) (55) 360.00
+ Docl/Search Fea (S5) 745
Nett Liability (S5) 3,917.45
Global Sum Settlement (S§) 3,910.00
INSPECTION
Date of Assignment: 08/042019
Data Inspected: 08/04/2018  Inspected At Sin Hwee Motor Pte Lid (HO)
Blk 3023A, Ubi Road 1, #01-59
Singapore 408717
Eslimated Period of Repair: 5.0 days
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Adjuster;: ADRIAN LING Manager: Chong Poh Kin

NOTE: This repart represents our fingings af fhe iime and place of inspachon steted heven, Such nspaction fiss beon carmod 0wl fo the st of our
knosvincioe and abiity bt any ather lahilly under any olhar cireumafances is hevedy sxpressly axciuded.
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Adjuster Report

REPAIR DETAILS

Recommended Parts

Page 3 of 4

No. Qty Part No. Particulars Condition Repairer's Amount
1 1 *REAR BUMPER Deformed TEE 4T FL *768.47 FL
2 1 ‘REAR BUMPER LOWER GARNISH Deformed 387 12FL *387.12FL
3 1 *REINFORCEMENT Cracked 358.31FL *358.311FL
4 1 *END PANEL Dented 348 B4 FL *348.B4 FL
5 1 *END PANEL TOP GARNISH Deformed BT28FL *BT.29FL
B 1 *WEATHER STRIP Mot Necessary 121 44 FL *-FL
7 1 *BOOTLID Buckled S74 B4FL *G74 B4 FL
B 1 *CERATO LOGO Mecessary 35.74FL *35.7T4FL
8 1 *KIA LOGO MNecessary 3756 FL *37 56 FL
0 1 *SET REVERSE SENSOR Damaged 280.00FS “200.00F3
F=Franchize part S=5SpcNeatt L=LsitemDisc
Sub Total (S5) 3,400.31 3,198.87
- List Item Discount on L Items 10.00/10.00% (5%} 31203 289,89
Total Parts (58} 3,088.28 2,898.98
Report was unsubmitied during this print-out. |
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Recommended Miscellaneous ltems
There are no new miscellaneous ltems selected.

Recommended Labour

No Particulars Lab.Type Repairer's Amount
Labour ltems
1 TO SUPPLY FITTING AND INSTALL REVERSE SENSOR New 60.00 40.00
2 TO REPLACE END PANEL INCLUDE KNOCKING AND MNew 950.00 B00.00
WELDING TO INSTALL AND ALIGN AFFECTED PARTS TO
SYSMETRICAL SPEC
3 TRANSFER BOOTLID MECHANISMS ,TRIMS AND FITTINGS MNew 150.00 0.00
TO NEW BOOTLID
4 TO REMOVE AND REFILX INNER TRIMS AND BOARDS TO New 150.00 50.00
FACILITATE REPAIR WORK
5 TO SPRAY PAINT END PANEL,REAR BUMPER AND BOOTLID New 850.00 600.00
g TO SUPPLY AND TUFF KOTE AFFECTED PARTS Mew 80.00 60.00
7 TO CARRY OUT WIRE CHECKING New 100.00 30.00
Gross Labour Cost (5§) 2,340.00 1.580.00

Report was unsubmitted during this print-out

< END OF ESTIMATES >
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