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W ALAERAFTRAE ¢ -
k SIN YEW HUP AUTO PTE LTD

353M, Woodlands Road, Yew Tes Industrial Estate, Singapore 67798)
Tol: 6760 OHIS  Faoc 6769 0221  Emall: syhaplSsngnetoom sg

€ /GET Ragn, Mo, 0OSIIEPSE  Specusibes in Lrsyrerce Claims and Geners Motor Repisls Wiork

10 AFR 2019

THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Third Party Vehicle No : SLA 3330 E
Date of Accident : 11/03/2019

M/S SLS 518 PTE LTD
C/o 393M Woodlands Road
Yew Tee Industrial Estate
Singapore 677981
COST OF REPAIR TO TOYATA HIACE : PC 7608 X
A) Chassis No : JTFHT02P400033305 B8) Date of Registration : 05/11/2008
S/No. Pc/s Item(s) :- A
0L 1 rear fender RH 1,670.00 -
02 1 wheel hubcap 185.00~€
03. 1 rear bumper 415.00 «-C -
2,270.00
Less 25% discount :- 567.50
1,702.50
Special Nett(s) :- =
04, 1 inner seal 40.00 jj
0s. 2 sealant B0.0D “
D6. 1 private bus sticker 20,00 asr —
1,892.50
Labour Charges ;
a) To dismantle all damaged parts, cut/weld rear fender RH and re-align, check, Lou
adjust and replace the above parts 1,000.00
b)  To putty and spray paint rear bumper, step garnish and all affected portions 600,00 %
c) To remove and refit rear fender glass RH 200.00 "
d) To check alignment 80.00 ——
e) To remove and refit trims and upholstery 12000 £ ©
3,822.50
GST (7%) :- 267.58

4,090.08

Consultants hifte ng
the Repairar of fhe 1y

- T: ", [

fedllnenng

’-*E:?MQ z};M 4 Total -




Asher Sna !LH.HAU!:I}

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuUto)
Sent: Thursday, 11 April 2012 3:11 PM
To: Sin Yew Hup Autoc Pre Ltd
Subject: RE: PCT608X
WITHOUT PREJUDICE

SAVEASTO COSTS

Hi Sir/Mdm,

We refer to the above matter.

Please be informed that basing on the accident statements submitted by both parties, the liability is clear / under BOLA
|subject to BOLA guideline settlement) and shall proceed with direct settlement for the above mentioned case,

Please note that this e-mail is on without prejudice basis which does not amount to an authorisation of repair to your
client's vehicle.

The final repair cost is subjected to the consistency of the damages according to the nature of the accident. And the
days of LOU/ LOR will base on the number of days of repair as recommended by our surveyor.

Kindly take note that the case handler in-charge is Asher and she can be contacted at her DID 6841 6051

In order to expedite the claim process, please forward all relevant documents to us (LKK) to proceed on negatiate
settlement.

Thank You

Baif Regorch
Asher Sng | Cote Handjer
LKK Ao Consultants Ple Uid

phone: 6841-6031 | emol géhenng@ikkguto com | fox 47414108
Bl 51. Poya Ubl Industial Pork. Uik Avence 1 #02-75 | 5[408733)

From: Sin Yew Hup Auto Pte Ltd <sinyewhup@gmall.com>
Sent: Thursday, 11 April 2019 2:53 PM

To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@Ikkauto.com>
Subject: PC7608X

Hi Asher,

Attached pls find the accident report of PC7608X,

Best Regards,



Edwin Yap
SIN YEW HUP AUTO PTE LTD

T : +65 67600819
F:+65 67690221

@ Virus-free. www.avg.com



6 Raffles Quay W1B8-00 Singzpore DAB58D

Tid (65) 6224 0010 Faw [65) 6224 0030

Opersting Hours | Monday 1o Friday, 09:00 - 17:00
RECORLS MANAGEMENT CENTHE VEN: S66550020G [ G5T Rmg. Mo, MA0DD1 7733

GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE
IN
ANBOCIATION

IMPORTANT NOTE: Please submitthe completed Addendum form to the same Authorised Reporting Centre
with whom you submitted the Original Report.

ADDENDUM

{A) PARTICULARS OF PERSON MAKING THEAMENDMENTS:

Original ReportNo : MBM118033435 Vehicle Registration No: SLA3330E

Nameas shownin NRIC) : LOW CHOON FONG NRIC/FIN/Passport No : ST8E6103H

(*Vehicle Driver / Vehicle Owner) (*) Please delete as appropriate

Address ; BLK 38 JALAN RUMAH TINGGI #10-250 Singapore| 150038 )
Contact (Tel) 2 Mobhile No. : 92302887

Email Address

Date of Accident  : 11/03/2018 Time of Accident : 11:15

Place of Accident ;960 OLD CHOA CHU KANG ROAD

Insurance Company: AlG ASIA PACIFIC INSURANCE PTE. LTD.

(8) ADDITIONALINFORMATION /AMENDMENTS:

| have made a report on the above mentioned accident and would like to include additional information or
make the following amendments:

DATE OF ACCIDENT SHOULD BE 11.03.2018

Policyhol der'.f Driver's Signature Reporting Centre Personnel's Signature
Date: Name:
NRIC/FIN No.;

Date:



A ARERAR R A
SIN YEW HUP AUTO PTE LTD

393M, Woodlands Road, Yew Tee Industrial Estate, 677361
Tel: 6760 0815  Fax: 6769 0221  Emall: syhapl@singnet com.sg

[

Co,/GET Regn. W, 2008210730 Spaciallss in Insurance Claims and General Motor Repair Wark

Your Ref: SLA3330E
Our Ref: PC7608X%

10 MAY 2019

AIG ASIA PACIFIC INSURANCE PTE LTD
78 SHENTON WAY

#07-16 AIG BUILDING

SINGAPORE 079120

Dear Sir/Mdm

ACCIDENT INVOLVING: PC7608X and SLA3330E
AT/ALONG 960 OLD CHOA CHU KANG ROAD ON 11/03/2019

We are the repairer of vehicle no PC7E08X that was involved in the above-mentioned accident.

We are instructed that on 11 MARCH 2019, the driver of your insured motor vehicle no, SLA3330F
did so negligently drove, managed and controlled the said motor vehicle that he caused or permitted
the same to collide into our client’s mator vehicle no.PC7608X.

To enable you to expedite this matter, we herewith forward the following support documents for
your kind consideration;

A) Invoice: 06932 B) Letter of Authority
C) Search Fees (GIA Ref: GR-19-038794 & GR-19-039826)

QOur Claim is quantified as follows:

1) Cost of Repairs $2,621.50 (inclusive 7% GST)
2) Loss of Use (6 working days plus 1 Sunday @ $180 per day) $1,260.00
3) Search Fees S 16.00

53,897.50

EEETEewee

Kindly let us have your settlement as soon as possible. Thank you very much.

Yours sincerely

i
Jgsephine Teo



Asher Sn uto

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 11 April 2019 3:16 PM

To: SHANICELOW®@SLA.COM.SG

Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLA 3330E AND PC 7608X ON 12/03/2019
Our Rel: CCHAIG19006415/cad

11 APRIL 2019

LEE KAH BING / LOW CHOON FONG

Dear Sit/Madam,
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLA 3330E AND PC 7608X ON 12032019

We refer to the above nccident where we are acting for AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Ple Lid to resolve the claim
against you andfor your authorized driver under the Auto Insurance policy taken up with them.

Based on the accident report and accident scenario, liability is down against us. We will therefore proceed 1o
negotiate for an amicable settlement with the Third Panty.

Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and settlement, please contact
us within 10 days from the date of this letter.

Please note that your No-Claim Discount (NCD)(if any) will be affected and reduced by 30% (20% for
commercial vehicles) upon next renewal due to this Third Party claim. However, if your policy has a NCD
protector feature, it will be deemed utilized for this claim and your NCD will be protected.

Please call us if you have further queries.

Yours faithfully,

Asher

Case Handler

DID: 6841 6051

FAX: 6741 4108

Email: Ashersng @lkkauto.com

c.c.  AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Pre Lid
{Motor Claims Dept)



LETTER OF AUTHORITY
THIRD PARTY MOTOR CLAI
e N a8 518 e LD
NRIC No. J0120285bH of 5 Mondan Esiale 4 06-68 |nwvten
Yow Singapore ( 29930 )

owner of Vehicle No. __PCTF60%h Insured by
chind ‘lﬂ]iﬁng nfurtng Pe & under Policy No.

D 3N B0b12IFO0  do hersby authorise 11 Yew Hup Aufo PR HT .

of 393M , ~itdlands road , yew L Indusiria| Estadt -

Singapore ( 6 T19¢| ) to act as myfour representative in my/our claim against the

ownsr({s)/driver(s) of Vehicle No(s). __ StA 3330&

In respect of an accident occurred at/along __ BLK k0 old chia chu s
rpad on /03] 2019

l/We also hereby authorise the myfour represantative to sattle my/our above-mentioned
claim in a manner that they deem fit and the reprasentative Is further authorise to receive
payment further to settlement of my/our claim with paymant cheque/s being made In
favourof __Sin_ Hew Hup pufo PR tH

And /We further indemnify myfour above-mentioned representative against all claims
and/or damages which may arise from all action taken for and on my/our behalf.

in the event if the damage claim to my/our vehicle Is ssitled dirsctly between
myselifourselves and the owner/driver and/or with the 3™ pariy's insurers whether
be it known or unknown to my/our repairars, /We will personally be hald liable

and responsible for the full cost of repair, rental charaes, survey fees, un-insursd

losses (Excess &/ Loss of use) and other Incidental charges incurred by my/our

repairers and /We undertaka to pay the same to them personally,

I'We the owner of Vehicle Registration No.  PC 08X affirm the

above-said statement balow.,

Date:__11 /03] 20/3 Signature : _
o mmmﬁ,ﬂppfkﬂm-j



RELEASE VOUCHER
(AIG Asia Pacific - Express Third Party Claim)

*We/l, SIN YEW HUP AUTO PTE LTD (“the workshop™) hereby confirm that we/T have reached
an agreement with the sppointed surveyor of AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Lid LKK AUTO
CONSULTANTS PTE LTD (name of surveyor) with respect to the amount claimed for §52,621.50
(Repair Cost), §5700.00 (Loss of Use/Restal), $316.00 (Disbursement) for vehicle no. PC 7608X
that was damaged pursuant to the accident which occurred on 11/03/2019 (date) along BLK 960
OLD CHOA CHU KANG ROAD (location) involving vehicle no/s SLA 3330E.

This is pursuant to the inspection conducted on 11/04/2019 (date) at “the workshop™.

We/1 confirm that we/l arefam nuthorized by the owner SLS 518 PTE LTD (“the third party
claimant™) of vehicle no. PC 7608X make the cluim us set out in the above paragraph and we/l have
full authority to settle the matter on his’her behalf in a manner that we/l deem fit. We/l enclose herein
the letter of authority given by “the third party claimant”.

We/l further confirm that we/l will indemnify AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Pie Lid For all damages,
loss and/or expense that they will or have already incurred in the event that “the third party claimant”
after the above said agreement lodges a further claim against the former for any loss and expenses
sulfered pertaining to costs of repairs andlor rental andfor loss of use pursuant Lo the damage (o PC
7608X (vehicle no.) as a result of the accident.

We/l confirm that the agreement reached above is in full and final settlement of any claim of “the
third party claimant™ pursuant to the accident and that further this settlement is reached on a without
prejudice and without admission of Lability basis,

This agreement is subject to the application of Singapore law and the Singapore Courts have

exclusive jurisdiction over any dispute ansing out of the same.

Dated this __2F__ (day) of _JUNE  (month) 201 (year

[ [ LKK _ m
Signed hi@]ﬂ surveyor Signed by “the w&hap" {with chop)




SIN YEW HUP AUTO FTE LTD
393M WOODLANDS ROAD,

YEW TEE INDUSTRIAL ESTATE
SINGAPORE 877981
syhapl@singnel.com.sg

GST Regietration No. : 200821075G

G FEIT ey Mw JERR2IGFIE

Tax Invoice 06932

INVQICETO
AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte.
Lid.
78 Shenton Way #07-16,
Singapora 078120
DATE ACTIVITY
11/03/2018 BEING COST OF REPAIRS FOR

PC7608X (TCYOTA HIACE AUTO 3.0L)

Plzass cross your cheque end makie it payabls o "SIN YEW HUP AUTO PTE LTD.'

aTry RATE AMOUNT

1 245000 2,450.00

SUBTOTAL 2,450.00
GST TOTAL 171,50
TOTAL 2,621.50
TOTAL DUE S$2,621.50
THANK YOU.



12/0372018 Irvaice

GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE
GENERAL RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE

6 Raffles Quay #16-00, Singapora 048580
INSURANCE Phone: +65 6224 0010 Fax: +65 6224 0030
ASSOCIATION Operating Hours: Manday to Friday Sam to S5pm
GST Reglstration No: M400017735

RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE
TAX INVOICE

QOur Ref No: GR-18-038794
Data of Reguest: 12/003/2019 Your Ref No: Online Purchase
Sin Yew Hup Auto Pia Lid
Blk D4 Woodlands Road 393M
Yow Tea Industirial Estala
Singapore 677981
Dear SirfMadam,
Enquiry Date 12/0372019
Enquiry By Edwin Yap Kiat Beng
TP Vehicle No, SLA3330E
Accidan! Data 11/03r12018
DESCRIPTION AMOUNT (S§)
TP Insurer Enquiry 1.87
GST Amounl D.13
Total Amouni Due (GST Inclusive) 2.00
Thank You.

This is a computer generated document and requires no signatura.

For GIARMC CfMcial usa:
Data;
[¥] GIRO [] Cash [ | Cheque

hitps:/isingapore medmen.comclaimsiindax.cfm Hussbox=MTRsas&fussaction=dsp_genimip&refid=20824658CFID=406403868CFTOKEN=254... 2/2



GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE
GENEML RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE
& Raffles Quay #18-00, Singapore 048580
INSURANCE Frone: +65 6224 0010 Fax: +65 6224 0030
ASSOCIATION Operating Hours: Monday o Friday 9am to Spm
GST Registration No: M400017735

RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE
TAX INVOICE

Qur Ref No: GR-19-039826
Date of Requast: 13/03/2019 Your Rel No: GR-19-038794
Sin Yew Hup Auto Pta Lid
Bik D4 Wocdlands Road 393M
Yew Tee Industrial Estate
Singapors 677981
Daar SiriMadam,
Dale of Accident: 121032019
Vehicls No: SLA330E

Place of Accldent: 860 OLD CHOA CHU KANG ROAD

Whhmhmmmmﬁmﬂmhhnmﬂunlmm.whmm:h-duuiulhwllguuddurRmpmum uested:

DOCUMENTS IACCIDENT LOCATION PER DOC (S§) aTy |AMOUNT (5%)

SLA3330E 960 OLD CHOA CHU KANG ROAD 14.00/1 13.08
GST Amount 0.82
Total Amount Due (GST Inclusiva) 14.00

The images provided to you are taken from the original reparts forwarded lo the centre by the members of the General Insuranca

Association of Singapore and we take no responsibility for their accuracy or contants and shall be under no liability whatsoever for any

loss or damage arising out of or in connection with the reports or their images.
Thank You.

This is 8 computer generated document and requires no signalure.

For GIARMC Official usa:
Date:
[X] GIRO [ ] Cash [ | Cheque
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*PC7608X (32764709575G)
[SLA3330E]
™

M/S S5LS 518 PTE LTD
Mar 11 2019 12:00AM
[LEE KAH BING]

Sin Yew Hup Auto Pte Ltd
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Preview

MOTE: TO BE COMPLETED BY SURVEYOR

Page | of 1

THIRD PARTY EXPRESS SETTLEMENT

(PAYMENT BREAKDOWN)
| Vehicle No: SLA3330E (Insd veh) Model: TOYOTA HIACE 3.0 (A)
PCT7608X (TP veh)
| Date of Accident: |11/03/2019

Global Sum Settiement || [ | Yes | [X] No
Repair Estimate -1 4 090.08
Final Repair Cosi - 262150
Loss of Use s 700.00 7.00 days at $100.00 per day
Rental (if any) - 0.00 days
LTA / GIA Search Fee -1 16.00
Othars: 5 0.00
-
Final Settlement Sum -1 333750

balow)

Is Third Party Workshop GIA Registered?

[

1 YES [ X]

NO (Kindly indicate

A) For Non GIA Registered Workshop:

B) For GIA Registered Workshop:

Agreed Liability

100 (%e)

BOLA Liability:
* Assessed Liabilily o be filled only for chain collisions and far cases where BOLA does not apply.

(%)

BOLA Applicable: Yes/ No BOLA Scenario Na:

Assessed Liability (*): (%)

Remarks

Payment Instruction: Payee's Breakdown

1) |Sin Yew Hup Auto Pte Lid . 3,337.50
2) ]
3) ‘5

JOANNE LEE KHANG MIN

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

01 Jul
2018

Date

Please attach all the supporting documents to the form.
(Final Repair Bill; Rental Involce; Releasa Voucher; Authorisation to Act; Survey Report; Medical

Report! Bill (if any)

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=SVCdoc& fuseaction=dsp_docltr...

1/7/2019



Adjuster Report

Page 1 of 4

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (co reg no 1sss0r1sem)

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubl Industrial Park
Singapone 408933
Tel 6256-3561 Fax: 6844-B805 Emaill sur@lkkauto.com assignments@ikkauto. com

VEHICLE DAMAGE INSPECTION REPORT

Our File No: CC4/AIG12006415T1EA3Q2
Date: 01/07/2019

REFERENCE

Handling Insurer: AIG Asia Pacific insurance Ple_ Lid.  Palicy No: 2100448458

Ciaimant Vehlcle po7s08x Insured Vahicle No : SLA3330E

Date of Loss: 11/032019 Mature of Clam; TP Claim No; 327647095756

| ICA F

Reg No: PCTE08X

Make & Modal: TOYOTA HIACE. 3.0 (A) Engine No: 1KD1855430

Reg. Date: 05M11/2008 (Man. Year: 2008) Chassis No: JTFHTO2P400033305

Colour: Silver Odometer: 213681 km

Engine Capacity: 2082 ec

Market Valus/New Car Price; N/A

Sum Insured (S5 Market Value/New Car Price

CONDITION OF VEHICLE AT THE TIME OF SURVEY

General Condifion: Steering (Serviceabla): Yes Foolbrake (Serviceable): Yes
Handbrake (Serviceabla): Yas Engine Modification: No  Pre-accident Condilion:
CONDITION OF TYRES
Front Tyre Siza: 195 R15 Rear Tyre Size: 195 R15
Front Left Side Bridgestone 6 mm Rear Left Side: Bridgestone & mm
Front Right Side Bridgesione B mm Rear Right Side: Bridgestone 6 mm
The above valses ragvesen! the remaining (e treads depth
COSTOFCLAIMS Repairer's  Adjuster's  Difference  DIff %
Pars 1,842 50 1.842.50 0.00 0.00
Miscellan=ous [tlems 0.00 0.00 0.00
Labour 1,880.00 1.220.00 760.00 38.38
Paintwork Labour 0.00 0.00 0.00
Towing 0.00 0.00 0.00
Calculated Gross Total (S§) 3,822.50 3,062.50 760.00 19.88
Approved Total (Overridden) [S5) 2,450.00
(S%) 3.822 50 2.450.00 137250 350
+ GST 7.00/7.00% (S5) 267.58 171.50 95.08 35.91
Nett Amount (5§) 4,090.08 2,621.50 1,468.58 aso
+ Loss of Use (7.0 x 5$100.00/day) (S$) 700.00
+ Doc/Search Fee (S§) 16.00
Nett Liability (S§) 3,337.50
INSPECTION
Date of Assignment: 10/04/20189
Dale Inspected! 11/04/2019 Inspecied Al: Sin Yew Hup Auto Ple Lid (HQ)

Blk D4 Woodlands Road 363M, Yew Tea

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm7fusebox=MTRadjuster& fuseaction=gen_p... 1/7/2019



Adjuster Report Page 2 of 4

Industrial Estate
Singapore 877981
Estimated Period of Repair: 6.0 days
Adjuster: MOHD TAUFIKH BIN HAMID Manager: Asher Sng Rong Yi

NOTE: This reporf represents owr findings af the fvme and place of mapection stated hovem. Such mspection has been camed outf (0 the bast of oar
kncwiedge and abiity but any other labiily under any other circumatances iy heraby sxpressly sxchuded.
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Adjuster Report Page 3 of 4
REPAIR DETAILS
Recommended Parts
No. Qty Part No. Particulars Condition Repairer's Amount
1 1 *REAR FENDER RH Benl 1.670.00FL *1.670.00FL
2 1 "WHEEL HUB CAP Cun 185.00 FL *185.00 FL
3 1 *REAR BUMPER Cut 41500 FL *415.00FL
4 1 *INNER SEAL Necessary 40.00FS *40.00FS
5 2 *SEALANT Necessary 80.00FS *80.00FS
6 1 *PRIVATE BUS STICKER Necessary 20.00FS *20.00FS
F=Franchisa part S=SpcNetl L=ListiemDisc
Sub Total (S§) 2,410.00 2,410.00
- List tem Discount on L ltems 25.00/25.00% (5%) 567 50 567.50
Total Parts (S§) 1,842.50 1,842.50

Report was unsubmitted during this print-out.
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Adjuster Report

Recommended Miscellaneous Items
There are no new miscellaneous ilems selected.

Recommended Labour

Page 4 of 4

No Particulars Lab.Type Repairer's Amount
Labour ltems
1 TO DISMANTLE ALL DAMAGED PARTS ,CUT /IWELD REAR New 1,000.00 600.00
FENDER RH AND RE-ALIGN .CHECK,ADJUST AND REPLACE
THE ABOVE PARTS
2 TO PUTTY AND SPRAY PAINT REAR BUMPER ,STEP New 800.00 400.00
GARNISH AND ALL AFFECTED PORTIONS
3 TO REMOVE AND REFIT REAR FENDER GLASS RH New 200.00 100.00
4 TO CHECK ALIGNMENT New 60.00 60.00
5 TO REMOVE AND REFTI TRIMS AND UPHOLSTERY New 120.00 80.00
Gross Labour Cost (S§) 1,980.00 1.220.00

Report was unsubmilted during this print-out.

< END OF ESTIMATES >
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