Déar Asher ,

Enclosed is the invoice & LOA .
As request following :

1. RC $ 4100 ( AS AGREED )
2. Lossofuse $560 (%80 - new car x 7 days - 5 days recommend + 1 day waiting PRS + 1 day weekend )
@ 100% ( direct from behind )

Total S 4660/-.

Please let us have your offer soon . Thanks

Regards,

Chris Chan Pick Yuen
HO BENG TRADING
HP: 92712214

From: Shu Pe| (LKKAuto) <shupei@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Wednesday, April 10, 2019 5:16 PM

To: chris_chanbebe@hotmail.com <chris chanbebe@hotmail.com>

Cc: assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a(@|kkauto.com>; Asher Sng (LKKAuto)
<AsherSng@lkkauto.com>

Subject: FW: Report SMG7755T DOA 03.04.219

Dear Chris,

We refer to the below email.

Please be informed that we are currently pending for our insured’s report.

Kindly note that for liability, claim negotiation and settlement, please contact Asher at 6841 6051.
Our respective case handler will look into the matter and revert to you in due course.

Thank you

To check availability of the case handler , you may contact the undersigned.

Best Regards,

Shu Pel| Admin
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Phone: 6366-00%5 | email: shupei@ikkauto.com | tax; 6741-2108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubl Avenue 1, #02-25 | ${408933)

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)
Sent: Wednesday, 10 April 2019 8:12 AM



To: ShuPei (LKKAuto) <shupei@lkkauto.com>
SI.IEIH'I FW: Report SMG77557 DOA 03.04.219

‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE”
SAVEAS TO COSTS

Dear Sir / Madam,

To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned.

Thank you,

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 o055 | emall: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com | fax: 67414108
Bk 51, Paya Ubi Industrinl Park, Ubi Avenoe 5, #02-25 | S{408933)

From: chan pick yuen <chris chanbebe@hotmail.com>
Sent: Tuesday, 9 April, 2019 9:47 PM

To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Melkwan@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: assignments <assignments@|kkauto.com>

Subject: Fw: Report SMG7755T DOA 03.04.219

Dear Sir / Mdm ,
Claim -AIG

Enclosed is our client's GIA , estimate .
Please advise your OIC , CLAIM NO, liability .
Please pass to Mr Adrian . Thanks

Regards,

Chris Chan Pick Yuen
HO BENG TRADING
HP: 92712214
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Asher Sng {LKKAutul

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 15 April 2019 2:29 PM

To: BOONSPOH@GMAIL.COM

Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SIT 303C AND SMG 77557 ON 03/04/2019

Our Rel: CCO/AIG19006401/Aeh3

15 APRIL 2019

BOON SENG POH

Dear SirMadam,
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SJT 303C AND SMG 7755T ON 03/04/2019

We refer to the above accident where we are acting for AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Lid to resolve the claim
against you and/or your authorized driver under the Auto Insurance policy tuken up with them.

Based on the accident report and accident scenario, liability is down against us. We will therefore proceed to
negotiate for an amicable settlement with the Third Party

Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and settlement, please contact
us within 10 days from the date of this letter.

Please note that your No-Claim Discoum (NCD)(if any) will be affected and reduced by 30% (20% for
commercial vehicles) upon next renewal due to this Third Party claim. However, if your policy has a NCD
protector feature, it will be deemed utilized for this claim and your NCD will be protected.

Please call us if you have further queries.

Yours faithfully,

Asher

Case Handler
DID: 6841 6051
FAX: 6741 4108

Email: Ashersng @ lkkauto.com

C.C AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Pre Lid
(Motor Claims Depr)



LETTER OF AUTHORISATION

HO BENG TRADING
BLOCK 3020A UBI
ROAD | #01-33
SINGAPORE 408714

Diear Sir,

accenton__ 3| ¢ [ 19 @ (3:30hc S

Iuvolving Venicle Nas. =I71C] 1 733[_& SJ T 3d 3 C

ASY RIS oo~ 3

Along

| 'We.the registered owner ‘driver of veliicle registration no. > P P—J s

p—
_ > |
have involved m the shove sccident. ;

I/We hereby authorize M/S HO BENG TRADING to commence repairs of the said vehicle
Torthwith.

1/We agree 1o assign the whole proceeds of my ‘our comprehensive/third party claim 1o vou and our
soliciton Lo act on my/our behall in respect of the above
matter. And if applicable,my our solicitors shall accept this as my/our inrevocable suthority to pay
the amount as deemed compensated direct 10 you after deduction of their costs on 4 Solicitor and
chient basis

I'We undertake to co-operate fully with you and our solicitors w ensure that clam s successful.

U'We also nuthorize you 1o sign all discharge vouchers indemnity forms and sll necessary papers in
relation with the above claim in my/our shsence

Your kind co-operation i this maiter will be much appreciated
Thank you

Yours truly.

é WA
Owner's Signature
(Company's stump il applicable)

Name: _-.'fM !;!'
NRIC N0 G SETG9C0]

Date: ___ i ~Hpr - 2219
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Pacific - E s Third P >

“We'l, HO_BENG TRADING| “the workshop™) hereby  conlirm  that we'l have rneached an
agreement with the appomed surveyor ol AIG Asin Pacitic Inswrance e l1d LEK ALTO
MMM (name ©f surveyor| with respect o the amount clamed  for
S84, 100,001 Repair ©ost) SS360,00(1 0% of bse/Rental), — | Dnsbursement) for vehicle no SMG
7581 that Wi damiged pursuam i e sccidern which ogQurmed on 03704201 %dmic) along
PAS » M ilocation) involving vehicle nos STIMNC Thus s pursuant (o the inspection
conducied on B804/2019 (date) at “the workshop ™.

we'l confirm that we'l arefam authorized by the owner LU _LIN(the third party clanmant | ¢ I
vehicke no. SMG T7SST make the claim as set out in the above paragraph and we/l have full
sathority to settle the matter on hisher behall m i mannes thal we'l deem Fit. We/l enclose heremn
the letier of duthoniy given by “the third party’ claiman

W'l further conficm tha we'l will mdemnify AIG Asia Pacilic Insurance e Lid for all damages,
loss andior expense that they will or have glready incurred in the event that “the third pary
laimant” after the above said agreement lodges 4 further claim agoainst the former for any boas and
cxpenses suffored pertaning o cosls ol repairs and/or rental amd o loss of use pursuant (o the
damnize 1o SMG TISST (vehicle o) as 4 resuht of the secident

We'l confirm that the agreement reached above is in [ull and fingl serlement of any claim of the
thid party claimant  puesaant Lo ihe accident and (hat lurther this weitlement is reached on

without prejudice snd without admission of lbility lasia

his agreement s subject 0 The application of Singapore law and the Singapore Courts have
exclusive jurisdiction ower any dispute arsing ol of the sEme

{ T‘I t"! | | T
Daied thas (day ) of {maonth) 20 {vear)

= Y~ N
(L | e
Lu? L ¥ .Il + 74 .
Signed by nied surveyor P g y e workshop™ fwith chop)
‘ \J/
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HO BENG TRADING

Block 3020A Ubi Road | # 01-33 Singapore 408714
HP: 92712214

INVOICE

LU LIN Date: 10™ October 17
Blk 3020A #01-33

Ubi Road 1
Singapore 408714

Accident date: 03" APRIL 2019
Final Bill For Vehicle No: SMG7765T HONDA VEZEL

Descriptions

fLump Sum repair cost as recommended by
LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD
urveyor : Mr Adrian Ling

S/IDLRS: FOUR THOUSAND ONE HUNDRED ONLY

Fage 410



