Asher Snﬂ (LKKAuto)

From: ONG LI Ll <llong®@lonpac.com>

Sent: Friday, 12 July 2019 10:54 AM

To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

Cc: MT_Claim_5G

Subject: RE: [MANDATE REQUEST] Our Ref. 19/19/19/VP05/021650 [External General]
Follow Up Flag: Follow up

Flag Status: Completed

Lonpac External - General
Hi Asher

Please proceed if their proposal is reasonable.

Regards,
Ong Li LI
Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd
300 Beach Road #17-04/07 The Concourse Singapore 199555
Tel : (65) 6250 7388 Ext. 254 Fax: (65) 6296 2706

—— r

The all ¥%%0 lonpac.com.sg

Lonpac External - General data is for internal / external use.

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) [mailto:AsherSng@Ikkauto.com]

Sent: Thursday, 11 July, 2019 3:48 PM

To: ONG LI LI

Cc: MT_Claim_SG

Subject: RE: [MANDATE REQUEST] Our Ref: 19/19/19/VP05/021650 [External General]

Hi Lili,

We refer to the email below.

Third party rejected our offer and counter proposed G/S $1,270 (all in).

Kindly let us have your approval / instruction if any.

Thank You.

Besl Regords.
Asher Sng | Cose Handier



LEK Aulo Consultants Ple Lid
phone: 6841-4051 | emall geshermg@egulo.com | fax 6741-4108
Blk 51. Paya Ubi Indushial Park. Ukl Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5anE933)

From: ONG LI LI <llong@lonpac.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 3 July 2019 9:22 AM

To: Asher Sng |LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com>

Ce: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com>

Subject: RE: [MANDATE REQUEST] Our Ref: 19/19/19/VP05/021650 |[External General]

Lonpac External - General
Dear Asher

Please proceed to negotiate loss of rental/income up to 3 days only.

Regards,

Ong Li LI

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road #17-04/07 The Concourse Singapore 199555
Tel : (65) 6250 7388 Ext. 254 Fax: (65) 6296 2706

The all ¥ lonpac.com.sg

Lonpac External - Genaral data is for internal / external use.

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) [malltp:AsherSng@ kkauto.com]

Sent: Monday, 1 July, 2019 5:41 PM

To: ONG LI LI

Cc: MT_Claim_SG

Subject: [MANDATE REQUEST] RE: Our Ref: 19/19/19/VP05/021650 [External General]

Dear Sirs,
We rafer to the above matter

We have highlighted to your good office on 11/04/2018 of Third-Party's request to do Direct Settiement with our Principal,
Lonpac Insurance Bhd

The accident occurred when our insured turn right into the main road and hit third party vehicle
Basing on the reports of the circumstance of the accident, we propose to settle third-party claim at 100% liability

Summary to offer to repairer COMFORTDELGRO ENGINEERING PTE LTD is as follows. -

Claimed Amount Revised Amount
1. Cost of Repair (W/GST) $ 298794 S 654.08
2. Loss of Rental (4days x $125 40) 3§ 50180 S 43880 (3. 5days x $125.40)
3. Loss of Income (4days x $80) $ 32000 $ 175.00(3.5days x $50)
4. LTA/GIA Search Fee -] 7.49 s T.48
Total | § 3,817.03 $1.275.48




"2 days recommendation for repair
Relevant supporting claim documents are attached herewith for your perusal and reference.

The above is for ra val please.

Thank You.

Basl Regands,

Asher Sng | Cose Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Fhone: 6841-6051 | emall: mhawmgkkauto com | fox: 6741-4108
Bik 51. Payo Ubi Industrial Park. Ubl Avenug |, #02-25 | 5(4087313)

From: ONG LI LI <llong@lonpac.coms

Sent: Thursday, 11 April 2019 5:37 PM

To: Shu Pel (LKKAuto) <shupel@lkkauto cam>

Ce: MT_Claim_SG <mit claim@lonpac com>; Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto com>; Asher Sng (LKKAuto)
<AsherSng@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Our Ref: 19/19/19/VP05/021650 [External General]

Lonpac External - General
Dear Shu Pe|

Please see attached.

Regards,

Ong Li Li

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road #17-04/07 The Concourse Singapore 199555
Tel : (65) 6250 7388 Ext. 254 Fax: (65) 6296 2706

—

The all {##%) lonpac.com sg

Lonpac External - General data is for internal / external use

From: Shu Pei (LKKAuto) [mallto:shupei@ |kkauto .com]

Sent: Thursday, 11 April, 2019 5:02 PM

To: ONG LI LI

Cc: MT_Claim_SG; Admin A; Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: Our Ref: 19/19/19/VP05/021650 [External General]

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear Sir/Madam,
We refer to the above matter.

We have inspected TP vehicle SHC 1105P at M/s ComfortDelGro Engineering Pte Ltd on a WP basis and TP
3



repairer proposed for a direct settlement.

Enclosed for your perusal is:
. Estimated cost of repair
Preliminary advice

Meanwhile, kindly let us have a copy of your insured's GIA report for our necessary action.
Kindly take note that the case handler in-charge is Asher and she can be contacted at DID: 6841 6051.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Shu Pei| Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366-0055 | email: shupeu®iceauio.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blle 51, Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Ubl Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 10 April 2019 4:10 PM

To: 'ONG LI LI <llang@lonpac.com>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto com>

Cc: 'MT_Claim_SG' <mt_claim@lonpac.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto com>; Bryan Ang [LKKAuto)

<bryana Ikkaito.com>
Subject: RE: Our Ref: 19/19/19/VP05/021650 [External General]

Dear Li Li,

Noted with thanks.

Best Regards,

G.Nivitha| Admin

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: pssignmentsa@ lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, 202-25 | 5(408937)

From: ONG LI LI [mallto:llo lonpac.cam

Sent: Wednesday, 10 April 2019 4:08 PM

To: Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com>; assignments <assignments@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac com>; Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto com>; Bryan Ang (LKKAuto)

(bryanang@|kkauto.com) < nang@lkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: Our Ref: 19/19/19/VP05/021650 [External General)

Lonpac External - General
Hi Nivitha



Please highlight to your surveyor that our Insured has informed us that initially the taxi
company has only requested $500 to close file and there was hardly any damage to the
taxi. There was no damage to our Insured vehicle.

Regards,

Ong LI LI

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road #17-04/07 The Concourse Singapore 199555
Tel : (65) 6250 7388 Ext. 254 Fax: (65) 6296 2706

—_——

The all t8% |onpac.com.sg

Lonpac External - General data is for internal / external use

From: ONG LI LI

Sent: Wednesday, 10 April, 2019 10:20 AM

To: Admin-D (LKKAuto); assignments

Cc: MT_Claim_5G; Admin A

Subject: RE: Our Ref: 19/19/19/VP05/021650 [External General]

Lonpac External - General
Dear Nivitha

Please forward the attached accident scene photograph taken by our Insured to your claim
handler.

Regards,
Ong Li Li
Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd
300 Beach Road #17-04/07 The Concourse Singapore 199555
Tel : (65) 6250 7388 Ext. 254 Fax: (65) 6296 2706

_——e

The all (88&3 [onpac.com.sg

Sent: Wednesday, 10 April, 2019 9:57 AM

To: ONG LI LI; assignments

Cc: MT_Claim_5SG; Admin A

Subject: RE: Our Ref: 19/19/19/VP05/021650 [External General]

Dear Li L,



Thank you for the assignment

Best Regnrds,

G.Nivitha| Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phane: 6841-1972 | emall: assiznments® |kkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(4089a4)

From: ONG LI U [mailto:llong @lonpac_com]

Sent: Tuesday, 9 April 2019 5:35 PM

To: assignments@lkkauto.com; Admin-D [LKKAuto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com>
Ce: MT_Claim_5G <mt _claim®@lonpac.com>

Subject: Qur Ref: 19/19/19/VP05/021650 [External General]

Lonpac External - General
Dear Nivitha

Please refer to the attached and arrange survey.

Regards,

Ong Li Li

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road #17-04/07 The Concourse Singapore 199555
Tel : (65) 6250 7388 Ext. 254 Fax: 6296 2706

The all {85 lonpac.com.sg

Lonpac External - General data is for internal / external use

This email has been checked for viruses by AVG antivirus software
WWW AVE. COm




COMFORIDELGRO

OurRef - T 0418/ SHC1105P _/KS(st) ENGINEERING

Your Ref :

Date : 23-Apr-19 CDGE Taxi Clamms Dept Iogt o v .
58 Loyang Drive 4th Fir

Lonpac Insurance Bhd Singapore 508960

300 Beach Road

#17-04 | 07, The Concourse

Singapore 199555

Attn : Motor Claim Department WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Sir

ACCIDENT INVOLVING OUR TAXI SHC1105P YOUR INSURED SJS6470T

AND OTHER ON 07.04.19 M

We are the authorised repair workshop for Comfort Transportation Pte Lid, the owner of motor
Vehicle No: SHC1105P which was involved in the captioned accident with your insured
vehicle. The vehicle owner and the taxi driver concemed have requested and authorized us to
assist them in presenting their claims against the party responsible for all applicable matters
arising from the damage to the vehicle.

As the accident was caused by the negligent act of your insured driving : SJS6470T
we are submitting these claims for your consideration on behalf of the claimants

TAXI OWNER'S CLAIM

i Cost of Repair & 65408

2 4 days Lossof Rental@ § 12540 perday 5 50160

3  Survey Report Fees (Surveyed by Mis LKK) 5 -

4 LTA Search Fees 3 7.49

§ GIA/ Police Report Fees $ -

6 Towing / Medical / Transporation Fees 5 -
SubTotal: 5§ 1,163.18

HIRER'S CLAIM

7 4 days Loss of Income @ $ B0.00 perdays $ 32000

Total Claims: 5 148318

We enclose herewith the following documents to support the claims: -

a) Original repair bill and photocopies of photographs 4 pcs
b) LTA search slip/s of - SJNG2402
c¢] GIA | Police report/s of . SHC1105P

d) Letter of authority from owner / hirer / operator
{ PIR { ) Towng/Medical billireceipts ( ) Certificate of Insurance
{ X ) Photographi/s of Accident Scene ( x ) Downtime/Mileage record ( x ) Rental Rale |etter

Kindly look into the matter and let us hear from you on the settiement of the said claims as
soon as possible,

Please note that it is a condition of any settlement reached that it shall be without prejudice
to any personal injury claim (if any) of the taxi driver.

Yours faithfully

Kazali 7j Selahudin

CDGE Taxi Claims Department

Tel : 6214 8736 Fax: 6214 1843 Emall. kazali@cdge com.sg

This is a computer generated letter. No signature is required

COMFORIDELGRO o @ Q



Sl e ¥ RERAS. ¥ o RN LALTE SULVIL LSRR

ACCIDENT INVOLVING TOYOTA PRIUS SHC1105P , S)S6470T

ALONG

17 We

and/ar

Taxl Number

LETTER OF AUTHORISATION
[NAF | PAF)

SERANGOON RD X HASTINGS RD

CHAN KWANH HUI

TED CHIU PENG

SHC1105P

hereby authorise ComfortDelGro Engineering Pre Ltd( CDGE):

(Hirer] NRIC No,

ruge | vl |

ON 07-Apr-19 19:00

S0470683H

(Relief) NEIC No.: S1B22403H

1. To suomit my/our claims for damages, costs and axpensa, including loss of incoine, loss of kantal,
imadical fee and legal costs

L

against third party [except personal Injuries and medical cialms),

3. Te sign Dischamge Vouchar on my/our behalf,

. To have absolute discretion to 3gres 1o any Settiement or COMPEnSanian amount in respect of my,/our claim

4. To accept any payment (claim proceeds) in respect of the claim against third party and payment by chegue
shall be forward directly to COGE In accordance with CDGE's instruction and made in favour of
"ComfortDelGro Engineering Pte Ltd".

Date

MName of Hirer
Hirer NRIC

Addrass

Contact No.

Name of Rellef
Relief NRIC

Address

Contact No.

hitp:‘edgek 2srv 82/ Runume Runtime’ Runtime Runtime: View CDG LV

13-Apr-2019

CHAN KWANH HUT

S0470683H Signature :

421 ANG MO KIO AVENUE 10 #10-1...
560421

94590021

TEO CHIU PENG

S1822403H Signature :

419 ANG MO KIO AVENUE 10 03-1085
560419

91130618

ol
// 3

/

13042019



LONPAC INSURANCE BHD

CLAIM NO : 19/19/19/VPO5/021650
DATE : 18 JULY 2019

DISCHARGE VOUCHER

/We, COMFORT TRANSPORTATION PTE LTD confirmed acceptance from M/s
LONPAC INSURANCE BHD and/or the owner SIS 6470T the sum of Singapore
Dollars ONE THOUSAND AND TWO HUNDRED ONLY. ($1,200.00) in full and
final satisfaction, liquidation and discharge of property claim competent to me/us
upon the said M/s LONPAC INSURANCE BHD in respect of property claim
sustained by me/us whether now or hereafter to become manifest, arising either
directly or indirectly from an accident to my vehicle, SHC 1105P on 07 APRIL 2019
along/at SERANGOON RD X HASTINGS RD.

I /We hereby agree to indemnify and keep indemnify (SELORAJU S/O
PONNUSAMY /LONPAC INSURANCE BHD) against all claims and any claims
whatsoever made by any person/persons on our behalf in respect of the said accident.

I/'We further authonze you to pay the above settlement sum directly to M/s
COMFORTDELGRO ENGINEERING PTE LTD.

I/'We hereby acknowledge that this payment is made on a without admission of
liability basis and without prejudice to all related claims and in respect of our
insured’s recovery action.

...........................................

Name of vchu:h Wmnmdtc



COMFORIDELGRO
+ ENGINEERING

4 noet of COMFOMDELGRO

GST REG. NO. M2-8921817-3

8010042

LONPAC TNSURANCE BERHAD
THE (TNTIHIREE

300 ARACH ROAD #17-04/07

STNGAPORE 8G 199555

CONTACT NO: 62507388

Dascription 3P 07.04.19

S/Mo  Part No.

FPART REQUISITION

0001 04-01-0302-2965

EXTENSION HH

JOB NATURE

o001 PB

oDozZ

PANEIL.

ap

ComfortDelGirn Engineering Pie Lud
& mmormtiar of CONRORE Lo

Hesid Office:
205 Broddell Road
Smgapore 579701

Kindly note that no recept shall ba issuesd unless requasted

HEATT NG
SPRAYFATNT CHARGE

ACC

0

TAX INVOICE

PRIG4 FILILLER-HEAR RIMPER

UNT No

ComforiDelGro Engineering Pie Lid

'ﬁx‘nl'lhhl'.'{!f
(AMFANY HEs M3, ¢ 1""“'!’1“HFA-'L‘-H
Fage: 1

VEHCT K N0 INV. RO/JDATR
SHC1105P 91438936 18.04.2019
HMAK K JOH RO
1YITIA 05285640
MO KT (MIMKTEN HEANTNG

FRTIES HYBRTIM (4 )

DATE (F HEG HATE/TIHK TN

05.07.2017 0R.04.2019 15:50
CHANSTS (INE
JTNEKRIFUROISATTRY
(ty  Imit Pripe SiNsc Net
1 148 40 25,00 11 A0
HIR-TXTIAL . 111.30
200,00 20000
ng, nn 200, 000
S1IB-T(FI'A]l. S00. 00

INVOICE No AMOUNT

BANK/CHQ No.

CUSTOMER'S COPY



COMFORIDELGRO
ENGINEERING

Enexy MR .wa[liu.ug 1
GST REG. NO. M2-8921817-3 TAX INVOICE (IMPANY
BO1D042
VERCLE W)
LONPAC INSURANCE BERHAD SH105P

THE CONCINIRSE
MAKK
TOYOTA

300 BRACH RDAD #17-04/07
STNGAPORE SG 199555

, MO,
CONTACT ND: 62507388 PRIIS HYRRIN(G4)

BATE _OF HEs
05.07.2017

CHASSIS (XHE

ComlortDelGro Engineering Pte Lid

KF. NO 1 9950n04HW

FAgea:

TRV, WO/DATE
Q1438946 18.04. 7019

JOR WO,
ANHZR5RL0

(INMETER HEAITNG

DATE/TIME 1IN

(08.04.2019 15; 5

JTOREIFIE035R1189

items total

Add GST B

nmvoilce amont

Issuad by KATHERINETAN 15.04. 2019 10:04:23
Hepair type C1.80/57/57

Cradit 30 days

Paymant Type/Term:

ComfortDelGro Engineering Ple Lid

A momoer of COMIORIDE,CAg ACCOUNT No INVOICE No

Head Office
205 Broddell Road
Simgapore 37901

aOT0na? 1438936

Fandiy note that no recalpl shall be ssued uniess requesied \ Fa - A

fhl11. 3l
T.000 % 47
nhd. 09

AMOUNT BANK/CHQ No

CUSTOMER'S COPY




Our Ref. CT19040233

Date: 17 April 2019 Lomloert

TO WHOM IT MAY CONCERN

Dear SirfMadam

ACCIDENT ON 07/04/2019 (@ 19:00 hrs
ALONG SERANGOON RD X HASTINGS RD
INVOLVING SJS6470T

We refer to the above-mentioned accident and wish to inform that Comfort
Transportation Pte Ltd is the registered owner of the taxi bearing vehicle registration
number SHC1105P (the "Taxl"). The Taxi was hired to CHAN KWANH HUI IC NO
S0470683H a registered hirer-operator of Comfort Transportation Pte Ltd at the time
of occurrence of the aforementioned accident at a rental rate $125.40 per day
{inclusive of GST),

Please be advised that the Taxi was Insured with India International Insurance Pte
Ltd on a third party basis at the material time of the accident.

We wish to confirm that the aforesaid hirer-operator had obtained our permission to
undertake repairs for damage on the Taxi arising from the said accident with a motor
workshop of his choice.

Please lialse with the said hirer-operator or his authorized workshop directly for

settiement of claims with third party's insurance company in respect of the said
accident.

Yours faithfully
Christine Tay

Assistant Manager, Fleet Safety

This is a computer generated letter. No signature is required.

383 Sin Ming Drive Singapore 575717 Mainline +65 6555 1188 Facsimile +65 6453 3183
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