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PRE-REPAIR INSPECTION REQUEST ~ GW3468K vs SMC7264P (Ol) on D.O.A.: 09/04/2019

From:  Hor, Yinrul

To: ‘assignments@Ikkauto.com’, Admin A (admin-a@ikkauto.com)

Ce: Fong, Andy-SY, Chin, Lee-Ying, Kaur, Baljit, Abu Kassim, Noor Mariesa, Azlan, Syazairdina, Chan, Yoke Shi, Lim, Sheng Yang, Mithoosingh, Aashweenjestkaur
Sent.  10/4/2019 12:03:59 PM

Attachments: ) 20190409180558477.00r ™) 20100409 180556477 00t

" A ke (oL

Please refer to the enclosed request from M/s Chia S Arul LLC.
Kindly carry out Policy coverage verification first before conductjng the pre-repair inspection within 48 hours

If you have any queries/concerns, please let us know,
Kindly assist to assign Marcus Chua as Single Joint Expert as requested.

Thanks & Regards,

Yin Rul, Hor {Vivianej

AIG
Claim Adjuster li, Singapore FNOL. Claims Operations ~ Auto
YinmtHor@aig.com | www.aig.sg

From: Jerone [mailto:jerone@chiaarul.com]
Sent: Wednesday, April 10, 2019 10:02 AM
To: Hor, Yinryl

Cc: Fong, Andy-SY; Chin, Lee-Ying; Kaur, Baljit; Abu Kassim, Noor Mariesa; Azlan, Syazairdina; Chan, Yoke Shi; Lim, Sheng Yang; Mithoosingh, Aashweenjeetkaur; 'Weng Kit’
Subject: [EXTERNAL] RE: PRE-REPAIR INSPECTION - ACCIDENT INVOLVING OUR INSURED VEHICLE SMC7264P AND GW3468K ON 09/04/2019

Caution: External Emait

O/Ref: GW 3468K (Jr)
Y/Ref. TBA

Dear Sir / Madam,

We refer to your email below.

Our client would like to nominate Mr. Marcus Chua (W's LKK Auto Consultants) as the mutual surveyor for the above matter.

Please let us have your confirmation on the same.
Yours faithfully,

Mr. Jerone Lee (Paralegal)

M/s Chia S Arut LLC

151 Chin Swee Road

#03-09 Manhattan House

Singapore 169876

Tel: (65) 6733 4647 Fax: (65) 6733 8183

This e-mail is from M/s Chia S Arul LLC, a firm of Advocates and Soligitors in Singpors, and is intended solely for the named addresses. It contains confidential and /or legally
privileged information. If the e-mait has reached you in error, please delete the e-mail immediately and inform us of the error. You may contact us at info@chiaarul.com. Internet
communications cannot be guaranteed to be secured or error-free as information could be intercepted, corrupted, lost, arrive late or contain viruses. The sender thersfore does not
accept liability for any errors or omissions in the context of this message which arise as a result of Internet transmission,

From: Hor, Yinrul [mailto:Yinrul.Hor@aig.com]

Sent: Wednesday, 10 April, 2019 9:02 AM

To: jerone@chiaarul.com

Cc: Fong, Andy-SY <Andy-SY.Fong@aig.com>; Chin, Lee-Ying <Lee-Ying.Chin@aig.com>; Kaur, Baljit <Baljit.Kaur@aig.com>; Abu Kassim, Noor Mariesa
<NoorMariesa.AbuKassim@aig.com>; Azlan, Syazairdina <Syazairdina.Azlan @aig.com>; Chan, Yoke Shi <yokeshi.chan@aig.com>; Lim, Sheng Yang <ShengYang.Lim@aig.com>;
Mithoosingh, Aashweenjeetkaur <Aashweenjeetkaur.Mithoosingh@aig.com>

Subject: PRE-REPAIR INSPECTION - ACCIDENT INVOLVING OUR INSURED VEHICLE SMC7264P AND GW3468K ON 09/04/2019

i

This is a secure, encrypted message, To read it, open the
attachment.
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Ini adalah pesan, aman terenkripsi. Untuk membacanya, membuka
attachment.

! Click here by 2019-04-17 09:02 +08 to read your message.
After that, open the attachment.

re it



Disclaimer: This email and its content are confidential and intended solely for the use of the
addressee. Please notify the sender if you have received this email in error or simply delete
it

Secured by Procipoint Encryption, Copyright & 2003-2017 Proofpoint, Inc. Alt rights
reserved

IMPORTANT NOTICE:

The information in this emall (and any attachments) is confidential, If you are not the intended recipient, you must not use or disseminate the information. If you have recaived this email in error, please
immediately notify me by "Reply” command and permanently delete the original and any copies or printouts thereof. Although this email and any attachments are believed to be free of any virus or other
defect that might affect any computer system into which it is received and opened, it is the responsibility of the recipient to ensure that it is virus free and no responsibility is accepted by American
Intemational Group, inc. or its subsidiaries or affiliates either jointly or severally, for any loss or damage arising in any way from its yse.

From: Yinrul. Hor@aig.com

To: jerone@chiaarul.com

Cec: Andy-SY.Fong@aig.com ,Lee-

Ying.Chin@aig.com ,Baljit Kaur@aig.com ,NoorMariesa.AbuKassim@aig.com ,Syazairdina Azlan@aig.com ,yokeshi.chan@aig.com ,ShengYang.Lim@aig.com ,Aashweenjeetkaur.Mithoosingh@aig.co
Subject: aigencrypt PRE-REPAIR INSPECTION - ACCIDENT INVOLVING OUR INSURED VEHICLE SMC7264P AND GW3468K ON 09/04/2019

Date: Wed, 10 Apr 2019 01:02:20 +0000

Without Prejudice

Your Reference - GW 3468K (Jr)
Our Reference : SMC7264P
Dear Sir/Madam,

We refer to your Notice of Accident of even date.

We intend to conduct a pre-repair survey of the damage to your client’s/your customer’s vehicle jointly with your client/your motor workshop. We propose to use one of the motor
surveyors named in the attached list to conduct the joint pre-repair survey as a single joint expert:

Name of Surveyor Company Name

AIG In House Surveyor AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd
Lawrence Ng Chun Kee Priority Services

Jeffrey Ong Leng Kiat Priority Services

Jimmy Lee Priority Services

EC Looi Automobile Inspection Services Pte Ltd
Pang Kiah Keen (Frankie) Formteam Adjusters Pte Ltd

Ng You Han Formteam Adjusters Pte Ltd

Soon HanXin (Gary) Formteam Adjusters Pte Ltd

Chow Bo Xiong Formteam Adjusters Pte Ltd

Chua Soo Teck (Benjamin) Formteam Adjusters Pte Ltd
Kalvin Ang LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Xing Guo Qiang LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Marcus Chua LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Mohamad Taufikh LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Adrian Ling LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Mohammed Rasul LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Kenneth Kong LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Please let us know within two (2) working days whether you agree to the appointment of any of these motor surveyors as a single joint expert. You may select one or more of the
listed motor surveyors. We will bear the cost of the pre-repair survey carried out by the single joint expert.

Thanks & Regards,

Yin Rul, Hor (Viviane)}
AlG

Clawrn 44 i, Singapore FNOL, Claims Operations - Auto

Yinrul,Hor@aig.com | www.aig.sg

From: Jerone [mailto:jerone@chiaarul.com]
Sent: Tuesday, April 09, 2019 6:07 PM

To: AIG SGP, Claims-Survey

Cc: 'Weng Kit'

Subject: [EXTERNAL] PRS Notice for GW 3468K

Caution: External Email

O/Ref. GW 3468K (Jr)
Y/Ref: TBA

Dear Sirs,

We refer to the above matter.

Kindly find enclosed herewith the PRS Notice for your attention.

Please feel free to contact us should you have any queries thereof.

Yours faithfully,

Mr. Jerone Lee {Paralegal)

M/s Chia S Arul LLC -
151 Chin Swee Road

#03-09 Manhattan House

Singapore 169876
Tel: (65) 6733 4647 Fax: (65) 6733 8183



CHIA S ARUL LLC

ADVOCATES & SOLICITORS
UEN 201330709H

ARULCHELVAN S « A, RAVIDASS

OurRef:  GW 3468K (Jr)
YourRef:  To be advised
9 April 2019
AIG ASIA PACIFIC INSURANCE PTE. LTD. BY EMAIL
Dear Sirs,
RE: PROPERTY DAMAGE CLAIM
CLAIMANT : P S PLUMBING AND ENGINEERING

ACCIDENT INVOLVING GW 3468K & SMC 7264P ALONG STANLET STREET
ON 9 APRIL 2019

PRE-REPAIR SURVEY NOTICE

We act for P S8 Plumbing and Engineering, the owner of motor vehicle no. GW
3468K was involved in the aforesaid accident.

We hereby in compliance with the Pre-Action Protocol for Non-Injury Motor
Accident Claims, Appendix C of the State Courts Practice Directions Amendment
No. 1 of 2016 (“the NIMA Protocol”) give you NOTICE that we are claiming
against your insured motor vehicle no. SMC 7264P for damages, costs and
disbursements as a result of your insured driver's negligence.

Please let us know if you wnsh to conduct a pre-repair survey on our client's motor
vehicle at: :

Workshop Ace Autolution

Address "~ |13 Kaki Bukit Road 4 #03 — 29 Bartley Biz Centre
Singapore 417807

Contact Person | Ms. Anna/ Ms. Shu Wen (6844 1184)

Pursuant to paragraph 2.3 of the NIMA Protocol, in the event we do not receive
your response within next two (2) working days (excluding any Saturday,
Sunday or public holiday), our client will instruct the workshop to commence
appraisal and repairs to the damaged motor vehicle without further reference to
you.

Please advise the appointed surveyor to endorse on page 2 of this letter after the
completion of each inspection.

Yours/faithfully,

A CHELVAN S
lient ( Emall)

TEL :

151 CHIN SWEE ROAD & #03-09
MANHATTAN HOUSE o SINGAPORE 169876
(65) 6733 4647 » FAX : (65) 6733 8183 (not for Service of Court documents)
EMAIL : info@chiaatul,com




> Back to OneMotoring

Business

Owner ID:

4131W

~ Vehicle No.: GW3468K
‘ Vehlcle to be Exported: Yes
Intended Deregistration Date: 11 Apr 2019
Veth|e Make A b TOYOTA i
Vehicle Model: DYNA 150D
Primary Colour: - ~ White
-~ Manufacturing Year: 2003
Engine No 8. “s3atse0
. ChassisNo: JTFUF34Y503001166
kMaximun"iy ﬁdvk\}e'r”Output: - '
Open Markeyty\}élué: - $2§1?26.OO
Origihél RegistrationDate: \0'4‘J;.k|r] 2003
First Regisfration Daté: - ” 04 Juh 2003
f Transfer Count: 1
* Actual ARF Paid: $1,187.00

 PARF Elighility

No'

_ PARFEligibility Expiry Date: - ‘
* PARF Rebate Amount: $0.00 .
.|
__ COEExpiry Date: 31May 2023
 COECategory: _ C-Goods Vehicle&Bus

COEuPeriod(Yearsy): - 5 .

PQPPaid: $17,865.00

ot rebmtepmomt. e

© TotalRebate Amount: $14,781.00 N

Please note that all future COE renewals for this vehicle can only be for a 5-year period, subject to the statutory lifespan (if applicable) of the

vehicle.

The informationy contamed Hereiﬁ IS correct asat 11 Apr 201'9“
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Post an Advertisement !
Sell it yourself! Advertise it at just !

$58 until it's SOLD! |

Toyota Dyna 150 2.0M (COE
till 63/2023)

Fuel Type: Diesel

yr COE)
Fuel Type: Diesel

Toyota Dyna 150 3.0M (New
5-yr COE)

Fuel Type: Diesel

5 Year COE Renewable,

B Toyota Dyna 150 3.0M (New
5-yr COE)
Fuel Type: Diesel

Net Link Partners Pte Ltd

[7] Toyota Dyna 150 3.0M (COE
till 12/2021) ,

Fuel Type: Diesel

[7] Toyota Dyna 150 3.0M (COE
till 12/2021)

Fuel Type: Diesel

Step Viewing Possible!
Net Link Partners Pte Ltd

till 04/2022)

[7] Toyota Dyna 150 3.0 (New 5-

[] Toyota Dyna 100 3.0M (COE

$22,838

100% In House Loan Available. View To Beheve’ Don't MISS, Call Today‘

$23,800

. $33,800

| $19,800

06 toyola dyna, To

$27,800

Free 6 Months Road Tax And Inspection!. Value For Mone

$19,900

Brand New! GST Inclusivet No
Gimmick! No Hidden Cost!

Borneo Umtl Call Now!

StarAd

«Back (1 2) Next »

Depreciation v

$5,750 /yr

100% In House Loan Available, View To Believe! Don't Miss, Call Today!

$4,750 /yr

 $6,750 /yr

vite Dyna, 2005 toyota dyna, Tovota D» na, foy ut‘a dyna,

Is your COE expiring? Let us help you renew it!

$7,410 /yr

$10,410 /yr

31-Mar-2003

12-May-2004

03-Mar-2005

12-Dec-2006

byna tovols dyna,

12-Dec-2006

Login |

Sign up

(’{% HIN LUNG AUTO

HoBee Groug

One Stop Car Hub
Finance, Insurance, Workshop
Mew and Used Carg

Sort by Date Posted

Y | 20 results/page

2,986 cc

(986 e

2,986 cc

2,986 cc

2,982 cc

Toyola, Dyna, dyna, Used ¥

2,982 cc

vota, Dyna, dyne, Used Toyota

Very Well Maintained By Previous Owner. No Repairs Needed. Paint Work And Servicing All Done Up Own This With Peace Of Mind.

Cyoia

6.5ft Box With Power Tailgate. New Paintwork, Excellent Condmon Doorstep V»ewmg Can Be Arranged For Test Dnve Hurry Call Now!

Truck

Truck

Truck

Truck

Truck

Truck

Available

 Available

Available

Available

v

Getting your COE renewed is easy, fast and affordable. We'll help you renew your COE and get a loan for it. Get the cheapest loan in town and an
approval in 2 days without effort! Enquire today.

Available

Available

y. High Trade In And High Loan Possible! Call Now For An No Obligations Discussion! Door

yna, Tovota Dyne

- $6,630 /yr

11-Apr-2007

‘2,982 cc

dyna, Used

Toyota

' Truck

Avaiiable



