Asher EnE (LKKAuto)

From: ONG LI LI <llong@lonpac.coms>

Sent: Wednesday, 3 July 2019 11:00 AM

To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

Ce: MT_Claim_SG

Subject: RE: [MANDATE REQUEST] Direct Settlement - Accident Invalving SMABSTX (Ol

19/19/19/VP05/021648 ) AND SHB4078U (TP : LKK REF - CC3/LPC19006263/K1ea3) on
07/04/20199 [External General]

Follow Up Flag: Follow up
Flag Status: Completed

Lonpac External - General
Dear Asher

Please proceed.

Regards,

Ong LI Li

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road #17-04/07 The Concourse Singapore 199555
Tel : (65) 6250 7388 Ext, 254 Fax: (65) 6296 2706

_——

The all 8% lonpac.com.sg

Lonpac External - General dala is for internal / external use

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) [mailto:AsherSnog@ikkauto.com]

Sent: Monday, 1 July, 2019 5:30 PM

To: ONG LI LI

Cc: MT_Claim_SG

Subject: [MANDATE REQUEST] RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SMAG57X (OI : 19/19/19/VP05/021648 ) AND
SHB4078U (TP : LKK REF - CC3/LPC19006263/K1ea3) on 07/04/20199 [External General]

Dear Sirs,
We refer to the above matter

We have highlighted to your good office on 16/04/2018 of Third-Party's request to do Direct Settlement with our Principal,
Lonpac Insurance Bhd

The accident occurred when our insured reversed and hit third party vehicle
Basing on the reports of the circumstance of the accident. we propose to settle third-party claim at 100% liability

Summary to offer to repairer COMFORTDELGRO ENGINEERING PTE LTD is as follows: -

Claimed Amount Revised Amount
1. Cost of Repair (W/GST) $ 340970 $2.354.00
2. Loss of Rental (3days x $112.67) § 33T $ 338.01 (3days x $112.67)




3. Loss of Income (3days » 580) $ 24000 s 150.00
4. LTA/GIA Search Fee ] 7.48 - 7.48
Total | § 3,994.20 § 2.849.50

**3 days recommendation for repair
Relevant supporting claim documents are attached herewith for your perusal and reference

The above is for your a val please

Thank You,

Best Regaras.

Asher Sng | Cose Handles

LEK Auto Comsulionts Ple Lid

phone: 5841-6051 | emall; mbeang@kegutocom | fox: 6741-4108
Bl 51, Poya Ubl industial Pork, Ubd Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408%33)

From: ONG LI LI <llong@lonpac.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 17 April 2019 5:06 PM

To: Mel Kwan [LKKAuto) <sMeikwan@lkkauto.com>; MT_Claim_5G <mt_claim @lonpac.com>

Cc: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@Ikkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; CS A Team <cs-a@|kkauto.com>
Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident involving SMAG57X (01 : 19/19/19/VP05/021648 ) AND SHB40O7BU (TP ! LKK
REF - CC3/LPC19006263/K1eal) on 07/04/20199 [External General]

Lonpac External - General
Dear Mei Kwan
Please see attached for our Insured’s GIA report.

Regards,
Ong Li Li
Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd
300 Beach Road #17-04/07 The Concourse Singapore 199555
Tel : (65) 6250 7388 Ext. 254 Fax: (65) 6296 2706

_———

The all S5 lonpac.com.sg

Lonpac External - General data is for internal / external use

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) [mailto: Mekwan dilkkauto.com]

Sent: Tuesday, 16 April, 2019 11:31 AM

To: MT_Clam_SG

Cc: GERALD POH WEE BIN; ONG LI LI; Asher Sng (LKKAuto); Admin A; CS A Team

Subject: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SMAB57X (Ol : LPC - TBA) AND SHB4078U (TP : LKK REF -
CC3/LPC19006263/K1ea3) on 07/04/20199

WITHOUT PREJUDICE



SAVEASTO COSTS
Dear Sir / Madam,
We refer to the above matter,

We have inspected TP vehicle SHB 4078U at M/s ComfortDelGro Engineering Pte Ltd (Loyang) on a WP basis and
TP repairer proposed for a direct settlement.

Enclosed for your perusal is:

s TP GIA report
+ Estimated cost of repair
» Preliminary advice

Meanwhile, kindly assist to verify validity of our insured's policy and let us have a copy of insured's accident report
for our necessary action.

Please take note that the case handler in-charge is Asher and she can be contacted at DID: 6841 6051.
To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned.
Thank you.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@|kkauto.com | fax: 67414108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Parle. Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408033)



P ey

COMFOR'IDELC.RQ_
Our Ref T 0419/ SHB4078U /KS(st) ENGINEERING
Your Ref :
Date 16-Apr-18 CDGE Tax Claims Dept ComlotDeiGra Enginearing Pte Lid

28 Loyang Drive 4th Fir B ingpipy §

Lonpac Insurance Bhd Singapare 508569
300 Beach Road
#17-04) 07, The Concourse
Singapore 198555 Workshops
Attn : Motor Claim Department WITHOUT PREJUDICE E“-"_‘"" L
Dear Sir i
ACCIDENT INVOLVING OUR TAXI SHB4078U YOUR INSURED SMA 657X
AND OTHER ON 07.04.19

‘We are the authorised repair workshop for Comfort Transportation Pte Ltd, the owner of motor
Vehicle No: SHB40T8U which was involved in the captioned accident with your insured
vehicle The vehicle owner and the taxi driver concerned have requested and authorized us to
assist them in presenting their claims against the party responsible for all applicable matters
arising from the damage to the vehicle.

As the accident was caused by the neagligent act of your insured driving - SMA 657X
we are submitting these claims far your consideration on behalf of the claimants.

TAXI OWNER'S CLAIM

Sin Ming
Pandan
Ui

Sencko

1 Cost of Repair 5 2,354.00

2 3 dayslossofRental@ § 11267 perday $ 338.01 s
3 Survey Report Fees  (Surveyed by Mis LKK) 5 -

4  LTA Search Fees s 740 Wi
5  GIAT Police Report Fees ] -

6  Towng / Medical / Transporation Fees 5 -

SubTotal: § 2699.50
HIRER'S CLAIM
7 3 days Loss of Income @ $ B0.00 perdays 5 240.00

Total Claims: 5 293950
We enclose herewith the following documents to support the claims: -

#)  Original repair blll and photocaopies of photographs T pcs.
1) LTA search slip/s of - SJIN5240Z
¢] GIA /[ Police report/s of : SHBA40TEU

d) Letter of authority from owner / hirer / operator
[ JPIR ({ )TowingMedical billlreceipts ( ) Certificate of Insurance

| X | Photographfs of Accident Scene ( x ) DowntimeMileage racord { ¥ ) Rental Rate letter

Kindly ook into the matter and let us hear from you on the settlement of the said claims as
s00n as possible,

Please note that it is a condltion of any settlement reached that it shall be without prejudice
to any personal injury claim (if any) of the tax| driver

Yours [aithfully

Karzalt My Selofiudin

CDGE Taxi Claims Department

Tel | E214 8736 Fax: 6214 1843 Email. kazali@cdge.com.sg

This is a computer generated letter, No signature is required

— Q
COMFORIDELGRO o



CDG VARS.V LettofAuthorisation Page 1 of 1

LETTER OF AUTHORISATION

(NAF / PAF)
ACCIDENT INVOLVING | 40 SHB4078U , SMA EEM‘ ON 07-Apr-19 10:15
ALONG BLK 640A PUNGGOL DR ACCESS ROAD
[/ We YEOQ CHEH LING (Hirer) NRIC No.:  S7124067C
and/for (Relief) NRIC No.:

Tam Number SHB4D7BU
hereby authorise ComfortDelGro Enginegring Pte Ltd{ CDGE):

1. To submit my/our claims for damages, costs and expense, including loss of Income, loss of rental,
megical fee and legal costs.

Z. To have absolute discretion to agree to any settlement or compensation amaount in respect of my/our claim
against third party (except personal Injuries and medical claims).

3. To sign Discharge Voucher on my/four bahaif.
4, Te accept any payment (claim proceeds) in respect of the claim against third party and payment by chegqus

shall pe forward directly to CDGE 1n accordance with CDGE's imstruction and made in favour of
"ComfortDelGro Enginearing Pte Ltd"™.

Date 07-Apr-2019
Mame of Hirer YEO CHEH LING
Hirer NRI1C S7124067C Signature
—/L’\ i
Address 105 SERANGOON NORTH AVE 1 =203...
550105
Cantact No. B1577711

hitp://edgek2srv: 82/Runtime/Runtime/Runtime/ Runtime/ View/CDG. V... 07/04/2019



LONPAC INSURANCE BHD

CLAIM NO : I9/1919/VPD5/021648
DATE : 11 JULY 2019

DISCHARGE VOUCHER

I/'We, COMFORT TRANSPORTATION PTE LTD confirmed acceptance from M/s
LONPAC INSURANCE BHD and/or the owner SMA 657X the sum of Singapore
Dollars TWO THOUSAND EIGHT HUNDRED FORTY NINE AND CENTS
FIFTY ONLY. ($2,849.50) in full and final satisfaction, liquidation and discharge of
property claim competent to me/us upon the said M/s LONPAC INSURANCE BHD
in respect of property claim sustained by mefus whether now or hereafter to become
manifest, arising either directly or indirectly from an accident o my vehicle, SHB
4078U on (07 APRIL 2019 along/at BLK 640A PUNGGOL DR ACCESS ROAD.

| /We hereby agree to indemmify and keep indemnify (SEAH MWEE HOON
MLONPAC INSURANCE BHD) against all claims and any claims whatsoever made
by any person/persons on our behalf in respect of the said accident.

I/We further authorize you to pay the above settlement sum directly w0 M/s
COMFORTDELGRO ENGINEERING PTE LTD.

I/We hereby acknowledge that this payment is made on a without admission of
liability basis and without prejudice to all related claims and in respect of our
msured’s recovery action.

: .r&‘@'l\'ﬁ., B T o oo D

Signature of v

BE

................. gabsiladieswddlecsisanssinn

Name of vehicle owner/Date



COMFOR1DELGRD CumfoanIGru Engineering Pte Ltd
ENGINEERING

COMORMIDELCRD -
(THMEANY HEG, RO, - 19950604806

GST REG. NO. M2-8921817-3 TAX INVOICE Page: 1
BO1D042 VEHCLE M) NOSDATE o
HHRBA0THN 91437907 12.04.2019
LONPAC INSURANCE BERHAD
THE CONOOURSE MAK I JUH RO,
: HYUNDA [ 5285754
300 BEACH ROAD #17-04/07
ETNGAPORE 199555 lliilﬁ. (HXMICTER READTNG
CONTACT NO: 62507388 i
DATE (0F HEG
16.07.2015
(HASSTS (ODKE JOH TYPK
KMHT. R4 IMGLO 75402
. Description : 3F 07.04.19
Invoice for Lump Sum Rapair
'otal Ia Sim Repair Amt 2, 200, 00
Add {{'"I'TNHP W 7.000 % 154, 00
Total Invaice amount 2,354.00
Issued by KATHEHINETAN 12.04.2019 14:43:33
Repalr |'{'p4=+ : CLSO/HT/57
Payment Type/Term : /Cradit 30 days

ComfortDelGro Engineering Pre Lid
A mambor of CoMPOmEKLCas

ACCOUNT No INVOICE Mo AMOUNT BANK/CHQ No

Head {fice:
205 Bruddell Road
Singapore 379701

Findly rote thal no receipt shall e (ssued unless requesied.
CUSTOMER'S COPY




OurRef:  CT19040177
cfomrort

| g

Date: 12 April 2019

TO WHOM IT MAY CONCERN

Dear Sir/fMadam

ACCIDENT ON 07/04/2019 @ 10:15hrs

ALONG BLK 640A PUNGGOL DR ACCESS ROAD
INVOLVING SMA 657X

We refer lo the above-mentioned accident and wish to inform that Comfort
Transportation Pte Ltd is the registered owner of the taxi bearing vehicle registration
number SHB4078U (the "Taxi"). The Taxi was hired to YEO CHEH LING IC NO
S§7124067C a registered hirer-operator of Comfort Transportation Pte Ltd at the time
of occurrence of the aforementioned accident at a rental rate $112.67 per day
(inclusive of GST).

Please be advised that the Taxi was insured with MS First Capital Insurance Ltd on
a third party basis at the material time of the accident.

We wish to confirm that the aforesaid hirer-operator had obtained our permission to
undertake repairs for damage on the Taxi arising from the said accident with a motor
workshop of his choice.

Please liaise with the said hirer-operator or his authorized workshop directly for

settlement of claims with third party's insurance company in respect of the said
accident.

Yours faithfully

Christine Tay
Assistant Manager, Fleet Safety

This is a computer generated letter. No signature s required.

383 Sin Ming Drive Singapore 575717 Mainline +65 6555 1188 Facsimile +65 6453 2183
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