
1

Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

From: Joel Goh <joel.goh@eqinsurance.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, 15 April, 2019 1:10 PM

To: service@kkimhin.com.sg

Cc: Sandra (Gmail); assignments; Admin A; Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: Accident Involving SME 5452 R and GBA4910T (EQ) on 26 Mar 2019 - 

(DM19HO00868-JG)

Attachments: FW: SME5452R - 3RD PARTY CLAIM - ( TP ) - ( GBA4910T ) - ( EQ INSURED ) - 

LIABILITY STATUS (DM19HO00868-JG)

Categories: HMK

Without Prejudice 

 

Dear Sandra 

 

We had previously assigned LKK to handle the direct settlement with Motor Image. 

Since third party has appointed your workshop now, we will appoint LKK to take over this direct settlement. 

 

Dear LKK 

 

Please take note of the change in workshop. 

 

Best Regards,  

 

Joel Goh  

Executive | Claims 

  

  
EQ Insurance Company Limited  
 

5 Maxwell Road  #17-00  Tower Block  MND Complex  Singapore 069110  

did 65 6500 6772 | tel 65 6223 9433 ext 772 | fax 65 6223 4190 

www.eqinsurance.com.sg         
  

   
Privileged/Confidential information may be contained in this message. If you are not the intended recipient, please notify the sender immediately and delete al
 

 

 

From: service [mailto:service@kkimhin.com.sg]  
Sent: Saturday, April 13, 2019 5:57 AM 

To: Joel Goh; Janet Tan 
Cc: service@kkimhin.com.sg; Sandra (Gmail) 

Subject: Accident Involving SME 5452 R and GBA 4910 T on 26 Mar 2019 

 
Your Ref: GBA 4910 T (EQ) 
Our Ref: SME 5452 R 
  
Dear Janet/ Joel 
  
Good day to you.  
  
Enclosed the GIA report of our client SME 5452 R who was hit by your insured GBA 4910 T on 26 March 2019. 
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Vehicle is not in yet. 
  
Please kindly appoint surveyor and advise liability. 
  
Our client has previously gone to Motor Image for his TP claim but was told that EQ has advised that the liability is not clear. As 
such, he would like to have us assist him in his TP claim instead. 
 
Many thanks. 
  
Best Regards 
Sandra 
6452 7018 
9622 2116  
K. Kim Hin Auto Pte Ltd 
  
  


