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Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 8 April, 2019 3:25 PM

To: 'Joel Goh'; assignments

Cc: Admin A

Subject: RE: SME5452R - 3RD PARTY CLAIM - ( TP ) - ( GBA4910T ) - ( EQ INSURED ) - 

LIABILITY STATUS (DM19HO00868-JG)

Categories: HMK

Dear Joel, 

 

Thank you for the assignment. 

 

Please be informed that vehicle is not in the workshop, repairer will arrange. 

 

 
Best Regards, 

 
G.Nivitha| Admin  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com  | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
 
 
 

 

 

 

 

From: Joel Goh <joel.goh@eqinsurance.com.sg>  

Sent: Saturday, 6 April 2019 3:31 PM 

To: Daniel Jude <danieljude@motorimage.net> 

Cc: TPY Insurance Team <tpyinsteam@tanchong.org>; Mohamed Isman <isman@motorimage.net>; Admin A 

<admin-a@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: FW: SME5452R - 3RD PARTY CLAIM - ( TP ) - ( GBA4910T ) - ( EQ INSURED ) - LIABILITY STATUS 

(DM19HO00868-JG) 

Importance: High 

 

Without Prejudice 

 

Dear Daniel 

 

My apologies for the late response. 

 

We welcome direct settlement, and will appoint LKK to handle this matter. 

 

Dear LKK 

 

Please assist to take over this direct settlement. 

 

Best Regards,  
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Joel Goh  

Executive | Claims 

  

  
EQ Insurance Company Limited  
 

5 Maxwell Road  #17-00  Tower Block  MND Complex  Singapore 069110  

did 65 6500 6772 | tel 65 6223 9433 ext 772 | fax 65 6223 4190 

www.eqinsurance.com.sg         
  

   
Privileged/Confidential information may be contained in this message. If you are not the intended recipient, please notify the sender immediately and delete all copies of it.
 

 

 

From: Daniel Jude [mailto:danieljude@motorimage.net]  

Sent: Saturday, April 6, 2019 10:33 AM 
To: EQI PRS; Joel Goh 

Cc: TPY Insurance Team; Mohamed Isman 
Subject: FW: SME5452R - 3RD PARTY CLAIM - ( TP ) - ( GBA4910T ) - ( EQ INSURED ) - LIABILITY STATUS 

Importance: High 

 

Hi Claims Team, 

 

Kindly advise liability status of the above mentioned on urgent basis 

 

Attached is the GIA report, Estimate and Video footage. 

 

 

2nd attempt 

 

 

 

Thank You. 

 

Best Regards 

Daniel A Jude 

Service Executive  

Motor Image Enterprises Pte Ltd 

19 Lorong 8 Toa Payoh Singapore 319255 

HP: 8611 3195 

Email: danieljude@motorimage.net 

Website: www.tanchong.com :  www.motorimage.net 
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Disclaimer: This e-mail is confidential. It may also be legally privileged. If you are not the addressee you may not copy, forward, disclose or 
use any part of this message. If you have received this message in error, please delete it and all copies from your system and notify the 
sender immediately by return e-mail. Internet communications cannot be guaranteed to be timely, secure, error-free or virus-free. The 
sender does not accept liability for any errors or omissions.  
 

 

From: Daniel Jude  

Sent: Friday, March 29, 2019 10:53 AM 

To: joel.goh@eqinsurance.com.sg 

Cc: TPY Insurance Team <tpyinsteam@tanchong.org>; Mohamed Isman <isman@motorimage.net> 

Subject: SME5452R - 3RD PARTY CLAIM - ( TP ) - ( GBA4910T ) - ( EQ INSURED ) - LIABILITY STATUS 

Importance: High 

 

Hi Claims Team, 

 

Kindly advise liability status of the above mentioned on urgent basis 

 

Attached is the GIA report, Estimate and Video footage. 

 

 

 

Thank You. 

 

Best Regards 

Daniel A Jude 

Service Executive  

Motor Image Enterprises Pte Ltd 

19 Lorong 8 Toa Payoh Singapore 319255 

HP: 8611 3195 

Email: danieljude@motorimage.net 

Website: www.tanchong.com :  www.motorimage.net 

 

 

 

 
 
 
Disclaimer: This e-mail is confidential. It may also be legally privileged. If you are not the addressee you may not copy, forward, disclose or 
use any part of this message. If you have received this message in error, please delete it and all copies from your system and notify the 
sender immediately by return e-mail. Internet communications cannot be guaranteed to be timely, secure, error-free or virus-free. The 
sender does not accept liability for any errors or omissions.  
 

 

 

 

This email has been checked for viruses by AVG antivirus software. 

www.avg.com  
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