Jimmy Chen (LKK Auto)

From: Audrey Woo (Auto Svcs/Claims & IA/Claims & IA/Buses) <audrey@smrt.com.sg>
Sent: Friday, 19 July 2019 9:04 AM

To: Jimmy Chen (LKK Auto); ‘claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com’

Cc: Vic (LKKAuto); Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Subject: Accepted $5507 - LKK Ref CC3/EQI19006234/Jpb3 - SMRT Ref

BUS/04/19/7004/AW - Accident involving SMB1437C and GBJ2555B on 5 April 2019
along Lavender Street

SMRT : BUS/04/19/7004/AW
LKK : CC3/EQI19006234/)pb3
China Taiping Ref : GBJ2555B
Without Prejudice. Save as to Costs.

We are glad to accept your offer of $5507 and shall look forward to China Taiping’s DV/CHQ soon. Thank
you.

Final CHQ $5507 may be issued to SMRT BUSES LTD and postal mailed to 6 Ang Mo Kio Street 62
Singapore 569140.

cAudrey Woe | DID : 6556 3521 | FAX:64819221 | Email : audrey@smrt.com.sg | Claims
Department | 6 Ang Mo Kio Street 62 Singapore 569140

From: Jimmy Chen (LKK Auto)

Sent: Thursday, 18 July 2019 5:44 PM

To: audrey@smrt.com.sg

Cc: Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh@lkkauto.com>; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com>
Subject: LOD to China Taiping - BUS/04/19/7004/AW - Accident involving SMB1437C - OUR REF:
CC3/EQI19006234/Jpb3

Without Prejudice (save as to costs)
Dear Sirs/Mdm,
We refer to the above matter.

We propose settlement as follows: -

1. Cost of Repair (w/GST) $4,750.00
2. Loss of Use (3 Days X $250.00) $ 750.00
3. LTA/GIA Search Fee $ 7.00

TOTAL | $ 5,507.00

Please confirm acceptance.

“Please note that our above settlement is made on a without prejudice basis, and should not be construed as an admission of liability on
our part or on the part of our insured/driver. Terms of such settlement should also not be disclosed in any other related matter(s) in
respect of the accident. Our offer made in respect of this present matter is made solely to resolve this matter only. No reference shall be
made to this offer or any settlement arising from this offer in any other related matters.



Settlement and payment are subject to production of original documents on demand at any time and execution of Discharge Voucher (for
settlement sum above $20,000/-) by the Plaintiff/Claimant. Further all original documents shall be retained by us after we have made
payment on the settlement sum.”

Best Regards,

Jimmy Chen| Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2928 | email: jimmychen@Ilkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Audrey Woo (Auto Svcs/Claims & IA/Claims & IA/Buses)

Sent: Wednesday, 22 May, 2019 9:30 AM

To: Admin A (admin-a@lkkauto.com); 'claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com’

Subject: LOD to China Taiping - BUS/04/19/7004/AW - Accident involving SMB1437C and GBJ2555B on 5 April 2019
along Lavender Street

SMRT Ref : BUS/04/19/7004/AW
China Taiping Ref : GBJ2555B

Dear Sir/Mdm,

We claim on behalf of SMRT BUSES LTD, owner of the vehicle registration number SMB1437C. Your client's negligent
driving has caused the above accident. As a result, my client has suffered the following losses,

Cost of Repair $4,750.00
Loss of Use ($275 x 3 Days) $ 825.00
LTA Search Fee $7.00
Total $5,582.00

We enclose the following documents,
® Repair Invoice
® GIAReport
e |TA Search
® Accident Scene Photos
® Survey Report and Bus Photos to be furnished China Taiping’s appointed surveyor LKK.

We look forward to your confirmation to settle our claims within 15 days from the date of this email. Payment by
cheque shall be crossed and made payable to SMRT BUSES LTD.

Audrey Wee | DID : 6556 3521 | FAX:64819221 | Email : audrey@smrt.com.sg | Claims
Department | 6 Ang Mo Kio Street 62 Singapore 569140

@smnr
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