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Y our ref; To Be Advised
Ouir ref: CCA/EQI006232/Unhb3 Date: 24.04.2019

The Maotor Claims Department

M/s EQ INSURANCE COMPANY LTD

Dear SirfMadam,

PRELIMINARY ADVICE OF VEHICLE NO. 5 74
We refer to the above matter

Please be informed that we hud conducted the inspection of the above mentioned vehicle on 23,04 2019
at the premises of M/s _Autolution Industrial Pre Ltd and have the following to report:-

Waorkshop Estimate Amount : 8% 6.325.50

Revised Estimate Amoun 188 4,567.12

"Check” ltems Amount 55 1,393.43

Maurker Value : 5% -

LTA Reimbursement Value : 88 -

Nett Value ;8% -

Description of Damage: b

The vehicle sustained damages at the - [_ =t i
/S Body =

Commenis/Present Stiutus;
Damages Consistent
Estimated normal period for repairs: 4 days

Yours faithfully,

MARCUS CHUA
Licensed Appraiser



Hsiao Taﬂ !LKKAutu!

From: Mavis Chng <mavis@tanchong.com>

Sent: Friday, 21 June 2019 8:46 AM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Cc: Elmer Alfonso; Hamzah

Subject: Re: Your Ref INSAC/H/0184/19 [SFL67Z) *Our Ref: CC4/EQI19006232/Upb3

[ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKH 582P(EQ) AND SFL 67Z ON 31/03/2019]

Hi Hsiao Tong,
We accept the offer $5098.82.

Thank you

Best regards

Mavis Chng

Snr Admin Executive

Autolution Industrial Pte Ltd

19 Ubi Road 4 Singapore 408623

Tel: +65 64909666 DID: + 65 67038692 Fax:+ 65 68467483
Email: mavis@tanchong.com

Website: www.nissan.com.sg

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Friday, June 21, 2019 8:31 AM

To: Hamzah

Cc: Mavis Chng; Elmer Alfonso

Subject: RE: Your Ref: INS/IC/H/0184/19 (S5FL67Z) *Our Ref: CC4/EQI19006232/Upb3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKH
582P(EQ) AND SFL 57Z ON 31/03/2019]

Without Frejudice
[save as to costs)

Dear Sirs/Mdm,
We refer to your below email.

For an amicable setflement. we are prepared 1o setfle your client's claim as follows: -

1. Cost of Repair [w/GST) % 488482
2. Loss of Use [3days x $70.00) § 210.00
3. LTA/ GIA Search Fee $ 2.00

TOTAL | § 5.098.82

Please confirm occeplance.,

“Please note that our above settlement is made on a without prejudice basis, and should not be construed as an admission of liability on
our part or on the part of our Insured/driver. Terms of such settlement should also not be disclosed in any other related matter(s] in



respect of the accident. Our offer made In respect of this present matter is made solely to resolve this matter anly. No reference shall be
made to this offer or any settlement arising from this offer in any other related matters.

Settlement and payment are subject to production of original documents on demand at any time and execution of Discharge Voucher (for
settlement sum above $20,000/-) by the Plaintiff/Claimant. Further all original documents shall be retained by us after we have made
paymeant on the settlement sum.”

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewhi@kkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{408933)

From: Hamzah <hamzah_saad@tanchong.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 18 June 2019 1:19 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@|kkauto.com>

Cc: Mavis Chng <mavis@tanchong.com>; Elmer Alfonso <elmer@tanchong.com>

Subject: Re: Your Ref: INS/IC/H/0184/19 (SFL672Z) *Our Ref: CC4/EQI19006232/Upb3 [ACCIDENT
INVOLVING SKH 582P(EQ) AND SFL 67Z ON 31/03/2019]

Dear Hsiao Tong,
Nissan Qashqai got 2 version, 1.2 Turbo and 2 litre, same body.
NIMA recommendation up to 580.00 per day.

Regards.

Hamzah 5a'ad

Service Supervisor

Autolution Industrial Pte Ltd

19 Ubi Road 4

5408623

TEL: +65 67038680 DID: +65 67038690 FAX: +65 68467483

Hp: +65 96450079 Email: hamzah saad@tanchong.com

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ilkkauto.com>

Sent: Tuesday, lune 18, 2019 9:04:07 AM

To: Hamzah

Cc: Mavis Chng; Elmer Alfonso

Subject: RE: Your Ref: INS/IC/H/0184/19 (SFL672Z) *Our Ref: CC4/EQI19006232/Upb3 [ACCIDENT
INVOLVING SKH 582P(EQ) AND SFL 67Z ON 31/03/2019]

Without Prejudice

Hi Hamazah,

We refer to your below email.



We wish to inform you that your client's vehicle s | 197cc. Therelore, we are of the view that our offer of LOU
at $460.00/day is reasonable.

Kindly re-consider our offer.

Thank you,

“Please note that our above settlement ls made on a without prejudice basis, and should not be construed as an admission of llability on
our part ar an the part of our Insured/driver. Terms of such settlement should also nat be disclosed In any other related matter(s) in
respect of the accident. Our offer made in respect of this present matter is made solely to resolve this matter only. No reference shall be
made to this offer or any settlement arising from this offer in any other related matters.

Settlement and payment are subject to production of original documents on demand at any time and execution of Discharge Voucher [for
settlement sum above $20,000/-) by the Plaintiff/Claimant. Further all original documents shall be retained by us after we have made
payment on the settlement sum.”

Best Regards,

Hsino Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park. Ubi Avenue 1, 202-25 | ${408933)

From: Hamzah <hamzah saad@tanchong.com>

Sent: Monday, 17 June 2019 9:17 AM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@|kkauto.com>

Cc: Mavis Chng <mavis@tanchong.com>; Eimer Alfonso <elmer@tanchong.com>

Subject: Re: Your Ref: INS/IC/H/0184/19 (5FL67Z) *Our Ref: CC4/EQI19006232/Upb3 [ACCIDENT
INVOLVING SKH 582P(EQ) AND SFL 67Z ON 31/03/2019]

Sorry,
Should be at $80.00 per day.

Regards

Hamzah 5a'ad

Service Supervisor
Autolution Industrial Pte Ltd
19 Ubi Road 4

5408623
TEL: +65 67038680 DID: +65 67038690 FAX: +65 68467483
Hp: +65 96450079 Email: hamzah saad@tanchong.com

From: Hamzah

Sent: Monday, June 17, 2019 8:48:20 AM
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Cc: Mavis Chng; Elmer Alfonso



Subject: Re: Your Ref: INS/IC/H/0184/19 (SFL67Z) *Our Ref: CC4/EQI19006232/Upb3 [ACCIDENT
INVOLVING SKH 582P(EQ) AND SFL 67Z ON 31/03/2019]

Dear Hsiao Tong,

NIMA benchmark about 20 years ago for up to 1600 cc is between $60.00 to 580.00 per day.
Why you offer me the minimum after about 20 years?

| maintain should be $800.00 per day.

Kindly revert and at mean times, legal action will be on hold.
Regards.

Hamzah Sa'ad

Service Supervisor

Autolution Industrial Pte Ltd

19 Ubi Road 4

5408623

TEL: +65 67038680 DID: +65 67038690 FAX: +65 68467483
Hp: +65 96450079 Email: hamzah saad@tanchong.com

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@|kkauto.com>

Sent: Saturday, June 15, 2019 11:04:58 AM

To: Hamzah; Mavis Chng

Subject: Your Ref: INS/IC/H/0184/19 (SFL67Z) *Our Ref: CC4/EQI19006232/Upb3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING
SKH 582P(EQ) AND SFL 67Z ON 31/03/2019]

Your Ref: INS/IC/H/0184/19 (SFL&71) Without Prejudice
Our Ref: CC4/EQI19006232/Upb3

Dear Sirs/Mdm,
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKH 582P(EQ) AND SFL 472 ON 31/03/2019
We reler to the above matier.

We propose settlement as follows: -

1. Cost of Repair (w/GST) $ 4,886.82
2. Loss of Use [3days x $40.00) $ 180.00
3. LTA/ GIA Search Fee $ 200

TOTAL | §5,068.82

Please confirm occeptlance.

“Please note that our above settlement is made an a without prejudice basis, and should not be construed as an admission of llability an
our part or on the part of our Insured/driver. Terms of such settlement should also not be disclosed in any other related matter(s) in
respect of the accldent. Our offer made in respect of this present matter is made solely to resolve this matter only. No reference shall be
made to this offer or any settlement arising from this offer in any other related matters.



Settlement and payment are subject to production of original documents on demand at any time and execution of Discharge Voucher (for
settlement sum above 520,000/-) by the Plaintiff/Claimant. Further all original documents shall be retained by us after we have made

payment on the settlement sum.”

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkouto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{4080933)
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PARF/COE Rebate Enquiry

> Back to OneMotoring

Page | of |

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars
Owner ID Type:

Owner ID:
Vehicle Details
Vehicle No.:

Vehicle to be Exported:
Intended Deregistration Date:
Vehicle Make:

Vehicle Model:

Primary Colour:
Manufacturing Year:

Engine No.:

Chassis No.:

Maximum Power Output:
Open Market Value:

Original Registration Date:
First Registration Date:
Transfer Count:

Actual ARF Paid:

Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility:

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:
PARF Rebate Amount:
Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date:

COE Category:

COE Period(Years):

QP Paid:

COE Rebate Amount:

Total Rebate Amount:

Singapore NRIC
5491A

SFL&7Z

No

23 Apr 2019

NISSAN

QASHQAI 1.2 DIG-T CVT ABS 2WD 5DR
Silver

2016

HRA2307174A
SINFEAJ11U1718821
85.0 kW (113 bhp)
$18.689.00

16 Nov 2016

16 Nov 2016

0

$13,689.00

Yes
15 Nov 2026
$10,266.00

15 Nov 2026

A - Car up to 1600cc & 97kW (130bhp)
10

$52,668.00

$39.833.00

$50,099.00

The information contained herein is correct as at 23 Apr 2019

httwes el Ira e conllta el /astianianmneraBl abharall Doklis RafaraDNoesaolamot TET TRITCTIOR IT=EATN 77T Awme 10



Used Nissan Qashqai Car & Used Cars & Vehicles Singapore - sgCarMari Page | of 3

sGCARMART.COMN Login - Skgh up
Now Cars Uted Cars Sall My Car Direciory Products Ingurance Articies Farum Resources
o A Qenera | 1 THirsg) al
L] l
o Mather of AME [ at Chack

B 1 -E]
Post an Advertisement New 5 Years Coe Renewnl Honda Stream 1

Sell it yoursed Advertsse it af just

$58 until it's SOLD!

Browse by Category ] «Back | 12 ) e Sort by Dite Posted w| 20 results/ipage [ w]
31 vehicles Migzan Gashaal AN Sea M Sutmii
Maje Mode Price Degreciation Bg Catre Eng Cap Miliage wah Type SENEL
Search Selection Miasan (Jeshasil Y JOLlE . Ly A yha
Missan Qashgai 2.0A 78,500 0,220 e 10-Moy- 2018 1997 ex 35,000 bim s Awailalie
Wery Canelul Deives =0
. L oy v oy | : . i ., i, e
Mizzan Qashgai 1.2A DIG-T $75.800 59,240 fyr D8-0ct-2036 1,197 ¢z 53, 23% km v Avalinine
Premiium
Graded A by STH
Purchase From An Awand Wimning Deslership! Agent Warranty Tl Donbeér 2015 Includes | Free Agent Seriong. STA Certifed Acodent:Free Quealty
Pre-Orned With Low Mileage And Agent Warranty For Peace.
iy fat ool ies
Missan Qashgal 1.2A DIG-T § 77 EHN 9,260 ryr 2% De- 2116 L1897 e 38, 00 wrm SN Awvailabie
Premitiim
1 Cwiner, Fully Serviced And Maintained By Tan Chong Motore, Agesst Warranty, Excellent Condition. Do Mol Miss! o ]
- iy - A by i - | TR (e o T AT, 1
Niszan Qashgal 1.2ZA DIG-T 45, 500 F5.150 fyr &-Feb-20186 1,197 45,500 km SUN Availanie
Premipm
Ome Dweer, Fully Agent Maintained. Large SUY With Reasonable Proe Tag To Go! 160 Point Check Done., Quality Assurance Inspection Complele, No
Repmwl Needed. Please Call Dur Sales Consuhant For More E P — )

Inchizape Pre-Dvrmd

ok Togm: 1 ' TGN =} I 1
Af ¥ T
Nissan Qushaal 1.2A DIG-T #71.088 59,510 fvr 05-May-2016 L1597 e 43,763 km SIN Awailabie
Premiom
1 Lagdy Owner, Pesdl Whte Cashga 1,240 Low Milsage Done A2 459785 Onty. Soll In Onginal Panwork And Comidion. Tip Top Condition. 100%
Accident-Free, Call Now For Viewsng LD
Missan Qashgal 2.0A Premium S8 1800 55,860 10 -Aiag-20186 1587 o 41101 km SLN Avnliable

Lo [mferest Rates From 1.99%, In House Loan Avalable. Low Milsage, Supert Well Maintained & Kesp H\l Previous Carefll One Owner Wsh On
Gung Warranty From Tan Chong Motors, Buy 11 From Lis With A Pea....

Dhickanin Aqmormiile

httre:anvw corarmart camfncad  rare/hichinn shaTROGNIETN1AEAMMNTNSAcean Moachoa &R PIOG=008VE Ti-Ane 10



' r
Nivitha (LKK Auto)

From: Janet Tan -:janet.tan@eqinsurance.mm.sg:-

Sent: Monday, 8 April 2019 4:26 PM

To: assignments

Cc Admin A

Subject: FW: DM19HOD0963/IT: Accident involving SFL67Z and your insured SKH582P on
31-3-2019

Attachments: sfi67z-sas 310319.pdf: sfl67z-estimate 310319.pdf; SAS2579604.PDF

Dear all

Please attend to the PRS.

Liability is cleared,proceed to direct sattle If possible, “ Kon CWE 3
Regards, Tiw: L55pW
Janet Tan SR

Senior Executive | Claims \/
E

eéjnsurorjce

EQ Insurance Company Limited

5 Maxwell Road #17-00 Tower Block MND Complex Singapore 069110
did 656496 9032 | tel 65 6223 9433 ext 032 | fax 65 6223 4190

WwWWw . eqinsurance.com.

~.. & Nermnger of | 1yitaie {#—_-—

Privileged/Confidential information moy be contained in this message. If you are not the intended recipient, please notify t!

From: Hamzah [rnalIm.'hamzah_saaﬂ@tanchnng.r.nm]

Sent: Monday, April 8, 2019 4:20 PM

To: Janet Tan <janet.tan@eqinsurance.com.sg>

Subject: Re: DM19HO00963/JT- Accident involving SFL67Z and your insured SKH582P on 31-3-2019

Dear Janet,

You may engage LKK Auto Consultant to survey.
Regards

Hamzah Sa'ad

Service Supervisor

Autolution Industrial Pte Ltd

19 Ubi Road 4
5408623



TEL: +65 67038680 DID: +65 67038690 FAX: +65 68467483

Hp: +65 96450079 Email: hamzah saad@tanchong.com

From: Janet Tan <janet.tan

insurance.com.

Sent: Monday, April 8, 2019 9:56:18 AM
To: Hamzah
Subject: DM19H000963/IT: Accident Involving SFL67Z and your insured SKH582P on 31-3-2019

Without Prejudice
Save As To Costs

Dear Sir/Madam,

For pre repair survey request, Rlease emall to eg[grs@tﬂ.‘ginauran;g.cam.g_g

We can agree on direct settlement, if possible.

We shall be appointing our surve
Below is a list of motor surveyo
objections to the appaintment of any of the motor su
agreed to the appointment of any of the motor sury
our proposed motor surveyors to the said assignme

rs in our panel, Please

Yor to attend to the pre-repair survey of your client’s vehicle.

revert within 2 working days if you agree or have any

rveyors. If we do not hear from you, you are deemed to have
eyors listed by us, Alternatively, please specify one or more of

1) AJAX Inspection Services Pte Ltd 2) Automobile Inspection Services Pte Ltd
Tel: 6255 0808 Tel: 6286 0155
Fax: 58499155 Fax: 6284 1539
Contact Person: Sophia
3) LBS Automotive Appraisal Pte Ltd 4) Priority Services
L.B.5. Auto Consuitants Pte Ltd Tel: 62934822
Tel: 6281 6690 / 62832866 Fax: 62963283
Fax: 6281 8748 Contact Person: Sharon
Contact Person: Amy/ Grace
5) RT Appraisal Pte Ltd 6) LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Tel: 67486076 Tel: 6256-3561
Fax: 67480361 Fax: 6741-4108
Contact Person: Elson/Elgene
7) Kelvin Automotive Appraising Services 8) Automotive Appraiser & Surveying
Tel: 81825263 Services
Fax: 67461148 Tel: 96623655
Contact Person: Kelvin Fax: 67655662
Contact Person: Mr Chee
9) JP Knights Pte Ltd 10) Appraisals Associates Pte Ltd
Tel: 63450068 Tel : 67472822
Fax: 63445328 Fax: 67470070
11) Infiniti Appraisal Service
Tel : 96684818/90099001




Fax: 64587432 | [
If you object to all the motor surveyors as proposed by us, please provide a list of at least 10 motor surveyors whom
you consider as suitable to appoint for our consideration. We shall revert to you within 2 working days.

Meanwhile, we reserve our rights on Post-Repair Inspection, kindly contact us or our appointed surveyor before you
return your client's vehicle to him/her,

Regards,

Janet Tan
Senior Executive | Claims

eqnsurance

T

EQ Insurance Com pany Limited
5 Maxwell Road #17-00 Tower Block MND Complex Singapore 069110
did 65 6496 9032 | tel 656223 9433 ext 032 | fax 65 6223 4180

www.eqgin surance.com.sg
L - o

Privileged/Confidential information may be contained in this message. If you are not the intended recipient, please notify t/

From: Hamzah [mailto:hamzah saad@tanch .Lom

Sent: Monday, April 8, 2019 9:34 AM

To: Janet Tan <janet.tan@eqinsuran e.com.s

Subject: Re: Accident involving SFL67Z and your insured SKH582P on 31-3-2019

Dear Janet,
Your insured driver called me last week and there was no indication on private settlement.
Kindly revert.

Regards

Hamzah Sa'ad

Service Supervisor

Autolution Industrial Pte Ltd

15 Ubi Road 4

5408623

TEL: +65 67038680 DID; +65 67038690 FAX: +65 68467483

Hp: +65 96450079 Email: hamzah saad@tanchong.com

From: Janet Tan <janet.tan@eginsuran £.C >

Sent: Thursday, April 4, 2019 2:19:28 PM

To: Hamazah

Subject: RE: Accident involving SFL67Z and your insured SKH582P on 31-3-2019

k|




Withdut Prejudice
Savg As To Costs

Dear Hamzah
Our insured driver shall be calling you shortly as he would like to private settle the matter,
Please keep us posted. Thank you.

Regards,

Janet Tan
Senior Executive | Claims

edlm_suronce

=T -.}-"'f"';- Lol

EQ Insurance Company Limited
3 Maxwell Road #17-00 Tower Block MND Complex Singapore 069110
did 65 5496 9032 | tel 65 6223 9433 ext 032 | fax 65 6223 4190

wﬂw.ggingg@ﬂge.;gm.sg
~" A& Mewnbas of {irniless (ﬁ_‘—' o

Privileged/Confidential information may be contained in this message, If you are not the intended recipient, please natify t}

From: Hamzah [mailto:hamzah saad@tanchong.com]|

Sent: Thursday, April 4, 2019 11:20 AM

To: Janet Tan <janet tan@eqinsuranc .Com.sg>

Subject: Accident involving SFLE7Z and your insured SKH582P on 31-3-2019

Hi,

Prior to the above, my client wish to make TP claim against your insured, direct settlement with claiming
for loss of use/vehicle rental.

Kindly check your insured liability and revert.
Attachment are my client accident report and workshop estimate.

Regards

Hamzah Sa'ad

Service Supervisor

Autolution Industrial Pte Ltd

19 Ubi Road 4

5408623

TEL: +65 67038680 DID: +65 67038690 FAX: +65 68467483



Hp: +65 96450079 Email: hamzah saad@tanchong.com
L]



Autolution Industrial Pte Ltd

DATE 85 015

¥OLUR REF CCAVEQNIS006232 /Uikb3

DUR REF INS/IC/H/D1R4/19 .
The Motar Claims Degartment £0 (NSLIRANCE COMPANY L 10

D Siry Mardam

Arpadint Ipvolving MY CLIENT VEMICLE SELATY AND YOUR INSURED VEHICLE SKH582F
Acpademn) Date $1/37 2019 TIME 10:30

Place and time of scoudent BAYSHORE ROAD

RE Direct Settherment {or the Wahiche Nimbes SFLGTE

Chn bekall al the swner of Metor Vehidle ho SFLETZ wihich ws menled

in thie captsuned accidiend
The Vehile wis sureryed by pou sppomted suveyor at AUTOLUTION INDUSTRIAL PFTE LTD 19 UBI ROAD 4 SINGAPORE 408623

#nd | based vy claimy on s recormmpnaaten o W0 3 SIMLE2 ooy The ropar ot and penod of nopair tar
E| dava Siricthy on @ Withool Prijudice Basis)
—
A The acordent Wik AUV Dy INe NERHRENT 200 o your imauned SEHSBIP  fam submitting this tlam for your

nnsideraban

COST REPAIR 604 4 88687
e ——
COAT OF LESS 3 DAYY (%) SGD% BO DAY SGOS 2140.DG

[Please el Lo duthorisalion letle

GIA BEPORT FEES (8GOS 12 .00 FOR SEARCH FEL & SG0% 15 00 FOR EACH SGOS

REPOWT FEE

LTASEARCH SLRVEY FEE SGD5 700
COST OF CARRENTAL DAYS) B0 5 WD s

Wedee sl laims sGD S

TOTAL AMOUNT il 511882

Wi pnaiose horewith the lobowing docements 1o ssppat my ¢emms

A AUTHORIZATION LETTER i FINAL REPAIR BILL (%)
n LTA SEARCH 4 GlA REPOIAT (5] RESANT
C INSUBRANCE CERTIHCATE ETT G LETTER OF DEMAND
o CAN BENTAL iWvTICE L MEIRCAL CLAIM

Kbl toak mte £ e miatler and ket me bt from you on The settisment of U owmer's

clalrms 20 soon @ possilile. Thank you

iy e Yarpuehy 1

Tel WTOESETD HP. Te45007TS

TANCHONG
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S URLAVE 1, #01-25 PAYA UBLINDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : 1065) 62563561 FAX : (065} 62564315

Our Ref: CC4/EQI119006232/hb3
12 April 2019

WONG YEW LIN

70 BAYSHORE ROAD
#22-08

SINGAPORE 469987
Atin: The Management

Dear Sir/Madam,
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKHS582P AND SFL67Z ON 31/03/2019

We refer to the above accident where we are acting for EQ INSURANCE COMPANY
LIMITED to resolve the claim against you and/or your authorized driver under the Auto
Insurance policy taken up with them.

We have received a claim from SFL67Z against vour motor insurance policy.

Based on the accident report and accident scenario, liability is down against us. We will
therefore proceed to negotiate for an amicable settlement with the Third Party.

Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and
settlement, please contact us within 10 days from the date of this letter.

Please note that your No-Claim Discount (NCD) (if any) will be affected and reduced by
30% (20% for commercial vehicles) upon next renewal due to this Third Party claim.
However, if your policy has a NCD protector feature, it will be deemed utilized for this
claim and your NCD will be protected.

Please call us if you have further queries.

Yours faithfully,

i

KHANCHNA

Case Handler

DID: 6841 2360

FAX: 6741 4108

EMAIL: vicalpehf@lkkauto.com

ce.  EQ INSURANCE COMPANY LIMITED
(Motor Claims Dept)
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TANCHONG

ITEMS

DOoLLa

v GUARL

VEHICLE NO :

AUTOLUTION INDUSTRIAL PTE LTD

r Aszociation with Tan Chong Motor Sales Pia Lid

19 UBI ROAD 4 SINGAPORE 408623 TEL: 64909656/67

Business Req. No., 198500871W
GST Reg. Mo MZ-8920338-9

JOB DESCRIPTION

INVOICE NO
INVOICE DATE
TERAMS

DATE RECT

8A BE

JOB NO

MILEAGE

YOUR REFERENCE

BMOUNT

WORKSHOP MANAGER

WORKSHOP



TANCHONG AUTOLUTION INDUSTRIAL PTELTD

In Associabion with Tan Chong Motor Sales Pie Lid
3 UBI ROAD 4 SINGAPORE 408623 TEL: 6290266&/6TO3B680 FAX: bE4GT4ES

Business Reg. No.. 1S9S00BTIN _ =
GST Reg. No: M2-BR20338-9
1
NAME INVOICE ND
INVOQICE DATE
ADDRESS TERAMS
DATE RECD
TELEFHONE A/ SE
WODEL ICHE MO
ENGINE MO MILEAGE
CHASSES MO YOUR REFERENCE
VEHIILE NO
ITEMS | JOB DESCRIPTION AMOUNT
A .
— Fi |
A LA
¥ 'l' W
DOLLARS

WORKSHOP

URITY GLARE =

VEHICLE ND . REl EABE BY



Invoice

GENERAL
INSURANCE
ASSOCIATION

RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE

Page 2 of 2

GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE

RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE
6 Raffies Quay #18-00, Singapors 048580
Phone: +85 G224 0010 Fax: +65 6224 0030
Operating Hours: Monday 1o Friday Bam to Spm

GET Registration No Ma000D17735

TAX INVOICE
Qur Ref No. GR-18-050489
Daie of Request D1/04/2018 Your Ref No Onling Purchase
Tan Chong Motor Sales Pte Ltd
911, Bukit Timah Road
Singapore 589622
Dear Sir/Madam,
Enquiry Date 01042018
Enguiry By Eric Kah Yong Lang
TP Vehicle No SkHsB2P
Accident Date 31032018
DESCRIPTION . - [AMOUNT (S5) =
TP Insurer Enguiry : 187
GST Amount | 013
"Total Amount Due (GST Inclusive) 1 200]

Thank You.

This is a computer generaled document and requires no signature

For GIARMC Official use
Date:
[X] GIRO | | Cash [ | Chegque

hups:Ysingapore.merimen.com/claims index cim?fusehos=MTRsas& fusenction=dsp ve

412019



Invoice Page 1 of 2

GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE
GENERAL  RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE
B Raffles Quay #18-00, Singapore 048580
INSURANCE #rone +65 6226 0010 Fax: +65 6226 0030
ASSODCIATION Operating Hours: Monday to Friday Sam to Spm
RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE CO! negistration No: M400017735

Third Party Insurer Enquiry

Our Ref Mo GR-15-050400
Date of Requesi: 01042019 Your Hef No Online Purchase

Tan Chong Motor Sales Pie Lid
911, Bukit Timah Road

Singapore 589622

Dear Sir/\Madam,

Enguiry Cate D1/0472018

Enquiry By Eric Koh Yong Lang

TP Vehicle No. SKHERZP

Accident Dale 31/032019

Enquiry Result

TP Vehicle No Insurer Pernod of Insurance Insurer Tel. No.

| SKH582P EQ Insurance Company Ltd 24/02/2019-23/022020 {6223 9433 |
Thank Yol.

The images provided 1o you are taken from the original reports forwarded 1o the centre by the members of the General Insurance
Assoctation of Singapare and wo take no responsibility for their accuracy or contents snd shall be under no liability whatsoever for any
lose ar damage arising oul of or in connection with the reparts or their Imeges

This is a computer generated document and requires no signatura.

htps:/singapore. merimen. com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=M | Rsas& [uscaction dsp_ge... 4/1:2019
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o | | T Consitants
e B B Pre Lrd

Company Reglstration No 199860T188R

1L AVE 1 #2222 PAYA UHLINDUSTHIAL PARK, SINGAPORE J88933 TEL : (651 625035081 FAX = (45 62564315

: M/s EQ INSURANCE COMPANY LTD

Date: 02/07/2019

THIRD PARTY DIRECT SETTLEMENT

Vahicie No SKH 582P (Insd Veh) |Your Ref. No.: DM19HOO00963/JT
I i
SFL67Z (TP Veh) |Our Ref. No, : CC4/EQI19006232/Upb3q2
Date of Accident 31/3/2018 -
Liability 100%
Final Repair Cost % 4 BB6.82
Loss of Use -] 210.00 3 days
Rental (If any) ' 9 days
Others: 5 2.00
-3

5,088.82
Final Settlement Sum |[: § 5,098.82
Remarks N

Payment Instruction: Payee's Breakdown

1)

AUTOLUTION INDUSTRIAL FTE LTD

:$ 5,088.82

JOANNE LEE
LKK Auto Consultanis Pte Ltd




/L7

- = - = =

e F W |

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #07-25
TEL

Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408833
G256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg No 198607T18ER GST Reg Mo, 18-8607188-R

Affillated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automoblle

EQ INSURANCE COMPANY LTD

5 MAXWELL ROAD
#17-00 TOWER BLOCK

MND COMPLEXSINGAPORE 069110

Ref : CC4/EQI19006232/Upb3g2

Date: 02-07-2018

Code: EQI
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SKH 582P Veh. Inspected SFLBTZ
Policy No. DMPPHQ19-0010686 Coverage ($) 0.00 b
Claim No. DM18HO009631T Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From  JANET Assign Date 0B8/04/2019
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model NISSAN QASHOAI (A) c.c 1197
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2018
Chassis No. SINFEAJ11UTTIBB21 Colour SILVER
Odometer 34485 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN CRDER Modification SPORTS RIM
General GOOD
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |215/80 R17 GOODYEAR 7 mm
L/H Front Tyre |215/60R17 GOODYEAR 7 mm
R/H Rear Tyre |215/60 R17 GOODYEAR 7 mm
L/H Rear Tyre |215/60R17 GOODYEAR 7 mm
4. Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE O/S BODY.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS
5, General Information
Accident Date  31/0372019 Inspection Date 22/04/2019
Survey held at AUTOLUTION INDUSTRIAL PTE LTD
19 UBI ROAD 4
SINGAPORE 408623
5a. Remarks
AJTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.
5b, Estimate Days of Repair
ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR 4 Working Days




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Ubi Ave 1 201-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408033
TEL: B258 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. No 189607188R GST Reg No 18-G607188-R Page No. 1 of 2
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SFL 672
' Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Condition Workshop ($)) ($)
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|R/R DOOR ARC MLDG (N) SCRATCHED 483.00 483.00
1|R/R DOOR LOWER PVC MODG (N) SCRATCHED 264.80 264 80
1|R/R DOOR CHECK LINK (N) NOT NECESSARY 3950
1|R/R DOOR LOWER HINGE (N) NOT NECESSARY 56.10
1|R/R DOOR TAPE (N) MNECESSARY 28.90 28.80
1|R/R DOOR TAPE (N) NECESSARY 28.90 26,90
1|DOOR-REAR RH (N) BADLY DENTED 1,104.80 1,104.80
1|R/F DOOR LOWER PVC MLDG (N) SCRATCHED 323.60 323.60
1|R/F DDOR TAPE (N) MECESSARY 2990 2090
1|RH FRT DOCR SASH (N) NECESSARY 100.70 100,70
1|DOOR -FRONT RH (N) BADLT DENTED 1,104.80 1,104.80
LESS 20% DISCOUNT -713.40 -504 28
2.853.60 2772
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1|SUNDRIES {SN) MNOT NECESSARY 70.00 -
1|WHEEL RIM REAR RH (SN} TO REPAIR SEE 1.231.80 -
LABOUR
1,301.80 -
LABOUR
LABOUR CHARGES TO REPAIR RH CENTRE PILLAR ,RH 800.00 585.00
REAR FENDER AND RENEW BOTH RH
DOORS.INCLUSIVE OF THE REPAIR OF WHEEL RIM
REAR RH,
CHARGES TO SPRAY PAINTING SAME. 800.00 750,00
REMOVE AND INSTALL BOTH RH DOORS MECHANISM, 160.00 160.00
APPLY SEALANT TO BOTH RH DOORS 200.00 200.00
RENEW REAR WHEEL RIM AND WHEEL BALANCING. NOT NECESSARY 15.00
CHECK AND ADJUST WHEEL ALIGNMENT, 85.00 85.00
2.170.00 1,790.00
GRAND TOTAL 6,325.50 4,567.12

Report Ref No. CC4/EQI16006232/Upb3qg2
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RECOMMENDED COST OF REPAIRS ] I | as67.12|
Report Ref No. CC4/EQI19006232/Upb3g2 4

CHUA KANG SENG

Licensed Appraiser

DISCLAIMER DF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES - This Raport W made solely for the uss snd bensil of e Client named on the froni pags of this Repon.




Joanne Lee SLKI{ Autu!

From: Joanne Lee [LKK Auto) <report@Ikkauto.com>

Sent: Friday, 5 July 2019 1157 AM

To: ‘eqiprs@eqinsurance.com.sg’

Ce: ‘chewht@|kkauto.com'

Subject: TP Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SKH SB2P (O1) and SFL 67Z (TP) an
31/03/2019

Attachments: LKK REPORT & PHOTO.pdf; TP DS SUPPORTING DOCUMENT.pdf

[Jear SirfMadam,

Please be informed that the above-mentioned case had been setiled

Enclose herewith final report & relevant documents for your necessary action please.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

JOANNE | Reports

LKK Auto Consultants Pte.Ltd.

Phone: 6256-3561 Ext.111 Fax: 6741-4108 email: repart@Ikkauto.com

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #01-25 Singapore 408933



