Shu Pei (LKKAuto)

From: Joel Goh <joel.goh@eginsurance.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, 9 April 2019 2:32 PM

To: AbwinM9 - Linda Liao

Cc: Admin A

Subject: RE: SJS1989Y Against GZ4579B (EQ) DOA : 05/04/2019
Attachments: Estimation.pdf; GIA Report.pdf

Without Prejudice
Dear Linda

Thank you for your email.
We will assign LKK to conduct PRS.

Dear LKK
Please assist on this PRS.
Best Regards,

Joel Goh
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Privileged/Confidential information may be contained in this message. If you are not the intended recipient, please notify the senc

From: AbwinM9 - Linda Liao [mailto:lindaliao@AbwinM9.com]
Sent: Monday, April 8, 2019 12:52 PM

To: Joel Goh

Subject: RE: SIS1989Y Against GZ4579B DOA : 05/04/2019

Dear Joel
We appoint to Lkk conduct survey before repair, please assigned to LKK.

Thank you



** Notice
Our email address has changed, please update your records.

With effect from 19" March 2019, my primary email address will change to lindaliao@AbwinM9.com

Please update my contact information in your address book and direct your messages to my new email address.

You messages are important to me, thanks for keeping my information up to date.

Warmest regards,

HABWIN 2w

Service Cemtre

Linda Liao

Claims Executive
DID +65 6713 9417
HP +65 9751 9596

Abwin Service Pte Ltd

T +65 67139400 | F +65 6713 9415

No. 8 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4

#07-48 Premier @ Kaki Bukit Gate 2 Singapore 415875
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