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Nivitha (LKK Auto)

From: Mivitha (LKK Auto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Thursday, 11 July 2019 12:56 PM

To: 'Chong Boon Sen’; ‘assignments@lkkauto.com'’

Ce: 'SUR'

Subject: RE: OUR REF: SNM19D201318- SIR8441U - Direct Settlement (SM) - Accident

Involving SLS5091L & SJRB441U DOA 23.03.2019

Dear Sir/Mdm,

Please be informed that we are unable to conduct the inspection for SLS 5091L after some attempts to inform the
workshop to present the vehicle,

This case has been pending for a lang time due to the unavailability of the owner, therefore we decided to
temporarily close this case.

Kindly advise us if there is any arrahigemeht made and will Be glad to re-apén the case accordingly.

BEST REGARDS,

G.Nivitha | Admin

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone 6841-1972 | email: gasignments@lkknutogom | Ry 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paye Ubi Industrial Parck,; Ubi-Avenne 1, 2oo25 | S(ao89323)

From: Nivitha (LKK Autg) [mailto:admin-d@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Friday, 5 April 2019:3:45 PM

To: 'Chong Boon Sen' <boonsen.chong@sg.cntaiping.com>; 'assignments@lkkauto.com’
<assignments@lkkauto.com>

Cc: 'SUR' <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: OUR REF: SNM19D201318- 5IR8441U - Direct Settlement (SM) - Accident Invalving SLS5091L &
SJRB441U DOA 23.03,2019

Dear Boon 5en,
Thank you for the assignment.
Please be informed that vehicle is not in the workshop, repairer will arrange.

Kindly assist to create this claim in merimen,

Best Regards,

G.Nivitha| Admin
LEK Auto Consultunts Pte Lud
Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax; 6256-4315

1



Nivitha (LKK Autu!

Frim: Cheng Boon Sen <boonsen.chong@sg.cntaiping.com>

Sent: Friday, 5 April 2019 2:30 PM

To: Suraidah 8 Saidi  PTCBC

Ce assignments

Subject: RE: OUR REF: SNM19D201318- SJR8441U - Direct Settlement (SM) - Accident

Involving SLSS091L & SIR8441U DOA 23.03.2019

i L]
Without Prejudice La
Dear Sir, -
We will appoint LKK.
Dear LKK,
Pls pri.

Chong Boon Sen
Claims Executive
Department

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Ple. Ltd.
3 Anson Road #18-00 Springleaf Tower Singapare 079909
DID: (B5) 63886171 | M. (B5) XXX XXXX | F (85) 6222 1033

Wi www socntaiping.com | FB: www facebook comichinataipingsgl | WeChat: X$ 4551 Taiping SG 3 Anson
Road #16-00 Springleaf Towat Singapore 072808
DID: (65) 63896171 | M (B5) XXXX XXXX | F:(65)8222 1033

From: Suraidah B Saidi PTCBC [mailto:SuraidahB.Saldi@inchcape.com.sg)

Sent: Friday, 5 April, 2019 2:20 PM

To: Chong Boon Sen <boonsen.chong@sg.cntaiping.com>

Subject: RE: OUR REF; SNM19D201318- SJR8441U - Direct Settlement [SM) - Accident Involving SLS5091L &
SJR8441U DOA 23.03.2019

Hi Boon Sen,
We would like to have ADRIAN LING to conduct the assessment.
Thank you.

Warmest Regards,

SURAIDAH

TPR TEAM, CLAIMS DEPT

D: 6631 1887 | F: 6872 7260 | E: suraldahb.saidi@inchcape.com.sg
Inchecape Centre

Level 4, Bodycare Centre

2 Pandan Crescent

singapore 128462

dww bornsomatars com.sg | www lexus.comesg | www.tovotasingapore.com.sg | www.hino.comsg | www.suzukicar.com.sg



From: Chong Boon Sen <h . 5¢. cntaiping.coma

Sent: Friday, 5 April 2019 11:09 AM

To: Angie Foo <angle foo@se cntalping.com>; Suraidah B Saldi PTCBC <SuraidahB.Saidi®inchcape.com sg>
Subject: RE: OUR REF: SNM19D201318- SIRB4411) - Direct Settlement (SM) - Accident Involving SLS5091L &
5JR8441U DOA 23.03.2019

Without Prejudice

Dear Sir,

We intend to eonduct a pre-repair survey of the damage to your client’s vehicle jointly with your r.ilent,r*ruur motar
workshop. We propose to use oné of the following motar surveyors to conduct the joint pre-repair survey as a single
joint expert.

Please let us know within two(2) working days whether you agree to the appointment of any of these motor
surveyors as a single joint expert.

You may select one of the listed motor surveyors and we will bear the cost of the pré-repair survey carried out by
the single joint expert.

Pls refer to list excel for surveyors.

Chong Boon Sen
Claims Executive
Departmant

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Ple. Ltd.
3 Anson Road #16-00 Spnngleal Tower Singapare 079909

DID: (65) 63896171 | M (B5) XXXX XXAXX | F (B85)6222 1033
W: www sa cnlaiping.cam | FB: www facebook comichinataipingsg/ | WeChat; A F ¥ Taiping SG 3 Anson

Road #16-00 Springleaf Tower Singapare 078908
DID. (B5) 63898171 | M: (B5) XXXX MHHKK | F:(B5)B222 1033

From: Angle Foo
Sent: Friday, 5 April, 2019 11:01 AM
To: Chong Boon Sen <boonsen.chong@se ctaiping.com>; Alfred Toh <alfred toh@sg entaiping com>; Chee So

Chow <sochow cheed@sg cntalping com>; sura idahb. saidi@i inchcape.com.sg
Subject: OUR REF: SNM19D201318- SJR8441U - Direct Settlement (SM) - Accident Involving SLSS091L & SIR8441L
DOA23.03.2019

[ear Boon Sen,
Please conduct PRS-5LSS091L urgently —{: SNM19D201318- SIRBA41L —FILE WITH BOON SEN)

Officer In Charge —BOON SEN-DID 6389 6171



Regards
Angle Foo

From: Suraidah B Saidi PTCBC [1 x
Sent: Friday, April 05, 2019 10:55 AM

To: Claims Dept of CTI; Angie Foo

Subject: RE: Direct Settlement (SM) - Accident Involving SLS5091L & SIRB4410 DDA 23.03.2019

Hi,
Attached as per requested.

Warmest Regards,

SURAIDAH

TPR TEAM, CLAIMS DEPT

D: 6631 1887 | F: 6872 7260 | E: surgidahb. saidi@inchcape. com.se
Inchcape Centre '

Level 4, Bodycare Centre

2 Pandan Crescent

Singapore 128462
www.bomeomators.com.sg | www.lexys com.sg | www.tovolasingspore.com 58 | www.hino.com.sg | www.suzukicar.com.sg

From: Suraidah B Saidi PTCBC

Sent: Friday, 5 April 2019 9:16 AM

To: 'claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com’ <claimsdept@sg cntaiping.com>; Angle Fao foo@sg ontaiping.com>
Subject: RE: Direct Settlement (SM) - Accident Involving SLS5091L & SIR8441U DOA 23.03.2019

Importance: High

Dear Angie,
Appreciate If you could assist on this matter.
Thank you.

Warmest Regards,

SURAIDAH

TPR TEAM, CLAIMS DEPT

D: 6631 1887 | F: 6872 7260 | E: suraidahb.saidi@inchcape.com.se
Inchcape Centre

Level 4, Bodycare Centre

1 Pandan Crescent

Singapore 128462
www borneomotors.com.sg | www.lexus.com.sg | www.toyotasingapore.com.sg | www.hine.com.sg | www.suzuklcar com sg

From: Suraidah B Saidi PTCBC

Sent: Tuesday, 26 March 2019 5:21 PM

To: ‘claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com’ <claimsde taiping.com>

Subject: Direct Settlement (SM) - Accident Involving SLS5091L & SIR8441U DOA 23.03.2019
Hi,

Reference lo the above-mentioned.

Piease find attached herein a copy of our client’s Accident Report, Damaged Photos & Estimate Invoice for your kind
perusal

As our client is claiming agains! your insured SJRB441U thus would appraciate If you could revert to us on the liability
3



urgently or we could settle the case under Direct Settlement with Car Rental of @ $130 per day x no. of days as
recommended by your appointed surveyor.

Kindly have your surveyor to contact our Motor Claim Assessor, Sam Joi @ 9847 6208 / 6631 1687 is located at 17
Ubi Road 4 for an appointment (o inspect our client's vehicle.

Your kind attention into the above is greatly appreciated,

Thank you!

Warmest Regards,

SURAIDAH

TR TEAM, CLAIMS DEPT

D: 6631 1887 | F: 6872 7260 | E: suraidahb. saidi@inchcape.com.sg
Inchcape Centre

Level 4, Bodycare Centre

2 Pandan Crescent
Singapure 128461

www.borngomotors.com.sg | www lexus.com.sg | www.tovotasingapore.com.sg | www.hino.com.sg | www.suzukicar.com.sa
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