Vic (LKKAuto)

— ——
From: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpohi@lonpac.coms>
Sent: Wednesday, 30 October, 2019 12:26 PM
To: Vic (LKKAuto)
Ce: MT_Claim_SG
Subject: RE- <SEEK MANDATE> Direct Settlement (SM) - Accident Involving SMC4352M &
SGE20090 DOA 04.04.2019 *** LKK REF: CC4/LPC19006095/Uha3 [External
Confidential]

Lonpac External - Confidential
Dear Vic,

Kindly proceed as proposed.

Best Regards

Gerald Poh

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd
300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706

—_——

The all 8%%8 lonpac.com.sg

Lonpac Extarnal - Confidential data is for use by authorised external parties only,

From: Vic (LKKAuto) [mailto:vicalpeh@kkauto.com]

Sent: Monday, 21 October, 2019 10:39 AM

To: GERALD POH WEE BIN

Cc: MT_Claim_SG; Admin A; Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE; <SEEK MANDATE> Direct Settiement (SM) - Accident Invalving SMC4352M & SGE2009D DOA
04.04.2019 **=* LKK REF: CC4/LPC12006095/Uha3 [External Confidential]

Dear Gerald,

We refer to your below email.

We were Informed by the TP repairer that they had misplaced the ariginal copy of the Medical Receipts.
Foar your further instructions please.

Thank you



Hest [:I'egnni's.

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler

LEK Auto Consulianis Ple Lid

Phone: 6841-2006 | emall: vicalpeh@|kkauto.com | fax: 6741-g108
Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, T7hi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{408033]

F LSLr .

EaSRSR = Save the Farth: Print enly when necessary
Fhis e-mall contain confidential and privileged material, and are for tha sole use ol tha inlendad reciplenl. Use of disthbulion DY an
unintinded recipient s prohibiled, and may be a violalion of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do nol
ead this &=mail or any atiached nems. Piease delets the e-majl and all alachments, includng any coples thereol, and inform the
sencar that you have felated the e-mall, all attachments and any copies lhere . Thank vy

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN [mallto:geraldpoh@lonpac.com]

Sent: Tuesday, 8 October, 2019 3:01 PM

To: Vic [LKKAuto)

Cc: MT_Claim_5G

Subject: RE: <SEEK MANDATE> Direct Settlement (SM) - Accident Involving SMC4352M & SGE2009D DOA
04,04,2019 *** LKK REF: CC4/LPC19006095/Uha3 External Confidential|

Lonpac External - Confidential
Dear Vic,

Please request for the original copy of the medical bills.

Best Regards

Gerald Poh

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd
300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706

E The all %% lonpac.com.sg

Lonpac External - Confidential data is for use by authorised external parties anly.

From: Vic (LKKAuto) [mailto:vicaipeh @ik 1]
Sent: Tuesday, B October, 2019 2:50 PM
To: GERALD POH WEE BIN

Cc: MT_Claim_SG; Admin A
Subject: RE: <SEEK MANDATE> Direct Settlement (SM) - Accident Involving SMC4352M & SGE20090 DOA
04.04.2019 *** LKK REF: CC4/L.PC19006095/Uha3 [External Confidential]

Dear Gerald,
We refer to your below mandate,
Please be infarmed that TP after we send the offer, had amended the LOD and confirmed that their client would

also like to claim for the medical bills. TP owner confirm will not claim for further bodily injuries {see attached email
fram TR).



As such, we would like to revise our mandate as below:

TP CLAIMED REVISED - TO OFFER
Cost of Repair [w/gst) S 9364.29 5 432117
Loss of Use (550 x 4 days) 5 200.00 S  200.00
GlA Search Fee S 2.00 5 2.00
Medical Bills 5 361.90 5 361.90
TOTAL | § 9,928.19 5 4,885.07
Breakdown of days is as follows:

Our surveyor's recommended days to repalr 4 days

TOTAL 4 days

For your approval please.

Thank you

"Please note thot our above offer and any settlement arising from the above offer are made on a without prejudice basis, and
ghould not be construed as an admission of lighility on our part or on the part of our Insured Driver. Terms of such settlement
should also not be disclosed in any other related matter(s) in respect of the accident. Our offer made in respect of this present
matter is made solely to resolve this matter only. No reference shall be made to this offer or any settlement arising from this offer

in any other related matters.

Hest Regards,

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Ple Lid

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh@lkknuto,com | fax; 6741-4108

Blk 51, Payva Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
F SRS =

T I FL A
- -

Save the EFarth Frint only when necessery:

This e-mall contain confidential and privileged malaral, and are for the sole use of the ntended recipient. Use or distribution by an
unintended reciplent is prohibited. and may be a violation of law If you belleve that you received this e-mall In efror, please da not
read his e-mall or any attached llems Plaase delele the e-mall and all alachments, including any copWs thereof, and inform the
sandar that you have deleted the e-mail. all attachments and any copies thereol, Thank you

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN [mailto:geraldpoh@lonpac.com]

Sent: Thursday, 29 August, 2019 12:08 PM

To: Vic [LKKAuto)

Cc: MT_Claim_56

Subject: RE: <SEEK MANDATE> Direct Settlement (SM) - Accident Invalving SMC4352M & SGE2009D DOA
04.04.2019 *** LKK REF: CC4/LPC19006095/Uha3 [External Confidential]

Lonpac External - Confidential
Dear Vic,

Kindly proceed as proposed.



o Sy N EEILOOBGY

0 Iﬂﬂl'l'lﬂ Moton {!mrﬂ Ple Lid
ncreape Bodycam Ca
Borneo Motors Level 4, Inchcape Centrs

2 Pandan Crescent
128483
Tel «B56831 185581500
Fax: «65 6872 7260
www bornecmolors com.sg

Our Ref: BMS2019/08/PD9775/D5(SM)
Your Ref: LONPAC-SGE200%D

16 Sep 2019 BY HAND (INS COPY)
M/S. LONPAC INSURANCE BERHAD C/O LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTELTD

Attn  : Officer in-Charge

Dept : Motor Claims

RE : ACCIDENT INVOLVING SMCA4352M AND SGE2008D ON 04 Apr 2019

Dear Officer,

We refer to the above captioned. (Amendment Copy)

The accident was caused by the negligence of your insured and as a result, our client has incurred
the following losses:

A, Repair Cost -54,321.17 B. LTA Search -52.00

C. Excess - D. Lossof Use - 5200.00(550x4days) |
E. Lossof Rental - F. Others -

G. Medical Claims - $361.90

Total Claim -54,885.07
-Undertake By Claimant L]

We would appreciate if you could revert to us with an offer to settlement within 8 working weeks as
required under NIMA Protocol.

Enclosed are the following decuments for your kind perusal:

[¥) Original Tax Invoice [¥) Vehicle Registration Card

(v') Car Rental Invoice/Agreement/Medical Receipt [X) Driver's driving license / Identity card
(¥) GIAS/Police Report/s (X) Original Photograph X

(v) Certificate of Insurance [X) Original/Photocopy Survey

(¥ Letter of Authority {¥) LTA Search Fees

*Cheque Is to be made payable to BORNEQ MOTORS (SINGAPORE) PTE LTD & mall it to, Inchcape

Bodycare Centre Level 4, Inchcape Centre, 2 Pandan Crescent, Singapare 128462, Attn: TPR
Department®

Yours faithfully,

TPR Team
Claims Service Department
F:68727260 E: claimstatusenguiny@borneomotors.com.sg

(As this is a computer generated letter, no signature is required.)



LETTER OF AUTHORITY

ACCIDENT INVOLVING Conesr M og (GE1037)oq YLD
Can vehicl's mankor Dilyer valivhe's foniher Diate of acoilerd
along fLE
Aocigen] location
BY THE LETTER OF AUTHORITY, lwe, (el (i wen (aphenn
Hm_iﬁmww

of 1 Tiwpan lonvend T H2Y VB Ahe Ttgines Tl )
Aiiws oF Policy Fcier '

owner of Vehicle Registration No. S*(“!% 247 hersby appoint BORNEQ MOTORS
(SINGAPORE) PTE LTD (hereinafter refars lo BMS), a company Incorporated In Singapore and
having its registered office at 33 Leng Kee Road, Singapore 169102, to do all or any of the following:

1. To submil, resolve and make any claims which */lwe may have against the other
*parly/parties to the Accident and under the Insurance *policy/policies taken up by such
*party/parties or alternatively under Insurance Policy number TR IT Tuly e taken up
byﬂnmandpaylhnmpdmrymmhmpuﬂuf&mmtnfmpnhsdhmd by *melus
arising from the Accident (loss and damage).

2 To collect paymeni(s) due in respeci of any such clalm(s) for the lass and damage, such
Pﬂ?menlmhmmwww&mlﬂimﬂwﬁw
LTD and give a valld receipl and discharge therafors,

3. For any of the purposa aforesald, to execule, sign and deliver all documents whatsoever in
relation thereto.

). anerally do ali such acts as i shall dewn necessary for the nurpose of saltling such =laim

*I/We hereby declare that all acts, Instruments and documents dona by virlue of this letter of authority
on “my/our behalf shall be as good valid and effectual 1o all intents and purposes whalsoever as If the
sama had been done or execuled by *ma/us In *mylour own proper parson(s) and *\we hereby ralify
and confirm, all acts, instruments and documents done or execuled by virlue of the authority and
powers hereby conferred.

“/We hereby further declare thal the letter of authority hereby conferrad shall remain
irrevocable.

“We further confirm thal the acceptance by BMS of the seltlement amount In respect of such
constitute the full discharge of "my/our ntalm[s]hrresp&nn{suuhm;umd damage.

IN WITNESS WHEREOF, "liwe hava hersunto to set *myfour hand and sign this U’ of
the month 1"-""ﬂ‘~-.\ Year20 %
|
Signed & Ddl!iamd By. Witness By: | A
14 -
LA

;  “dulets & appropriate

{17 b=



Vit

LONPAC INSURANCE BHD

CLAIM NO  : 19/19/19/VPO5/021633
DATE : 30 OCTOBER 2019

DISCHARGE VOUCHER

I'We, LEE LI WEN CATHERINE confirmed acceptance from M/s LONPAC
INSURANCE BHD and/or the owner of SGE 2009D the sum of Singapore Dollars
Four Thousand Eight Hundred Eighty Five and Cents Seven Only ($4.885.07) in full
and final sausfaction, hiquidation and discharge of property claim competent 1o me/us
upon the said M/s LONPAC INSURANCE BHD in respect of property claim
sustained by mefus whether now or hereafter 10 become mamifest. ansing either
directly or indirectly from an accident to my vehicle, SMC 4352M on 04 APRIL
2019 along PIE EXIT TO KALLANG BAHRLU.

I /We hereby agree to indemnily and keep indemnify (SME ALLIANCE LLP /
LONPAC INSURANCE BHD) against all claims and any claims whatsoever made
by any person/persons on our behalf in respect of the said accident.

I/We further authorize you to pay the above settlement sum directly 10 M/S
BORNEO MOTORS (SINGAPORE) PTE LTD.

I'We hereby acknowledge that this payment is made on a without admission of
liability basis and without prejudice to all related claims and in respect of our
insured’s recovery action.

MName of vehicle owner/Date

M 11S



@ TOYOTA Borneo Motors (Singapore) Pte Ltd

T

CoRegNo : 1967000862
ESTE!!Q No : MR-8500000-9 TAX INVOICE LE fync i O
Downlosg "My Toyota 567 app on Playstore : ss pnur Togota ME account & mone! Tel mo.: 6531 1188
=< ACcount Na
Account Dotail Customer Deta
. | 51000007 /ICLPI1
Lonpac Insurance Bethad - | Ms Lee Li Wen Catherine
100 Beach Road Docoment No 23 Tampines Central 7
#19-00 Shaw Tower 39009102 #04-28 The Tampines Trilliant
Singapore 189702 Singapore 528609
Attnr Mo Lily Xoh/Mr Chia Dacian Date 1 3
Mobile: 85885048
14/08/2019
Yiear Make Ml Reg Date Vebh Rog Na Kikmmeters AP N Drvier WaodHe
18 AHXVE E5 WHPI1OR 29/06/2018 SMCEISZM 11912 18108 67/DS/SNCA352M
Chpsss No Engina No Terem yiTwICE Erdins #hil oiecTed Cir
JYDKDIBI001615292  INZB575640 80 Sam San Joi 04/04/2019 13.31 08/05/2019 8.42
L Cat Joby/Purts Deoription Dy ik Pba
12 74 BSZ161-0K040 FIECE, AR BUMFER 110,00 4.00 40.00
|
Barnen Motoryls the onky adthorsed warbahog o rmaindisn pour Toutta. Sendos vous Togota eueerny,
I =31, ol DA R i et m v ©ooemees b to argoy warTEmTTy bemptTi Lomdmnorm.appy
! - —;M - — -l' i Cosdrrs s Smgmatiire I Py St . I - '.' 0]"‘3
I Please acknoadedge recespt al velilche | Puit 617.30 GST 7.00% 282.69
[ L/ L abtuimar 194.00
|u. v il 3;22?.13 L 0. 00
Loabiild & i lwilad O.m
= - 0.00
Asmaynt Dus i,321.17

TO SECURITY GUARD 4036248
pate 14/08/2019

PLEASE ALLDW THE UNDERMENTIONED TIME 08:31

VEHICLE TO LEAVE THE COMPANY PREMISES

VEHICLE NO SMCA352M

SIGNATURE

CUSTOMER FOR BORNED MOTORS (SINGAPORE) PTELTD

@ Bomeo Motors



& TOYOTA

CoRegNo ; 1967000862
GST RegNo © MR-B500000-9 TAX INVOICE
Download "My Toyota SG° app on Playstare Wpetore to aceees your Toyata ME accaunt & n

| .-:';n-um-i Ma
Arcouni Detinl

I = . §1000007 /ICLPI1
Lonpac Insucance Bechad |
100 Baach Road Documyni ki
#19-00 Shaw Tower 39009102
Singapore 109702
Attn: Me ul’ Koh/Mr Chis In'm..lllll' I Date
14/08/2019
Year Mike Miel Reqg Dute Voh Rieg Mo il
18 AHXVE ES NHP1OR 29/06/2018 SMCA352M 11912
Chassis No Engine No Teerns s £
JTDKDIBIO01615292  INZBSTSE40 60 Sam San Joi

Jab/Purts Description
1 2 BP-SUNDRY
TP-5GE2009D
DRIVE IN:04/04/2019

DATE-IN:30/04/2019 DATE SURVEY:30/04/2019

NO OF REPAIR DAYS:4 DAYS
BY :MARCUS (LKK)

SUNDRIES TP-DIRECT SETTLEMENT

ACC DATE:04/04/2019

Borneo Motors (Singapore] Ple Ltd
IER1ITRTI] Jag i Bk
i, loygta com.s

17 bl Road 4
Singapore 405611

Centre

x frjare Tel no.: 6631 1108

Ms Lee Li Wen Catherine
23 Tampines Central 7
#04-28 The Tampines Trilliant

Singapore 528609
Mobile: 85885048

dr M P

18108 67/DS/SMCA352M

04/04/201% 13.31 0B/05/2019 8.42

30.00

183.18
164.00
164.00
328.00

1312.00

2 8 PSP PER PANE LABOUR FOR PLATINUM SHINEPRO & SHINE 164
FER PANEL APPLICATION ON REAR ACCIDENT AREAS
3 § BP-SUBLET DRILL BOLE & INSTALL REAR REVERSE SEMSOR A4S
4 5 PBP-SUBLET CHECK LIGHTING & CONDUCT WATER LEAK TEST A4S
| 5 8 PBP-SUBLET REMOVE & INSTALL REAR COMPARFTMENT CARFE A45
T,GARNISH AND TRIMMING TO ASSIST REPAIR
€ § BP-SUBLET REPLACE REAR ACCIDENT DAMAGED PARTS Ads
STRAIGHTEN & ALIGN REAR ACCIDENT AFFECTED AREAS
7 & BP-SUBLET RESPRAY JOB ON REAR ACTIDENT AFFECTED AR A4S
EAS
8 B BP-ECUZ TO RESET ECU AND REPROGRAMME -
91 MP52159-52984 COVER, RR BUMPER
10 2 [M52562-52061 RETAINER, RR BUNPER R
(11 |3 mw52575-52180 RETAINER, RR BUMPER R

-l ar B or el ;:r_
Borneo Makors

L SArwmveT & 5

Plezse ackrnmadidge recrial of uelicle

b aiamrns ¥ lwilid

888

460.70
48.70
67.590

Amount Due

1076.00

164.00
460.70
48.70
67.90

FLEASE MAIL YOUR CHEQUE TO 2 PANDAN CRESCENT, LEVEL 10 INCHCAPE CENTRE, SINGAPORE 1284€E36247

TO SECURTTY GUARD

DATE  14/08/2019
PLEASE ALLOW THE UNCERMENTIONED TIME 08:31
VEHICLE T0 LEAVE THE COMPANY PREMISES
VEHICLE NO SMCIL352M
SIGMATLIRT
CUSTOMER FOR BORNED MOTDRS (SINGAPORE) PTELTD

4036247

@ Bomeo Motors



RafflesMedical

Your Truwtod Partoee for Health MED'CAL CERTI F‘ CATE
NRIC SHS17606D VISIT DATE 4 Apr 2018 (11:04)
NAME LEE LI WEN, CATHERINE VISIT NO GOSR18010226

This 1s 1o certify that the above mentioned has been given

OUTPATIENT SICK LEAVE for 5 days from 04 Apr 2019 1o 08 Apr 2019

DOCTOR Goh Yao Chen (M177208)
CLINIC 24 HR EMERGENCY CLINIC
ADDRESS 585 NORTH BRIDGE ROAD LEVEL ~0T-000KA

Thiy cormhicate 14 mot wadid for abaenpe from court o olher judiclal procs

“Thm cerpcate T mectranically geneTated Mo vgnatute i requined.




RafflesMedical

Yoy T
gl e s TAX INVOICE

GST REGN N, MG-D00048T- N PAGE 1ot
VISIT NO ; GOOAT80 10226 BiLL TYPE PATIVNOUT
VISIT DATETIME - Deb-APFL20 15 1 1{3AM AilLL DATE 04-APR-2019
INVOICE NO PGORE1I010226-1 PATIENT NAME LEE LI WEM, CATHERIME
PAY 8Y SELF PATIENT ID NQ, : SBS17605D
PAYER NAME LEE LI WEN, CATHERINE POLICY ND
ADDHESS « 73 TAMEINES CENTRAL 7 THE TAMPINES TRILLIANT #l4.28 SINGAPORE 518600
DESCHRIPTION aTty L 5% [T
CONSULTATION 50,00
PHARMACEUTICAL

FAMOTIDINE 20MG TAS 4.0 547

NAPROXEN 275MG TAB 28D 11.18

ORPHEMADRINE I5MEPARACETAMOL 450MG 20 0.80

TAE

ORPHENADRINE I5MOPARACETAMOL 4A50MG 420 16.79

TAD

34.25

PRACTICE COST

PRALTICE COST L0 20,00 |

20,00

RADIOLOGY
LUMBOSACRAL SPINE XRAY (2 VIEWS) 1.0
FELVIS XRAY [1 VIEW) 1.0
SACRD-COCCYX XRAY 1.0

SLB-TOTAL
TOTAL CHARGES BEFOHE GST
GST TS
1OTAL CHARGES AFTER GST
LESS ROUNDING ADJUSTMENT
TOTAL AMOQUNT PAID
REG 1500445067 - D4/042018 - MASTER
TOTAL BALANCE DUE




4 Invoice Page 1 of 2

GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE
GE RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE

& Raffles Quay #18-00, Singapore 048580
|Nsumc Phone: +85 6224 0010 Fax: +85 6224 D030
ASSOCIATION Oparating Hours: Monday to Friday Sam to 5pm

RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE GST Registration No: M400017735

Third Party Insurer Enquiry

Dur Ral Na: GR-19-053166
Date of Request: 05/04/2018 Your Rel No: Online Purchasa

Bomeo Motors (S) Pie Lid
33 Leng Kee Road
Singapore 159096

Daar SirfMadam.

Enquiry Date 05/04/2019

Enquiry By Angela Tan Hong Choo

TP Vehicle No. SGEZ008D

Accidant Date 04/04/2019

Enquiry Result

TP Vehicle No. Insurar Pariod of Insurance Insurar Tel, No.
SGEZ008D Lonpac Insurance Bhd 16/03/2019-15/03/2020 +A5 62507388
Thank You.

The images provided fo you are mken from the original reports forwarded 1o the centre by the mesmbers of the Ganeral Insurance
Assacialion of Singapore and we take no responsibility for their accutacy or contents and shall be under no Eabillly whatsoever for any
joas or damage ansing oul of or in connection with the reports or thesr iImages.

This is a computar generated document and requires no signature,

hups://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRsas& fuscaction=dsp_ge... 542019



- Invoice Page 2 of 2

GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE
GENERAL  RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE

& Raffles Quay #18-00, Singapaore 048580
I"SUWCE Phona: +85 6224 0010 Fax: +65 6224 0030
ASSOCLATION Operating Hours: Montay to Friday 9am to Spm
RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE CST Registration No: MA00017733

TAX INVOICE
Our Ral Na: GR-18-053166
Date ol Request: D5/04/2018 Your Ref No: Cnline Purchase
Bomeo Motors (S) Pte Lid
33 Leng Kee Road
Singapore 159096
Dear SirfMadam.
Enquiry Dale 05/04/2019
Enquiry By Angela Tan Hong Choo
TP Vehicle Mo, SGE20090
Accidant Date 04/04/2019
DESCRIPTION AMOUNT (5%)
TP Insurer Enquiry 1.87
GST Amounl 013
Total Amount Due (GST Inclusive) 2.00
Thank You.

This is @ computer generated document and requires no signalure.

For GIARMC Official use:
Data:
[X] GIRO [ ] Cash [ ] Chegue

https://singapore. merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRsas& fuscaction=dsp_ge... 5/4/2019



