
Nivitha (LKK Auto)

From: LEW JENNY <jennylew@uoi.com.sg >

Sent: Wednesday,3 April 2019 4:47 PM

To: Suraidah B Saidi PTCBC; assignments@lkkauto.com; sur@lkkauto.com
Subject: RE: Direct Settlement (RS) - Accident lnvolving GBG2585E & SFQ4649S DOA

'19.03.2019

Attachments: G BG2585E_Est lnv.zip

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Suraidah,

We will appoint LKK as SJE for this case.

Dear Denise/Caiherine,

Please arrange to survey the vehicle at Borneo Motors @ 2 Pandan Crescent.

Warmest Regards

Jenny Lew

Claims Division

United Overseas lnsurance Limited

3 Anson Road, #28-01 Springleaf Towe., Singapore 079909
Main . (65) 6222 7733 lDlD.{65) 6490 3329 iFax. (65) 6327 3869 | Email 'iennylew@uoi.com.sg

UOB EIVIAIL DISCLAI I\4ER
Any person receiving this email and any attachment(s) contained, shall treat the lntormation as confidential and not misuse, copy,
disclose, distribute or retain the information in any way that amounts to a breach of confidentiality. lf you are not the intended
recipient, please delete all copies oi this email from your computer system. As the integrity of this message cannot be guaranteed,
neither UOB nor any entity in the UOB Group shall be responsible for the contents. Any opinion in this email may not necessarily
represent the opinion of UOB or any entity in the UOB Group.

From: Suraidah B Saidi PTCBC Imailto:SuraidahB.Saidi@inchcape.com.sg]
Sent: Wednesday, 3 April, 2019 4:43 PM

To: LEW JENNY <jennylew@uoi.com.sg>

Subject: RE: Direct Settlement (RS) - Accident lnvolving GBG2585E & 5FQ4649S DOA 19.03.2019

HiJenny,

We have no objection on your proposal to have LKK, please be inform that our client's vehicle is grounded in our
premises.

Thank you.

Wormest Regards,
SURAIDAH
TPR TEAIT, CUIITS DEPT
D: 6631 1887 | F: 6872 7260 | E: suraidahb.saidi@inchcoDe.com.sq
lnchcape Centre
Level 4, Bodycare Centre
2 Pandan Crescent
Singapore 128462
www.borneomotors.com.sq I www.lexus.com.sa I www.tovotasinqapore.com.sg I www.hino.com.ss I www.suzukicar.com.sg


