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HWA SENG SPRAY PAINTING COMPANY 1of1
160 Sin Ming Drive, #05-11,
Sin Ming AutoCity
Singapore 575722 Dte of accidese M1 |as g
[Registration no :095744/008) =
Tel : 64533100, Fax 62669932 eur gy __1:]‘ i 80P @3NT
Estimate repair cost to MAZDA § regno - SLG 713 ¥
1oc front bumper 55 & 1096.40| —
Ipc front bumper ofs retainer 2oy IS.EI —
1p¢ o/s headlamp Plemr  svs| —"
1pc ofs headlamp bracket T 2p00| 7
1pc front bumper reinforcement T 55200 A

1pe front bumper o/s fog lamp cover
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Panel knocking

Spray painting
Wire checking

P G150 _—

2672.70|
534.54

2135.16

20000 T2y

HWA SENG SPRAY PEINTING COMPANY

s,
B 247¢.74



HWA SENG SPRAY PAINTING CO lali
160 Sin Ming Drive, #05-11,

Sin Ming Autocity

SINGAFORE 575722

{COMPANY REGISTERATION NO. 095744008)

TEL: 64533100

FAX: 62669932

el 125.00|

1pc nowzle spray watler tank

Less 20% 15.00

100.00

HWA SENG SPRAY BAINTING COMPANY




HWA SENG SPRAY PAINTING COMPANY
160 Sin Ming Drive, #05-11,

Sin Ming AutoCity

Singapore 575722

(Registration no :095744/008)

Tel : 64533100, Fax 62669932

L)y n{ Qocidest. - 2R [ EXA

Moot Tnsured

Ve ws: SOP 683N T

Estimate repair cost to MAZDAGregno:SLG 713 Y

1pc front bumper 55
1pc front bumper o/s retainer

1pc o/s headlamp

1pc ofs headlamp bracket

1pc front bumper reinforcement

1pc front bumper o/s fog lamp cover

Less : 20%

Labour & misc charges
Panel knocking

Spray painting

Wire checking

£ 1056.40

/2:r 16.20
917.60
28.00
552,00

P.7 6250

2672.70
334.54

2138.16

400.00
500.00
80.00

3118.16

HWA SENG SPRAY PAINTING COMPANY
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PRE-REPAIR INSPECTION REQUEST - SLGT13Y va SOPA03ST (0I) an D.0.A: 200172018

Frane:  Hox, 'Yinsul

Ta ‘mmsigrenents @ikkautn conr, Adinin A (sdoin-aiskallo. com|

c= Feng, Andy-5. Cnin, Lae-Ying, Maur, Baljil. Atu Kassim, Moor Manees, Azien, Syseseting, Chan, Toke S5, Lim, Shang Yang, Milhossngh, Asshwesnjesms
Seni: D010 22362 PM

Amactunests S e 200N ol

Hi.

Plesse refier w ihe enclosed request from HWA SENG SPRAY PAINTING COMPANY
Kindly eurry aut Policy covernge verificution [lrsf before conducting the pre-repalr inspection within 48 hours

I vou have any queries/concerns, plee let us know ?jjw*r Hh B"ﬂ'ﬂ
Kinelly cnvist 0 aseign Kenneth Kong ax Single Joim Expert ax roguaesid

Thanks & Regards, V. ok

¥ir Rul, Hor (Viviane)

AIG e v

iy Adursier || Singapone FNOL. Dlaens Opemlions - s

Shwred Serces - Matayws | Gobal Bugingss Servnes 1". ;‘* q F M

Yoroy) Hofaig com s kg g

Fromi hsh.pantér@yshoo.com [maikozhsh.painter@yehoo.com]
Sent: Wednesdey, April 03, 2019 2:50 PM
Ta: Hor, Yinrul

Subject: RE: PRE-REPAIR INSPECTION - ACCIDENT INVOLYING OUR INSURED VEHICLE SDPGOIIT AND SLG713Y ON 28/03/2015

dear sir,
kindly arrange Kenneth kong from LKK group of compames.

hwa seng spray pminiing co
hwee boon
hp 98630678

From: Hor, Yinrul

Sent: Wed, 3 Apr 2019 06:25:25 +0000

Ta: hah painter@y ahoo com

Ce: Fong, Andy-SY, Chin, Lee-Ying, Kour, Baljit. Abu Kassim, Noor Maricsa, Azlan. Syazairdina, Chan, Yoke Shi, Lim, Sheng Yang
Mithoosingh, j

Subject: PRE-REPAIR INSPECTION - ACCIDENT INVOLVING OUR INSURED VEHICLE SDP6039T AND SLGT713Y ON 281372019

Without Prejedice

Your Reference SLGTI3Y
Our Reference SDP&03IT
Denr SinMadam,

We refier to your Motice of Accident of even dole

We intend 1o conduct & pre-repair survey of the damage o your client's'your customer’s vehicle jointly with yoor cllentfvour motor workshop, We propose
10 use one of the motor surveyors numed in ihe sttached list to conduct the joint pre-repair survey as 4 single joint expert;

Naine of Surveyor Compuny Name

AIG In House Surveyar AlG Asis Pacific Insurance Pie Lid
Lawrence Ng Chun Kee Prionty Services

JuiTroy Onjt Leng Kint Priority Services

Jimmy Les Priority Services

EC Looi Automobile lnspection Services e Lid
Pang Kizh Keen (Frankie) Formizam Adjusters e Lid

Ni You Han Fotmizam Adjusters Pie Lid




Soon HanXin (Gary)

Formtenm Adjustens e Lid

i| Chow Ho Xiong Formiteam Adjusiers Pie Lid

Chun o0 Teck (Beninmin) Formteam Adjustien Me Lid
Kalvin Ang LEK Auto Consultnnts Pz Lid
Xing Guo Quang LKK Auto Consultanty Pie Lid
Marcus Chua LEK Auto Consultunts Pz Lid
Maohamad Taufikh LKK Auto Consultmmts Pre Lid
Adrisn Ling LEK Auto Consultants Pie Lid
Muohummed Rasul LEX Auto Consultants Fre Lid
Kenneth Kong LEK Auto Cansultomts Pre Lid

Please let ua know within two (2) working days whether you agree o the sppointment of any of these motor surveyors as a single jolnt expert. You may
select one or more of the listed motor surveyors, W will bear the cost of the pre-repair survey carried out by the single joint expen

Thanks & Regardy,

Yin Rul, Hor (Viviana)

AG

Camnm Adtjrimie 1| Sngapore FNOL, Cairm Opasanons - &uig
Shued Sereces - Walayws | Glabe Desmesy Sonanes

iyl HorSias S | el 5

From: Pairter Heh [malito:hsh. painter@yahoo.com]
Sent: Wednesday, April 03, 2019 2:11 PM

Ta: AlG 5GP, Clalms-Survey
HM[MMﬂmtmuﬂMMM{mmm]lmﬂm:MMTlﬂm!T

Caution: External Emuil
Daar sir,
YOUR INSURED VEHICLE NUMBER : SDP 8038 T

Kindty arrange your susveyar io survey vehicle no | SLG 713 Y
Vehicia is inside cur workshop

Attach |s estimate, pia repont snd Lta search

plus polica report.

Please et us have your list of suneeyor
fhank u

hwea Boan
hwa sang spray painting oo
hpGBEIDETE

IMPORTANT NOTICE:

The information in this email (and any sttachments) is confidential. 1f you are not the intended recipient, you must not use or disseminmte the
information. Il you have received this email in error, please immediately notify me by "Reply” command and permanently delete the original
and any copigs of pantouts thereof Although this email and any attachments are believed 1o be frec of any virus or other defect that might
affect any computer system into which it is received and opened, it is the responsibility of the recipient 1o ensure that i1 w virus froe snd no
responsibility is accepted by American International Group, lnc. of its subsidinries or affiliates either jointly or severally, for any loss or damage
arising in any way from s usc

IMPORTANT NOTICE:

Tha information in thin email (and any attachments) s confidentisl. If you e not he Intended mcplont, you must not use or dissemnats the informatemn. iIf you have recelved
inis eemall in wrrce. plesse immedistely notdy me by "Aeply® command and permanently dessls (e original and any copes ar prntoats thereo! i
altachimants sre Ballsved 1o be Ses of any vrus of oiher dedest imal maght sfec! sny computer systam nis which 1t s received snd cponed, if is the responsdkiiiny of ihe
il 10 @nmars that 1t 18 vious from and no respoanaibility is sccopted by Amanicen inmemational Group, Inc o s subsidianss or aMistes sither iy or severaly, lor sy
loes or gamage arisng in any wey o i use



42018 Monmen e-Clams

View Received Message

Thes mail 18 assocated with |

*SLGT13Y (54084690615G)
[SDPGEO3IT]
e
SUM HONG LIAN
Mar 28 2019 5:000M
[Eria ah Cher|
Hwa Seng Spray Painting Co

Regly | Reply All | Mark a3 Unrend | Print Message | Delete Message | Forward |

From AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte, Ltd, (AIG_SG), sen! on 05/04/2019 15:41 PM,

Sublect Mo OF G1A Report

o .
Pluase be nformed thit no O GIA report recinved Till date.

Pleasa find O] detats below for your further action

Ql name: Chia Ah Char

Aodress

25 Mugiiston Road

Singapore 437714

Contact No: 975430818

Regards
Sheng Yang

DOCUMENTS SUMMARY
There Bre no CoCUMEencs.

hifpe.('singapore meriman com/claimsfindex cfmPusabox=5VCmail&luseaction=dsp_viewAmode=1Alinboxld=146203681Domainid=114I0bjld=64 = 12
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SPLILAVE L20025 PAY A DI INDTSTRIAL PARK SINGAPURE 4o id JEL: 08 nd3h 5300 FAN D 0inS bS48 E

Our Ref: CC4/AIG 1900601 2/ph3
09 Apnl, 2019
Chia Ah Cher

25 Mugliston Road
Singapore 437714

Dear Sirs,
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLG 713Y AND SDP 6039T ON 28/03/2019 ALONG/
AT OLD AIRPORT ROAD

We, LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd has been appointed to act on the behalf of your
insurer, AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Lid (AIG) o settle @ THIRD PARTY claim
against you for an accident which happened on the above-mentioned date and location.

Kindly proceed to lodge your GIA report within five (05) working days of receipt of this
letter, giving the version of the accident amongst other things related Lo the accident. The
GIA repont can be lodged at any of AIG reporting centres. You may refer to your
Certificate of Insurance for the list of the reporting centres.

Il you have any information to add or any amendments to make, please contuct the
undersigned within five days from the date of this letter.

Please note that the standing of your insurance policy such as NCD, premium & etc
would be affected.

Yours (aithfully.
e

k-7

Hsiao Tong

Claims

Tel : 6742 3197

Fax: 6741 4108

Email : chewht @ [kkauto.com

c.e.  Claims Manager
AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pre Lid
{Mator Claimy Dept)



SUUTEAVE 1, mi0-28 PAYA U INDUSTRIAL PARK. STNGAPORE S08555 TEL < (D651 62563561 FAX £ (0a8) a1864113

Our Ref: CC4/AIG19006012/ph3

13 MAY 2019 By Registered Mail
First Reminder

Chia Ah Cher

25 Mugliston Road

Singapore 437714

Dear Sir,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLG 713Y AND SDP 6039T ON 28/03/2019 ALONG/
AT OLD AIRPORT ROAD

We refer to the above subject matter. Your insurer AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Lid (AIG)
has received a third party claim(s) against your motor insurance policy, and has appointed LKK
Auto Consultants Pte Ltd to act on their behalf to handle this matter.

We highlight that this accident has not been reported to AIG.
Please note that you had been notified by our via mail by post from our office on 09/04/2019

Kindly proceed to lodge your accident report immediately, giving the version of the accident
amongst other things related to the accident, The accident report can be lodged at any of AIG
reporting centres. For the listing of AIG reporting centres, you may refer to your Centificate of
Insurance or visit A1G Singapore’s website,

To enable us 1o look into the matter immediately, please let us hear from you within fourteen
(14) days from date of this letter (by 29/05/2019).

Please be reminded that in accordance with the terms and conditions under your policy, failure
of compliance, our principal M/s AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Lid reserves the right 10

repudiate lability.

IT you need further assistance or clarifications, please contact the undersigned.

Yours faithfully,

Hsiao Tong

Claims

Tel : 6742 3197

Fax: 6741 4108

Email : chewht@lkkauo.com

ee Claims Manager
AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Lid
(Motor Claims Dept)



1 U00AVE 1, 201-25 PAYA UBLINDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : (065) 62563561 FAN @ (065 67414108

Our Ref: CCH/AIG19006012/Keb3

02 AUG 2019

CHIA AH CHER
25 MUGLISTON ROAD
SINGAPORE 437714

Dear Sir/Madam,
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SDP 6039T AND SLG 713Y ON 28/03/2019

We refer to the above accident where we are acting for AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Ple
Lid to resolve the claim against you and/or your authorized driver under the Auto
Insurance policy taken up with them.

Based on the accident report and accident scenario, liability is down against us. We will
therefore proceed to negotiate for an amicable settlement with the Third Party.

Should you however wish 1o further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and
settlement, please contact us within 10 days from the date of this letter.

Please note that your No-Claim Discount (NCD)(if any) will be affected and reduced by
30% (20% for commercial vehicles) upon next renewal due to this Third Pany claim.
However, if your policy has a NCD protector feature, it will be deemed utilized for this
claim and your NCD will be protected.

Please call us if you have further queries.

Yours faithfully,

Asher

Case Handler
DID: 6841 6051
FAX: 6741 4108

Emuail: Ashersng @ [kkauto.com

cc.  AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Pre Lid
{Morar Claims Depr)



LETTER OF AUTHORIZATION

To Whom It May Concern

Accidenton 28(07%)2019 involving SL&F13Y and SVP 60397
along 01d ﬂ’irparﬂ? Raoad ( Outside

o kes Cewntre )
e S um 3—\,;-«5 Lo NRICNo. S 136494613
of _Bll& 196 € Furﬁﬁl! Field # 15487 Snasgore 523194

Owner of Motor Vehicle Registration No._ SLG 127 insured by

of RTuc lnegme [n -Opeetiander Policy No. SDG3535275-01

L=

do hereby suthorize M/s_Hie  Sene  Spream  feiint o .
e B =

as my/our representative with full authority to write, negotiate and settle claim
for damages on my/our behalf against the owner and/or driver of

Motor Vehicle No. S Df £ 02497  inregard to the abovementioned accident.

I/'We also consent to the agreed settlement sum be made in favour of my/our

representative, Mis _Huwa 5‘4;.3 5?{1-...:\} Finn Lo . and
&msﬂdpa;mﬂhhmmﬂa&mMmhemmadasﬁlﬂmdﬁmidimmaf

my/our claim.

Owner Signature & Company Stamp

Date : “L[q; {LG A




RELEASE VOUCHER
(ALG Asia Pacific - Express Third Parly Claim)

vwell, HWA SENG SPRAY PAINTING CO. (“the workshop") hereby confizm thal we/l have
reached an agreement with the appointed sucveyor of AIG Asin Pacific Insurance e Lid LKK

NSULT * LLTD (name of surveyor) with respect to the amount claimed for
§$2.494.16 (Repair Cost), $$270.00 (Loss of Use/Rewesd), S37.45 (Disbwrsement) for vehicle no.
81.G 713Y ihat was damaged pursaant to the accident which wecurred on 28/03/2019 (datc) along
OLD AIRPORT ROAD (OUTSIDI HAWKER CENTRE) (Iocation) involving vehicle o/s SDE

This is pursuant to the inspoetion conducied an 10/0472019 (date) al “the workshop™

W/l confirm that we/I arefam suthorized by the owner SUM TIONG LIAN (“ine third party
claimnnt’) of vehicle no. SLG 7T13Y make the claim as setoul in the above paragraph ind well have
full uuthority to setilc the matter on his/her behalf in a manaer thal we/l decm fit. We/l enclose herein
the letisr of authority given hy “the third party claimant™.

We/l further confirm that we/l will mdemnity AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Lid for all damages,
toss andfor expense that they will or have already incas red in the cvent that “the third party clannant™
afier (he above said ggreement lodges n farher claim against the former for any loss and expenses
suffered pertaining to costs of repairs and/or rental andior loss of use pursuani to the damage to SLG
713Y (vebicle no.) as u result of the accident.

We/T conlfirm thet the ugreemcnt reached sbove is in full and final seltlement of uny claim of “the
fhird party claimant” pursuant to the accident and that forther this setflement is reached op 2 without
prejudice and withoot admission of hiability basis.

This agreement is subject to the appfication of Singapore law and the Singapore Courts have
exclusive junsdiction over any dispute arising ous of the same.

Dated this _ ¥ (day)af __G'E____{mmh}m_‘i (yeur)

Signed by mppointed surveyor Signed by “the




HWA SENG SPRAY PAINTING CO.

"160 Sin Ming Drive, #05-11, Sin Ming Autocity

Singapore 575722
Tel No. : 64533100 Fax No. : 62669932

Buss. Reg. No. : 095744/008

SUM HONG LIAN
BLK 186C PUNGGOL FIELD #15-487

B23196

Attention - Motor Claim Depariment
Comact: 80182888

SN  Cuantity Particular

Final Repair Bill : HO0074

Date = 02/05/2018
Vehicie Num. . SLG 713 Y
MakeModel - MAZDA B
Chassis/Eng®
Accident Date © 28/03/2018
Claim MNa. :
Refarence
Policy No. :

Unit Price Amouni 5%

LIST ITEMS :
FRONT BUMPER

HEADLAMP O/S

BN
— ek ok A

List Total 5% :
20.00% Discount 5%

LABOUR
Panel knocking

Spray painting
Wire checking
Labour Total 5%

FRONT BUMPER O/S RETAINER

FRONT BUMPER O/S FOG LAMP COVER
NOZZLE SPRAY WATER TANK

1,008.40
16.20
g17.60
62.50
125.00

2.217.70
443 54

1,774.18

300.00
400.00
20.00

720,00

for HWA SENG SPRAY PAINTING CO.

E&OE




4112018 Recaipl
» Back to OneMotoring

| ol tr:nmgmrr Aurharmv

Land Transport Autharity
10 Sin Ming Drive

Singapora STST01
GST Registralion Mo, | M3-0006528-2

Print Date/Time : 01 Apr 2019 /11:12:38
Receipt Date/Time : 01 Apr 2018/ 11:12:38

Tax Invoice/Receipt

Receipt No., - [TNET-00000-190401-000876

Pravious Recaipt No. ©

SN Item Description/ Amount GST Amount
Business Transaction Reference Before Amount After GST
No. GST(3%) (5%) (5%)

Rasull of Insurance Enquiry - SDPG038T

As at 28 Mar 2019/17:00:00

Insurance Co. AlG ASIA PACIFIC INSURANCE PTE. LTD.

1 Insurance Enguiry - SOPS03ST

Enquiry Fes T.00 048 T48
201804011111221007T60
Sub-Total T.00 0.48 748
Total Bofore Rounding T.00 040 T48
Rounding Difference 0.04
Total Amount Payabile TAS
Paid By
Credil Card:
T.4
waooiooooo B TE2 sot 5
Totndl T.45
Cash Change 0.00
Tendered Amosint TAS
Excess Ralundable Amoun! 0.00

THANK YOU AND HAVE & NICE OAY!

Please ensure thal all payments 1o the Authority are good and promptly settiod by the paymant sarvica
pravider [ financial institution. Otherwise, the transaction and recelpt is considered vold and late fee

may apply.

IO T S (O SO R BTN SO TN IS I TN i LI RN L= i



Merimen e-Claims Page 1 of |

...CLAIM SUBFOLDER...(Pending for Survey Report)

Fastiane

CLAIM SUBFOLDER TRACKING
Case  |Motihed Ext Submitted | Ad] Assighed Ad] Bot Ad) Submitted | Ins Auth'ed Statu
|03 Apr 2019 R iy §$2,494.16 | S$L,494.16 m" for Survey
Eait Reg ko A e | Edit Esemates | | view it | camcel Case |

Hain Reference

CLAIM SUBFOLDER DETAILS | [Created by adjuster]
Insured: CHIA AM CHER, 1D: SDOBT175C

EH:I:M . |SUMHONG LIAN, 1D: S1759613F
Vahicle Reg |28/0372019 17:00 - 159
i SLG713Y Diate of Loss: |14 \uonths and 8 Days From LTA Reg Date (Man ¥r}]
Ciaim Type: TP / 540846906156 apcy/Covet | 1800054402-01 (Comprehensive)
Vehicle Reg.
ho. SDPEOIST oy |sos3szsazsean
[insured): =
Exress:

Repairer: | Hwa Seng Spray Painting Co (160 SIN MING) 160 SIN MING DRIVE, #05-11 SIN MING AUTOCITY, 575722 Sin Ming - Tel:

m"‘__‘ ALG Asla Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd. (Expreas) - Tel: 65-6415-3000 ., [Handled by Lee, Ming-Yao] Ming7ac LesEaig com

mmmm’ NTUC Income Insurance Co-operative Ltd (HQ) - Tel:
Adjuster: LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd {HQ) - Tel: 5256-3561 . [Handied by KENMETH KONG] ... [Final Rpt due 15/04/201%]
ASSOCIATED MAIL RECEIVED view &8l |  Compose Case Mas |

AlG_SG (30/05/2019): Re: No O1 GIA Report
AIG_SG (08/05/2019): Re: No DI GIA Report
AIG_SG (05/04/2019): Mo DI GIA Report

ALL ASSOCIATED TASKS= View Al | Search Tasks | Creste hew Tose | Complete |

Due Data Priority Type Task Group Subject Handler Asalgned By Completed On Created On Done?
No results.
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Claim Documents

*SLG713Y (54084690615G)
[SDP6039T]
TP
SUM HONG LIAN
Mar 28 2019 5:00PM
[CHIA AH CHER]
Hwa S5eng Spray Painting Co

Upicad Documents | upiosa photss | Compose mew Lener | Upiced vides | upicsd Audis | View [imw n Srowser | v ]
Letters/ Correspondences [1perpage [v] %3]
No | Finslized On LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid (HG) | Thumbnall | Print
1 |(oraht) Third Party Express Settiermant - Payment Greakdown | Edit
Photos/Images 11 per page 91 & |
tc | Relabel/Reorder | LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd [(HQ) Thumbnall | Print
1 17708019 16114 Genaral View 0| adiws | A
7 |17/04719 16:14 | Ganaral View 0| toews | A
3 |17/04/19 16:14 Ganaral View 0| tesawc | A
4 [17/04/1916:14 | General View @ | toacws | B
5 |17/04/19 16:14 | General View 0| oeaiws | A
6 |17/04/10 16:14 | General View @ | weairc |
7 [17pans 1814 | General View D | twawc | B
8 [17/m4/1916:14 | General View D | t=awe | A
5 |17/04/19 16:14 | Odometer Reading 0| edws | B
10 |17/04/19 16:14 | Chassis Number 0| v | 4

{11 |17/04/19 16:04 | Genersl View 0| s | F
12 |17/04/19 16:14 Ganeral View 0| toedira | &
13 |17/04/19 16114 | General View 0| eowc | B
14 |17/04/19 16:14 | Genersl View 0| i | &
Documentation [iperpae  TV1| B4
ho | Aelabel/Reorder | LKK Auto Consultants Pt Ltd (HQ} Thumbnall | Print
1 |D4/04/19 16:58 | EMAIL FROM ALG DD 03042018 Load POF
2 |04/04/19 16:58 | TP EST & GIA REPORT Load POF
3 |09/04/19 10:13 | Non reporting letter @ | Losd PoF
&  |11/04719 16:55 TP ESTIMATE- MARKED @ | Lood ror
5 |1a/08719 10:37 LETTER TO 01 @ | Losd POF
B [12/09/16 10:18 | WORKSHOP INVOICE 0 | Load FOF
7 [12/09/19 10:18 | AUTHORISATION TO ACT FORM Load POF
B 12/09/19 10:18 Release Voucher Load POF
9 |12/09/19 10:18 | LTA SEARCH € | oo ror
10 |12/09/1% 10:18 | Registered Mail Fee @ | Load FOF
Mo | Finaliped On AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd. (SG) Thumbnall | Print
1 |30/05/19 16:32 | O GIA REPORT @ | Loaaror

Documents Checklist

DOCUMENTS CHECKLIST
There are no document checklists configured.

heset | save | Prnt |

Our Checkiist Remarks - LKK Auto Consultants Pie Ltd (HG)

Show Remarks To: [ Handling Insurer
LTS mn--mnu_nmmuumnm
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NOTE: TO BE COMPLETED BY SURVEYOR TEAM

THIRD PARTY EXPRESS SETTLEMENT

(PAYMENT BREAKDOWN)
| Vehicle No: SDP6039T (Insd veh) Model: A 6 2.0 4-DOOR
SLGT713Y (TP veh) EDAN (A)
| Date of Accident: | 28/03/2019
Global Sum Settiement [ - | [ ] Yes | 1%X] No
Repair Estimate 5 3.218.16
Final Repair Cost s 24984 18
Loss of Use 8 270.00 3.00 days at $80.00 per day
Rental (if any) 5 0.00 days
LTA / GIA Search Fee - § 745
Others: $ 0.00
'$
Final Settlemeant Sum - 2,771.61

s Third Party Workshop GIA Registered? [ ] YES [X ] NO (Kindlyindicate
below)

A) For Non GIA Reglstered Workshop: Agreed Liability 100 (%)
' BOLA Applicable: Yes/ No BOLA Scenario No

B) For GIA Reglstered Workshop:

BOLA Liability: (%) Assessed Liability (*): (%)
* Assessed Liability to be flled only for chain collisions and for cases where BOLA does not apply.
Remarks

Payment Instruction: Payee's Breakdown

1) |Hwa Seng Spray Painting Co. $ 277181
2} - §
3) 3
12 Sep
JOANNE LEE KHANG MIN ﬂ
LEK Auta Consultanis Pte Lid Date

Please attach all the supporting documents to the form.
(Final Repair Bill; Rental Involce; Release Voucher; Authorisation to Act; Survey Report;
Medical Report/ Bill (if any)

https:/singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=SVCdoc&fuseaction=dsp_d... 12/9/2019
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd icoregne:1sssoriser:

51 Ubl Ave 1 £01-25, Paya Ubi Industrial Park
Singapore 408933
Tel: 256-3561 Fax: 6844-8805 Email: sur@lkkauto.com;assignments@ikkauto.com

VEHICLE DAMAGE INSPECTION REPORT

Our File No: CC4/AIG18006012/KEB30Q2

Date: 12/09/2019
REFERENCE
Handling Insurer: AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Lid. Policy No: 1800054402-01
Claimant ‘
Vehicle No : SLGT713Y Insured Vehicle No : SDP&038T
Date of Loss: 280372019 MNature of Claim: TP Claim No: 540846908156
DESCRIPTION & IDENTIFICATION OF VEHICLE
Reg No SLGT13Y
Make & Model: MAZDA 6, 2.0 4-DOOR SEDAN (A) Engine No; PE20801044
Reqg. Dale: 20/092016 (Man. Year; 2016) Chassis No: JMEGJ10T2G0242724
Colour: Metallic Grey Odometer: 55608 km
Engine Capacity: 1908 cc
Market ValueM™ew Car N/A
Price:
Sum Insured (S$): Market Value/New Car Price
CONDITION OF VEHICLE AT THE TIME OF SURVEY
General Condition: Steering (Serviceable): Yes Foolbrake (Serviceable): Yes
Handbrake (Serviceable): ¥Yes Engine Modification: Mo Pre-accident Condition:
CONDITION OF TYRES
Front Tyre Size: 225/55 R17 Rear Tyre Size: 225/55 R17
Front Left Side: Michelin 7 mm Rear Left Side: Michelin 7 mm
Front Right Side: Michelin 7 mm Rear Right Side: Michelin 7 mm
The above valuss represen! the remaining e ireads depth
\COST OF CLAIMS Repairer's Adjuster's Difference  DIff %
Parts 2,238.186 1,774.18 464 00 20,73
Miscellaneous llems 0.00 0.00 0.00
Labour 980.00 720.00 260.00 26.53
Paintwoark Labour 0.00 0.00 0.00
Towing 0.00 0.00 0.00
Nett Amount (S§) 3,218.16 249416 724.00 22.50
+ Loss of Use (3.0 x 5590.00/day) (SS) 270.00
+ Doc/Search Fee (S3) 745
Nett Liability (S§) 2,771.61
INSPECTION
Date of Assignment: 03/04/2019
Date Inspected: 10/04/2018 Inspected At: Hwa Seng Spray Painting Co (160 SIN
MING)
160 SIN MING DRIVE, #05-11 SIN
MING AUTOQCITY
Singapore 575722
Estimated Period of Repair: 3.0 days
Adjuster: KENNETH KONG Manager: Asher Sng Rong Yi

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=g... 12/9/2019



Adjuster Report Page 2 of 4

NOTE" This report represents our findings al the time and place of inspection stated herain. Such inspection has been camied out i the beat af our
knowledge and ability but any ather fabilily wnder any ather circumstances i3 hoereby expressly sxcluded

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster& fuseaction=g... 12/9/2019
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REPAIR DETAILS

Recommended Parts

No. Gty Part No. Particulars Condition Repairer's Amount

1 1 *FRONT BUMPER Bent 1.086. 40FL *1.08640FL
2 1 *FRONT BUMPER O/S RETAINER Distorted 16.20FL *16.20FL
3 1 *0/S HEADLANMP Mig Cracked 817.B0FL  *"817.B0OFL
4 1 *0/S HEADLAMP BRACKET Repair 28.00FL *-FL
5 1 *FRONT BUMPER REINFORCEMENT Repair 552.00FL *-FL
6 1 *‘FRONT BUMPER O/S FOG LAMP COVER Distorted 62 50FL *652 S0FL
7 1 *NOZZLE SPRAY WATER TANK Dented 125.00FL  *125.00FL
F=Franctuse part. L=ListiamDisc

Sub Total (S§) 2,797.70 2,217.70
- List tem Discount on L lems 20.00/20.00% (S§) 550, 54 443.54

Total Parts (S§)  2,238.16 1,774.18

| Report was unsubmitted during this print-out. |

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=g... 12/9/2019
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Recommended Miscellaneous Items

Thers are no new miscellanecus tems selectad,

Recommended Labour

No Particulars Lab.Type Repairer's Amount

Labour ltems

1 PANEL KNOCKING Mew 400.00 an0.00

2  SPRAY PAINTING New 500,00 400.00

3 WIRE CHECKING New 80.00 20.00
Gross Labour Cost (S$) 980.00 720.00

Report was unsubmitted during this print-out.

< END OF ESTIMATES >

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=g... 12/9/2019



