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- . . Canxiltants
s = Pre Lid Company Registration No. 159807 158R

!‘ !’;l’} Auto

t

SUUHEAVE |, #0225 PAYA LRI INIM STRIAL PARK, SINGAORE JURYAY TEL : (005 62563561 FAN @ (065 A1S441] 5

Yourrel:  I18/1919/VCO5/021457 Date: 14/11/2019
Owr ref: CCH/LPCI9006006/T 1ha3

The Motor Claims Department

M/s LONPAC INSURANCE BHD

Dear Sir/Madam,

PRELIMINARY ADVICE OF VEHICLE NO. YP 602H
We refer o the above matter.

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the above mentioned vehicle on 12/04/2019

at the premises of M/s AAK L v L and have the following to report:-
Workshop Estimate Amoum : 5% 3,330.00

Revised Estimate Amount - S% 2,000.00

"Check” Ttems Amount 1 5% .

Total (Including Check ltems) - 5% 2,000.00

Market Value : S§§ - (est)

LTA Reimbursement Value . 5% - lest)

Nett Value : 5% - (est.)
Description of Damage:

The vehicle sustained damages at the o e
Rear Portion

Comments/Present Status:

Damages Consistent
Estimated normal period for repairs: 6.0 days
Y ours faithfully,

MOHD. TAUFIKH
Licensed Appraiser



FAKF/LULE Kebate Enquiry

> Back to OneMotoring

hitps2/vrl It gov.sg/lta/vri/action/enquireRebateByPublicBefore D

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars

Owner |ID Type: Company
Owner 1D: 442H
Vehicle Details

Vehicle No,; YP&O2ZH
Vehicle to be Exported: No

Intended Deregistration 30 Jul 2019
Date:

Vehicle Make: ISUZU
Vehicle Model: NPRBSUHSA
Primary Colour: White
Manufacturing Year: 2015

Engine No.: 4JJ12EB303
Chassis No.: JAANPRB5SHF7100804
Maximum Power .

Output;

Open Market Value: $31,095.00
Original Registration 01 Dec 2015
Date;

First Registration Date; 01 Dec 2015
Transfer Count: 0

Actual ARF Paid: $1,555.00
Intended PARF Rebate Details

PARF Eligibility: No

PARF Eligibility Expiry -

Date:

PARF Rebate Amount: $0.00
Intended COE Rebate Details

COE Expiry Date: 30 Nov 2025
COE Category: C - Goods Vehicle & Bus
COE Period(Years): 10

QP Paid: $44,8%0.00
COE Rebate Amount: $28,430.00
Total Rebate Amount: $28,430.00

The information contained herein Is correct as at 30 Jul 2019

lof]

OK

30/7/2019, 12236 p
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RAK 10GISTICS SERVICES PTE LTD

Blk 153 Bukil Batok Strest 11 #03-202 Singapore 650153
Tel: (65) 6665 0190 Fax: (65) 6581 9509
E-mall: admin@aakls com
Company Registralion No.: 201325787TM
GST Reg, No.: 201325787TM

10 Quotation
Lonpac Insurance - Claims Dept DATE : 12-Api-18
300 Beach Road. TERMS : 30 Days
#17-04/07 The Concourse, PAGE ND.: Page 141

Singapore 199555

SN | DESCRIFTION [ QTY | UNITPRICE| AMODUNT (3)
Accident Repalr of YP60OZH
DOA - 20202015 @ ALONG BT BATOK WEST AVE 2 (GBGS1500) Goo
1 Tojel, pull ond sdjust the box strueiure with welding i 1.050.00
Add dpes of angle bar with welding support on rear corner pillars
To supply part and labaur oy
2 Foseppiv-and reploes | pe spring lock st RHS sliding door 6 5 £0.00 72
3 Fosupply-andreplaec 2pcs aluminium composite panel st rear swing doar 2 0 gRo000 § 1,60000 p1 - 12L00
d  To spray painting 5 60000 |s00
Teweh W I;i?ufra 349
H L4
[ & hance notify
Lﬁmu"“ﬂﬂ . F L-q Meigr By, beme
the Repairer of the following: f
To reservey buiorelafier speay caiing
:T@ gisghey Samagod partis) Gunhg Msumey E/‘i‘“":‘) '”(ﬂ“ *‘rﬁ .
» Party piices s SUBHCT 12 COMTTMATN ) .
o Thurd pirty Survey (8 50 3 VNt Prigutios” bema | 6 1 DL:.: \
 Na lllegal mooficanonis| i atowed NG
« GuppHemenary femis) mu ¥ be 'mmrﬂﬂ
11u’h1m:|:‘r1|'m¥m|llm'|"wmw h“&u‘_ ¢ “4.‘ |- avet
Acknowledged by AEparer 2500
Signature: &
Dk (s 1 2000
b
EAOE sus-ToTAL ')  $3330.00
SGO THAEE THOUSAND FIVE HUNDRED SIXTY-THREE AND CENTS TEN ONLY % GST 23340
TOTAL §3,563.10

Page 10l 1



Nivitha (LKK Auto)

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 3 April 2019 4:11 PM

To: assignments@|kkauto.com

(o= MT_Claim_SG

Subject: FW: Legend Motors YPE02H against GBG3160B on 23/02/19 [External Confidential]
4200 BLFJJM

Lonpac External - Confidential | AP

Our Ref : 18/19/19/VC05/021457 uehide M

Dear Nivitha,

Kindly proceed as proposed.

Best Regards

Gerald Poh

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706

The all £%%3 lonpac.com.sg

Lonpac External - Confidential data is for use by authorised external parties only.

From: Peijuan [mallto:auto@aakls.com]

Sent: Wednesday, 3 April, 2019 3:15 PM

To: GERALD POH WEE BIN

Cc: MT_Claim_5G

Subject: RE: Legend Motors YP602H against GBG9160B on 23/02/19 [External Confidential]

Hi Gerald,
| prefer 4) Mohammed Rasul. Kindly get surveyor to call me before coming

Best reaards,
Peljuan

AR

+ Pewjuru Close
Silngapore 608574
Tel: 66776227

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 3 April 2019 3:03 PM

To: Peijuan <auto@aakls.com>

Cc: MT_Claim_5G <mt_claim@lonpac.com>

Subject: RE: Legend Motors YPE02H against GBG91608 on 23/02/19 [External Confidential]



- Lonpac External - Confidential
WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Our Ref: 18/19/19/VC05/021457
Dear Pejjuan,

We intend to conduct a pre-repair inspection of your client’s vehicle
and attached a list of motor surveyors from LKK Auto Consultants Pte
Ltd for your necessary action.

Please revert.

Best Regards

Gerald Poh

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706

4

|ﬂ The all (¥ lonpac.com.sg

Lonpac External - Confidential data is for use by authorised external parties only.

From: Peijuan [mallto:auto@aakls.com]

Sent: Wednesday, 3 April, 2019 12:19 PM

To: MT_Claim_SG

Subject: Legend Motors YP602H against GBG91608B on 23/02/19

Hi,

I'm sending this email on behalf of Legend Motors & Leasing Pte Ltd to claim for vehicle no. XE4667P
Please refer to attached GIA report and photos of damaged vehicle.

Kindly arrange for a surveyor at 4 Penjuru Close, Singapore 608574.

Please also provide us claim handler email & contact for this case.

Best reaards,
Pci}juﬂw.

AANL

4 Penjuru Close
Singapore 608574
Tel: ee7762a7



DISCHARGE VOUCHER

To: Lonpac Insurance — Claims Dept

I/We LEGEND MOTORS & LEASING PTE LTD hereby accept/satisfy that the

repairs to my/our vehicle registration no. ___ YPEOZH have been completed to my/us

in respect of the damage caused to my/our said motor vehicle in the accident which

occurred on the 23/02/2019 ’

Policyholder/Driver/On behalf

Name: LEGEND MO LEAS
NRIC/ROC: 2049094421

. .L"\;ﬁ
Signature: ( L E%' }

Date:




RRAK 10GISTICS SERVICES PTE LTD

Blk 153 Bukit Batok Streat 11 #03-292 Singaporae 850153
Tai; (65) 6665 0190 Fux: (B5) 85681 6508
E-mall: adminFaakls.com
Company Registralion No.: 2013257T8TM
GST Aeg. No.: 201325787M

LETTER OF AUTHORISATION

|/We ___ LEGEND MOTORS & LEASING ng LTD ___(“the third-party claimant”), of

4

63 Ub| Road 1 #10-33; Oxley Bizhub 1/408731 (address) of the owner of

YP602H (vehicle no), hereby authorise AAK LOGISTICS SERVICES PTE LTD (“the workshop)
to act for me with respect to my d'aiqi for repalr costs and/or rental and/or loss of use ("the daim”)

YPGo3H
for my vehicle no. _ 58691588 ‘TP » that was demaged involving in the accident which

occurred on _ 23/02/2019  date along W {location) invelving
vehicle(s) no. GBG9160B  ("the a::ldarﬁ"l,__

| further authorise the werkshop to settle my ab we-men':l-nn'éd_:}aim in a manner that they are deem
fitand the workshop Is further suthorised to receive payrment to settlement of my clalm with payment

cheque(s) being made in favour to the workshop.

| further acknowledge that any settlement the workshop may reach with your company on my behalf

is on a without prejudice and without admilssion of liability basis insofar as the driver/owner/Insurers

of the other vehide(s] is concerned.

Dated this on 18 dayof _ JULY  (month)20_19 (year)

0
(B
A
Signature wth-£€d ny's stamp
{workshop)

Signature "t,"".\___
(the third-party dlalia




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubl indusinal Park, Singapore 408833
TEL: 6258 2561 FAX: 5258 4115
Feg Mo 189607 188R GST Reg. Mo 18-860T168-R

Afiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

LONPAC INSURANCE BHD Ref : CC4/LPC1B00BO0E/T1haldn2
¥17.04107 THE CONCOURSESINGAPORE 199555 D987 02:042020 ”"MIH""'I”"
Code: LPC2
1. Pollcy Particulars ;- THIRD PARTY CLAIM .
Insured Veh. GBG 91608 Veh. Inspected ¥P 602H
Policy No. Z18VCO5001296 Coverage ($) 0,00
Claim Ne. 1B/18/19/VC05/021457 Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From GERALD Assign Date 03/04/2019
2 Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model |ISUZU NPRES c.c 2009
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2015
Chassis No. JAANPREBSHFT100804 Colour WHITE
Odometer Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Medification SPORTS RIM
Genaral GOOD
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |205/85 R16 HANKOOK B mm
L/H Front Tyre |[205/85R16 HANKOOK & mm
R/H Rear Tyre |205/85 R16 (D) HANKOOK BI6 mm
L/H Rear Tyre |205/85 R16 (D) HANKOOK 6% mm
: ‘Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE REAR PORTION
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS,
= General Information
Accident Date  23/0212019 |inspection Date 12/04/2019
Survey held at 53 UBI ROAD 1,0XLEY BIZHUE 1
Repairar AAK LOGISTICS SERVICES PL
S P S I T
AJTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.
5b. Estimate DaysofRepalr

1EETIMATEU NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR: & Working Days




’ V V LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

g ma = $1 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408833
- TEL 6256 3561 FAX: 5256 4315

Reg No: 198607188R GST Reg. No, 19-0807198-R
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. YP 602H

1|SPRING LOCK AT RHS SLIDING DOGR (SN) NOT NECESSARY B0.00 -
2|ALUMINIUM COMPOSITE PANEL AT REAR SWING DOOR |BENT 1.600.00 1.200.00
{@5B00.00 (SN)
1.880.00 1.200.00
LABOUR
TO JET PULL AND ADJUST THE BOX STRUCTURE WITH 1.050.00 800,00
WELDING ADD 4PCS OF ANGLE BAR WITH WELDING
SUPPORT ON REAR CORNER PILLARS TO SUPPLY PART
AND LABOUR.
TO SPRAY PAINTING. 600.00 500.00
1,650.00 1,300.00
GRAND TOTAL 3,330.00 2,500.00

MOHAMAD TAUFIKH HO LEONG CHUAN
M.MATAI, AMSAE-A Automotive Assessor
Automotive Assessor

DISCLATMER OF LIABILTTY TD THIRD PARTIES - This Report b made saksly for the uss snd bareiit of fhe Cliant nemed an e front pags of

this Raper




