Vic (LKKAuto)

From: Pei Juan <peijuan_lee@aakls.com>

Sent: Monday, 23 March, 2020 2:24 PM

To: Vic (LKKAuto)

Cc: Admin A

Subject: RE: Legend Motors YP602H against GBG9160B on 23/02/19 *** LKK REF:
CCC4/LPC19006006/T1ha3 [External Confidential]

Attachments: 20200323141513071.pdf

Hi Vic,

FYA, will post out today.

Best regards,
Peljuan

AAK

4 Penjuru Close
Singapore 60574
Tel: 6776227

From: Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Monday, 16 December 2019 5:02 PM

To: Peijuan <auto@aakls.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Legend Motors YP602H against GBG9160B on 23/02/19 *** LKK REF: CCC4/LPC19006006/T1ha3
[External Confidential]

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear Peijuan,
We refer further to our below email.

On a without prejudice basis and purely for an amicable settlement on a without admission of liability to our
Insured’s part, we have our principal’s mandate and we confirm acceptance of your offer of $3,046.25 (all in).

Kindly let the owner chop and sign the attached DV and forward the original signed hard copy to us (LKK) for
payment processing.

The above amount is to be made payable to AAK LOGISTICS SERVICES PTE LTD.

Thank you.

""Best Wishes for Merry Christmas & Happy New Year 2020"

"Please note that our above offer and any settlement arising from the above offer are made on a without prejudice basis, and
should not be construed as an admission of liability on our part or on the part of our Insured Driver. Terms of such settlement
should also not be disclosed in any other related matter(s) in respect of the accident. Our offer made in respect of this present
matter is made solely to resolve this matter only. No reference shall be made to this offer or any settlement arising from this offer

in any other related matters.



Best Regards,

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

¥ SRS T
we Save the Earth- Print only when necessary:

P

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you.

From: Vic (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 2 December, 2019 5:42 PM

To: Peijuan

Cc: Admin A; Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: Legend Motors YP602H against GBG9160B on 23/02/19 *** LKK REF: CCC4/LPC19006006/T1ha3
[External Confidential]

Without Prejudice
Dear Peijuan,
Received with thanks.

However, for the COR, our surveyor had recommended L/S @ $2,000.00 with 6 repair days (please refer to the marked
estimate).

Kindly amend the Repair Invoice and LOD.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

¥ ETES e
SR RS= mw Suve the Larth: Frint only when necessary-

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you.

From: Peijuan [mailto:auto@aakls.com]
Sent: Monday, 2 December, 2019 4:10 PM
To: Vic (LKKAuto)




Cc: Admin A
Subject: RE: Legend Motors YP602H against GBG9160B on 23/02/19 *** LKK REF: CCC4/LPC19006006/T1ha3
[External Confidential]

Hi Vic,
FYA

Best regards,
Petjuan

AAK

4 Penjuru Close
Singapore 60L574
Tel: e 776227

From: Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Monday, 2 December 2019 2:32 PM

To: Peijuan <auto@aakls.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>; Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh@|kkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Legend Motors YP602H against GBG9160B on 23/02/19 *** LKK REF: CCC4/LPC19006006/T1ha3
[External Confidential]

Without Prejudice
Dear Pei Juan,

Please furnish us a copy of your LOD and supporting documents (Authorization to Act Letter, Repair Invoice , LTA/GIA
Search Fee Invoice, etc.) for our further action.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh @lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

¥ ESES

SERER NWTT Suve the Larthe Print only when necessary

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you.

From: Peijuan [mailto:auto@aakls.com]

Sent: Tuesday, 5 November, 2019 1:44 PM

To: Vic (LKKAuto); 'GERALD POH WEE BIN'

Cc: 'MT_Claim_SG'; Admin A

Subject: RE: Legend Motors YP602H against GBG9160B on 23/02/19 *** LKK REF: CCC4/LPC19006006/ha3 [External
Confidential]




Hi Vic,
FYA as requested.

Best regards,
Petjuan

AAK

4 Penjuru Close
Singapore 60574
Tel: 6eF7622F

From: Peijuan <auto@aakls.com>

Sent: Friday, 1 November 2019 10:39 AM

To: 'Vic (LKKAuto)' <vicalpeh@lkkauto.com>; 'GERALD POH WEE BIN' <geraldpoh@Ilonpac.com>

Cc: 'MT_Claim_SG' <mt _claim@I|onpac.com>; 'Admin A' <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Legend Motors YP602H against GBG9160B on 23/02/19 *** LKK REF: CCC4/LPC19006006/ha3 [External
Confidential]

Hi Vic,
Please update status. When will you be sending DV to me?

Best regards,
Peljuan

AAK

4 Penjuru Close
Singapore 60574
Tel: 66776227

From: Peijuan <auto@aakls.com>

Sent: Thursday, 17 October 2019 1:04 PM

To: 'Vic (LKKAuto)' <vicalpeh@lkkauto.com>; 'GERALD POH WEE BIN' <geraldpoh@Ilonpac.com>

Cc: 'MT_Claim_SG' <mt claim@I|onpac.com>; 'Admin A' <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Legend Motors YP602H against GBG9160B on 23/02/19 *** LKK REF: CCC4/LPC19006006/ha3 [External
Confidential]

Hi Vic,
Please confirm for an update.

Best regards,
Peljuan

AAK

4 Penjuru Close
Singapore 602574
Tel: 66776227

From: Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 2 October 2019 1:07 PM

To: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com>

Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com>; Peijuan <auto@aakls.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Vic
(LKKAuto) <vicalpeh@Ikkauto.com>




Subject: RE: Legend Motors YP602H against GBG9160B on 23/02/19 *** LKK REF: CCC4/LPC19006006/ha3 [External
Confidential]

Dear Gerald,
We refer to the below email and the contents were noted.
We will check and will get back for an update.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

F EFES e
SR mE= e Save the Larthe Print only wherr necessary-

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you.

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN [mailto:geraldpoh@Ilonpac.com]

Sent: Wednesday, 2 October, 2019 12:57 PM

To: Vic (LKKAuto)

Cc: MT_Claim_SG; Peijuan

Subject: FW: Legend Motors YP602H against GBG9160B on 23/02/19 *** LKK REF: CCC4/LPC19006006/ha3 [External
Confidential]

Lonpac External - Confidential
Dear Vic,

Kindly resolve the outstanding issue.

Best Regards

Gerald Poh

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706

The all ©Hew™ lonpac.com.sg

Lonpac External - Confidential data is for use by authorised external parties only.



From: Pei Juan [mailto:peijuan lee@aakls.com]

Sent: Wednesday, 2 October, 2019 12:52 PM

To: GERALD POH WEE BIN; MT_Claim_SG

Cc: 'Vic (LKKAuto)'; 'Admin A'; 'assignments'

Subject: RE: Legend Motors YP602H against GBG9160B on 23/02/19 *** KK REF: CCC4/LPC19006006/ha3

Hi Gerald,
Till date I've not receive DV for this case? Kindly advise. I've posted out all documents to your side around August.

Best regards,
Peljuan

AAK

4 Penjuru Close
Singapore 60574
Tel: 66776227

From: Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh@l|kkauto.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 24 July 2019 6:02 PM

To: Pei Juan <peijuan lee@aakls.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; assignments <assignments@Ikkauto.com>; Vic (LKKAuto)
<vicalpeh@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Legend Motors YP602H against GBG9160B on 23/02/19 *** LKK REF: CCC4/LPC19006006/ha3

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear Pei Juan,
We refer to the above matter.

Please be informed that basing on the accident statements submitted by both party, the liability is clear subject to
the BOLA guideline settlement.

Please note that this e-mail is on without prejudice basis which does not amount to an authorisation of repair to
your client’s vehicle and admission of any liability to our Insured’s part. The final repair cost is subjected to the
consistency of the damages according to the nature of the accident. And the days of LOU/ LOR will be based on the
number of days of repair as recommended by our surveyor and approved by our principal.

Kindly forward the LOD and all supporting documents to us if available to proceed with the settlement.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh@Ikkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

8 7g g

SeERE2% W Sve the Larthe Print only when necessary-

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not
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read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you.

From: PeiJuan [mailto:peijuan lee@aakls.com]

Sent: Wednesday, 24 July, 2019 5:57 PM

To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto); Vic (LKKAuto)

Cc: Admin A; assignments; CS A Team

Subject: RE: Legend Motors YP602H against GBG9160B on 23/02/19 *** LKK REF: CCC4/LPC19006006/ha3

Hi Vic,
Please get back to me latest by tomorrow before 12pm. Thanks

Best regards,
Peljuan

AAK

4 Penjuru Close
Singapore 602574
Tel: ceFFe22F

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@I|kkauto.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 24 July 2019 5:00 PM

To: Pei Juan <peijuan lee@aakls.com>; Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>; CS A Team <cs-a@I|kkauto.com>
Subject: RE: Legend Motors YP602H against GBG9160B on 23/02/19 *** LKK REF: CCC4/LPC19006006/ha3

‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE’
SAVE AS TO COSTS

Dear Sir / Madam,

Thank you for your email.

Our respective case handler will look into the matter and get back to you in due course.
Hi Vic,

Kindly assist.

To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@Ikkauto.com | fax: 67414108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Pei Juan <peijuan lee@aakls.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 24 July, 2019 4:56 PM

To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com>; Joy Irene (LKKAuto) <Joylrene@|kkauto.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>; CS A Team <cs-a@I|kkauto.com>
Subject: RE: Legend Motors YP602H against GBG9160B on 23/02/19 *** LKK REF: CC4/LPC19006006/ja3




HiJoy,
Any outcome? Liability cleared?

Best regards,
Petjuan

AAK

4 Penjuru Close
Singapore 60574
Tel: 6eF7622F

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@Ilkkauto.com>

Sent: Monday, 3 June 2019 11:33 AM

To: Pei Juan <peijuan lee@aakls.com>; Joy Irene (LKKAuto) <Joylrene@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>; CS A Team <cs-a@I|kkauto.com>
Subject: RE: Legend Motors YP602H against GBG9160B on 23/02/19 *** LKK REF: CC4/LPC19006006/ja3

‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE’
SAVE AS TO COSTS

Dear Sir / Madam,

Thank you for your email.

Our respective case handler will look into the matter and get back to you in due course.
Hi Joy,

FYNA please.

To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com | fax: 67414108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Pei Juan <peijuan lee@aakls.com>

Sent: Friday, 31 May, 2019 2:43 PM

To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; assignments <assignments@Ilkkauto.com>; CS A Team <cs-a@lkkauto.com>;
Joy Irene (LKKAuto) <Joylrene@I|kkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Legend Motors YP602H against GBG9160B on 23/02/19 *** LKK REF: CC4/LPC19006006/ja3

Hi MeiKwan,

Please advise liability for DS.
Best regards,

Petjuan

AAK

4 Penjuru Close



Singaport GOL574
Tel: eeFFe227

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@I|kkauto.com>

Sent: Friday, 17 May 2019 9:12 AM

To: Pei Juan <peijuan lee@aakls.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; assignments <assignments@Ilkkauto.com>; CS A Team <cs-a@Ikkauto.com>;
Joy Irene (LKKAuto) <Joylrene@I|kkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Legend Motors YP602H against GBG9160B on 23/02/19 *** LKK REF: CC4/LPC19006006/ja3

‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE’
SAVE AS TO COSTS

Dear Sir / Madam,
We refer to the above matter.
Kindly advise whether your client still would like to pursue with TP claim.

If so, please provide us the following and arrange for TP survey.
e evidence i.e. video and scene photo.
e estimated cost of repair
e GIAreport

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com | fax: 67414108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Pei Juan <peijuan lee@aakls.com>

Sent: Monday, 8 April, 2019 5:30 PM

To: Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@Ilkkauto.com>; Joy Irene (LKKAuto) <Joylrene@|kkauto.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>; CS A Team <cs-a@|kkauto.com>
Subject: RE: Legend Motors YP602H against GBG9160B on 23/02/19

Hi Joy,
Is liability cleared?

Best regards,
Petjuan

AAK

4 Penjuru Close
Singapore 60574
Tel: 6eFF6227

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@|kkauto.com>

Sent: Friday, 5 April 2019 3:21 PM

To: 'Pei Juan' <peijuan lee@aakls.com>; Joy Irene (LKKAuto) <Joylrene@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>; CS A Team <cs-a@I|kkauto.com>
Subject: RE: Legend Motors YP602H against GBG9160B on 23/02/19




Dear Pei Juan,

Thank you for the email.
Dear Joy,

Kindly assist for liability.

FYNA Our Ref : CC4/LPC19006006/ja3

Best Regards,

G.Nivitha| Admin
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Litd

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: PeiJuan [mailto:peijuan lee@aakls.com]

Sent: Friday, 5 April 2019 3:13 PM

To: 'Admin-D (LKKAuto)' <admin-d@I|kkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Legend Motors YP602H against GBG9160B on 23/02/19

Hi Nivitha,
Full Liability cleared right?

Best regards,
Peljuan

AAK

4 Penjuru Close
Singapore 602574
Tel: 66776227

From: Pei Juan <peijuan lee@aakls.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 3 April 2019 5:22 PM

To: 'Admin-D (LKKAuto)' <admin-d@I|kkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Legend Motors YP602H against GBG9160B on 23/02/19

Hi Nivitha,
Yes direct settlement.

Best regards,
Peljuan

AAK

4 Penjuru Close
Singapore 602574
Tel: eeF 76227
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From: Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@|kkauto.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 3 April 2019 5:20 PM

To: 'Pei Juan' <peijuan lee@aakls.com>

Subject: RE: Legend Motors YP602H against GBG9160B on 23/02/19

Dear Pei Juan,

Does this case do DS ?

Best Regards,

G.Nivitha| Admin
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Pei Juan [mailto:peijuan lee@aakls.com]

Sent: Wednesday, 3 April 2019 5:14 PM

To: 'Admin-D (LKKAuto)' <admin-d@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Legend Motors YP602H against GBG9160B on 23/02/19

Hi Nivitha,
Nope, need arrange to come.

Best regards,
Petjuan

AAK

4 Penjuru Close
Singaport GOL574
Tel: 66F76227

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@|kkauto.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 3 April 2019 5:01 PM

To: 'Pei Juan' <peijuan lee@aakls.com>

Subject: FW: Legend Motors YP602H against GBG9160B on 23/02/19

Dear Pei Juan,

Is the vehicle YP 602h in the workshop?

Best Regards,

G.Nivitha| Admin
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Litd
Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
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