
1

Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 10 April 2019 9:04 AM

To: Nadaraja, Deebanalnadaraja; SUR; Claims Dept

Subject: RE: OD / 6800863734SG / SGR2012A - Excess waiver

Dear Deeban Nadaraja, 

 

Noted with thanks. 

 
Best Regards, 

Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: siewsc@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

From: Nadaraja, Deebanalnadaraja <Deebanalnadaraja.Nadaraja@aig.com>  

Sent: Wednesday, 10 April 2019 8:59 AM 

To: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; Claims Dept <claims@premiumauto.com.sg> 

Subject: OD / 6800863734SG / SGR2012A - Excess waiver 

 

Hi Shiau, 

 

Please be inform that insured entitled half excess waiver for in car camera. 
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Thanks & Regards, 

 

Deeban Nadaraja 

AIG 

Claims Adjuster | Express Auto Claims 

Singapore Claims | AIG Shared Services 

 

Deebanalnadaraja.nadaraja@aig.com  www.AIG.com 
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