Jia Le (LKK Auto)

#

From: ONG LU LI <llong@lonpac.com>

Sent: Friday, 24 May 2019 4:23 PM

To: Jia Le (LKK Auto)

Cc: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto); Admin A

Subject: RE: {Seek Mandate) Our Ref 19/19/19/VC05/021620 accident involving vehicle nos.

SKT 2924 K / GBB 1600 C [External General]

Lonpac External - General
Dear Jia Le

Please proceed.

Regards,

Ong Li Li

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road #17-04/07 The Concourse Singapore 199555
65) 6296 2706

The all - mew | Jonpac.com.sg

Lonpac External - General data is for infernal / external use.

From: Jia Le (LKK Auto) [mailto:JiaLe@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Tuesday, 21 May, 2019 9:34 AM

To: ONG LI LI

Cc: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto); Admin A

Subject: (Seek Mandate) Our Ref: 19/19/19/VC05/021620 accident involving vehicle nos, SKT 2924 K / GBB 1600 C
[External General]

Lonpac Rel: 19/19/19/VC05/021620
LKK Ref: CC4/LPCI190046001 /Epad
Dear SirsfMadarn,

We refer to the above matter

We have highlighted to your good office on 10/04/2019 of Third-Party's request to do Direct Settlement with
our Principal; Lonpac Insurance Bhd.

Insured driver collided onto the parked vehicle. Liabillity is not in our driver's favour.

summary to offer 1o third party repairer. “SU BROTHERS' MOTOR WORKSHOP" is as follows: -

Claimed Amount Revised Amount

1. Cosl of Repair [w/G5T] $ 7.073.03 $2.247.00
2. Loss of Use [4days x $120.00) $ 72000 % 720.00 [6days x $120.00]
3. LTA/ GIA Search Fee 3 2.00 ] 2.00

Total | $ 7,795.03 769.




. **05days recommendation for repair + 1sunday = ddays.
Relevant supporting claim documents are attached herewith for your perusal and reference.

v for raval

Best Regards,

Carlor Chan | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6749 5792 | email: Jiale@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenoe 1, #02-25 | 5(408033)

From: ONG LI LI <llong@lonpac.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 10 April, 2019 10:22 AM

To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com=>

Ce: MT_Claim_5G <mt_claim@lonpac.com>; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@|kkauto.cam>; CS A Team <¢s-
a@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Our Ref: 19/19/19/VC05/021620 accident involving vehicle nos. SKT 2924 K / GBB 1600 C [External
General]

Lonpac External - General
Dear Mel Kwan

Please see attached for our Insured's GIA report.

Regards,
Ong Li Li
Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd
300 Beach Road #17-04/07 The Concourse Singapore 199555
Tel : (65) 6250 7388 Ext. 254 Fax: (65) 6296 2706

The all * ¥ | lonpac.com.sg

Lonpac External - General data is for internal / external use.

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) [mailto:Meikwan@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Wednesday, 10 April, 2019 10:15 AM

To: ONG LI LI

Cc: MT_Claim_SG; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto); CS A Team; Admin A

Subject: RE: Our Ref: 19/19/19/VC05/021620 accident involving vehicle nos. SKT 2924 K / GBB 1600 C [External
General]

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
SAVE AS TO COSTS

LPC ref: 19/19/19/VC05/021620
LKK REF: CC4/LPC19006001/Epa3

Dear Sir / Madam,
We refer to the above matter.

Enclosed revert of vehicle: SKT 2924K



We have not authorized repairs.

Enclosed for your perusal is:
* TP estimated cost of repair
« Preliminary advice

Kindly let us have a copy of insured's accident report for our necessary action.
Please take note that the case handler in-charge is Hsiao Tong and she can be contacted at DID: 6742 3197.

To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LEKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com | fax: 67414108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | $(408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)
Sent: Wednesday, 3 April, 2019 5:33 PM
To: 'ONG LI LI' <llong@lonpac.com:; assignments <assignments & |kkauto.com>

Ce: 'MT_Claim_5G' <mt_claim@lonpac.com>; Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>
Subject: RE: Our Ref: 19/19/19/VC05/021620 accident involving vehicle nos. SKT 2924 K / GBB 1600 C [External

General]
Dear Sir/Mdm,
Thank you for the assignment.

Please be informed that repairer agreed survey on 04/04/2019.

Best Regards,

G.Nivitha| Admin

LEK Auto Consultants Pre Ltd

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: gssignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408033)

From: Nivitha (LKK Auto) [mailto:admin-d@|kkauto.com]
Sent: Wednesday, 3 April 2019 5:31 PM
To: 'ONG LI LI’ <llong@lonpac.com>; 'assignments@Ilkkauto.com’ <assignments@|kkauto.com>

Cc: ‘MT_Claim_SG' <mt_claim@lonpac.com>; ‘Admin A’ < n-a@lkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: Our Ref: 19/19/19/VC05/021620 accident involving vehicle nos. SKT 2924 K / GBB 1600 C [External

General)

Dear Sir/Mdm,



Thank you for the assignment.

Please be informed that vehicle is not in the warkshop, repairer will arrange.

Best Regards,

G.Nivitha| Admin

LEEK Auto Consultants Pre Ltd

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933]

From: ONG LI LI [mailto:llong@lonpac.com]
Sent: Wednesday, 3 April 2019 12:35 PM

To: su_bros@singnet.com.sg; assignments@Ikkauto.com; Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com>

Ce: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com>

Subject: FW: Our Ref: 19/19/19/VC05/021620 accident involving vehicle nos. SKT 2924 K / GBB 1600 C [External
General]

Lonpac External - General

Without Prejudice
Save as to Costs

Dear Sir/Mdm

Please see the list of motor surveyors and liaise with LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd for
survey.

Dear Nivitha

FYA

| o] M R iesm s |
1 Kalvin Ang
2 Xing Guo Qiang
3 Mohamad Taufikh
4 Bryan Ang
5 Adrian Ling

6 Mohammed Rasul
7 Marcus Chua

8 Kenneth Kong




Muhammad Nazril Bin
Abdullah

Ong Hwee jie/Steve Chen

Please let us know within two (2) working days whether you agree to the appointment of any
of these motor surveyors as a single joint expert.

Regards,
Ong Li Li
Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd
300 Beach Road #17-04/07 The Concourse Singapore 199555
Tel : (65) 6250 7388 Ext. 254 Fax: (65) 6296 2706

¥
ﬂ r The all * vew . lonpac.com.sg
E —

Lonpac External - General dala s for internal / external use

From: su_bros@singnet.com.sg [mailtoisy bros@singnet.com.sq]
Sent: Wednesday, 3 April, 2019 11:08 AM

To: MT_Claim_SG

Subject: accident involving vehicle nos, SKT 2924 K / GBB 1600 C

Hi,
Copy attached.
Kindly provide 10 surveyors list.

Regards
Su Bros

This email has been checked for viruses by AVG antivirus software.
WWW.BVE.COm
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SU BROTHERS' MOTOR WORKSHOP

BLK S034 ANG MO KIO IND PK 2 #01-341/343 SINGAPORE 559537

Date 12 Apr 2019 Pe: 12
Our ref: SB/MC/0131/04/19 TD

Lonpac Insurance Bhd
300 Beach Road
#17-04/07 The Concourse
Singapore 1995355

Attn Motor Claims Dept

Dear Sir/fMdm,

Re : Accident Involving Motor Vehicle Nos. SKT 2924 K [ GBB 1600 C
Alo wils Changi Ai Beside Changi Nort
02/04/2019.

Please refer to the above accident,

From the circumstances of the accident, the driver of your insured’s vehicle no.
GBB 1600 C was entirely negligent in causing the above accident.

Our client has been put to loss & expense, particulars of which are as the below

followings:-
1) Lump Sum Repair $ 2.247.00
2) Loss of Rental @$120.00 x 6 days % 720.00
3) GIA Search S 2.00
s 2,969.00

Remarks: Client vehicle was lying at our w/s on 02/04/19. Your appointed
surveyor Mr. Steve Chen had inspected client vehicle on 04/04/19. He
recommended 5 repair days. Said vehicle was completed repaired & back to
client on 08/04/19. So total 6 days of claim, cross 1 weekend.

TEL 4824355 FAX AB24TE8




5] . Heffes b Rk

SU BROTHERS' MOTOR WORKSHOP

BLK 5034 ANG MO KIO IND PK 2 #01-341/343 SINGAPORE 569537

Pg:22

We enclose the following documents in support our client's claim for your

consideration.
1) Satisfaction & Discharge Voucher / Letter OF Authority.

2) GIA Report OF SKT 2924 K.

3) Final Repair Bill (Invoice No : 0131/04/19),
4) Certificate Of Insurance Of SKT 2924 K.

) GIA Search OF GBB 1600 C.

) B & O Vehicle Rental w/agreement no, 19291,

Kindly revert to our client’s claim as soon as possible.

TEL 1824355 FAX 4824788




LETTER OF AUTHORITY

RE : Accident imvolving motor vehicle no Sy 7 1% rrk b OGbb lhan o
aloy TIE Tvends Choo Blr Forl besids claas) pordl Cvafzend
eyl 1y | J

e, Mr Liwn (lues Hoe Nric No._ §11e%785 ]

of Bk U793 ik me 7, Al UME gVl

Ovner of Motor Vehicle Registration No. SET 191\

Insured by 5n-—-Pa l'\munu__ ﬂﬂ:;.gu,ra._ P under policy no.

PIYmTIN ol ea gy g% do hereby authorised M/S SU BROTHERS' MITUR WORKSHOP of

Blic 5034 Ang Mo Kio Industrial Park 2 #01-341/343, Singapore 569537. To act as my/our
representative in my/our claim against the owner/driver of Vehicle Registration No.
AN (haal in respect of the above-mentioned accident.

m.mmﬂsdwsmms*mmmmﬂmaﬂmnf solicitor of
ﬂ:nirclwi:etnactmny!ourbebnlfinrespectufmclam,ﬁmq.

1/We, also hereby authorised that any payment due to me/us from the aforesaid claim to be
paid to my/our above-named representative.

I/We, indemify my above-named representative against all claim and/or damaged which arise
from all actions taken for and on my/our behalf,

1/We, the above-mentioned vehicle owner/driver affirm the sbovesaid statement below.

BY AUTHORITY WITHNESSED BY
Dlht\i 1\ 2 . [%

OWNER/DRIVER

NAME M/ Lie Chwae  Hwea xave € B aopy

HRIC S0 l-r"\";aq.'j NRIC CIvi L1y

DATE oA Gl vty DATE +'.u(! )4 1Oy




' LONPAC INSURANCE BHD

CLAIM NO  : 1919/19/VC05/021 620
DATE 24 MAY 2019

DISCHARGE VOUCHER

I'We, LIM CHWEE HWA confirmed acceptance from M/s LONPAC INSURANCE
BHD and/or owner of GBB 1600C the sum of Singapore Dollar Two Thousand Nine
Hundred and Sixty-Nine Only ($2.969.00) in full and final satisfaction, liquidation
and discharge of all property losses competent to me'us upon the said M/s LONPAC
INSURANCE BHD in respect of all property losses sustained by me/us whether
now or hereafter to become manifest, ansing either directly or indirectly from an
accident involving SKT 2924K and GBB 1600C on 02 April 2019 along TPE Twds
Changi Airport Beside Changi North Cres,

I /We hereby agree to indemnify and keep indemnify (LONPAC INSURANCE
BHD/ HONG JIE RENOVATION & TRADING AND/OR SOOLIYARAJ
SAANKAR) agminst all claims and any clmms whatsoever made by any
person/persons on our behalf in respect of the said accident

I'We further authorize you to pay the above settlement sum directly to SU
BROTHERS' MOTOR WORKSHOP.

I/We hereby acknowledged that this payment is made on a without admission of
liability basis and without prejudice to all related claims and in respect of our
insured’s recovery action.

Signature of vehicle owner/Date

‘l'.' |_

Name of vehicle owner /Date



Su Brothers' Motor Workshop

Blk 5034 Ang Mo Kio Industrial Park 2
#01-341/343
Singapore 569537

Tel : 64824355 Fax:64824788 Email : su_bros@singnet.com.sg

Co. Reg. No : 26584500M GST Reg No : M3-0008282-A

Date 12/04/2019
Qur Ref SB/MC/0131/04/18 TD

Tax Invoice 0131/04/18

Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road

#17-04/07 Tha Concourse

Singapore 188555

Attention : Motor Claims Departmeant

Vahicle No : BKT 2924 K Your Insured Vehicle reg no: GBB 1600 C
Make/Model  Subaru XV

DoA 02/04/2019

Final Cost Of Repairs : -

Lump sum repair .. .

5 2,100.00
GST 7% H 147.00
5 2.247.00

Dollars Two Thousand Two Hundred And Forty-Seven Only



B-& 0 VEHICLE RENTAL

Bk 5033, Ang Mo Kio Industrial Park 2 #01-279 (off Ang Mo Kio Ave. 3)
Singapore 569536 Tel B4B2 5577 (3 Lines) Fax: G402 5000

Reg No: 53060835M

TOWING SERVICE: GBS5E 4067 (Alter 10.30 pm)

. QLI

W HHEER
VEHICLE RENTAL AGREEMENT
Date: 3["{5“3
Owner: B&O \"EHICLE[IENTA.L (“the owner”)
Hirar: o~ Gl neer -
NRIC / Co. Reg. No: S PN yS J

Tel

E Fax: H/P:
address:  BYS U1 D~ Mmoks A3 Hi(-ogys SN\
U

Ownar and Hirer have agreed to enter into this Vehicle Rental Agreement for the motor vehicle described below and upon the
terms and conditions contained an both sides of this document. Hirer acknowledges having read and understood all the terms and

conditions and signifies acceptance upon signing.

Address:

vehicle Reg. No: S (3w F AgreementNo: 19291
Driver's Particulars
Name: (—L (/r*"“""cp HLV'C- FEEEE

Date & TimeOut:_ Y11 f 3\\) _—
Date & Time In: 3{“!'? l.‘h}j}/r"_'

I'C No: i Dri/Licenca No:
Q 1IxoynSfT1|™ : e HOUP @S o
I
Date of Issue: ¢ Occupation: | ... 0D pays@s. 2217 |
— i V?UH CWKS @8
4 Tools: |
i Ll
] l ]‘} ‘ | AN | Spare Tyre: Al YA e NS @6 |
E%mw insurance claim ansing from e dals Mmmmgmmm DBIHJEH ME}Z
vehicle (both dates inclusive) Hirer unconditionally agrees 1o pay Owner 5§ ) =
compiising excess payable and compensation to Owner for impact of claim on Nulure molor Sub-Total :
Dun Veni Jow |~ Balance ToPay: | <& 1w ¥
n Yehicle Dambsge ! . 3 alance To ' ;
T & VIt maa s w8 e 5 S R A s e
5 TR,

Agthorissd Driver
Hirer shall pay addmonal excess of S$1500 if the Authormed Driver 8 below the age of 25 or
is above 85 years old or has lees than 2 years driving ssperience
Driver Mot Cover By [hsursnce

policy’ does ol cover against any difver aged below 22 andor above T0 yeurs
oid arcian with diving expotionce of 1 year and beiow.

B & O VEHICLE RENTAL

PETROL DIGSEL AT YOUR OWN EXPENSE
FOR LOCAL USE DMLY

Hirer's Signature
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GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE
RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE

6 Raffles Quay #16-00, Singapore 048580
I"SURA“CE Phone: +65 6224 0010 Fax: +65 6224 0030
ASSOCIATION Operating Hours: Manday to Friday 8am to Spm
GST Registration No; M400017735

FECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE
Third Party Insurer Enquiry
lur Ref No GR-18-061472
ate of Request: 02/04/2018 Your Ref No. Ornline Purchase

u Brothers’ Motor Workshop
lk 5034 Ang Mo Kio Industrial Park 2

11-341/343

ingapore 568537

ear SirfMadam,

nquiry Date 02/04r2018

nquiry By Koh Siew Ling

P Vehicle Mo. GBB1600C

ccident Date 02/04r2018

nquiry Result

P Vehicle No. Insurer Period of Insurance insurer Tel. No.
iBB1600C Lonpac Insurance Bhd 2BM0212018-27/02r2020 +65 62507388
hank You,

& imapges provided to you are taken from the original reports forwarded to the centre by the members of the General Insurance Association of
ngapore and we take no responsibility for their accuracy or contents and shall be under no liabllity whatsoever for any loss or damage arising oul of
in connection with the reports or their images.

his s & computer generaled document and requires no signature.

ttps://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRsas& fuseaction=dsp_geninvip&r... 02-Apr-19



voice Page 2 of 2

GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE
RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE

6 Raffies Quay #18-00, Singapore 048580
INSURANCE Frone «65 6224 0010 Fax +65 6224 0030
ASSOCIATION QOperating Hours: Monday 1o Fridey Sam lo S5pm

GST Registration No: M400017735

RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE
TAX INVOICE
iur Ref No. GR-18-061472
ate of Reguest: 02/04/2018 Your Ref No: Online Purchase
u Brathers' Motor Workshop
Ik 5034 Ang Mo Kio Industrial Park 2
11-341/343
ingapore 569537
igar SirMadam,
nquiry Date 02/04/2019
nuiry By Koh Siew Ling
P Vehicle No. GBB1600C
ccident Date 021042018
IESCRIPTION AMOUNT (S%)
P Insurer Enquiry 1.87
ST Amount Q.13
‘otal Amount Due (GST Inclusive) 2.00
hank You.

his is 8 computer generated document and requires no signature.

or GIARMC Oficial use:
iate:
] GIRO [ ] Cash [ ] Cheque

ttps://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRsas& fuseaction=dsp_geninvip&r... 02-Apr-19



