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Jimmy Chen (LKK Auto)

From: Jimmy Chen (LKK Auto)
Sent: Monday, 22 July 2019 3:11 PM
To: Rico 60
Cc: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto); Vic (LKKAuto)
Subject: RE: OUR REF: CC4/ASM19005996/Upa3 - Accident involving SMA9938B and 

FBD23P on 02/04/2019
Attachments: EXPRESS SETTLEMENT FORM.pdf

‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE’ 
  SAVE AS TO COSTS 
 
Dear Sirs/Mdm, 
 
Please refer to attached, thank you. 
 
 
“Please note that our proposal and correspondence with you is strictly on a without prejudice basis and should not be construed as an 
admission of liability on our part and/or that of our policyholder and/or the authorised driver. The terms of our without prejudice 
engagement should not be disclosed in any other related matter(s) in respect of this accident nor should it be binding in any other related 
claims.” 
 
 
Best Regards, 

Jimmy Chen| Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841-2928 | email: jimmychen@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

From: Rico 60 <claims@rico60.com>  
Sent: Monday, 22 July 2019 12:37 PM 
To: Jimmy Chen (LKK Auto) <jimmychen@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>; Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: OUR REF: CC4/ASM19005996/Upa3 - Accident involving SMA9938B andFBD23P on 02/04/2019 
 
Hi Jimmy, 
 
Thank you for your offer. 
 
Please be informed that offer accepted. 
Kindly assist to release DV soonest possible. 
 
Thank you. 
 
Best Regards, 
Jin Hai 
 

 
RICO 60 AUTO SERVICES PTE. LTD. 
Co. & GST Reg. No.: 201807623M 
8 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4, Premier @ Kaki Bukit 
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#02-24, Singapore 415875 
Tel: +65 6286 6060 | Fax: +65 6286 7060 
Email: claims@rico60.com 
 

From: Jimmy Chen (LKK Auto) 
Sent: Monday, 22 July 2019 10:21 AM 
To: claims@rico60.com 
Cc: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto); Vic (LKKAuto) 
Subject: OUR REF: CC4/ASM19005996/Upa3 - Accident involving SMA9938B andFBD23P on 02/04/2019 
 
‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE’ 
  SAVE AS TO COSTS 
 
Dear Sirs/Mdm, 
 
We refer to the above matter. 
 
We propose settlement at a global sum of $10,590.57 (all-in). 
 
Please confirm acceptance. 
 
“Please note that our proposal and correspondence with you is strictly on a without prejudice basis and should not be construed as an 
admission of liability on our part and/or that of our policyholder and/or the authorised driver. The terms of our without prejudice 
engagement should not be disclosed in any other related matter(s) in respect of this accident nor should it be binding in any other related 
claims.” 
 
 
Best Regards, 

Jimmy Chen| Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841-2928 | email: jimmychen@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 
 
 

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto)  
Sent: Monday, 8 July 2019 11:35 AM 
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: LOD for SMA 9938 B 
 
 
 
‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE’ 
  SAVE AS TO COSTS 
 

Thank You. 

 

Best Regards, 

Asher Sng | Case Handler   

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

phone: 6841-6051 | email: ashersng@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
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From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto)  
Sent: Tuesday, 2 July 2019 3:34 PM 
To: Enquiry <claims@rico60.com>; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: LOD for SMA 9938 B 
 
‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE’ 
  SAVE AS TO COSTS 
 
Dear Sir / Madam, 
 
Thank you for your email. 
 
Our respective case handler will look into the matter and get back to you in due course. 
 
Hi Hsiao Tong , 
 
Kindly assist. 
 
 
Thank You. 

 

Best Regards, 

Asher Sng | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

phone: 6841-6051 | email: ashersng@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
 

From: Enquiry <claims@rico60.com>  
Sent: Tuesday, 21 May 2019 4:59 PM 
To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: LOD for SMA 9938 B 
 
Dear Asher , 
 
Kindly ignore previous LOD. 
 
Attached file as per your pursuant. 
Kindly release DV/cheque. 
 
 
Thank you. 
 
Best Regards, 
Shanelle Lim 
 

The linked image cannot be displayed.  The file may have been moved, renamed, or deleted. Verify that the link points to the correct file and location.

 
RICO 60 AUTO SERVICES PTE. LTD. 
Co. & GST Reg. No.: 201807623M 
8 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4, Premier @ Kaki Bukit 
#02-24, Singapore 415875 
Mobile: +65 9187 8064| Tel: +65 6286 6060 | Fax: +65 6286 7060 
Email: enquiry@rico60.com 
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From: Enquiry 
Sent: Tuesday, 21 May 2019 4:55 PM 
To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) 
Subject: RE: LOD for SMA 9938 B 
 
Dear Asher , 
 
Kindly ignore previous LOD. 
 
Attached file as per your pursuant. 
Kindly release DV/cheque. 
 
 
Thank you. 
 
Best Regards, 
Shanelle Lim 
 

The linked image cannot be displayed.  The file may have been moved, renamed, or deleted. Verify that the link points to the correct file and location.

 
RICO 60 AUTO SERVICES PTE. LTD. 
Co. & GST Reg. No.: 201807623M 
8 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4, Premier @ Kaki Bukit 
#02-24, Singapore 415875 
Mobile: +65 9187 8064| Tel: +65 6286 6060 | Fax: +65 6286 7060 
Email: enquiry@rico60.com 
 

From: Enquiry 
Sent: Tuesday, 16 April 2019 11:05 AM 
To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) 
Subject: LOD for SMA 9938 B 
 
Dear Asher, 
 
Attached file as per your pursuant. 
Kindly release DV/cheque. 
 
 
Thank you. 
 
Best Regards, 
Shanelle Lim 
 

The linked image cannot be displayed.  The file may have been moved, renamed, or deleted. Verify that the link points to the correct file and location.

 
RICO 60 AUTO SERVICES PTE. LTD. 
Co. & GST Reg. No.: 201807623M 
8 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4, Premier @ Kaki Bukit 
#02-24, Singapore 415875 
Mobile: +65 9187 8064| Tel: +65 6286 6060 | Fax: +65 6286 7060 
Email: enquiry@rico60.com 
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