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Celine Fong (LKKAuto)

From: Claims at crownasia <claims@crownasia.com.sg>
Sent: Wednesday, 18 August 2021 6:13 PM
To: Celine Fong (LKKAuto)
Cc: 'Claims at crownasia'
Subject: RE: REPAIR ESTIMATE FOR PC3425H DOA 29/03/2019

Dear Celine Fong, 
 
Thanks for your reply. 
 
We accept your offer. 
 
 
Thanks and Best Regards, 
Andy Ooi (Mr) 
Operation Dept. 
 

 
Crown Asia Bus Builder Pte Ltd 
Tel: 6966 0666/ 8688 9995 
44 Sungei Kadut Ave, Singapore 729667 
 

From: Celine Fong (LKKAuto) [mailto:celinefong@lkkauto.com]  
Sent: Wednesday, 18 August 2021 12:31 PM 
To: claims@crownasia.com.sg 
Cc: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: REPAIR ESTIMATE FOR PC3425H DOA 29/03/2019 
 
Dear Andy, 
 
Without Prejudice 
 
My surveyor has gone through the estimate and based on our computation the offer is as below. 
 
Parts After 10%                                 $216.00 
Special Nett                                        $20.00 
Labour                                                  $1,650.00 
 
Sub Total ( Parts + S/N + Labour)- $1,886.00 
 
Lump Sum - 20% - $1,500.00 and 05 Repair Days 
 
 
Please confirm. 
 

Best Regards, 

Celine Fong  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
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phone: 6256-3561 | email: celinefong@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
 
 
 

From: Claims at crownasia <claims@crownasia.com.sg>  
Sent: Wednesday, 4 August 2021 10:00 AM 
To: Sun Pin (LKK Auto) <sunpin@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: 'Claims at crownasia' <claims@crownasia.com.sg> 
Subject: RE: REPAIR ESTIMATE FOR PC3425H DOA 29/03/2019 
 
Dear Hwee Jie, 
 
May I know any update about the case? 
And the main issue in order to salve this case as soon as possible. 
Looking forward to your reply. 
 
 
Thanks and Best Regards, 
Andy Ooi (Mr) 
Operation Dept. 
 

 
Crown Asia Bus Builder Pte Ltd 
Tel: 6966 0666/ 8688 9995 
44 Sungei Kadut Ave, Singapore 729667 
 

From: claims@crownasia.com.sg [mailto:claims@crownasia.com.sg]  
Sent: Saturday, 17 August 2019 11:20 AM 
To: HWEEJIE@LKKAUTO.COM 
Subject: RE: REPAIR ESTIMATE FOR PC3425H DOA 29/03/2019 
 
Dear Hwee Jie, 
 
May I know progressing of this case? it stuck for 4 months already. Please advise  
 
Thanks and Best Regards, 
Faika 

Crown Asia Bus Builder Pte Ltd 
Tel: 6966 9995 / 6996 9995       Fax:6469 4319 
Email: faika@crownasia.com.sg 
44 Sungei Kadut Ave, Singapore 729667 
 
 

From: Claims [mailto:claims@crownasia.com.sg]  
Sent: 10 April, 2019 9:39 AM 
To: HWEEJIE@LKKAUTO.COM 
Subject: REPAIR ESTIMATE FOR PC3425H DOA 29/03/2019 
 
Dear Hwee Jie, 
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Please find the attached repair estimate for your marking, 
 
Thanks and Best Regards, 
Jayden 

Crown Asia Bus Builder Pte Ltd 
Tel: 6966 9995 / 6996 9995       Fax:6469 4319 
Email: jayden@crownasia.com.sg 
44 Sungei Kadut Ave, Singapore 729667 
 
 


