Asher Sna !LKI{Auto]

From: ONG LI LI <llong@lonpac.com=

Sent: Tuesday, 8 October 2019 11:21 AM

To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

Cc: MT_Claim_SG

Subject: RE: [MANDATE REQUEST] Your Ref: 19/19/19/VC05/021616, ACCIDENT INVOLVING
GBF 7425G AND SX 9999H ON 02/04,/2019

Follow Up Flag: Follow up

Flag Status: Completed

Dear Asher

Please proceed.

Regards,

Ong LI LI

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd
300 Beach Road #17-04/07 The Concourse
Singapore 199555

Tel : (65) 6250 7388 Ext. 254 Fax: (65) 6296 2706

The all "we% |onpac.com.sg

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) [mailto:AsherSng@lkkauto.com)

Sent: Thursday, 3 October 2019 9:53 AM

To: ONG LI LI

Cc: MT_Claim_5G

Subject: RE: [MANDATE REQUEST] Your Ref: 19/19/19/VC05/021616, ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBF 7425G AND SX 9999H
ON 02/04/2019

Hi Li L,

Sorry for the typo errar.

Summary to offer to repairer VOLKSWAGEN CENTRE SINGAPORE is as follows: -

Claimed Amount Revised Amount

1. Cost of Repair (w/iGST) % 14,040 42 $6.357.53
2. Loss of Use (10days x $80) $ B00.00 5 600.00 (10days x 360)
3. LTA/GIA Search Fee s 2.00 g 2.00

Total | § 15,751.42 § 6,959.53

**B days recommendation for repair

Relevant supporting claim documents are attached herewith for your perusal and reference



The above is for your approval please,

Thank You.

Best Regords

Asher 3ng | Case Hondles

LKK Auto Consuliants Ple Lid

phone:; &84 1-6051 | emall; ginennodikkouio com | koo 67474108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industricl Park, Ukl Avenue |, #02-25 | $[408933)

From: ONG LI LI < QnEiwionpa Tiiks

Sent: Thursday, 3 October 2!]19 9:32 AM

To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <4chersng @ l >
Cc: MT Clalm EG'C ! a@im @lonpal T

Subject: RE: [MAND.&TE REQUEST] Your Hef— 19/19/19/VC05/021616, ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBF 7425G AND 5X 9999H
ON 02/04/2019

Hi Asher

Please check the total sum (diff 2 cents).

Regards,

Ong Li Li

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd
300 Beach Road #17-04/07 The Concourse
Singapore 199555

Tel : (65) 6250 7388 Ext. 254 Fax: (65) 6296 2706

The all "% lonpac.com.sg

From: Asher 5ng (LKKAuto) [mailto AsherSng@ikkauto com]

Sent: Tuesday, 1 October 2019 5:24 PM

To: ONG LI LI

Ce: MT_Claim_SG

Subject: [MANDATE REQUEST] Your Ref: 19/19/19/VC05/021616, ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBF 7425G AND SX 9999H ON
02/04/2019

Your Ref. 18/19/19NC05/021616
Dear Sirs
We refer to the above matter

ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBF 7425G AND SX 9999H ON 02/04/2019

We have highlighted to your good office on 03/04/2018 of Third-Party's request to do Direct Settiement with our Principal,
Lonpac Insurance Bhd
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The accident occurred when our Insured reversed and collided third party vehicle
Basing on the reports of the circumstance of the accident, we propose to settle third-party claim at 100% liability
Summary to offer to repairer VOLKSWAGEN CENTRE SINGAPORE is as follows: -

Claimed Amount | Revised Amount
1. Cost of Repair (w/GST) S 14,849 42 §6,357.33
2 Loss of Use (10days x $80) $§ B00.0O $ 60000 (10days x $60)
3 LTA/GIA Search Fee 5 2.00 $ 200
Total | § 15,751.42 § 6.959.53

**8 days recommendation for repair

Relevant supporting claim documents are attached herewith for your perusal and reference
The above is for your approval please.

Thank You.

Best Regords,

Asher Sng | Cose Hondles

LEK Auto Consultants Ple Lid

phone: $§841-4051 | emall! guherngdibeguio com | o 4741-4108
Bl 51, Poyo Ubi industial Pork. Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5|408933)



Volkswagen Centre Singapore

247 Alexandra Road Singapore 159934
Fax: 64743643 Tel: 63057299

Biz Bag MNe Z3100046FE
GET M. M08 5052

LETTER OF DEMAND
Your Refl : S
Our Ref: 999 A
To: kﬂm‘-_
Dear Sirs,
ACCIDENT INVOLVING ™ 9917 o aspquss Gy 2-4-19
We are claiming on behalf of our client 984 AN Hﬂmﬂ NG owner of
K 9TIN 2 419

vehicle number involved in accidenton

with vehicle  O8F 1H25G | a B W

Description of claims:

Cost of Repairs s 36 .53 ( Incl 7% GST )

Loss of Use/Rental s g° X_'" pays=g 90

Medical Fee s ( Incl 7% GST)

Search Fee s * ( Incl 7% GST)

TOTAL s_1'59-¢s

We are claiming in full and final settlement of s 1/59- 5 payable to
Volkswagen Centre Singapore.

Kindly send us a written acknowledgement within 14 days from receipt of this document
Please note that finalization/settlement offer of this claim should be within 8 weeks from the
date of this document. Please email all settlement offers to meiy. wong@vw.com.sg

!
—_—— 110N 0



Volkswagen Centre Singapore

Bi Mg, N SLOI04FE
GET ha MTO0D9ES0%-2

LETTER OF AUTHORITY

ACCIDENT INVOLVING 94994 Y ang  (8F 8% on  o3kM[rae

Dot vl 's ALMber DOffier vahrcie's nymber Daie of sociden
along Hoald &aH) Dive smnf=ET  CAEpaer

Arigam incation
BY THE LETTER OF AUTHORITY, l/we, Yew  cHUN  ppgun Nk
‘-I‘?E sigmp of Podcy Holder L IC S Peesport rumber .

of §710 owner of Vehicle Registration
Number SHA9%94 nhereby irevocable appoint Volkswagen Centre Singapore

Orwr wdfiicie s furmber
(hereinafter refer to VGS), a company incorporated in Singapore and having Its registered office at 247
Alexandra Road, Singapore 158934, Ils agents of any person authorized by VGS to be *my / our Attorney and
in * my / our name(s) on *my / our behalf o do all or any of the following:

To submit, resalve and make any claim(s) (including the commencement of legal proceedings) which *l/we may
have against the other “party/parties to the Accident and under the insurance *policy/policies taken up by such
“partyfparties or alternatively under Insurance Palicy number _UPa/ P1 514053 taken up by *me/us and
pay the compulsory excess in respect of the cost repairs suffered by *me/us arising from the Acciden! (less and
damage)/

To collect payment(s) due in respect of any such ciaim(s) for the loss and damage, such payment to be made by
way of Cheque In favour of Volkswagen Centre Singapore and give a valid receipt and discharge therefore.

For any of the purpose aforesaid, lo execute, sign and deliver all documents whatsoever in relation thereto.

Generally do all such acts as It shall deem necassary for the purpose of settling such claim

*l/We hereby declare that all acts, instruments and documents done by virtue of this letter of authority on *mylour
behalf by the Altorney, its agents or any parson authorized by VGS in that behalf shall be as good valid and
sffectual to all intents and purposes whatsoever as if the same had been done or executed by “mefus in *mylour

own proper person(s) and “liwe hereby ratify and confirm, all acts, instruments and documents done or executed
by virtue of the authority and powers hereby conferrad

*I/We hereby further declare that the letter of authority hereby conferred shall remain irrevocable,

*IWe further confirm that the acceptance by VGS of the settlement amount In respect of such constitute the full
discharge of "myfour claim(s) in respect of such loss and damage.

3
IN WITNESS WHEREOF, *liwe have hereunto to set *my/our hand and sign this 2" of the month
MAY ‘(“r I'iﬂ

Signed & Dalﬁ By:
A

Py Holder

Witness By y




LONPAC INSURANCE BHD

CLAIMNO : 191919%VC05/021616
DATE <11 OCT 2019

DISCHARGE VOUCHER

I'We, YEW CHOON MARVIN NG confirmed acceptance from M/Ss LONPAC
INSURANCE BHD and/or the owner GBF 7425G the sum of Singapore Dollars STX
THOUSAND NINE HUNDRED FIFTY NINE AND CENTS FIFTY THREE ONLY,
($6,959.53) in full and final satisfaction, liquidation and discharge of all property
losses compelent to mefus upon the said M/s LONPAC INSURANCE BHD in
respect of all property losses sustained by me/us whether now or herealter (o become
manifest, arising either directly or indirectly from an accident involving, SX 9999H
on 02/04/2019 along/at HOLLAND DRIVE MARKET CARPARK.

1 MWe hereby agree 10 indemnify and keep indemnify (ECK SHEN
CONSTRUCTION & TRADING PTE LTD /LONPAC INSURANCE BHD)
against all claims and any claims whatsoever made by any person/persons on our
behalf in respect of the said accident.

/'We further authorize you to pay the above settlement sum directly to
M VOLKSWAGEN CENTRE SINGAPORF

I/'We hereby acknowledge that this payment is made on a without admission of

liability basis and without prejudice to all relasted claims and in respect of our
insured's recovery action

b oe7 (9

Signuture of vehicle owner/Date

NG Yew CHoon magvid  Lh oef 19,

Provide always that this discharge

for dnmages tclating to the lamape | lo
ghall not prejudice o L o Ic I-
from making a furthes ol i 1

domages for my person
in the same accidenl



VOLKSWAGEN CENTRE SINGAPORE
9 Tuas Avenue

Singapore 539176
Bir Reg No 1991014047
GST No : M200385052

Company Customer Details
Lonpac Insurance BHD Mr
101 Thamson Road NG
#18-0" United Square YEW CHOON MARVIN
Singapore 307531 13 DOVER CLOSE EAST
520
Singapore 130013
Licanse pime  Mooal code Firs regisiration Vin
SXo5eaH 162265 12-08-2014
Position no Description Quantity Unit
5CB807T2170 GAU  Cover For Bumper Primed 1 pes
206059
SCEEZI0NE Heod 1 pee
kr-080579
SCH853851 OWA  Raoiator Grille Satin Bla 1 pes
cd- 070518
5CE8055880 Look Camer With Mourtin 1 pos
xr-060573
SCHB0STOED Guide 1 pos
BUMPER CENTRE GUIDE*XR-140518
SCEBOT2BT 9B3 License Flaln Bracket Sal 1 pcs
XA-140519
N D3B5481 At -] pes
XR-140519
SCBBOSSAT Supporl For Lock Carrier 1 pcs
XA-140518
FRONT NUMBER PLATE 1 pos
LABOUR 4 pcs
SPRAY PAINTING 2 pcs
Dipgnosiic and Programming 1 pcs
Check Shori Circult | Harmess Repair 1 pcs
DIRECT SETTLEMENT AGAINST LONPAC
DOA: 2418 TP VEH: GEFT425G REPAIR
LIMIT s6K
Tax Labour Matorial Material GST%
Code Discount
& 5,947 52 3824 57 %

Testal

Customer

Model
WVYWZZZ1GZEMOZ74T0  Jesta TS| Trend 80 D7F

unit price

oxd. GST

1,129 42
113621
449 90
112241
10032
100.21
053

B3 54
B0.00
BOO.00
BOO 0D

480 00
280 00

4155

O

valkswagen SKODA

lax invoice

Page

Cocument no
Documen dale
Customer no
Customar GST-ID
Deaber

Job order number
Job order date
Service Advisor

e

12333900321
27-05-2019
521104380°

35999
20190002431 1
17-04:2009

9

ME| KWAN EDNG

Mileage
47 882

ind. GST
B2R.41
63218
250.33
B24.51
56.38
55.76
177

46 48
5092
2,396 80
1,198.40

256 80
149.80

Tax cooe  Total amount  Totad amount
excl GST
4800% ¥ 58730
AR 00% @ 59083
48 D0% " 23385
48 00% &1 58365
B0k M S268
4800% # 52 11
4000% & 165
4B00% ¢ 4344
000 # 56.00
o » 2,240.00
30.007% LAl 112000
5000 & 24000
5000 & 14000
Total Total amouni Total amount
Discount el GET
3,624 57 5041 62

S B0

~—VISIT OUR WEBSITE afiersaes v com sg (lor onling servios BoD0iniments| and vokpsagen com ag anc www skoda com sg [or aoditional services, produchs

and promotions) --—



9 Tuns Avenue
Singapore 639178

VOLKSWAGEN CENTRE SINGAPORE @ @
sy

Biz Rag Mo : 1991014842 Volkswagen SKODA

GST Mo M200985052

Page
Company Customer Details: Document no
Lonpac Insurance BHD Mr Document date
101 Thomson Road KRG Cuslomer no
#18-01 United Square YEW CHOON MARVIN Cuslomer 3STID
Singapore 307581 13 DOVER CLOSE EAST Cealer
#5210 Job order number
Singapore 130013 Job order date
Service Advisor
License plale  Model code First registration ViN Maocal
5%9999H 1622G5 12-08-2014 WYWZZZ1BZEMD2TATO  Jefia TS| Trend 80 D7F

12333800321
27-05-2019
5211043801

2019000243/ 1
17-04-2019
ME! KWAN KONG

47 982

All fund transior payments 810Ukl ba made Dayabls 1o Volkewagen Group Singapore Pre Lic, Bark Name. Deutsche Bank AG (Singapore Branch), Bank Account
252E214002. Swift Coder DEUTSGEG. Pleass Indicate Customer Number (eg 521X(XXXXX), Cuslomar Name and Imeice Mumbar in the payments

Usilil payment of all goods (narts, sccessorins sie. | has been made in Ll 1o and mosved by Yolkswagen Group Singapans (VGS), the gooos remaln in legal
possesson ol VS, irmespectve if they Nave siready been instalied into your vaficls, Howaver, the warranty o the goods [where applicabin] starts wilh he issuance of

thet [mwion of the collsclien of your car, whichmm© s sarfiar
Far warranty lerme gnd condiions pisase wisi out webaile wem volkswsgen com g

Thim w an authonees cocument. No signatune s recured



Invoice Page | of 2

GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE
GENERAL  RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE
IHWE 6 Raffles Quay #18-00, Singapora 048580
Phone +65 6224 0010 Fax +85 8224 D030
ASSOCLATION Operating Hours' Monday to Friday Sam 1o S5pm

RECORDS MANAGEMENT CanTRE GST Registration No: M400D17735

Third Party Insurer Enquiry

Dur Ral No: GR-18-051533

Date of Reguest: 02/04/2016 Your Ref No Online Purchase

Volkswagan Centre Singapore

247 Alexandra Road

Singapore 153934

Dear SirMadam,

Enqguiry Date (21042016

Enguiry By Charmaine Kong Mei Kwan

TP Vehicle No. GBFT425G

Accident Dale 02042018

Engquiry Result

TP Vehicle No. Insurer Penod of Inslrance Insurer Tal. No
GBF7425G Lonpac Insurance Bhd 28/02/2019-27102/2020 +i5 82507388
Thank You

The images provided to you are taken from the original reports forwarded io the cantre by the members of the General Insurance
Association of Singapore and we take no resporsibility for their accuracy or contents and shall be under no liability whatscaver for any
loss or damage ariaing out of or in connection with the reports ar their images

This is a compuler generated document and requires no signalure

https://singapore. merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRsas& fuseaction=dsp ge... 2/4/2019



Invoice Page 2 of 2

GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE
RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE

6 Raffles Quay #18-00, Singapore 048580
I"SME Phone: +65 6224 0010 Fax: +85 6224 0030
ASSOCLATION Operating Hours. Monday to Friday Sam to Spm
GEST Registration No: MaD0017735

RECCROS MANAGEMENT CENTRE

TAX INVOICE
Our Ref No: GR-15-051533
Date of Request:  D2/04/2019 Your Ref No: Online Purchase
Volkswagen Centre Singapore
247 Alexandra Road
Singapore 158834
Dear SirMadam,
Enguiry Date 02/0472018
Enquiry By Charmaine Kong Mel Kwan
TP Vehicie No. GBF7425G
Accident Date 02/04/2018
DESCRIPTION AMOUNT (5%)
TP Insurer Enguiry 1.87
GST Amount 0.13
Total Amount Due (GST Inclusive) 200
Thank Yaou,

This is a computer generated document and requires no signature

For GIARMC Official use:
Date:
[X] GIRG [] Cash [ ] Chegque

hitps://singapore. merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRsas& fuseaction=dsp ge... 2/4/2019



