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dealers
competed to
buy my car!

v Used Car Comparison

Sell u

Hig

Direciory Products

r Car for Mo Cash

est Price or Get $100 Free

Get Paid Mow, Handowver Later

Toyota Corolla &t 1,64

Toyeta Corolla Altis L.AA

Inswrance Articles

Login | Sign up

Farum

SELL YOUR CAR

Avancer
Cdaith

NO IMAGE AVAILABLE

NO IMAGE AV

Hack to starch mesut i
CAR DETAILS
Prica #17,000 $17.300
Inmialment §5.980 51,760
Rpgistration Date 17-Juin- 2009 i&-Nov- 2006
Manutsctured 2008 2005
Mileaga 1049 918 krm 147,803 km
Transmiasian Auito Autn
Engine Cap 1598 o L5
Road Tax 747 743 fyr
Power BO.0 LW (10T Bhp) BO.D kW | 10T bhg)
Curb Welght L1595 kg LASE kg
Features Fued EMiciant 1.6L 16 Valve DOHC VT
Engine, Smooth Auto Tranomisgion With
Ert, SRS Alrbags, ABS Digital Clinate
Contral Arton,
AlTEssnries Pramium Rims. Lesther Ssats, Touch Crigimal From Agami
Soreen Aucio System, Reverse Sensors,
Solar Film, Rettactabie Mirma With
Ingucators
Description New Wheekl/Suspersion/Alrcon/All Wear  Dinly Drive To Office And Home.
A Tear Al Have Boon Changesd Wan
Sarvicing Raconds To Prove. Good To
Ranww COE. Practical And Wery Fieel
EMciency kdeal For Dudy Drives. Fully
Doma Up Te Lost. Ca |n Superts
Excallent Condithon. Firm With My Proe,
Wiew To Boleee.
COE ¥9.68% 517,905
oMy $17,500 $17,853
ARF $172.500 $17,851
Depreciztion NA, $11.830 fo
o, of Owners F | L]
Type of Vehicke Sedan S
Category o
Availahllivy Avaitable Avatlable

SELLER INFORMATION

Saller

Direct Dwner

Direct Dwner



> Back to OneMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Cwner 1D Type: Company
Cramer ID 10456R
N T T e e e el
Vehicle No 5J58715PF
Vehicle to be Exported Yes
Intended Deregistration Date 08 Apr 2017
Vehicle Make TOYOTA
Yehicle Mode! COROLLAALTIS 1.6 AUTOD
Primary Colour Beige
Manufacturing Year 2009
Engine Mo ILZ4930402
Chassis No MROS3IZEE1061545654
Maximum Power Output B0.0 kW {107 bhg)
Open Market Value $17.853.00
Criginal Registration Date 14 Sep 2009
First Registration Date 14 Sep 2009
Transfer Count Fi
Actual ARF Paid £17.853.00
(il PARERFRATS O FRI e e P e o e S S
PARF Eligibllity: Yes
PARF Eligibllity Expiry Date: 13 5ep 2017
PARF Rebate Amount: $8,926.00
lnkended SO o i e e e e TRl
COE Expiry Date 1350 2019
COE Category A - Car [1600cc & balow)
COE Perlod(Years) 10
QP Paid $18.020.00
COE Rebate Amount; $775.00
Total Rebate Amount $9.701.00

The information contained herein s correct as at 08 Apr 2019

OK
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- Nivitha (LKK Auto)

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh®@lonpac.com>

Sent: Thursday, 4 April 2019 12226 PM

To: assignments@lkkauto.com

Cc: MT_Claim_5G; operations@9%9&motorsports.com

Subject: FW: PRI for SJS B915P; YOUR INSURED GBE 5726G [External Canfidential]
12-3p Pmﬂ-ﬂm

Lonpac External - Confidential =

Dear Nivitha,

ﬁ}\,ﬁi;an EH hp\

Kindly proceed as proposed by workshop.

Best Regards

Gerald Poh

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706

‘ - oy
Lo = The all E88%3 lonpac.com.sg
s Iy E -

(-

Lonpac External - Confidential data is for use by authorised external parties only.

From: operations@96motorsports.com [mailto:operations@%6motorsports.com]
Sent: Thursday, 4 April, 2019 12:25 PM

To: GERALD POH WEE BIN

Cc: MT_Claim_5G; claims@96motorsports.com

Subject: RE: PRI for 5)S 8915P; YOUR INSURED GBE 5726G [External Confidential]

Dear Sir,
As spoken, we would like Adrian Ling.

Thank you
Royce

© G mororseonrs
62/64 Kaki Bukit Avenue 6
Ark @ KB Singapore 417893

Tel - 6702 6996
Fax - B384 6996
Email laims gtorsports.com

Website: www.896motorsports com

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com>
Sent: Thursday, 4 April, 2019 12:20 PM



~T0: operations@96motorsports.com
" Ce: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com>
. Subject: RE: PR| for 5J5 B915P; YOUR INSURED GBE 57266 [External Confidential]

Lonpac External - Confidential
WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Our Ref :19/19/19/VC05/021625
Dear Royce,

We intend to conduct a pre-repair survey of your client’s vehicle and
attached the list of motor surveyors from LKK Auto Consultants Pte
Ltd for your attention

Please revert.

Best Regards

Gerald Poh

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706

| LY -

. =i
1“' _ The all (8% lonpac.com.sg

Lonpac External - Confidential data is for use by authorised external parties only.

From: gperations@96motorsparts.com [mallto;operations@96motorsports.com]
Sent: Thursday, 4 April, 2019 11:00 AM

To: MT_Claim_SG

Cc: 'andysonckl'; 'Gary Chang'; gperations@aemaotorsports.com

Subject: PRI for 5)S B915P; YOUR INSURED GBE 5726G

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear Lonpac,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING 5J5 8915P and GBE 5726G on 03.04.2019
AT / ALONG BLOCK 21 KALLANG AVENUE

We act for MS Carz Leasing Pte Ltd, whose vehicle registration number SIS 8915P was damaged in the above accident.

Kindly let us have your list of surveyors within 2 working days of your receipt of this notice should you like 1o conduct a pre-
repair survey of the vehicle

If we do not receive any reply from you within the stipulated timeline, our client shall proceed to repair the vehicle
without further reference to you.

Thank you.
Royce



@ © mororsrorTs
62/64 Kaki Bukit Avenue 6
Ark @ KB Singapore 417893
Tel : 6702 6996
Fax : 6384 6396
Email : Claims(@%96motorsporis.com
Website: www.96motorsports com




Shu Pei (LKKAuto)

e ——————— ———
From: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoch@lonpaccom>
Sent: Wednesday, 10 April 2019 2:33 AM
To: Shu Per (LEKAUtD)
Cc MT_Claim_5G
Subject: RE: PRI for SIS B915P, YOUR INSURED GBE 5726G [External Caonfidential]
Attachments: 10042019093033 pdf

onpac External - Confidential
QOur Ref : 19/19/19/VC05/021625

Dear Shu Pei,

Attached copy of insured's GIA report for your attention.

Best Regards

Gerald Poh

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd
300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706

The all 8% lonpac.com.sg

Lonpac External - Confidential dala is for use by authorised extemnal parties only

From: Shu Pel (LKKAuto) [mailto:shupei@ikkauto.com ]

Sent: Wednesday, 10 April, 2019 9:22 AM

To: GERALD POH WEE BIN

Cc: MT_Claim_5SG; Admin A; Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: PRI for SJS B915F; YOUR INSURED GBE 5726G [External Confidential]
WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Sir f Madam,

We refer to the above matter,

We have Inspected TP vehicle S]S B915P at M /s 96 Motorsports Pte Ltd on a WP basis and TP repalrer proposed
for a direct settlement.

Meanwhile, kindly let us have a copy of your insured's GIA report for our necessary action,

Enclosed for your perusal is:
TH's GLA report



Please be informed that estimated cost of repair and preliminary advice is not ready yet.
Our case handler in-charge is Asher and she can be contacted at DID: 6841 6051.
Thank you,

Best Regaras,

Shu Pei| Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Fhone: 6366-0055 | wmad: shuppesiskayin com | few 6741-4108
Bik 51, Paya Ubl industral Bark, Ube Avenue |, #02-25 | $[408933)

From: Admin-D [LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 4 April 2019 12:40 PM

To: 'GERALD POH WEE BIN' <geraldpoh@lonpac.com>; assignments <assignments@|kkauto.com>
Cc: 'MT_Claim_5G' «<mt_claim@lonpac.com>; Admin A <admin-a@|kkauto com>

Subject: RE: PRI for 5JS 8915P; YOUR INSURED GBE 57266 [External Confidential]

Dear Gerald,
Thank you for the assignment

Please be informed that vehicle 15 not in the workshop, repairer arrange on 05/04/2019

s Heganls,

G.Nivitha) Admin

LEK Auto Consultants e Lid

hone: oBp-1072 | emall: aesiomensss lkouiocom | fax; b2s0-4915
B 50, Pava Ubl ndusteial Park, UbL Avenie 1, #o2-25 | SI4084541)

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN [mailto geraldpohibllonpar com)

Sent: Thursday, 4 April 2019 12:26 PM

To: assignments@Ikkauto com

Cc: MT_Claim_5G <mt_claim@lonpac.com>; gperationsH96motorsports com
Subject: Fw: PRI for SIS 8915P; YOUR INSURED GBE 5726G [External Confidential]

Lonpac Exlernal - Confidential
Dear Nivitha,

Kindly proceed as proposed by workshop.



Best Regards
Gerald Poh
Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd
300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706
= i

The all 888D lonpac.com.sg

Lonpac External - Confidential dala is for use by authorised extermal parties only

From: gporations9bmotorspoits.com [mallto:operatians i l_.i[.:|'.-:_.I_=:|'_i'.__n'1:::_'_|;.]
Sent: Thursday, 4 Apnl, 2019 12:25 PM

To: GERALD POH WEE BIN

Cc: MT_Claim_5SG; daims @9 motorsports.com

Subject: RE: PRI for S1S 8015F; YOUR INSURED GBE 5726G [External Confidential]
Dear Sir,
As spoken, we would like Adrian Ling

Thank you

Hoyce

) © mororsrorTs
6264 Kaki Bukil Avenue 6

Ark (@ KB Singapore 417893

Tel B702 6986

Fax 5384 6996

Email Claims{@9Gmolorsporis.com

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN <goraidpon@ion 1>

Sent: Thursday, 4 April, 2019 12:20 PM

To: operations @S6motorspor s com

Ce: MT_Claim_SG «<mt claim@lonpac.com>

Subject: RE: PRI for 5JS 8915P; YOUR INSURED GBE 5726G [External Confidential]

ic External - Confidential
WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Our Ref 119/19/19/VC05/021625
Dear Royce,

We intend to conduct a pre-repair survey of your client’'s vehicle and
k|



attached the list of motor surveyors from LKK Auto Consultants Pte
Ltd for your attention

Please revert.

Best Regards

Gerald Poh

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd
300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
Tel: [65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706

“' F The all {882 lonpac.com.sg

=

Lonpac External - Confidential data is for use by authorised exlernal parties only

From: operationsE 9bmotarsporns.coim [I|1-_=;Il_-.. Ao Sa MOotorsport i)
Sent: Thursday, 4 April, 2019 11:00 AM

To: MT_Claim_5G

Ccx "andysonckl’; 'Gary Chang'; cperabions @ 96moiorsports.com

Subject: PRI for SJS B915P; YOUR INSURED GBE 572866

WITHOUT PREIUDICE
Dear Lonpac,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING 515 8915P and GBE 5726G on 03.04.2019
AT / ALONG BLOCK 21 KALLANG AVENUE

We act for MS Carz Leasing Pte Ltd, whose vehicle registration number 515 8915P was damaged in the above accident

Kindly et us hava your list of surveyars within 2 working days of your receipt of this notice should you like 1o condudt 8 pre-repair
survey al the vahicle

If we do not receive any reply from you within the stipulated timeline, our cllent shall proceed to repair the vehicle without
further reference to you

Thank you
Royce

9 6 MOTORSPORTS

62/64 Kaki Bukil Avenue &
Ark @ KB Singapore 417893

Tel 6702 6996
Fax 6384 6996
Emaill . Claims@S6molorspatis.com

Website: www SEmatarsports.can




This email has been checked for viruses by AVG untivirus soltwuire.
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Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

From: Asher Sng (LKKAUto)
Sent: Monday, 15 April 2019 2:55 PM
To: operations@96motorsports.com
Cc claims@96motorsports.com
Subject: RE: PRI for SIS B915P; YOUR INSURED GBE 57266 [External Confidential]
WITHOUT PREIUDICE"
SAVEAS TO COSTS
Hi Sir/Mdm,

We refer to the above matter.

Please be informed that basing on the accident statements submitted by both parties, the liability is clear / under BOLA
{subject to BOLA guideline settlement) and shall proceed with direct settlement for the above mentioned case.

Please note that this e-mail is on without prejudice basis which does not amount to an authorisation of repair to your
client’s vehicle.

The final repair cost Is subjected to the consistency of the damages according to the nature of the accident. And the
days of LOU/ LOR will base on the number of days of repair as recommended by our surveyor.

Kindly take note that the case handler in-charge is Asher and she can be contacted at her DID 6841 6051

In order to expedite the claim process, please forward all relevant documents to us (LKK) to proceed on negatiate
settlement.

Thank You.

Bast Regards

Aaher 3ng | Cale Handier

LEK Auto Consultants Ple Lid

phons: §841-405!1 | small gshersng@lkkguio.oom | fooe 4741-4108
Blk 57, Poyo Uti Incusinol Park, Ut Avenue 1, #0225 | 5[408%33)

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN [mailto geraldpoh@lonpac.com]
Sent: Thursday, 4 April 2019 12:26 PM
To: assignmentsi@lkkauto.cam

Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt claim@lonpac.com>; operations@%96maotorsports com
Subject: FW: PRI for 5J5 8915P; YOUR INSURED GBE 57266 [External Confidential]

Lonpac External - Confidential
Dear Nivitha,

Kindly proceed as proposed by workshop.




Best Regards

Gerald Poh

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
Tel_:_{_ESJ 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706

LA E The all {¥% ) lonpac.com.sg

—

Lonpac Exlernal - Confidential data is for use by authorised external partias only.

From: operations@96motorsports.com [mallto:operations@96motorsports.com]
Sent: Thursday, 4 April, 2019 12:25 PM

To: GERALD POH WEE BIN

Ce: MT_Claim_SG;

Subject: RE: PRI for 515 8915P; YOUR INSURED GBE 5726G [External Confidential]

Dear Sir,
As spoken, we would like Adrian Ling.

Thank you
Royce

, 6 MOTORSPORTS
62/64 Kaki Bukit Avenue 6
Ark @ KB Singapore 417893

Tel : G702 69596
Fax G384 6996
Email laim moltorsporls.com

Website: www.98motorsparis.com

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com>

Sent: Thursday, 4 April, 2019 12:20 PM

To: operations@96motorsports.cam

Ce: MT_Claim_5SG =mt claim@lonpac.com>

Subject: RE: PRI for 55 B915P; YOUR INSURED GBE 5726G [External Confidential]

Lonpac External - Confidential
WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Our Ref :19/19/19/VC05/021625

Dear Royce,



We intend to conduct a pre-repair survey of your client’s vehicle and
attached the list of motor surveyors from LKK Auto Consultants Pte
Ltd for your attention

Please revert,

Best Regards

Gerald Poh

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
TeE_LES} 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706

The all {% 2 lonpac.com.sg

Lonpac External - Confidential dala is for use by authorised external parties only.

From: cperations@96motarsports.com [mailto:operations@96motorsports.com]
Sent: Thursday, 4 April, 2019 11:00 AM

To: MT_Claim_SG

Ce: 'andysonckl’; ‘Gary Chang'; operations@96motorsports.com

Subject: PRI for 515 B915P; YOUR INSURED GBE 5726G

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear Lonpac,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SIS 8915P and GBE 5726G on 03.04.2019
AT / ALONG BLOCK 21 KALLANG AVENUE

We act for MS Carz Leasing Pte Ltd, whose vehicle registration number 515 8915P was damaged In the above accident

Kindly let us have your list ol surveyors within 2 working days of your receipt of this notice should you like 1o conduct a pre-repair
survay ol tho vehiclo.

If we do not receive any reply from you within the stipulated timeline, our client shall proceed to repair the vehicle without
further reference to you.

Thank you
Royce

, 6 MOTORSPORTS
62/64 Kaki Bukit Avenue &

Ark @ KB Singapore 417893

Tel : 6702 6996

Fax : 6384 6996

Email :Claims@396motorsporls.com
Website: www.98motorsporis.com
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i{hanchna (LKK Auto)

From: claims@9&motorsports.com

Sent: Thursday, 12 March 2020 12:36 PM

To: Khanchna [LKK Auto)

Cc Admin A

Subject: RE: Direct Settlement; LOD for 5J5 8915P; YOUR INSURED GBE 5726G [External
Confidential]

Attachments: B915 dv.pdf

Without prejudice
Dear Khanchna,

Kindly find DV attached.
***Please note that there is a difference in address for the company chop on LOA and DV due to the shifting of
my client’s company.

Will mail out the original copy today to vour good office

Thank you,
Jade

From: Khanchna (LKK Auto) <khanchna/@lkkauto.com=

Sent: Wednesday. 4 December. 2019 2:03 PM

To: claims@%6motorsports.com

Ce: Admin A <admin-a‘@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Direct Settlement: LOD for SIS 8915P; YOUR INSURED GBE 57260 [External Confidential]

Without Prejudice

Dear Sir/Madam.

We refer to the above matter.

Thank you for the acceptance.

we attoch herewith a copy of the DV for your further action.

Kindly send us (LKK) all the documents below for our necessary action: -

. Original LOD
. Original Final Repair Tax Invoice. rental agreement
. Original Letter of Authorisation & hardcopy of the DV

Thank you.



"kindly note that this negatiation between parties on this matter iy purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resalving
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from
this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/inMuence on the ssues of
liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation termy/sertlement,

Best Regards,

Khanchnal Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

DID: 6841 2360| email: Khanchna a lkkauto.com Fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya L/bi Industrial Park. Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: claims @ 96motorsports.com <claims @ Y6motorsports.com=>
Sent: Wednesday, 4 December 2019 1:48 PM
To: Khanchna (LKK Auto) <khanchna e lkkauo.com>

Subject: RE: Direct Settlement: LOD for SJS 8915P: YOUR INSURED GBE 5726G [External Confidential |
Dear Khanchna,

We accept.
Please let us have your DV

Thank you,
Jade

From: Khanchna (LKK Auto) <khanchna a lkkauto com>

Sent: Wednesday, 4 December, 2019 1:36 PM

To: cluims@ 9o motorsports.com

Ce: vincent.lee/a 96motorsports.com; Andyson <andysoncklia yahoo.com>; Gary 96
<gary.chang@96motorsports.com>; Admin A <admin-aalkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Direct Settlement; LOD for SJS 8915P; YOUR INSURED GBE 5726G | External Confidential

Without Frejudice
(save as to costs)

Dear Sirs/Mdm,
We reler 1o 1he above matier.

We propose settlement as follows: -

1. Cost of Repair [w/G5T) $1.230.50
2. Loss of Rental {1 days x $100} $ 100.00
3. LTA Search fee + GIA $ 2145

TOTAL | §1.351.95

Please confirm acceptance.



“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is porely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of linbility, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from
this negotiation of terma/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/inMuence on the issues of
linbility/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,

Khanchna| Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

DID: 6841 2360| email: Khanchna@lkkauto.com |Fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)



' V ” LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Al 4B 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Payn Ubi Indusinial Perk, Singapore 408833
- TEL: G256 3561 FAX 8256 4315

Reg. No: 185607108R GST Reg. No, 19-8607188-R

|_ 1 i ta - L

LONPAC INSURANCE BHD Rel : CCA4/ILPC19005972/Aka3n2

300 BEACH ROAD Y

#17-04/07 THE CONCOURSESINGAPORE 189555 O 1003200 I.IlIIIIIIIIII

Policy No. Z18VC05001654 Coverage (§) 0.00

Make & Model TOYOTAALTIS c.e 1598

Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2009
Chassis No. MRO5S3ZEE 106154604 Caolour GOLD
Odomatar 282284 Stearing IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification SPORTS RIM

R/H Front Tyre |195/5 R15 FALKEN B mm
L/H Front Tyre |195/65 R15 FALKEN 6 mm
R/H Rear Tyre |195/65 R15 FALKEN 8 mm
L/H Rear Tyre |195/85 R15 FALKEN & mm

THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE N/S BODY.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.

D3/04ar2018

Survey held at 96 MOTORSPORTS PTE LTD

52/54 KAKI BUKIT AVENUE &
SINGAPORE 417893
ARK @ KB

"[A)THE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON AWITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIR




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Pays Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408833
TEL B258 3581 FAX: G258 4315
Reg. Na 199607198R GST Reg. No. 18-0607108-R

ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. 5JS 8915P

B

B N e e (e W S T Tl <

Report Ref No. CC4/LPC19005972/Aka3n2

REAR BUMPER DEFORMED 650.80 486 B0
REAR BUMPER SIDE RETAINER L+R NS NECESSARY 77.50 35.00
REAR BUMPER CLIP NECESSARY 50.00 50.00
REAR BUMPER REFLECTOR LH NOT NECESSARY 48,60 .
REAR BUMPER REINFORCEMENT WITH SPONGE NOT NECESSARY 19820 -
REAR FENDER BUMPER BRACKET LH NOT NECESSARY 8852 §
REAR FENDER COWLING LH NOT NECESSARY 07 27 .
REAR FENDER CLIP LH NOT NECESSARY 550 -
REAR WINDSCREEN GLASS MOULDING (NPA) NOT NECESSARY . :
TAIL LAMP LH CRACKED 485 B0 342.00
TAIL LAMP INNER SEAL LH NECESSARY 37.60 20.00
TAIL LAMP CLIP LH NECESSARY 18.92 10.00
REAR ABSORBER LH NOT NECESSARY 199,91 -
REAR WHEEL BEARING LH NOT NECESSARY 685,80 -
REAR WHEEL HUB LH (NPA) NOT NECESSARY . .
REAR WHEEL AXLE NOT NECESSARY 2,533.12 &
LESS 25% DISCOUNT - -235.85
5,186 54 707.85
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
REAR W/S GLAS MOULDING SEALANT (SN) NOT NECESSARY 120,00 :
RIM LH (SN) NOT NECESSARY 600.00 .
REAR TYRE LH (SN) NOT NECESSARY 300.00 .
REVERSE SENSOR (SN) NOT NECESSARY 25000 -
1,270.00 .
LABOUR
TO R&R ACCIDENT AFFECTED AREA. 1,000.00 300.00
TO RESPRAY ACCIDENT AFFECTED AREA. 800.00 400.00
TO RUST PROOF ACCIDENT AFFECTED AREA, NOT NECESSARY 60.00 I
TO R&R REAR BOOT MECHANISM . NOT NECESSARY 120.00 .
TO R&R REVERSE SENSOR 60.00 50.00




_’ 7L LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

m,#_. 61 Uty Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Singapore 408833
TEL: 8256 3581 FAX: 62506 4315

Reg. No: 109607198R GST Reg, No, 19-9607158-R Page No.2 of 2

TO R&R WIC SYSTEM. NOT NECESSARY 200.00 -
TO RA&R REAR LUGGAGE COMPARTMENT. NOT NECESSARY 120.00 -
TO CHECK WATER SEEPAGE . NOT NECESSARY 60.00 -
TO R&R WHEEL ALIGNMENT. NOT NECESSARY B0.00 -

2,300.00 750.00
GRAND TOTAL B,756.54 1,457.85

KR

ADRIAN LING WAI PING

B.Eng AMSOE.AMIRTE.AMSAE-A M MATAI
Licensed Appraiser

DESCLAMER OF LIABILITY 70 THIRD FARTIES - This Repart s mads sslaly lor the uss wsd bt of the Cliant namsd on the bront page of ths Reparn.




