
To : M/s EQ INSURANCE COMPANY LTD Date: 14/09/2021

Your Ref. No. : DMCPHQ18-006084

Our Ref. No. : CC4/EQI19005966/T1pa3q2

: $ 2,059.75         

: $ 375.00            5 days

Rental (If any)      : $ days 

: $ 2.00                

: $

2,436.75         

: $ 2,700.00         

:

 

1)                   : $ 2,700.00                                

                  : $

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

50%

WTS ENGINEERING PTE LTD

Others:

Final Settlement Sum 

Liability

Vehicle No.

2/4/2019

GBA 1201B

XD 7925E

Date of Accident

   (TP Veh)

THIRD PARTY DIRECT SETTLEMENT

Payment Instruction: Payee's Breakdown

Remarks 

Loss of Use

Final Repair Cost

(Insd Veh)

JOANNE LEE

GLOBAL SUM















1

Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: Kenji Lee Tong Ren <kenjilee@woodlandstransport.com.sg>
Sent: Thursday, 9 September 2021 9:04 AM
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)
Cc: Goo Lee Ping; Admin A
Subject: RE: LOD  VS GBA1201B DOA 02/04/19 //LKK REF: CC4/EQI19005966/T1pb3

Dear Hsiao Tong, 
 

Account Name   WTS Engineering Pte Ltd 
Account Number   3633003481 
Bank Name   United Overseas Bank Limited 
Bank & Branch Code   035 

 
 
Thank you. 
 
 
Thanks and Regards, 
 

Kenji Lee   

  
Claims Department 
 

 
Woodlands Transport Service Pte Ltd 
8, Gul Circle, Singapore 629564 
Main Line   : +65 6559 8988         Fax   : +65 6898 2394 
Direct Line : +65 6559 8954   
www.woodlandstransport.com.sg   

 

Group of Companies:               

Facebook Platforms:            

Bus Charter:                

 
 

 
 

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Thursday, 9 September 2021 8:42 AM 
To: Kenji Lee Tong Ren <kenjilee@woodlandstransport.com.sg> 


