Vic (LKKAuto)

From: Shu Pei (LKKAuto)
Sent: Thursday, 1 August, 2019 9:50 AM
To: gina_tatheng@yahoo.com.sg
Cc: Admin A; Vic (LKKAuto)
Subject: FW: GBH2531E
Attachments: gbh2531-Inv.pdf
Dear Sir / Madam,

Thank you for your email.

Our respective case handler will look into the matter and revert to you in due course.

Please note that: -

LKK ref Officer in charge
CC4/LPC19005931/Ehb3 Vic

To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned

Best Regards,

Shu Pei| Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366-0055 | email: shupei@I|kkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: georgina mei kuan <gina_tatheng@yahoo.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 31 July 2019 3:30 PM

To: Joy Irene (LKKAuto) <Joylrene@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>
Subject: GBH2531E

Dear Claims Dept

Attached for your kind attention.
Please kindly DV for settlement.
Thank you.

Your Sincerely,

Georgina Soong

Tat Heng Motor Works

10 Ang Mo Kio Industrial Park 2A

#02-09 AMK Autopoint, Singapore 568047
t: 6483 7103

m: 9113 5112






