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MS‘ FirstCapital ?Hﬁﬁwm (N s TRROULL0E mhum.m
Tel (651 67¢2 2311 Fax (65) 5222 3547
mﬁs}%mnwﬂmm' [PIeSEL GO N
MOTOR SURVEY ASSIGNMENT
Date 02-04-2018 Our Ref No. D12002235MFSH
Accident Date 20-03-2018 Claim Type. Third Party
Insured Vehicle SHegTIY Third Party Vehicle. SJE8328B

Survey Location
Contact Person.
Contact No.

Survey Typa

Appointed
Surveyor
Contact Person

Contact Number,

303 ALEXANDRA ROAD SIME DARBY PERFORMANCE CENTRE
CAROLINE

63180174/ 0 Fax No. 64784801

WITHOUT PREJUDICE: LIABILITY UNCLEAR (TP SAS STATED QD CLAIM 7 /
EST. COR $6,746.02)

LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD

NA, Fax No, 68418315
NA

FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT

Please submit to us the Tax Invoice together with letter of claim for Rental OR Loss of use (based on

NIMA Benchmark rates) together with your survey report,

THIRD PARTY SURVEY REQUEST

Cc : Workshop

Cec: TP Solicitor

Officer Incharge

PERFORMANCE

MOTORS LIMITED ABerdion. NI
NA TP Solicitor Fax No. NA
SERENE

IMPORTANT NOTE

Kirdly submit the survey report via CWS within 14 days for survey asslgnment and 7 days for re-inspection

This is & cornputer generaled letlar, no signiture required
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Nivitha SLKI( Autﬂ!

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 30 April 2019 4:26 PM

To: 'Serene Ler’; assignments; 'CWS Motar Claims'

Cc: SUR

Subject: RE: TP revert to OD claim - SURVEYOR APPOINTED; QUR REF: D19002235MFSH :

YOUR REF: SJEBS2EB

Dear Serene,
Please be informed that no survey was done for SIE 89288,

We will close this file at our end without billing.

Best Regards,

G.Nivitha| Admin
LEK Auto Consultants Pre l.l_d

Mhone: 6841-1972 | email: assignmentasklautocom | fax: 6256-4915
8lk 51, Payn Ubi Industrisl Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408934)

from: Serene Ler [mailto:Sereneler@msfirstcapital.com.sgl

Sent: Monday, 29 April 2019 4:46 PM

To: LKK Auto Appraisers {assignments@lkkauto.com) <assignments@ikkauto.com>; CWS Maotor Claims
<cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Subject: RE: TP revert to OD claim - SURVEYOR APPOINTED; OUR REF : D19002235SMFSH ; YOUR REF: SIEB9288

Dear Veron,
Kindly note TP revert fo OD claim and we are in receipt of the BOLA Recovery.

Please check and revert. If there is no PRI conducted, then you may proceed to cancel the assignment and close file at
your end.

\We await your soan reply.

Regards,
Serene Ler
Motor Claims

MS First Capital Insurance Limited

A Member of EESEN Insurance Group

16 Robinscn Road, Glrty Huuaa #15-*&1 i&ngﬂm 0B8B7T | Tel: 6507 3848 | Fax: 6507 3848 |Reg. No, 195000106C
Motor Claims: maof com.sq | Website: www msfitsteapital com sg




*With effect from 15 January 2018, we will be known as MS First Capital Insurance Limited. Our new website
will be www.msfirsteapital.com.sg.

Personal Dats Protection Act 2012 ("PDFA"):
Under the POPA, there are various requirements that regulate tha processing of youir personal dats.
Please refer to www.first-insurance.com,sg for detalls of POPA Personal Data Collection Statement.

Confidentiality Notics: This e=mail is confidential. It may also be ledally privileged.
If you are not the addreszee or to whom It Is intended, you may not copy, forward, disclose or use any part of it.

If you have received this meéssage In efror, please delets the message and all copies from your system and notify the sender
immediately by return e mail;

From: CWS Motor Claims
Sent: Wednesday, April 3, 2019 9:47 AM

To: PNMIL-PBSPESIMEDARBY.COM.SG

Ce: CWS Motor Claims <cwsmotorclaims@mslirstcapital.com.se>; Serene Ler <Sereneler@msfirstcapital.com. sg>
Subject: SURVEYOR APPOINTED; OUR REF : D19002235MFSH : YOUR REF: SIEB928B

Dear Sir/Madam

PRI Request For SIEB928B Accident Involving SH6979U On 20-03-2019 AT 22:50:00HRS.
Please find below details for your reference

» Claim number : D19002235MFSH

+ Insured vehicle number : SH6979U

Accident date : 20-03-2019

Third-party vehicle number : SJES928B

Assignment type : WITHOUT PREJUDICE: LIABILITY UNCLEAR
Surveyor : LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD
Officer-in-Charge : SERENE

- L ] L] L ] -

PS: This is a system generated mail. Please do not reply to this mail.

Regards,

Admin Team

Claim Workflow System

Motor Clamims Department

MS First Capital Insurance Limited
Tel : 6507 3848

Fax ; 6507 3849

. AVG This email has been checked for viruses by AVG antivirus software.
WWW.aVE.com



