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Celine ang sLKKAutu!

From: Celine Fong (LKKAuUtD)

Sent: Tuesday, 8 Octaber 20189 634 PM

To: Chong Boon Sen

Cc: assignments

Subject: RE: 3rd party direct settlement SDX2010) & your jnsured SKU9504M/DOA27/03/2019/Est §

Dear Boon Sen,

Please be informed that we are unable to conduct the inspection for SDX 2010) after some attempts to inform the
werkshop to present the vehicle.

This case has been pending for a long time due to the unavailability of the owner, therefore we decided to temporarily
close this case.

Kirdly advise us if there is any arrangement made and will be glad to re-open the case accordingly:

Brst Regards,

Celine Fong

LXK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

phione: 6256-3561 | email: celingfongd kkauto. com | fax: Bast-4315
BIk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | ${308033)

From: Chong Boon Sen <boonsen.chong@sg.cntaiping.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 2 April 2019 5:20 PM

To: Ng 5in Hai <shng@kahmotor.onmicrosoft.com>

Cc assignments <assignments@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: RE: 3rd party direct settlement SDX2010) & your insured SKUSS04M/DOA:27/03/2019/E5t 5

Without Frejudice

Ple provide search on pelicy number for our next course of action.
We will then check at our end before advising.

This could be motar trade policy.

Chong Boon Sen
Claims Executive
Department

Ckina Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.
3 Ansan Road #18-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079809
DID: (65) B3BS8171 | M: (B5) XXXX XXXX | F:(65) 6222 1033

W: www sacntaiping.com | FB: www.facebook com/chinataipingsg/ | WeChat: A5 %5 Taiping SG 3 Anson Road
#15-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 0178908
DID: (B5) B3BEB1TT | M (BE)XMAX XXXX | F:(85) 8222 1033



Mivitha (LKK Auto)

Srom: Chong Boon Sen <boonsen.chong@sg.cntaiping com>
Sent: Tuesday, 2 April 2019 5:08 PM

To: Ng Sin Hai

Ca: assignments

Subject: RE: 3rd party direct settlement SDX2010J & your insured

SKU9504M/DOA:27/03/2019/Est $

Without Prejudice
Dear Sir,

We pri:

Dear LKK,

Pls pri.

Chong Boon Sen
C alms Executive
D=partment

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Lid.
3 Anson Road #16-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079808
DID: (65) 83896171 | M- (B5) XXXX XXXX | F: (65)6222 1033

W:www.sgentaiping.com | FB: www facebook com/chinataipingsa/ | WeChat: AT Taiping SG 3 Anson
Road #18-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079809
DID: (65) 63886171 | M: [65) XXXX XXXX | Fl{65)8222 1033

From: Ng 5in Hai [mailto:shng@kahmotor.onmicrosoft.com)

Sent: Tuesday, 2 April, 2019 5:07 PM

Te: Chong Boon Sen <boonsen.chong@sg.cntaiping.com>

Subject: RE: 3rd party direct settlement SDX2010J & your Insured SKUS504M/DOA:27/03/2019/E5t 5

Dear Boon Sen,

Ariy of your surveyor is fine for me,

Trank you and have a nice day,©
Warmest Regards,

Ng Sin Hai

Kah Motor Co. Sdn. Bhd

(A fiember of Orientol Holdings 8erhad)
Body Repair & Paint Centre

255 Alexandra Road

Singapore 159937

DID: 6471 5419

HF: 9072 1769



E-mail: shng@honda.com.sg
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5;“_‘ Please consider the environment before printing this email

CONFIDENTIAL NOTE: The Information comuined in thie c-mail is intended anky for the wde of the indlvidug) or entity named above md
iLay contaln information thut is privileged, confidential and exempt from disclasure urider applivable low. 1 the réader aof this mesauige [ not the
Irtentled reciplent, vou are hereby wotifiod thit any dissemination, distribution or copying of this communication is strictly prohibited. If v
hive received this messuge in ervor, please immedimely notify the sender and delele the mail, Thank you for vour collaboction,

From: Chong Boon Sen <boonsen.chong@sg.cntaiping.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 2 April, 2019 5:05 PM

To: Ng Sin Hal <shng@kahmotor onmicrosoft.com>

Subject: RE: 3rd party direct settlement SDX2010) & your insured SKU9S04M/DOA:27/03/2019/E5t §

Without Prejudice
Dear Sir,
We intend to conduct a pre-repair survey of the damage to your client's vehicle jointly with your

client/your motor workshop. We propose to use one of the following motor surveyors to conduct the joint
pre-repair survey as a single joint expert.

ADRIAN LING
Kelvin Ang
SEE CHEW SENG
MOHD FADHILAH BIN
(OSMAN
XING QUO QIANG
KENNETH KONG
SIMON HO
CHUA WELIE
MARCUS CHUA
HENRY NG

Plzase let us know within two(2) working days whether you agree to the appointment of any of these
mator surveyors as a single joint expert.

Ytu may select one of the listed motor surveyors and we will bear the cost of the pre-repair survey carried
out by the single joint expert.

Chong Boon Sen
Claims Executive
Departmeant

Ckina Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.
3 Anson Road #16-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079809
DI (65) 6386171 | M (65) XXXX XXXX | F: (55)6222 1033

W: www sg entaipingcom | FB: www faceboak comichinataipingsg/ | WeChat: X ¥ Taiping SG 3 Anson
Road #16-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079809
DID: (B5) B3B96171 | M (B5) XXXX XXXX | F (65) 62221033




From: Ng Sin Hal [mailto:shng@kahmoator.onmicrosaft com
Sent: Tuesday, 2 April, 2019 4:27 PM

To: Chong Boon Sen <boonsen.chong@sg.cntaiping com>

Subject: RE: 3rd party direct settlement SDX2010) & your insured SKUBSMMfDﬂﬂ:Z-?fm{ZﬂJQ!Eﬂ b
Eear Boon Sen,

This is the third party search.

Thank you and have a nice day, @

Warmest Regards,

Ng Sin Hai

Kish Motor Co. Sdn. Bhd

(A member of Orlental Holdings Berhad)
Body Repair & Paint Centre

255 Alexandra Road

Singapore 159937

DID: 6471 5419

HP: 8072 1769

E-mail: shng@honda.com.sg
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% Please consider the environment before printing this email
CONFIDENTIAL NOTE: The Informution contiined in thé emiil is ititended anly for the use of the individunl ar entity named above and
s contadn ibfrmation thut is privileeed, confidentinl and exempt feom diselosiore undler applicible low. I the reader of this essage ks not the

intenidid tecipient. vou nre hereby potified that my divsemination, distribution or copying of this communication & serictly prohibited. If vou
have received this miessase in ermor, please immediately notity the sender and delete the mail. Thank vou for vour collaboration,

From: Chong Boon Sen <boonsen.chone@sg.cntaiping.com>
Sent: Tuesday, 2 April, 2019 4:23 PM

To: Ng Sin Hal <shng@kahmotor.onmicrosoft.com>

Subject: RE: 3rd party direct settlement SDX2010) & your insured SKUSS04M/DOA:27/03/2019/Est $
Without Prejudice

Dear Sir,

The car SKU9504M does nat seem to be insured us.

Any documents to show they are insured or covered under (s?

Chong Boon Sen
Claims Executive
Derartment

China Taiping Insurance {Singapore) Pte. Ltd.
3 Anson Road #16-00 Springleal Towesr Singapore 079909
DID: (65) 63896171 | M: (B5) XXXK XXXX | F (65) 6222 1033
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W: www sg entaiping com | FB: www. facebook com/chinatalpingsg/ | WeChat: A F¥4E Taiping SG 3 Anson
Foad #16-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079900
CUD: (65) 63896171 | M (B5) XXXXXAXX | F (66) 6222 1633

From: Ng Sin Hai [mailto:shng@kahmotor onmicrosoft com]

Sent: Tuesday, 2 April 2019 3:54 PM
Ta: Ciaims Dept of CTi <claimsdept @sg.cntaiping.com> _
Subject: RE: 3rd party direct settlement SDX2010) & your insured SKUS504M/DOA:27/03/2019/Est $

Paar All,

Please refer to the attached pdf, we are assisting our insured vehicle SDX20101 to file a 3rd party claim against your
insured vehicle SKU9504M and ta request for direct settlement.

Kindly assist and expedite to chick the claim liability saonest.

Thank you and have a nice day,®

Warmest Regards,

Ng Sin Hai

Kah Motor Co. Sdn. Bhd

(A member of Oriental Holdings Berhad)
Body Repair & Paint Centre

255 Alexandra Road

Singapore 159937

DID: 6471 5419

HP: 9072 1769

E-mail: shng@honda.com.sg
3
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CONFIDENTIAL NOTE: The Infirmition contoined i the e-mail is itended only for the use of the individusl or entity named above and
may contain mformation that is privileged, confidentinl and exempt from discloayre under applicable kne If the reader of this message is nol the
it wledd reciplent, you are herehy notified that any disseminarion., diswibution or copying of this communieption is strictly peahibited. If sou
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This email has been scanned by the Symantec Email Security.cloud service.

For more information please visit http://www. svmanteccloud.com

This email has been scanned by the Symantec Email Security.cloud service,
For more information please visit hutp:/www symanteceloud,.con




This email has been scanned by the Symantec Email Security.cloud service.
For more information please visit hitp://www symanteccloud.com




