
















1

Jia Le (LKK Auto)

From: Jia Le (LKK Auto)
Sent: Friday, 25 September 2020 1:56 PM
To: 'may@hengguan.com.sg'; 'Heng Guan'
Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING YP 201G AND SHB 8487X ON 31/03/2019

Our Ref:  CC3/CTI19005883/K1ds3 
 
HENG GUAN POULTRY INDUSTRIES PTE LTD 
 
Dear Sir/Madam, 
 
ACCIDENT INVOLVING YP 201G AND SHB 8487X ON 31/03/2019 
 
We refer to the above accident where we are acting for China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte Ltd to resolve the 
claim against you and/or your authorized driver under the Auto Insurance policy taken up with them. 
                 
Based on the accident report and accident scenario, liability is down against us. We will therefore proceed to negotiate 
for an amicable settlement with the Third Party. 
 
Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and settlement, please contact us 
within 10 days from the date of this letter. 
 
Please call us if you have further queries. 
 
Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via 
email.  Submission of claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much 
regretted. 
 
Best Regards, 

Chan Jia Le | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6749 5792 | email: Jiale@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
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RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING YP201G & SHB8487X ON 31 MARCH 2019 ALONG JALAN
BUKIT MERAH / QUEENSWAY (SNM19D202863C02/YP201G/tanghl) LKK REF:
CC3/CTI19005883/K1ds3)

Albert Chua <albert.chua@sg.cntaiping.com>
Tue 1/26/2021 7:24 PM
To:  Jia Le (LKK Auto) <JiaLe@lkkauto.com>; Lionel Chua <lionel.chua@sg.cntaiping.com>
Cc:  Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Hi Jia Le,
 
Please proceed as proposed.
 
 
NOTICE :
In response to the escalating Covid-19 cases, please refrain from sending hardcopy documents to us as delay is to
be expected for handling hardcopy documents. All correspondence should be made via email
claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com or fax at 6224 7175. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.
 
Regards,
 
Albert Chua
Deputy Head
Claims Department
 
China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.
3 Anson Road  #15-00  Springleaf Tower Singapore 079909
DID: (65) 6389 6181  |   F: (65) 6224 7175
 
W: www.sg.cntaiping.com   |    FB: www.facebook.com/chinataipingsg/   |   WeChat: 太平狮城 Taiping SG
 
Disclaimer: This e-mail and any files transmitted with it is intended only for the named recipients and may contain confidential information. Any

unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination of this message, either in whole or partial, is prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient,

please notify the sender immediately. Please delete the e-mail and any copies of it thereafter.

 
China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.
3 Anson Road  #15-00  Springleaf Tower Singapore 079909
DID: (65) 6389 6181  |   F: (65) 6224 7175
 
W: www.sg.cntaiping.com   |    FB: www.facebook.com/chinataipingsg/   |   WeChat: 太平狮城 Taiping SG
 

From: Claims Dept of CTI <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>  
Sent: Tuesday, 13 October 2020 1:48 pm 
To: Jia Le (LKK Auto) <JiaLe@lkkauto.com>; Lionel Chua <lionel.chua@sg.cntaiping.com> 
Cc: Claims Dept of CTI <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING YP201G & SHB8487X ON 31 MARCH 2019 ALONG JALAN BUKIT MERAH /
QUEENSWAY (SNM19D202863C02/YP201G/tanghl) LKK REF: CC3/CTI19005883/K1ds3)
 
Dear Sir,
 
Kindly note Lionel Chua is case handler.

Dear Lionel,

mailto:claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com
http://www.sg.cntaiping.com/
http://www.facebook.com/chinataipingsg/
http://www.sg.cntaiping.com/
http://www.facebook.com/chinataipingsg/
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Fya.
 
NOTICE :
In response to the escalating Covid-19 cases, please refrain from sending hardcopy documents to us
as delay is to be expected for handling hardcopy documents.  All correspondence should be made
via email claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com or fax at 6224 7175. Any inconvenience caused is much
regretted.
 
Thank you
 
Chong Boon Sen
Claims Department
 
China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.
3 Anson Road #15-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079909 
DID: (65) 63896116   |   F: (65) 62247175  
  
W: www.sg.cntaiping.com   |    FB: www.facebook.com/chinataipingsg/   |   WeChat: 太平狮城 Taiping SG
 
Disclaimer: This e-mail and any files transmitted with it is intended only for the named recipients and may contain confidential information. Any

unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination of this message, either in whole or partial, is prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient,

please notify the sender immediately. Please delete the e-mail and any copies of it thereafter.

 
 
 
From: Jia Le (LKK Auto) <JiaLe@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Tuesday, 13 October 2020 1:41 PM 
To: Alfred Toh <alfred.toh@sg.cntaiping.com>; Ben Tang <Ben.Tang@sg.cntaiping.com> 
Cc: Claims Dept of CTI <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>; Chee So Chow
<sochow.chee@sg.cntaiping.com>; Albert Chua <albert.chua@sg.cntaiping.com>; Admin A <admin-
a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING YP201G & SHB8487X ON 31 MARCH 2019 ALONG
JALAN BUKIT MERAH / QUEENSWAY (SNM19D202863C02/YP201G/tanghl) LKK REF:
CC3/CTI19005883/K1ds3)
 

Dear Sirs/Madam,

 

We refer to the below email.

 

Kindly let us have your approval/instruction on mandate as third party is chasing.

 

Thank you.
 
Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. 
Submission of claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much

mailto:claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com
http://www.sg.cntaiping.com/
http://www.facebook.com/chinataipingsg/
mailto:JiaLe@lkkauto.com
mailto:alfred.toh@sg.cntaiping.com
mailto:Ben.Tang@sg.cntaiping.com
mailto:claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com
mailto:sochow.chee@sg.cntaiping.com
mailto:albert.chua@sg.cntaiping.com
mailto:admin-a@lkkauto.com
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regretted.
 
Best Regards,

Chan Jia Le | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6749 5792 | email: Jiale@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
 
From: Jia Le (LKK Auto)  
Sent: Wednesday, 7 October 2020 11:13 AM 
To: Alfred Toh; Ben Tang 
Cc: Claims Dept of CTI; Chee So Chow; Albert Chua; Admin A 
Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING YP201G & SHB8487X ON 31 MARCH 2019 ALONG
JALAN BUKIT MERAH / QUEENSWAY (SNM19D202863C02/YP201G/tanghl) LKK REF:
CC3/CTI19005883/K1ds3)
 

Your ref : SNM19D202863C02

Our ref : CC3/CTI19005883/K1ds3

 

Dear Sirs/Madam,

 

ACCIDENT INVOLVING YP 201G(OI) & SHB 8487X(TP) ON 31/03/2019

 

We refer to the above matter.

 

Insured’s vehicle door opened. Liability is not in our driver’s favour.

We did clarify with insured the nature of the accident and he's aware that NCD (if any) would be affected.

 

We seek your approval to offer Third Party repairer "PREMIER AUTOMOTIVE SERVICES PTE
LTD" at $1,321.35(all-in).

 

The summary is as follows: -

 

 Amount Claimed Amount Revised

1. Cost of Repair (w/GST) $ 1,873.57 $    856.00

mailto:Jiale@lkkauto.com
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2. Loss of Rental (3days x $104.45) $    313.35 $    313.35 (3days x $104.45)

3. Loss of Income (3days x $100) $    300.00 $    150.00 (3days x $50)

4. LTA/ GIA Search Fee $       2.00 $       2.00

Total $ 2,488.92 $ 1,321.35

 

**02 days recommendation for repair + 1PRS = 3days.

 

Enclosed here with all the relevant documents for your perusal.

 

For your approval/instruction please.
 
Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. 
Submission of claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much
regretted.
 
Best Regards,

Chan Jia Le | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6749 5792 | email: Jiale@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
 

From: Alfred Toh [mailto:alfred.toh@sg.cntaiping.com]  
Sent: Wednesday, 23 September 2020 4:30 PM 
To: Jia Le (LKK Auto); Admin A; Ben Tang; jeffrey.tan 
Cc: Claims Dept of CTI; Alfred Toh; Chee So Chow; Albert Chua 
Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING YP201G & SHB8487X ON 31 MARCH 2019 ALONG
JALAN BUKIT MERAH / QUEENSWAY (SNM19D202863C02/YP201G/tanghl) LKK REF:
CC3/CTI19005883/K1JB3)
 
Dear Ben
 
Please put up proposal to repudiate liability as Insured has failed and/or refused to file accident report till
date.
 
p.s no longer our Insured
 
NOTICE :
In response to the escalating Covid-19 cases, please refrain from sending hardcopy documents to us
as delay is to be expected for handling hardcopy documents.  All correspondence should be made
via email claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com.  Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.
 
Best Regards
 
Alfred Toh

mailto:Jiale@lkkauto.com
mailto:alfred.toh@sg.cntaiping.com
mailto:claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com
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Senior Executive
Claims Department
China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.
3 Anson Road #15-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079909
DID: 65 6389 6183
Email: claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com
              alfred.toh@sg.cntaiping.com
W: www.sg.cntaiping.com   |    FB: www.facebook.com/chinataipingsg/   |   WeChat: 太平狮城 TaipingSG
Disclaimer: This e-mail and any files transmitted with it is intended only for the named recipients and may
contain confidential information. Any unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination of this message,
either in whole or partial, is prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient, please notify the sender
immediately. Please delete the e-mail and any copies of it thereafter.
 
From: Jia Le (LKK Auto) <JiaLe@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Wednesday, September 23, 2020 3:50 PM 
To: Alfred Toh <alfred.toh@sg.cntaiping.com> 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Claims Dept of CTI <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com> 
Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING YP201G & SHB8487X ON 31 MARCH 2019 ALONG
JALAN BUKIT MERAH / QUEENSWAY (SNM19D202863C02/YP201G/tanghl) LKK REF:
CC3/CTI19005883/K1JB3)
 
Dear Alfred,
 
Kindly advise whether insured has lodge the report. If so, please let us have a copy.
 
Thank you.
 
Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. 
Submission of claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much
regretted.
 
Best Regards,

Chan Jia Le | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6749 5792 | email: Jiale@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
 

From: Alfred Toh [mailto:alfred.toh@sg.cntaiping.com]  
Sent: Wednesday, 16 September 2020 11:23 AM 
To: hr@hengguan.com.sg 
Cc: Ben Tang; Admin A; Claims Dept of CTI; jeffrey.tan; Alfred Toh 
Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING YP201G & SHB8487X ON 31 MARCH 2019 ALONG JALAN
BUKIT MERAH / QUEENSWAY (SNM19D202863C02/YP201G/tanghl) LKK REF:
CC3/CTI19005883/K1JB3)
 
POLICY NO:   DMCVSN30700918000
VEHICLE NO: YP201G
INSURED:      HENG GUAN POULTRY INDUSTRIES PTE LTD
From 11 NOVEMBER 2018 TO 10 NOVEMBER 2019
DATE OF ACCIDENT: 31 MARCH 2019 ALONG JALAN  BUKIT MERAH/QUEENSWAY
DRIVER:          LI SONG (G8637402T) – provided by Third Party claimant
CLAIM NO:    SNM19D202863C02/YP201G/tanghl

mailto:claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com
mailto:alfred.toh@sg.cntaiping.com
https://apc01.safelinks.protection.outlook.com/?url=http%3A%2F%2Fwww.sg.cntaiping.com%2F&data=02%7C01%7Cclaimsdept%40sg.cntaiping.com%7Cc5d44d78bda44aaa2f1708d86f3a98d0%7C52fbc9ef9a574c5ba4ca46f2633868e5%7C0%7C0%7C637381644786624609&sdata=xDW8hCFtP1ssiMwLZl1G48v5aT%2FDbY514idplHkx%2FeY%3D&reserved=0
https://apc01.safelinks.protection.outlook.com/?url=http%3A%2F%2Fwww.facebook.com%2Fchinataipingsg%2F&data=02%7C01%7Cclaimsdept%40sg.cntaiping.com%7Cc5d44d78bda44aaa2f1708d86f3a98d0%7C52fbc9ef9a574c5ba4ca46f2633868e5%7C0%7C0%7C637381644786634597&sdata=baP5BrszAuQdmxQ%2Fh%2Bm9F87xjEBjeZX%2FqNJPcFMAzYQ%3D&reserved=0
mailto:JiaLe@lkkauto.com
mailto:alfred.toh@sg.cntaiping.com
mailto:admin-a@lkkauto.com
mailto:claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com
mailto:Jiale@lkkauto.com
mailto:alfred.toh@sg.cntaiping.com
mailto:hr@hengguan.com.sg
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M/S HENG GUAN POULTRY INDUSTRIES PTE LTD
ATTN: OFFICER-IN-CHARGE
 
Dear Sirs
 
We refer to the above matter.
 
It is note that there is no report filed by your good office on the accident on 31 March 2019.
 
Please file the accident report at any of China TaiPing Insurance’s Authorized Workshop
(Reporting Centre) IMMEDIATELY to enable us to handle the incoming claim against your motor
insurance policy on your behalf.
 
If we do not receive the Accident report by Friday, 18 September 2020, we shall have no alternative
but to repudiate liability and re-direct all claims to you for your own disposal.
 
Aside to Ben, please keep track/follow up on the matter.
 
NOTICE :
In response to the escalating Covid-19 cases, please refrain from sending hardcopy documents to us
as delay is to be expected for handling hardcopy documents.  All correspondence should be made
via email claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com or fax at 6224 7175.  . Any inconvenience caused is much
regretted.
 
Best Regards
 
Alfred Toh
Senior Executive
Claims Department
China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.
3 Anson Road #15-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079909
Email: claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com
              alfred.toh@sg.cntaiping.com
W: www.sg.cntaiping.com   |    FB: www.facebook.com/chinataipingsg/   |   WeChat: 太平狮城 TaipingSG
Disclaimer: This e-mail and any files transmitted with it is intended only for the named recipients and may
contain confidential information. Any unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination of this message,
either in whole or partial, is prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient, please notify the sender
immediately. Please delete the e-mail and any copies of it thereafter.
 

mailto:claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com
mailto:claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com
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