Khanchna (LKK Auto)

From: Khanchna (LKK Auto)

Sent: Wednesday, 10 July 2019 4:37 PM

To: Specialists Motor Pte Ltd

Cc: Admin A; Poh Kin (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: Claim of GBH2531E and SLL4169R Our Ref: 19/19/19/VP05/021614 & Our Ref:

18/19/19/VC00/021612 [External General]

Tracking: Recipient Delivery
Specialists Motor Pte Ltd

Admin A

Poh Kin (LKKAuto) Delivered: 10/7/2019 4:37 PM
shupei@lkkauto.com Delivered: 10/7/2019 4:37 PM
olivialau@Ikkauto.com Delivered: 10/7/2019 4:37 PM
Meikwan@lkkauto.com Delivered: 10/7/2019 4:37 PM

Without Prejudice
(save as to costs)

Dear Sirs/Mdm,
We refer to the above matter.

We propose settlement as follows: -

1. Cost of Repair (w/GST) $17,773.81

2. Loss of Rental (13days x $120.00) $ 1,560.00

3. LTA/GIA Search Fee $ 2.00
TOTAL | $19,335.81

Please confirm acceptance.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from
this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues of
liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,

Khanchna| Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

DID: 6841 2360| email: Khanchna@lkkauto.com | Fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Poh Kin (LKKAuto)
Sent: Wednesday, 10 July 2019 4:31 PM
To: Khanchna (LKK Auto) <khanchna@Ikkauto.com>



Cc: Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>; Specialists Motor Pte Ltd <cardoc@singnet.com.sg>
Subject: FW: Claim of GBH2531E and SLL4169R Our Ref: 19/19/19/VP05/021614 & Our Ref: 18/19/19/vVC00/021612
[External General]

Hi Khanchna,
Kindly assist revert to TP.
Thank you.

Best Regards,
Poh Kin, Chong (Mr) | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2132 | email: pohkin@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

ReERER W Syye the Larth Print only when necessary-

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not read
this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the sender that
you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you.

From: Specialists Motor Pte Ltd [mailto:cardoc@singnet.com.sg]

Sent: Wednesday, 10 July 2019 4:24 PM

To: Poh Kin (LKKAuto) <pohkin@lkkauto.com>; Shu Pei (LKKAuto) <shupei@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Claim of GBH2531E and SLL4169R Our Ref: 19/19/19/VP05/021614 & Our Ref: 18/19/19/VC00/021612
[External General]

Without Prejudice
Dear Poh Kin
Any update for the above claim?

Thanks & Regards
Irene
6747 2112

From: ONG LI LI [mailto:llong@Ilonpac.com]

Sent: Thursday, 13 June, 2019 9:55 AM

To: Specialists Motor Pte Ltd; 'Wilson Chow'; MT_Claim_SG; Poh Kin (LKKAuto) (pohkin@Ikkauto.com);
shupei@lkkauto.com

Cc: 'Ho Meng Yee'

Subject: RE: Claim of GBH2531E and SLL4169R Our Ref: 19/19/19/VP05/021614 & Our Ref: 18/19/19/VC00/021612
[External General]

Lonpac External - General
Without Prejudice



Dear Irene

As spoken, please liaise with LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd.
Dear Poh Kin/Shu Pei

FYA — TP vehicle SLL4169R (Our Ref: 18/19/19/VC00/021612)

Regards,

Ong Li Li

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road #17-04/07 The Concourse Singapore 199555
Tel : (65) 6250 7388 Ext. 254 Fax: (65) 6296 2706
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Lonpac External - General data is for internal / external use.

From: Specialists Motor Pte Ltd [mailto:cardoc@singnet.com.sg]

Sent: Thursday, 13 June, 2019 9:40 AM

To: ONG LI LI; 'Wilson Chow'; MT_Claim_SG

Cc: 'Ho Meng Yee'

Subject: RE: Claim of GBH2531E and SLL4169R Our Ref: 19/19/19/VP05/021614 [External General]

Without Prejudice

Dear Sir/ Madam,

Please refer to our LOD dated 29" April 2019.

Up to date, we still had not receive any reply from you.

Kindly let us have your offer for the above claim as soon as possible.
Thanks & Regards

Irene Ting
6747 2112



