Shu Pei (LKKAuto)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 3 April 2019 10:26 AM

To: 'ONG LI LI'; assignments

Cc: 'MT_Claim_SG'; Admin A

Subject: RE: Our Ref: 181919VC00021612 ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLL4169R AND YN2109M ON

01/04/2019 AT CTE [External General]

Dear Sir/Mdm,

Thank you for the assignment.

Best Regards,

G.Nivitha| Admin
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: ONG LI LI [mailto:llong@lonpac.com]

Sent: Wednesday, 3 April 2019 9:45 AM

To: cardoc@singnet.com.sg; assignments@lkkauto.com; 'Admin-D (LKKAuto)' <admin-d@Ilkkauto.com>

Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com>

Subject: FW: Our Ref: 181919VC00021612 ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLL4169R AND YN2109M ON 01/04/2019 AT CTE
[External General]

Lonpac External - General
Without Prejudice

Dear Irene

Please liaise with LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd for survey and assessment of liability.
Dear Nivitha

FYA

Regards,

Ong Li Li

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road #17-04/07 The Concourse Singapore 199555
Tel : (65) 6250 7388 Ext. 254 Fax: (65) 6296 2706
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From: Specialists Motor Pte Ltd [mailto:cardoc@singnet.com.sq]

Sent: Wednesday, 3 April, 2019 9:03 AM

To: MT_Claim_SG

Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLL4169R AND YN2109M ON 01/04/2019 AT CTE

Without Prejudice

Dear Sir/ Madam

Please refer to the above matter.

Our client (SLL4169R) is claiming against your insured (YN2109M).

Kindly check for us the liability and arrange the surveyor to survey the vehicle SLL4169R at
Specialists Motor Pte Ltd

Blk 3018A, Ubi Road 1,

#01-24/25/26

Singapore 408711

Thanks & Regards
Irene Ting
6747 2112

From: cardoc@singnet.com.sg [mailto:cardoc@singnet.com.sq]
Sent: Wednesday, 3 April, 2019 7:42 AM

To: CARDOC

Subject: Attached Image
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