Vic (LKKAuto)

From: Vision Autowork <visionautowork@gmail.com>

Sent: Monday, 19 August, 2019 8:48 AM

To: Vic (LKKAuto)

Cc: Admin A

Subject: Re: Accident involving SFS301K and SKW5046J) on 02.04.19 (Your

Ref:CC4/LPC19005880/Ahb3)

Dear Vic,

Please hold the case first.

My client will go to traffic police appeal the case.
Thank You

Yours faithfully,

Michelle
Hp: 9856 4815

8 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4,
#08-09,Premier @ Kaki Bukit,
Singapore 415875

Tel: 6341 6789

Fax: 6341 6778

On Thu, Aug 15, 2019 at 6:00 PM Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh @lkkauto.com> wrote:

Without Prejudice

Dear Michelle,

We refer to your below email.

Our principal had further reviewed the matter and will still maintain our position on a 50/50 settlement.

Furthermore, PIR from Traffic Police also indicate that their investigation does not produced any substantive result.



As such, our offer as per our below email on even date is already fair and reasonable.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Litd

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

w0 Save the Earth Print only when necessary:

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you.

From: Vision Autowork [mailto:visionautowork@gmail.com]

Sent: Thursday, 15 August, 2019 12:02 PM

To: Vic (LKKAuto)

Cc: Admin A

Subject: Re: Accident involving SFS301K and SKW5046)J on 02.04.19 (Your Ref:CC4/LPC19005880/Ahb3)

Dear Vic,

We refer to your email dated 15.08.19.

Please find our client's video footage via the
link https://drive.google.com/open?id=1kr7FMABpgy0 al.cGkhv8pPXF1SnsfQqr




Kindly note our client's video clearly shown our client's was completely travelling straight on the lane 2
when your insured was changing into lane 2, thus the collision happened.

Hence for swift and amicable settlement, we would like counter propose as follows:

Cost of Repair $9,095.00 (agreed)
Loss of Rental $800.00 (agreed)
LTA Search Fee $7.45 (agreed)
Total @100% $9,902.45

Kindly look into the matter and let us have your reply soon.

Thank You

Yours faithfully,

Michelle

Hp: 9856 4815

8 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4,
#08-09,Premier @ Kaki Bukit,
Singapore 415875

Tel: 6341 6789

Fax: 6341 6778

On Thu, Aug 15, 2019 at 11:30 AM Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh @lkkauto.com> wrote:
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Without Prejudice

Dear Michelle,

We refer further to our below email.

Purely for an amicable settlement on a without prejudice basis and without admission of any liability to our
Insured’s part, our principal is in the view that both parties are equally liable since both parties changed lane (see
attached video footage) and we have our principal’s mandate to offer settlement as below:

Cost of Repair (w/gst) S 9,095.00
Loss of Rental (5100 x 8 days) S 800.00

Subtotal 5 9,895.00
50% S 4,947.50

LTA Search Fee S 7.45
TOTAL S 4,954.95

If agreeable, kindly let the owner sign the attached DV and forward the original sighed hard copy to us(LKK) for

payment processing.

The above amount is to be made payable to VISION AUTOWORK PTE LTD.

Thank you.

"Please note that our above offer and any settlement arising from the above offer are made on a without prejudice basis, and
should not be construed as an admission of liability on our part or on the part of our Insured Driver. Terms of such settlement
should also not be disclosed in any other related matter(s) in respect of the accident. Our offer made in respect of this present
matter is made solely to resolve this matter only. No reference shall be made to this offer or any settlement arising from this

offer in any other related matters.



Best Regards,

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Litd

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

w0 Save the Earth Print only when necessary:

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by
an unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please
do not read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and
inform the sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you.

From: Vic (LKKAuto)

Sent: Saturday, 10 August, 2019 1:38 PM

To: Vision Autowork

Cc: Admin A; Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: Accident involving SFS301K and SKW5046J on 02.04.19 (Your Ref:CC4/LPC19005880/Ahb3)

Without Prejudice

Dear Michelle,

We refer to your below email and we confirmed in receipt of the LOD.

Please be informed that we are currently seeking for our principal’s mandate approval.

We will expedite and will get back to you for an update/offer in due course.

Thank you.



Best Regards,

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Litd

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

w0 Save the Earth Print only when necessary:

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by
an unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please
do not read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and
inform the sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you.

From: Vision Autowork [mailto:visionautowork@gmail.com]

Sent: Monday, 10 June, 2019 5:37 PM

To: Joy Irene (LKKAuto)

Subject: Re: Accident involving SFS301K and SKW5046) on 02.04.19 (Your Ref:CC4/LPC19005880/Ajb3)

Dear Joy,

We refer to the above matter, LOD mailed on 30.04.19
Till date, we have yet to receive any offer from your side.

Please update the status and let us have your reply soon.

Thank You

Yours faithfully,



Michelle

Hp: 9856 4815

8 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4,
#08-09,Premier @ Kaki Bukit,
Singapore 415875

Tel: 6341 6789

Fax: 6341 6778

On Tue, Apr 30, 2019 at 3:40 PM Vision Autowork <visionautowork @ gmail.com> wrote:

Dear Joy,

Please refer to attach LOD.

The original copy today will be post out.

Thank You

Yours faithfully,

Michelle

Hp: 9856 4815



8 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4,
#08-09,Premier @ Kaki Bukit,
Singapore 415875

Tel: 6341 6789

Fax: 6341 6778



