Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Billy <billy@mova.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, 17 May 2019 5:12 PM

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Cc: Jia Yu'

Subject: RE: Re:SJK6098C-DOA: 30/3/2019
Hi Veron,

Confirm Thank You.

Best Regard’s
Billy Liaw

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) [mailto:veronchen@lkkauto.com]
Sent: 17 May 2019 16:47

To: Billy; SUR; Rasul (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: Re:SIK6098C-DOA: 30/3/2019

Dear Billy,
WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Close at Lump Sum Limit $18,000.00 @ 32 days

Kindly send Final invoice and all supporting documents directly to CHINA TAIPING

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Billy <billy@mova.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, 17 May 2019 4:38 PM

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@Ikkauto.com>
Subject: Re:SJIK6098C

Hi Veron,
Attach after repair photos. Please help to close Lump Sum Limit $18000.00 32days. Thank you.

Best Regard's
Billy Liaw

MOVA Automotive Pte Ltd
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