Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 1 April, 2019 11:52 AM

To: motorclaims.sg@fwd.com; Asher Sng (LKKAuto); assignments
Cc: clarali@fwd.com; Admin A

Subject: RE: Arrange survey on SGY7330L D.O.A: 28/03/2019 (Our Ref:

PNPV2018-00009568)

Follow Up Flag: Follow up
Flag Status: Completed
Categories: HMK

Dear Sir/Mdm,
Thank you for the assignment.

Please be informed that vehicle is not in the workshop, repairer will arrange.

Best Regards,

G.Nivitha| Admin
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: motorclaims.sg@fwd.com [mailto:motorclaims.sg@fwd.com]

Sent: Monday, 1 April 2019 9:14 AM

To: AsherSng@lkkauto.com; assignments@lkkauto.com; sur@Ilkkauto.com; admin-a@Ikkauto.com; admin-
d@lkkauto.com

Cc: motorclaims.sg@fwd.com; clara.li@fwd.com

Subject: FW: Arrange survey on SGY7330L D.0O.A: 28/03/2019 (Our Ref: PNPV2018-00009568)

Hi LKK team,

Please refer to the email below and liaise with TP repairer for survey arrangement.

Attached is the repair estimate, TP GIA report.

Please explore direct settlement with TP repairer and create the case in Merimen.

Thank you.

Regards,
Josey



From: City Auto [mailto:cityauto@singnet.com.sg]

Sent: Saturday, 30 March, 2019 9:16 AM

To: Motor Claims SG - SG Common

Subject: Arrange survey on SGY7330L D.O.A: 28/03/2019

Dear Survey Dept,

Kindly arrange LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd survey on Monday 01 April 2019 on following vehicle :
Your Vehicle No. : SJS2254C

Our Vehicle No. : SGY7330L

D.0.A : 28/03/2019

LOCATION : Blk 160, Sin Ming Drive, Sin Ming Auto City #05-01 Singapore 575722

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Vronica Law

City Auto Pte Ltd

Blk 8 Sin Ming Industrial Estate,
#01-60/62 Sin Ming Road,
Singapore 575643

Tel : 6453 1235

Fax : 6453 7944
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