Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 1 April 2019 4:44 PM

To: CDGE Braddell Private Cars Crash Repair Operation

Cc: Denis Teo Chin Chye; CDGE Braddell Private Cars Crash Repair Counter; Patrick
Chung Chan Kim; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto); CS A Team; Admin A; assignments

Subject: RE: PC7674D VS FBM4972B DOA 14022019 TP CLAIM *** LKK REF:
CC4/ASM19005718/pa3

Categories: HMK

‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE’

SAVE AS TO COSTS
Dear Sir / Madam,

We refer to the above matter.

Please be informed that OI has reported. Please refer to the below OI's sketch plan and statement.

SKETCH PLAN

DESCRIBE CIRCUMSTANCES OF THE ACCIDENT
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Brief details.

I was riding my motorcycle (FBM 4972B) along woodlands avenue 12 towards the SLE entrance. | saw a
taxi (SHC 3124X) stopped on a forward+right turn lane with a bus (PC 7674D) stopped on its left. There
was a gap between the two vehicles. | decided to pass the taxi on its left, in the gap between the taxi and
the bus, as i was going forward but the taxi was turning right. As { was in between the two vehicles, the
bus on my left moved forward and a protruding metal bumper above its rear wheel hooked my left
handlebar and pulled my bike to the ground. My bike scraped the left side of the taxi and toppled onto the

ground. The metal bumper of the bus also cracked during the accident. As a result of my fall, my left
thumb, forearm, and shoulder was badly bruised and the left sleeve of my motorcycle jacket was torn.

Please arrange for TP survey.
Please note that for liability, claim negotiation and settlement, please contact Hsiao Tong at 6742 3197.
Our respective case handler will look into the matter and revert to you in due course.

To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned.

Thank you.
Best Regards,



Mei Kwan | Admin
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com | fax: 67414108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: CDGE Braddell Private Cars Crash Repair Operation <braddell operation@sparkcarcare.com>
Sent: Saturday, 30 March, 2019 11:18 AM

To: SG AXA Insurance SM AXA SGP - Motor Survey <motor.survey@axa.com.sg>

Cc: Denis Teo Chin Chye <denisteo@sparkcarcare.com>; CDGE Braddell Private Cars Crash Repair Counter
<braddell cr@sparkcarcare.com>; Patrick Chung Chan Kim <patrickchung@cdge.com.sg>

Subject: PC7674D VS FBM4972B DOA 14022019 TP CLAIM

Hi Sir,

Please check our client liability.

Best Regards,

Ngo Toh Wee
External Business | ComfortDelGro Engineering Pte Ltd
Off: 6383 7656 (Ngo - Supervisor) / Off: 6383 8115 (William) / Off: 6383 7362 (Andrew)

Fax: 6281 5767
www.SPARKcarcare.com




