Vic (LKKAuto)

— e —————————]
From: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com>
Sent: Wednesday, 30 October, 2019 11:49 AM
To: Vic (LKKAuto)
Cc: MT_Claim_SG
Subject: RE- <SEEK MANDATE> Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SLU3460H (OI : LPC

19/19/19//PDS/021595) AND SKE2541K (TP : LKK REF - CCE/LPC19005699/Ahb3)
on 28.03.2019 [External Confidential]

Lonpac External - Confidential
Dear Vie,

Kindly proceed as proposed.

Best Regards

Gerald Poh

Semor Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd
300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 xt.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706
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The all %3 lonpac.com.sg

Lonpac External - Confidenual data is for use by authonsed external parties only.

From: Vic (LKKAuto) [mailto:vicalpeh(@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Wednesday, 23 October, 2019 7:27 PM

To: GERALD POH WEE BIN

Ce: MT _Claim_SG; Admin A; Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: <SEEK MANDATE=> RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SLU3460H (OI : LPC -
19/19/19/VP0O5/021595) AND SKE2541K (TP : LKK REF - CC6/LPC19005699/Ahb3) on 28.03.2019
| External Confidential |

Your Ref: 19/19/19/VP05/021585
Our Ref: CC6/LPC19005699/Ahb3

Dear Gerald,
ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLES SLU 3460H (01) AND SKE 2541K (TP) ON 28/03/2019

We refer to the subject matter and to the assignment dated 1" April 2019 of Third-Party’s request to do Direct
Settlement with our Principal, Lonpac Insurance Bhd.

It was reported that Insured vehicle had rear-ended the TP vehicle.

As such, under MCF and BOLA scenario 27, for rear-ended colllsion, we have to settle the claim from the front
vehicle.

We propose to offer to TP repairer “"KANG CAR REPAIRERS PTE LTD" as below:
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TP CLAIMED REVISED - TO OFFER
Cost of Repair (w/gst) S 492812 5 2,728.50
Loss of Use (120 x 6 days) - Learner Car S 720.00 5 720.00
GIA Search Fee s 2.00 5 2.00
TOTAL |§  5,650.12 $ 3,450.50
Breakdown of days is as follows:
Our surveyor's recommended days to repair 5 days
Weekends / Downtime 1 day
TOTAL 6 days

The above is for your approval and/or further instructions please.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6841-2006 | email: vdealpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(4080933)

SeSRIT ST Suve the Earthe Print only when hecessary:

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient.
Use or distribution by an unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe
that you received this e-mail in error, please do not read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the
e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the sender that you have deleted the e-
mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank vou,

From: Jov Irene (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 2 July, 2019 6:18 PM

To: GERALD POH WEE BIN

Ce: MT_Claim_SG; Admin A; Vie (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SLU3460H (Ol : LPC - TBA) AND SKE2541K (TP :
LKK REF - CC6/LPC19005699/Ajb3) on 28.03.2019 [External Confidential |

REF: 19/19/19/VP05/021595

Dear Gerald,
We attach herewith our PA and marked estimate for your records.
We will be requesting for mandate shortly.

Thank vou.



Best Regards,

Joy Irene | Case Handler

LLKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

DID: 6841-2409 | email: joyirene@ lkkauto.com!Fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

All contents of this email is intended strictly for the addressee(s) only. It may contain confidential and/or
privileged information.If you are not the ntended recipient (or have received this email in error) please
notify the sender immediately and destroy this email. Any unauthorized copying, disclosure or distribution
of the material in this email 1s stnctly forbidden.

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 2 Apnl 2019 1:13 PM

To: Shu Pet (LKKAuto) <shupeif@lkkauto.com=>

Ce: MT Claim_SG <mt_claim(@lonpac.com=>

Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SLU3460H (O1 : LPC - TBA) AND SKE2541K (TP
LKK REF - CC6/LPC19005699/Ajb3) on 28.03.2019 [External Confidential]

Lonpac External - Confidential
Our Ref 19/19/19/VP05/021595

Dear Shu Pes,

Anached copy of mnsured’s GIA report for your attention.

Best Regards

Gerald Poh

Sentor Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd
300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706

The all %% lonpac.com.sg

Lonpac External - Confidenual data is for use by authorised external parties only.

From: Shu Pei (LKKAuto) [mailta:shupel@|kkauto.com|

Sent: Monday, | April, 2019 7:23 PM

To: GERALD POH WEE BIN; '‘ERIC WOO JUN KIAT: ONG LI LI

Ce: MT Claim_SG; Admin A, Joy Irene (LKKAuto)

Subject: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SLU3460H (O1: LPC - TBA) AND SKE2541K (TP :
LKK REF - CC&/LPC192005699/A)b3) on 28.03.2019

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear Sir / Madam,

We refer to the above mater.



We have mspected TP vehicle SKE 254 1K at M/s Kang Car Repairers Pte Ltd on a WP basis and TP
repairer proposed for a direct settlement.

Meanwhile, kindly let us have a copy of your insured’s GIA report for our necessary action.

Enclosed for your perusal is:
- TP's GIA report

Please be informed that estimated cost of repair and preliminary advice 15 not ready yet.

Our case handler in-charge 15 Joy and she can be contacted at DID: 6841 2409 .

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Shu Peil Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pre Lid

Phone: 6366-0035 | email: shupeialkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ub1 Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{408933)



SR RRAR AL G
KANG CAR REPAIRERS PTE LTD

1 KAKI BUKIT AVE 6 #02-06 AUTOBAY @KAKI BUKIT SINGAPORE 417883

TEL: 67477636, 67473005 FAX: 67485071 Email: kangcar@singnet.com.sg
Co. Reg. No. 201300201N GST Reg. No. 201300201N

QOur Ref KCR0D320192541LON
Your Ref SLU34E0H

Date 07 JUN 201 WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Lonpac Insurance Bhd

C/O LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25

Paya Ubi Industrial Pk

Singapore 408933

Attention | Motor Claim Department

Dear Sirs,
.l/

Accident Involving SKE2541K and SLU3460H on ZB.{IE.Eﬁ‘t 9 along Kaki Bukit Ave 1.

We refer to the above accident. On our record showed that you are the insurer of motor
vehicle SLU3460H.

We are instructed that the accident was caused by your insured’s negligent driving and/or
management of his vehicle. As a result of the accident, our client’s vehicle was damaged and
our client has been put to loss and expense

On behalf of and as authorized by M/S ComfortDelgro Driving Centre Pte Ltd, the owner of
motor-vehicle no: SKE2541K. we submit their claim to you:

Cost of repairs (Inclusive of 7% GST) $2,728.50
Loss of use (6 days (5 days+1 Sunday x $120.00-Training Veh) $ 72000
GIA search fee 3 200

$ 3,450, ﬁu

Enclosed herewith are copies of the following documents in support of our client's claim

1) Tax invoice no. KCR-INV1900270
2) GIA report and certificate insurance of SKE2541K
3) GIA search fee and invoice

4) Vehicle Registration Details
We hope to receive your early reply soon

Thank you.

¥
oy

Yours faip‘l}ully, 4
KANG F‘;'A'B REPA S PTELTD



LETTER OF AUTHORITY

Your Ref SLU3460H

Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road
#17-04/07 The Concourse
Singapore 198555

Dear Sirs,
Accident involving SKE2541K and SLU3460H
on 28.03.2018 _at Kaki Bukit Ave 1.

I/We am/are the owner/s of vehicle number SKE2541K

IAWe had instructed KANG CAR REPAIRERS PTE LTD to make a claim on my/our
behalf against your company in respect of the abovementioned matter.

I/We hereby authorize you to issue the settlement cheque in favour of my/our
workshop, KANG CAR REPAIRERS PTE LTD in full and final settlement of my/our
claim for my/our repair cost and loss of use/rental charges, in respect of the above
accident.

Yours faithfully,




f; LONPAC INSURAN

CLAIM NO 1919 1YV POS/02 | 595

DATE 30 OCTOBER 2019

CE BHD

This Dschame Vouchir apples siricly o Clsmant'y
LA O ey |

Clawms whutsoowe present of kb that may
manifest arwng dicectly or indinectly fom s acocer

This setthermant kerms haman o without an sdre s
of lighiity on e pant of the clawmard and the see
W SFauid rof G wsasd il evdonce i iy

of chaime aneing fom ihis scodent.

DISCHARGE VOUCHER

We. COMFORTDELGRO DRIVING  CENTRE _PTE__LTD  confirmed
acceptance from M/s LONPAC INSURANCE HHH and/or Ih.. owner of SLU
MOOH the sum of Singapore i ¢ and Cents

Fiftv Onlv ($3.450.50) in full and final sausfaction. liquidation and discharge of

property clarm competent (o me/us upon the sid M/s LONPAC INSURANCE BHD
in respect of property claim sustained by me/us whether now or hereafier to become
manifest. ansing either directly or indirectly from an acaident to my vehicle, SKE

2541K on 28 MARCH 2019 along KAKIBUKIT AVENLUE 1

I /We hereby agree to indemnify and keep indemnify (RASHID BIN ALI /
LONPAC INSURANCE BHD) against all claims and any claims whatsoever  made
by any person/persons on our behalf in respect of the said accident.

I'We further authorize you to pay the above settlement sum directly to M/S KANG
CAR REPAIRERS PTE LTD.

I/'We hereby acknowledge that this payment is made on a without admission of
habihity basis and without prejudice (o all related claims and 0 respect of our
insured’s reg@yery action.

Signature of m.hmin: ow ngr,rn_ﬂ,:
Jailani Bin Drahman

Asmistant Vice President

fraining & Corp ,_HH anﬁ" 2515

Name of vehicle ownerMate



i 2RI AR L G
" KANG CAR REPAIRERS PTE LTD

1 KAKI BUKIT AVE 6 #02-06 AUTOBAY @KAKI BUKIT SINGAPORE 417883
TEL: 67477636, 67473005 FAX. 67485071 Email: kangcar@singnet.com.sg
Co. Rag. No. 201300201N GST Reg. No. 201300201N

M/S: LONPAC INSURANCE BHD Final No; KOR-INVI900270
100 BEACH ROAD Cluim No: EST 1900083
#19-00 SHAW TOWERS Date: 16 May 2019
SINGAPORLE 189702 Policy No: M489523

TEL: 623507388 FAX: 62962706 Veh Reg No: SKE2541K

ATTN: Motor Claim Department Muke/Model: TOYOTAVIOS E

MANUAL

Your Ref No SLU3460H Chassis No: MROS3HY9305288484

Claim Type: Third Pany Engine No: INZY 461864

Accident Date:  28/03/2019 Reg. Date: 200022012

. TP Veh Reg No: SLU3460H
Tax Invoice to Vehicle No :SKE2541 K

FALLE:]

Description | Quantity | List Price Amouni
55 5%

As recommended by surveyor 1o proceed repair an total cost lumpsum cost 5% 2.550.00

Add GST @ ™o | 78.50

Fotal Amount pavable S§ 2.728.50

TOTAL: SINGAPORE DOLLAR TWO THOUSAND SEVEN HUNDRED TWENTY EIGHT AND CENTS
FIFTY ONLY

y
For Kang Car Repairers Ple Lid

, S 7
® ’ ]'/Z// ~/

E&OE AUTHORISED SIGNATLRE



Invoice Page 2 of 2

GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE
GEN RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE
8 Raffles Quay #18-00, Singapore 048580
IHSURANCE Phone: +65 8224 D010 Fax: +65 6224 0030
ASSOCIATION Operating Hours: Monday 1o Friday 8am to Spm
RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE ©°' nesisiration No: M400017735

TAX INVOICE

Our Ref No: GR-18-048010

Cate of Reques!; 28/0372019 Your Ref No: Online Purchase

Kang Car Repairers Pte Lid

Mo 1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6
#02-06 AutoBay@ Kaki Bukit
Singapore 417883

Dear Sir'Madam,

Enquiry Date 28/03/2019

Enquiry By Yee Mel Cheng

TP Vehicle No SLU34E80H

Accident Date 28/032019

DESCRIPTION AMOUNT (S%)

TP Insurar Enquiry 1.87
GST Amount 0.13
Total Amount Due (GST Inclusive) 2.00
Thank You.

This is a computer genarated documeant and requires no signature

For GIARMC Official use
Date:
[X] GIRO [ ] Cash [ ] Cheque

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRsas& fuseaction=dsp_g... 29/3/2019



Invoice Page | of 2

GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE
RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE

& Raffles Quay #16-00, Singapore 048580
l"SURANCE Phone: +65 6224 0010 Fax: +85 6224 0030
ASSOCLATION Operating Hours: Monday to Friday Sam to Spm
RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE ©S' Redistration No: 400017735

Third Party Insurer Enquiry

Cur Ref No GR-18-048010
Date of Request. 28/03/2019 Your Ref No. Online Purchasa
Kang Car Repairers Pte Lid

MNo 1 Kaki Bukil Ave B
#02-08 AutoBay@ Kaki Bukit
Singapore 417883

Dear SirfMadam,

Enquiry Date 28/0372019

Enquiry By Yee Mel Chang

TP Vehicle MNo. SLU3480H

Accident Date 28/03r2018

Enguiry Result

TP Vahicle No Insurer Period of Insurance Insurer Tel. No.
SLU3480H Lonpac Insurance Bho 11022018-10/02r2020 +85 82507388
Thank You

The images provided to you are taken from the onginal reports forwarded 1o the cantie by the mambers of the General Insurance
Association of Singapore and wa take no responsibillly for their sccuracy or contents and shall be under no lmbility whatsoaver for any
loss or damage arising out of or in cannection with the reports or theil images

This is a computer generated document and requires no signature.

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRsas& fuseaction=dsp_g... 29/3/2019



