
1

Khanchna (LKK Auto)

From: Khanchna (LKK Auto)
Sent: Thursday, 25 July 2019 5:02 PM
To: sm automotive
Cc: Admin A; Shu Pei (LKKAuto)
Subject: RE: GBG9505R CLAIMING SLM894B DOA 28.03.19 SM

TrackingTracking: Recipient Delivery

sm automotive

Admin A

Shu Pei (LKKAuto) Delivered: 25/7/2019 5:02 PM

Meikwan@lkkauto.com Delivered: 25/7/2019 5:02 PM

olivialau@lkkauto.com Delivered: 25/7/2019 5:02 PM

Without Prejudice 
(save as to costs) 
 
Dear Sirs/Mdm, 
 
We refer to the above matter. 
 
We propose settlement as follows: - 
 
 

1. Cost of Repair  $ 4,500.00 
2. Loss of Rental (5days x $80.00) $    400.00 
3. LTA/GIA Search Fee $        7.45 

TOTAL $ 4,907.45 
 
Please confirm acceptance. 
 
“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving the 
matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from this 
negotiation of terms/settlement. 
 
In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues of 
liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.” 
 
 
 
Best Regards, 
Khanchna| Case Handler 
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
DID: 6841 2360| email: Khanchna@lkkauto.com|Fax: 6741-4108  
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
 

From: sm automotive <sm_automotive@hotmail.com>  
Sent: Tuesday, 23 July 2019 9:24 AM 
To: Khanchna (LKK Auto) <khanchna@lkkauto.com> 
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Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Shu Pei (LKKAuto) <shupei@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: Re: GBG9505R CLAIMING SLM894B DOA 28.03.19 SM 
 
Without Prejudice - gentle reminder  
 
Hi Khanchna 
 
Please advice your offer and revert for close case,thanks. 
 
 
Regards, 

Sukyi Chong  
SM AUTOMOTIVE 
1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6 
Blk C #01-43 
Singapore 417883  
Tel: 6747 9241  Fax: 6741 7276  

From: sm automotive <sm_automotive@hotmail.com> 
Sent: Tuesday, July 16, 2019 11:31 AM 
To: khanchna@lkkauto.com <khanchna@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Shu Pei (LKKAuto) <shupei@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: Re: GBG9505R CLAIMING SLM894B DOA 28.03.19 SM  
  
 
Without Prejudice - gentle reminder  
 
Hi Khanchna 
 
Please advice your offer and revert for close case,thanks. 
 
Regards, 

Sukyi Chong  
SM AUTOMOTIVE 
1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6 
Blk C #01-43 
Singapore 417883  
Tel: 6747 9241  Fax: 6741 7276  

From: sm automotive <sm_automotive@hotmail.com> 
Sent: Tuesday, July 9, 2019 10:02 AM 
To: khanchna@lkkauto.com 
Cc: Admin A; Shu Pei (LKKAuto) 
Subject: Re: GBG9505R CLAIMING SLM894B DOA 28.03.19 SM  
  
Without Prejudice - gentle reminder  
 
Hi Khanchna 
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Please advice your offer and revert for close case,thanks. 
 
 
Regards, 

 
SM AUTOMOTIVE 
1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6 
Blk C #01-43 
Singapore 417883  
Tel: 6747 9241  Fax: 6741 7276  

From: sm automotive <sm_automotive@hotmail.com> 
Sent: Tuesday, July 2, 2019 11:13 AM 
To: khanchna@lkkauto.com 
Cc: Admin A; Shu Pei (LKKAuto) 
Subject: Re: GBG9505R CLAIMING SLM894B DOA 28.03.19 SM  
  
Without Prejudice - gentle reminder  
 
Hi Khanchna 
 
Please advice your offer and revert for close case,thanks. 
 
 
Regards, 

 
SM AUTOMOTIVE 
1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6 
Blk C #01-43 
Singapore 417883  
Tel: 6747 9241  Fax: 6741 7276  

From: sm automotive <sm_automotive@hotmail.com> 
Sent: Tuesday, June 25, 2019 9:06 AM 
To: khanchna@lkkauto.com 
Cc: Admin A; Shu Pei (LKKAuto) 
Subject: Re: GBG9505R CLAIMING SLM894B DOA 28.03.19 SM  
  
Without Prejudice - gentle reminder  
 
Hi Khanchna 
 
Please advice your offer and revert for close case,thanks. 
 
 
Regards, 

 
SM AUTOMOTIVE 
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1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6 
Blk C #01-43 
Singapore 417883  
Tel: 6747 9241  Fax: 6741 7276  

From: sm automotive <sm_automotive@hotmail.com> 
Sent: Tuesday, June 18, 2019 10:58 AM 
To: khanchna@lkkauto.com 
Cc: Admin A; Shu Pei (LKKAuto) 
Subject: GBG9505R CLAIMING SLM894B DOA 28.03.19 SM  
  
Without Prejudice 
 
Hi Khanchna 
 
Please advice your offer and revert for close case,thanks. 
 
Regards, 

Sukyi Chong  
SM AUTOMOTIVE 
1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6 
Blk C #01-43 
Singapore 417883  
Tel: 6747 9241  Fax: 6741 7276  

From: sm automotive <sm_automotive@hotmail.com> 
Sent: Tuesday, June 11, 2019 9:08 AM 
To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) 
Cc: Admin A; Shu Pei (LKKAuto) 
Subject: Re: GBG9505R CLAIMING SLM894B DOA 28.03.19 SM  
  
Without Prejudice 
 
Hi Asher 
 
Please advice your offer and revert for close case,thanks. 
 
 
Regards, 

 
SM AUTOMOTIVE 
1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6 
Blk C #01-43 
Singapore 417883  
Tel: 6747 9241  Fax: 6741 7276  

From: sm automotive <sm_automotive@hotmail.com> 
Sent: Tuesday, June 4, 2019 8:59 AM 
To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) 
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Cc: Admin A; Shu Pei (LKKAuto) 
Subject: Re: GBG9505R CLAIMING SLM894B DOA 28.03.19 SM  
  
Without Prejudice 
 
Hi Asher 
 
Please advice your offer and revert for close case,thanks. 
 
 
Regards, 

 
SM AUTOMOTIVE 
1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6 
Blk C #01-43 
Singapore 417883  
Tel: 6747 9241  Fax: 6741 7276  

From: sm automotive <sm_automotive@hotmail.com> 
Sent: Tuesday, May 28, 2019 9:09 AM 
To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) 
Cc: Admin A; Shu Pei (LKKAuto) 
Subject: Re: GBG9505R CLAIMING SLM894B DOA 28.03.19 SM  
  
Without Prejudice 
 
Hi Asher 
 
Please advice your offer and revert for close case,thanks. 
 
Regards, 

 
SM AUTOMOTIVE 
1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6 
Blk C #01-43 
Singapore 417883  
Tel: 6747 9241  Fax: 6741 7276  

From: Shu Pei (LKKAuto) <shupei@lkkauto.com> 
Sent: Tuesday, May 21, 2019 6:57 PM 
To: sm automotive 
Cc: Admin A; Asher Sng (LKKAuto) 
Subject: FW: GBG9505R CLAIMING SLM894B DOA 28.03.19 SM  
  

Dear Sir / Madam, 

 
Thank you for your email. 
  
Our respective case handler will look into the matter and revert to you in due course. 
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Please note that: - 

 
LKK ref Officer in charge   
CC6/CTI19005694/Aeb3 Asher  

  
To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned 

  
Best Regards, 
Shu Pei| Admin  
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
Phone: 6366-0055 | email: shupei@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
  

From: sm automotive <sm_automotive@hotmail.com>  
Sent: Tuesday, 21 May 2019 3:55 PM 
To: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: GBG9505R CLAIMING SLM894B DOA 28.03.19 SM 
  
*Without Prejudice* 
  
Dear Motor Claims Department, 
  
Enclosed LOD and supporting documents for your reference. 
Originals have been posted out. 
Please kindly advise officer in charge and hope to receive offer soon.  
Thank you. 
  
Regards, 

Sukyi Chong 
SM AUTOMOTIVE 
1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6 
Blk C #01-43 
Singapore 417883  
Tel: 6747 9241  Fax: 6741 7276  


