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Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: Jonathan Lim <Jonathan.Lim@ethozgroup.com>
Sent: Tuesday, 14 January 2020 11:17 AM
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)
Cc: Stanley Lim; Suhelmi Bin Suharman; Ng Boon Kai; Admin A; assignments
Subject: RE: Accident Involving GBE5848M & SJZ9566U (AXA) @ 28 TUAS AVE 2 DOA 

14/03/2019 15:10 - OUR REF: CC4/ASM19005626/pa3

Hi Hsiao Tong, 
 
FYI 
 
My client withdraw claim. 
 
Thank you 
  
Regards, 
 
JONATHAN LIM 
SERVICE ENGINEER 

 
ETHOZ GROUP LTD 
22 TAMPINES STREET 92 SINGAPORE 528876 
DID 6654 7606 AND FAX 6654 7648 

Website: www.ethozgroup.com  

            
 

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) [mailto:chewht@lkkauto.com]  
Sent: Tuesday, January 14, 2020 8:04 AM 
To: Jonathan Lim <Jonathan.Lim@ethozgroup.com> 
Cc: Stanley Lim <Stanley.Lim@ethozgroup.com>; Suhelmi Bin Suharman <Suhelmi.Suharman@ethozgroup.com>; Ng 
Boon Kai <BoonKai.Ng@ethozgroup.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; assignments 
<assignments@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: Accident Involving GBE5848M & SJZ9566U (AXA) @ 28 TUAS AVE 2 DOA 14/03/2019 15:10 - OUR REF: 
CC4/ASM19005626/pa3 
 
Without Prejudice 
 
Dear Sirs/Mdm, 
 
We refer to our below email. 
 
Kindly advise if your client is still pursuing third party claim against our insured / M/s AXA Insurance Pte Ltd. If so, 
kindly arrange for survey. 
 
Please respond and let us know within 10 days from the date of this e-mail. Otherwise, we will proceed to close file 
at our end. 
 
Thank you. 
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“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving 
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred 
from this negotiation of terms/settlement. 
 
In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues 
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.” 
 

“Wishing you a Happy and Prosperous New Year”  

 
 

Best Regards, 

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

 

 
 

From: Jimmy Chen (LKK Auto) <jimmychen@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Friday, 12 July 2019 10:38 AM 
To: Jonathan Lim <Jonathan.Lim@ethozgroup.com> 
Cc: Stanley Lim <Stanley.Lim@ethozgroup.com>; Suhelmi Bin Suharman <Suhelmi.Suharman@ethozgroup.com>; Ng 
Boon Kai <BoonKai.Ng@ethozgroup.com>; Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh@lkkauto.com>; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) 
<chewht@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: Accident Involving GBE5848M & SJZ9566U (AXA) @ 28 TUAS AVE 2 DOA 14/03/2019 15:10 - OUR REF: 
CC4/ASM19005626/pa3 
 
WITHOUT PREJUDICE 
 
Dear Sir/Mdm, 
 
We refer to the above matter. 
 
Please be informed that basing on the accident statements submitted by both party, the liability is clear subject to 
the BOLA guideline settlement. 
 
Please note that this e-mail is on without prejudice basis which does not amount to an authorisation of repair to 
your client’s vehicle and admission of any liability to our Insured’s part. The final repair cost is subjected to the 
consistency of the damages according to the nature of the accident. And the days of LOU/ LOR will be based on the 
number of days of repair as recommended by our surveyor and approved by our principal. 
 
Kindly forward the LOD and all supporting documents to us if available to proceed with the settlement. 
 
Thank you. 
 
 
“Please note that our proposal and correspondence with you is strictly on a without prejudice basis and should not be construed as an 
admission of liability on our part and/or that of our policyholder and/or the authorised driver. The terms of our without prejudice 
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engagement should not be disclosed in any other related matter(s) in respect of this accident nor should it be binding in any other related 
claims.” 
 
 
Best Regards, 

Jimmy Chen| Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841-2928 | email: jimmychen@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

From: Jonathan Lim <Jonathan.Lim@ethozgroup.com>  
Sent: Friday, 29 March 2019 10:31 AM 
To: SG AXA Insurance SM AXA SGP - Motor Survey <motor.survey@axa.com.sg> 
Cc: Stanley Lim <Stanley.Lim@ethozgroup.com>; Suhelmi Bin Suharman <Suhelmi.Suharman@ethozgroup.com>; Ng 
Boon Kai <BoonKai.Ng@ethozgroup.com> 
Subject: Accident Involving GBE5848M & SJZ9566U (AXA) @ 28 TUAS AVE 2 DOA 14/03/2019 15:10 
 
Hi Sir/Madam, 
 
Please be at advised that we will be submitting a claim against your insured. 
 
We would like to propose direct settlement for this case. 
 
Attached herewith is the GIA Report for your perusal. 
 

Our Client’s Vehicle Number:  GBE5848M 

AXA Vehicle Number:  SJZ9566U 

Date/Time of Loss:  14/03/2019 15:10 

 

 
 
Thank you 
  
Regards, 
 
JONATHAN LIM 
SERVICE ENGINEER 

 
ETHOZ GROUP LTD 
22 TAMPINES STREET 92 SINGAPORE 528876 
DID 6654 7606 AND FAX 6654 7648 

Website: www.ethozgroup.com  
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Disclaimer: This message may contain confidential information intended only for the use of the addressee named 
above. If you are not the intended recipient of this message you are hereby notified that any use, dissemination, 
distribution or reproduction of this message is prohibited. If you received this message by mistake, please notify the 
sender by reply email immediately. Please conduct your own virus checks before opening any attachment as ETHOZ 
Group does not guarantee the integrity of this email or attached files has been maintained nor this communication 
is free of viruses, interceptions or interference. Any views expressed in this message are those of the individual 
sender and may not necessarily reflect the views of ETHOZ Group. ETHOZ Group shall not be responsible nor liable 
for the improper and incomplete transmission of the information contained in this communication nor for any delay 
in its receipt or damage to your system.  
Disclaimer: This message may contain confidential information intended only for the use of the addressee named 
above. If you are not the intended recipient of this message you are hereby notified that any use, dissemination, 
distribution or reproduction of this message is prohibited. If you received this message by mistake, please notify the 
sender by reply email immediately. Please conduct your own virus checks before opening any attachment as ETHOZ 
Group does not guarantee the integrity of this email or attached files has been maintained nor this communication 
is free of viruses, interceptions or interference. Any views expressed in this message are those of the individual 
sender and may not necessarily reflect the views of ETHOZ Group. ETHOZ Group shall not be responsible nor liable 
for the improper and incomplete transmission of the information contained in this communication nor for any delay 
in its receipt or damage to your system.  


