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Khanchna (LKK Auto)

From: Phoebe Xie <phoebe.xie@ergo.com.sg>
Sent: 17 September 2020 9:32 AM
To: Khanchna (LKK Auto); Ivy Yong
Cc: Admin A
Subject: RE: MANDATE REQUEST -  Accident Involving SJT5353A (OI : ERGO - CDMPG19000666) 

AND SKW7216Y (TP : LKK REF - CC6/EGI19005617/Uha3) on 28/03/2019

Data Classification: Confidential, C3 

 
Dear Khanchna, 
 
Please proceed as recommended. 
Thank you 
 
Warmest Regards, 
Phoebe Jay Xie 
Manager 
ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd. 
 
5 Temasek Boulevard, #04-05 Suntec Tower Five 
Singapore 038985 
DID.:  +65 6829 9191 
phoebe.xie@ergo.com.sg 
 

 
 
Your acceptance of our offer constitutes a binding agreement in the full and final settlement of your claim. By clearing 
our cheque, you are discharging ERGO Insurance Pte Ltd and our insured/s from all further liabilities arising directly or 
indirectly from the said accident. 
 

From: Khanchna (LKK Auto) <khanchna@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Thursday, 17 September 2020 9:26 am 
To: Ivy Yong <ivy.yong@ergo.com.sg>; Phoebe Xie <phoebe.xie@ergo.com.sg> 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: MANDATE REQUEST - Accident Involving SJT5353A (OI : ERGO - TBA) AND SKW7216Y (TP : LKK REF - 
CC6/EGI19005617/Uha3) on 28/03/2019 
 
ERGO REF: Please advice 
LKK REF : CC6/EGI19005617/Uha3 
 
============================  
 
Dear Sir/Madam, 
 
ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLES SKW7216Y (TP) & SJT5353A (OI) ON 28/03/2019 
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We refer to the above matter. 
 
Insured driver made a U-turn and collided into Third party vehicle moving straight.  
 
We had informed to the Insured of the TP claim and NCD issues and he agreed to let Insurance handle. 
 
In view of the above, we are of the view that BOLA 11(b) is applicable. 
 
Summary to offer to repairer  FASTECH AUTO PTE LTD is as follows: 
 

TP CLAIMED REVISED - TO OFFER 

Cost of Repair (w/GST)                          $     24,286.11                   $ 7,597.00 
Loss of Rental ($100 x 4 days)                          $         400.00                   $    400.00 ($100 x 4 days) 
GIA Search Fee                          $             2.00                   $         2.00 

TOTAL                          $     24,688.11                   $ 7,999.00 
 
Breakdown of days is as follows: 

*5 days recommendation for repair  
 
Relevant supporting claim documents are attached herewith for your perusal and reference. 
 
For your approval and/or further instructions please. 
 
Thank you. 
 
 
 
 
 
Best Regards, 
Khanchna| Case Handler 
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
DID: 6841 2360| email: Khanchna@lkkauto.com|Fax: 6741-4108  
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
 

EMAIL DISCLAIMER 
The information contained in this email communication is confidential. You should only read, disclose, re-transmit, copy, 
distribute, act in reliance on or commercialize the information if you are authorized to do so. If you are not the intended 
recipient of this email communication, please notify the sender by replying to the email and destroy any electronic or 
paper copy of this message. 
Any views expressed in this email communication are those of the individual sender. ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd. does not 
represent, warrant or guarantee that the integrity of this communication has been maintained or that the 
communication is free of errors, virus or interference. 
ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd. asserts copyright in respect to this email including any attachment. No part may be 
reproduced by any process or for any purpose without prior written permission. 


