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Company Registration Mo 193607188k

S1 UBTAVE 1, #02-25 PAYA URIINDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 406933 TEL + (065} 62363361 FAN : 10651 625643

Your ref; 18/19/19/VCOW021587

Our ref: CS/LPC19005568/Uvd3 Date: 6/6/2019

The Motor Claims Department
M/s LONPAC INSURANCE BHD

Dear Sir

PRELIMINARY ADVICE OF VEHICLE NO.GZ 55887

We thank for your instruction on 28/3/2019

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the above mentioned
vehicle on 3/4/2019 at the premises of M/s KAIZEN MOTORS PTE LTD

and have the following to report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount
Revised Estimate Amount
"Check"” Items Amount
Market Value

LTA Reimbursement Value
MNett Value

Description of Damage:
The vehicle sustained damages at the
ofs body

Comments/Present Status:
Damages Consistent

Yours faithfully,

MARCUS CHUA
Licensed Appraiser

:85%2,680.00

-551.000.00

5%

155

5%

5%




‘Veron Chen {LI{I{Autn!

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 6 June 2019 9:28 AM

To: ‘GERALD POH WEE BIN'; SUR

Cc: ‘MT_Claim_SG'; 'KENNY LIM CHING GHEE'

Subject: RE: PRE-REPAIR SURVEY --- YOUR REF: GBE 6889 M--- ACCIDENT INVOLVING GZ

5588 T AND GBE 6889 M ON 23 MARCH 2019 AT SHUNLI INDUSTRIAL PARK AT
ABOUT 0850 HOURS [External Confidential]
Attachments: GZ 5588T PRELI ADVISED pdf

Dear Gerald,

Enclosed preliminary revised of vehicle GZ 5588T
Date of survey: 3/4/2019
Number of days : 3 days

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email ;sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 28 March 2019 4:57 PM

To: 'GERALD POH WEE BIN' <geraldpoh@Ionpac.com>; assignments <assignments@Ilkkauto.com>; SUR
<sur@lkkauto.com=

Ce: 'MT_Claim_SG' <mt_claim@lonpac.com=; 'KENNY LIM CHING GHEE' <kennylim@lonpac.com>

Subject: RE: PRE-REPAIR SURVEY - YOUR REF: GBE 6883 M--- ACCIDENT INVOLVING GZ 5588 T AND GBE 68839 M
ON 23 MARCH 2019 AT SHUNLI INDUSTRIAL PARK AT ABOUT 0850 HOURS [External Confidential]

Dear Sir / Mdm,
Thank you for the assignment.
Please be informed vehicle not in the workshop, repairer will arrange.

Best Regards,

Summer Lee | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@|kkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN [mailto:geraldpoh@lonpac.com]

Sent: Thursday, 28 March, 2019 4:26 PM

To: assipnments@lkkauto.com; sur@lkkauto.com

Cc: MT_Claim_5G <mt_claim@lonpac.com>; KENNY LIM CHING GHEE <kennylim@|onpac.com=>

Subject: FW: PRE-REPAIR SURVEY --- YOUR REF: GBE 6889 M--- ACCIDENT INVOLVING GZ 5588 T AND GBE 6889 M
ON 23 MARCH 2019 AT SHUNLI INDUSTRIAL PARK AT ABOUT 0850 HOURS [External Confidential]

Importance: High




‘Lonpac External - Confidential
Our Ref : 18/19/19/VC00/021587

Dear Nivitha,

Kindly proceed accordingly.

Best Regards

Gerald Poh

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65 6296 2706

Sent: Thursday, 28 March, 2019 4:10 PM
To: GERALD POH WEE BIN

Ce: MT_Claim_SG; KENNY LIM CHING GHEE

Subject: RE: PRE-REPAIR SURVEY --- YOUR REF: GBE 6889 M--- ACCIDENT INVOLVING GZ 5588 T AND GBE 6889
M ON 23 MARCH 2019 AT SHUNLI INDUSTRIAL PARK AT ABOUT 0850 HOURS [External Confidential]
Importance: High

Our Ref: GZ 5588 T (et}
WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Sir/Madam,

We refer to your email an 27 March 2019 informing that you wish to conduct a pre-repair survey and your List of
Surveyors.

Our client confirmed appointment of MARCUS CHUA — LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD as the Single Joint Expert
for this matter.

Venue: KAIZEN MOTORS PTE LTD
68 Kaki Bukit Ave 6
#02-12 ARK®@KB
Singapore 417896
Contact: Shawn Yap @ 6384 1956 / 9150 0670 (Please call before going)

If you fail to conduct the pre-repair inspection within the next 2 working days excluding any intervening Saturday,
Sunday or Public Holiday, the said workshop will commence repairs thereafter without further reference to you.

FOR SURMEYOR
Thank you. Plea seinitial here atter compl etion ofp e -repair ins peciion
Thank you

fopointed suneyor
'::écl (Mame & Signature)

Date & Timeoflnspecion



Regards,

‘Elaine Toh

Vision Law LLC

Tel: 65342811 (Ext. 122)
Fax: 65356207

cc: GZ 5588 T — By email only

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN [mailto:geraldpoh@lonpac.com]

Sent: Wednesday, 27 March, 2019 3:45 PM

To: Elaine Toh

Cc: MT_Claim_SG; KENNY LIM CHING GHEE

Subject: RE: PRE-REPAIR SURVEY --- YOUR REF: GBE 6889 M--- ACCIDENT INVOLVING GZ 5588 T AND GBE 6883 M
ON 23 MARCH 2019 AT SHUNLI INDUSTRIAL PARK AT ABOUT 0850 HOURS [External Confidential]

Lonpac External - Confidential
WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Our Ref : 18/19/19/VC00/021587

Dear Elaine,

We intend to conduct a pre-repair survey of your client ‘s vehicle and
attached a list of motor surveyors from LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
for your attention.

Flease revert.

Best Regards

Gerald Poh

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
TeEiﬁS) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706

The all 8888 lonpac.com.sg

Lonpac External - Confidential data is for use by authorised external parties only.

From: Elaine Toh [mailto:Elainetoh@visionlawllc.com]

Sent: Wednesday, 27 March, 2019 2:55 PM

To: MT_Claim_5G

Subject: PRE-REPAIR SURVEY --- YOUR REF: GBE 6889 M--- ACCIDENT INVOLVING GZ 5588 T AND GBE 6889 M
ON 23 MARCH 2019 AT SHUNLI INDUSTRIAL PARK AT ABOUT 0B50 HOURS

Importance: High

Our Ref: GZ 5588 T (et)
WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Sir/Madam,



We are instructed by UNICONNECT SYSTEMS PTE LTD to notify you of a road traffic accident on 23 March 2019 at
_about 0850 hours at Shun Li Industrial Park involving our client’s motor vehicle registration number GZ 5588 T and
motor vehicle registration number GBE 6889 M driven by you/your insured at the material time.

As a result of the accident, our client’s motor vehicle has been damaged. Before our client proceed to repair the
damaged motor vehicle, please let us know within 2 working days of your receipt of this notice whether you or your
insurer would like to conduct a pre-repair survey of the motor vehicle. |f we do not receive any reply from you within
the stipulated timeline, our client shall proceed to repair the motor vehicle without further reference to you.

Thank you.

Regards,

Elaine Toh

Vision Law LLC

Tel: 65342811 (Ext. 122)
Fax: 65356802

oo GZ 5588 T — By email only

VISION LAW LLC

Advocates & Solicitors

(Incorporated with limited liability)

Unique Entity No. 200721148H

Head Office: 133 New Bridge Road #18-01/02 Chinatown Point, Singapore 059413
Branch: 490 Lorong 6 Toa Payoh #03-11 HDB Hub (Biz 3 Lobby 1), Singapore 310490

DISCLAIMER:

The contents of this email (including any attachments) are confidential and privileged and only intended for
the recipient(s) addressed above. If you received this email

by error, please notify the sender immediately and destroy it (and all attachments) without reading, storing
and/or disseminating any of its contents (in any form) to any

person. Email communication is not secure. Vision Law LLC is not liable for any losses arising out of any
errors or omissions in the contents resulting from email

transmission or any illegal or unauthorised usage or tampering of its email system.

VISION LAW LLC

Advocates & Solicitors

(Incorporated with limited liability)

Unique Entity No. 200721148H

Head Office: 133 New Bridge Road #18-01/02 Chinatown Point, Singapore 059413
Branch: 490 Lorong 6 Toa Payoh #03-11 HDB Hub (Biz 3 Lobby 1), Singapore 310490

DISCLAIMER:



Catherine Chnna (LKK Auto)

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh®@lonpac.com>

Sent: Thursday, 28 March, 2019 4:26 PM

To: assignments@lkkauto.com; sur@Ilkkauto.com

Cc: MT_Claim_3SG; KENNY LM CHING GHEE

Subject: FW: PRE-REPAIR SURVEY --- YOUR REF: GBE 6889 M--- ACCIDENT INVOLVING GZ

5588 T AND GBE 6883 M ON 23 MARCH 2019 AT SHUNLI INDUSTRIAL PARK AT
ABOUT 0850 HOURS [External Confidential]
Attachments: image002.emz; image004.emz

Importance; High

Lonpac External - Confidential
Our Ref : 18/19/19/VC00/021587

Dear Nivitha,

Kindly proceed accordingly.

Best Regards

Gerald Poh

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd
300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706

The all €48%3 lonpac.com.sg

Experence it Mow

Lonpac External - Confidential data is for use by authorised external parties only.

From: Elaine Toh [mailto:Elainetoh@visionlawllc.com]

Sent: Thursday, 28 March, 2019 4:10 PM

To: GERALD POH WEE BIN

Cc: MT_Claim_5G; KENNY LIM CHING GHEE

Subject: RE: PRE-REPAIR SURVEY --- YOUR REF: GBE 6889 M--- ACCIDENT INVOLVING GZ 5588 T AND GBE 6889
M ON 23 MARCH 2019 AT SHUNLI INDUSTRIAL PARK AT ABOUT 0850 HOURS [External Confidential]
Importance: High

Our Ref: GZ 5588 T (et)
WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Sir/Madam,

We refer to your email on 27 March 2019 informing that you wish to conduct a pre-repair survey and your List of
SUFVeyors,

Cur client confirmed appointment of MARCUS CHUA — LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD as the Single Joint Expert
for this matter,

Venue: KAIZEN MOTQORS PTE LTD
1



68 Kaki Bukit Ave b
#D2-12 ARK[@KB
Singapore 417896
Contact: Shawn Yap @ 6384 1956 / 9150 0670 {Please call before going)

If you fail to conduct the pre-repair inspection within the next 2 working days excluding any intervening Saturday,
Sunday or Public Holiday, the said workshop will commence repairs thereafter without further reference to you.

FOR SURVEYOR

Thank you. Pleaseinitial here atter compl etion ofp e -repair ins pecton. |
Tha nk you. ;

|
Appoined sureyor | |
@ {Name & Signature)

Regards,

Elaine Toh _

Visionlawlic Date & Timeofinspecion

Tel: 65342811 (Ext. 122)
Fax: 65356802

e GZ 5588 T - By email only

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN [mailto:geraldpoh@lonpac.com)

Sent: Wednesday, 27 March, 2019 3:45 PM

To: Elaine Toh

Cc: MT_Claim_5G; KENNY LIM CHING GHEE

Subject: RE; PRE-REPAIR SURVEY — YOUR REF: GBE 6889 M--- ACCIDENT INVOLVING GZ 5588 T AND GBE 6889 M
ON 23 MARCH 2019 AT SHUNLI INDUSTRIAL PARK AT ABOUT 0850 HOURS [External Confidential]

Lonpac External - Confidential
WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Our Ref © 18/19/19/VC00/021587

Dear Elaine,

We intend to conduct a pre-repair survey of your client ‘s vehicle and
attached a list of motor surveyors from LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

for your attention.

FPlease revert.

Best Regards

Gerald Poh

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555

Lonpac External - Confidential data is for use by authorised external parties only.



From: Elaine Toh [mailto:Elainetoh@visionlawllc.com)
Sent: Wednesday, 27 March, 2019 2:55 PM

To: MT_Claim_SG

Subject: PRE-REPAIR SURVEY --- YOUR REF: GBE 6889 M--- ACCIDENT INVOLVING GZ 5588 T AND GBE 6889 M
ON 23 MARCH 2019 AT SHUNLI INDUSTRIAL PARK AT ABOUT 0850 HOURS

Importance: High

Qur Ref: GZ 5588 T [et)
WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Cear Sir/Madam,

We are instructed by UNICONNECT SYSTEMS PTE LTD to notify you of a road traffic accident on 23 March 2019 at
about 0850 hours at Shun Li Industrial Park involving our client’s motor vehicle registration number GZ 5588 T and
motor vehicle registration number GBE 6889 M driven by you/your insured at the material time.

As a result of the accident, our client’s motor vehicle has been damaged. Before our client proceed to repair the
damaged motor vehicle, please let us know within 2 working days of your receipt of this notice whether yOou or your
insurer would like to conduct a pre-repair survey of the motor vehicle. If we do not receive any reply from you within
the stipulated timeline, our client shall proceed to repair the motor vehicle without further reference to you.

Thank you,

Regards,

Elaine Toh

Vision Law LLC

Tel: 65342811 (Ext. 122)
Fax: 65356802

£es GZ 5588 T - By email only

VISION LAW LLC

Advocates & Solicitors

(Incorporated with limited liability)

Unique Entity No. 200721148H

Head Office: 133 New Bridge Road #18-01/02 Chinatown Point, Singapore 059413
Branch: 490 Lorong 6 Toa Payoh #03-11 HDB Hub (Biz 3 Lobby 1), Singapore 310490

DISCLAIMER:

The contents of this email (including any attachments) are confidential and privileged and only intended for
the recipient(s) addressed above, If vou received this email

by error, please notify the sender immediately and destroy it (and all attachments) without reading, storing
and/or disseminating any of its contents (in any form) to any

person. Email communication is not secure. Vision Law LLC is not liable for any losses arising out of any
rrors or omissions in the contents resulting from email

transmission or any illegal or unauthorised usage or tampering of its email system.




sGC ARMART.COM

Used Nissan Cabstar Car for Sale in Singapore, - sgCarMart

Page 1 of 2

Login  Sign up
Mew Cars Used Cars Sell My Car Directory Products Insurance Articles Forum Resources
il srthd ARy
CONNECTING CAR BUYERS & SELLERS. wwppemn  \ CONNECT
We’ll handle your loans, insurance & other paperwork for FREE.
nissan cabstar Price Range ~| | Depreciation i: = 10year({ % | Vehicle Type | M Submitt o
CHTH Faesg] Cany Wearh CRIners Nissan Cahstar [(COE 1
Missan Cabstar (COE till 01/2021)
Overview Financial Accessories Similar Research Photos Map DIEECT WHER
Price %12 888 Lifespan 08-Feb-2021
Depreciation £7,030 fyr Reg Date 09-Feb-2001
{1yr 9mths 28days COE left)
Mileage M.A. Manufactured 000
Road Tax M.A. Transmission Marual
Dereg Value 38,278 as of today {: =) oMV 5§23 464
———— = : :
174 7

Engine Cap 3,153 oc Mo. of Owners 5

100% FREE !

y PAPEAWORK i

Curb Weight 1,490 kg SUPPORT FOR T

BOTH BUYER -

& SELLER ERITRD R AR

Type of Vehicle

Description

Can't Avoid Replacement Of Parts For Used Lorries, Have Since Replace Most OF The Parts For The Past 3 Years,
Servicing Dane Promptly And On Time. Have Workshop Invoices As Prove, Loy [n Tip Top Mechanical Condition,
Lorry St On The Road, Inspection Done On 31 Jan 2019, Road Tax Till 31 Jul 2019. Whatsapp Me If Keen,

Category

Status
Available

Resources

ST

s 1-5\

Vehicle Evaluation

Car Valuation - Frea
Find out the market value of your existing car for free. Got

Upfront Payment

Transfer Fee £25
Down Payment $1,289 (change)
1st Instalment $596

Compare

https://www.sgcarmart.com/used_cars/info.php?ID=

Afraid of lemons? Request to have this car evaluated professsonakly, |

807971&DL=1000

Seller Information
Contact Person(s) Wito Su

Contact No.

7999591

Enquiry

ESSENTIAL TRANSACTION FORMS

« Indemnity form « Sales agresment

= Receipt » Hand-over form

= Dhaenership TransTer

ﬁ GET HELP WITH
M PAPERWORK

sgCarMart Connect handles your transaction
paperwork - send us your completed Sakes Agreement,
and we'll help with Car Loans, Insurance, Payments
B Ownership Transfer. FREC for all sgCarkart
Advertised Vehicles.

el AR AT

CONNECT

Upload your Sales Agroosmant

Read our B Step Guide for Direct Buyers & Sellers

03-Apr-19



PARF/COLE Rebate Enquiry Page 1 of 2

> Back to OneMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle
Vehicle Owner Particulars

Owner ID Type: Company
Owner 1D: 8015K
Vehicle Details

Vehicle No.: GZ5588T
Vehicle to be Exported: No

Intended Deregistration Date: 03 Apr 2019
Vehicle Make: NISSAN
Vehicle Model: CABSTARG
Primary Colour: Beige
Manufacturing Year: 2006

Engine No.: QD32223973
Chassis No.: JN1SF4F23Z0861188
Maximum Power Output: -

Open Market Value: $18,509.00
Original Registration Date: 22 Jun 2006
First Registration Date: 22 Jun 2006
Transfer Count: 3

Actual ARF Paid: $926.00
Intended PARF Rebate Details

PARF Eligibility: No

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date: -

PARF Rebate Amount: $0.00
Intended COE Rebate Details

COE Expiry Date: 21 Jun 2021
COE Category: C - Goods Vehicle & Bus
COE Period(Years): 5

PQP Paid: $22,326.00
COE Rebate Amount: $9.897.00
Total Rebate Amount: $9.,897.00
Message

Please note that all future COE renewals for this vehicle can only be for a 5-year period,
subject to the statutory lifespan (if applicable) of the vehicle.

The information contained herein is correct as at 03 Apr 2019

OK

https://vrl.lta.gov.sg/lta/vrl/action/enquireRebate By PublicBeforeDeregInput?FUNCTION _ID=F030... 03-Apr-19



BARAY 18035142 Matonal Assessdenl Cantre Senioes = U
ENTRY DATE & TIME: 25/03/2018 1744
SUBMITTED BY: Jacksan Ho Zhae Tran

SINGAPORE ACCIDENT STATEMENT

IMPORTANT NOTICE

1, Please report correctly the detalls of the accident lo speed up the claims process.
. This Form must be completed by the Policyhalder andior the Authorised Driver.,

3. Infermaton provided must be as truthful and accurate as possible, Any witful misrepresenialion of withokding of malenal facls may allow Insurance compares o

repudiate policy lability

4. Tha issus and acceplance of this Form by insurance companies B net an admission of policy liability on the par of e insurance companies
5. Any false reporting may he referred to the Police for investigation.

B. This repoart will be forwarded by the insurers of the GlA Records Management Centre established by the General Insurance Association of Singapore (GlA) for
archiving and that copies of this report will, far a fee, be made available upon applicaton by ineresled parbes.

7. By the ladgement of this report to the insurers, you hereby consent 1o the archiving of this repart at the centre and to copies of the report being made avaidable

aloresaid.

ACCIDENT STATEMENT

Date Of Report
Date Of Accident
Exact Location Of Accident

Country/State of Loss

25/03/2019 17:46
23032019 08:50

SHUM LI INDUSTRIAL PARK
SINGAPORE

DETAILS OF OWN VEHICLE

Vehicle Registration Number
Insured/Policyholder
Name Of Registerad QOwner
Cao Reg No

Email Address

Mobile Phone No

Alternative Phona Mo
Vehicle Particulars
Manufacturer

Maodel

Exact Purpose for which vehicle was being used at
time of accident

Are you claiming under your own insurance policy
far repair to your vehicle?

If Mo, Please state action to be taken
Vehicle Category

Insurance Company

Mame of Insurance Company
Type Of Coverage

Fleet Policy

Paolicy Number

Cover Mote Number

Driver

Mame of Driver

Passport No/FIN

Date Of Birth

Ceccupation

Date Of Driving Pass

Driving Experiencea

Gender

Mobile Number

Fax Number

Contact Number

EMail Address

GZ5588T

UNICONMNECT SYSTEMS PTE LTD
201318015K

NOEMAIL

(LOCAL) +65-82509698
OFFICE-82509699

MNISSAN
CABSTAR G

WORKING

NO

THIRD PARTY
COMMERCIAL VEHICLE

TOKID MARINE INSURANCE SINGAPORE LTD
THIRD PARTY

NO

18-MUC07297-R01

KULDEEP SINGH
GA2840940

26/04/1983

QUTDOOR

29/05/2017

1 YEAR AND 9 MONTHS
MALE

(LOCAL) +65-00529165

OFFICE-20528165
NOEMAIL

Fage 1 of 16



Address 656 GEYLANG ROAD
Posteoda 3BO5EE

Was driver an employee of the Insured's Company YES
If Mo, Relationship of the Driver with the Insured

Vehicle Registration Mumber of Driver's Own -
Vehicle -

Insurance Company of Driver's Own Vehicle =

General Information of the Accident

Type Of Accident COLLISION - MAJORMINOR RD
Weather Conditions CLEAR

Road Surface DRY

Other Information

Was any foreign vehicle involved in this accident? NO
Mumber of vehicles (including own vehicle)

invalved in the accident 2

Was any body injured in the Accident? NO

VWas any injured conveyed to hospital by

ambulance?

Was any other material or property damaged? YES

| h:—nre been apnrnacﬁed by unknown parson{s) NO
soliciting/offering accident claims assistance,

Mumber of Passengers (Including Driver) 2

Passanger 1 NAME: B

GEMDER: :© MALE

Details of Police Action

Was the accident reported o the police? [
If Yes, Please state which Police Station

Was notice of intended Prosecution given? NO

If ¥es,against whom?

Circumstances of Accident

REFER TO STATEMENT.

Attachment(s)

Are accident photos available for attachment? YES

Was there any video captured by Car Camera? NO

Was there any audio recorded? NO

Vehicle Registration Mumber GEEGBE8IM

Vehicle Make/Model/Colour

Details Of Properties

Vehicle Category COMMERCIAL VEHICLE
Mame of Driver RAMACHANDRAMN VISHNUVARTHAN
NRIC/Passport Mumber GT420125W

Contact Mumber

Addrass

Postcode

Insurance Company Name
Mature Of Damage
Mo, Of Passenger (Including Driver) =

Page 2 of 16



F‘asser.lger 1 NAME:
GENDER:

Passenger 2 NAME:
GENDER:
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Accident Sketch Plan

1 Please report commecthy the Setaih of the acodent ta speed up the claims proceds
2 This Form must be (ompheted by the Policyholder and/or the Authorived Driver

1 Informaton provides mat be 3c trathiul aod scourate o pessible. Any willul mizrepresentation or withholding of material
F3e00 e allaw raurance comosneed bo eppediate poltcy Babilivy.

4 The Bsce and scceptance of tha Form by indutance Compsnies - not an admisdon of polcy Kability on the part of the murance
Comparuet

B The repor will be forwarded by The mserers of the GIA Records Mansgement Cenire established Dy the Genersl Inurince

Asiociation of Smgapare (GiA) for archaving and thet copies of the report well for 4 fee be made dvadabie upon application ty
IRiEfELLAl PATTIER

T By the loogment of thet report 1o the insurers, you hareby consont to the archoong of this report at the centre snd Lo Lopies of
the report beeng made svallable sforesald

A Consent under the Personal Data Protection Act (POPA)
| undentand. acknowiedpe, agres ard consent that

(8] My insurer, my worshon end the General insurants Assocition of Sangapore ("GIA”] may/are permitted to coliect, ute.
daciom andfor protess My personal data/persons’ informatson set out in this [form] and any other perional sformaton
provided by ma or possessed by my insurer (collectivaly the “Personsl Information”| snd disciose and rransler such
Perunnal indprrmation 1o atl insurerl) wiho have intured vekicks|1] invobeed n this acoident (2l mauree|n] el nuee o es
wehicleji) minlvad = thin acckdent shall be collectively referred to as the “nsurens” ), the inaurers’ lawyerulew T, she
Monetary Buthorty of Singapone and ary relevant government agency/suthority [tuch a1 the palice|, for the purpose(s)
ot

{i| processing, handing andfor dealing wih my claimi including the settiement of the taims and amy necessary
meiligationd relating o the clamm;

(W} mwestigating the acodent and/ar my claima,

(Wi} carrying oul and/or dasling with my inttrudtions o rerpanding ta any enguiries by me;

e} adeministering my clawm (including the mading of correspondence, statements, inwices, reporty of Poticet 1o e,
which could svvaive ducloture of cortain perional data about me to bring about delivery of the same s well as om the
external cover of envelopes/mail packages), and/or

v} comphyng with spolicabie lew n adminitenng. processing, handbing and/or dealing with my clama foollectively the
“Purposes”|

bl all insurer|s) who hawe insurea vehicleds) imvolved in this acodent and the Ingurers’ lwyers/law firms, may/are permitied
te collect, uie, dacioee snd/or process my Perignal information for one or more of the above Purpowes, and

e} my Personal information may/can be dacosed by any of the induners and/ar GIA to theer third party Lervice of e dad ar
agentilindluding their lawyersflaw Frma), which may be sited outside of Sagapore, for one or mare of the above Purposes

[d} v Personal mformation wil shio be collected snd used to compsle claimm bistory for the purpose of frawd detechan
wvestigalon and management in present and all fulure clarms

(B} the infarmation wo coliected under (d] above may be shared / dsclosed

(i) 1o 20 imssrary and/pr any other third partses thal sasist in evalusting. investigating, controlling or managing fraud,
tegulatons, law enlorcement snd government agencies as reasonably requared for the purposes stated, or

(4} Tor complying weth fequirementy under any reguiations, (3ws or court orders

tddes! S

Dvvwed’s. Signature Reparmng Centre "
(it driver s not the policyholder| K
Date & Time MR TN N
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Accident Sketch Plan

SKETCH PLAN
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i b Halgmmd
// -
"
DECLARATION
| dectare i } UCula 308 Lrue 0 ery reRpaeCE

:g Wingy l“r";.

LB ahwe= |2 -
s KldeelGwrh N\
Polcynolders WE . Cireers"s Mgnature Repprimg Centre ey b rature

Date & Tene (H @river s not e policyhoider | Harme
Date & Tome MEELTIN Mo
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Accident Sketch Plan

ON STATED DATE AND TIME, | WAS TRAVELLING STRAIGHT ALONG THE MAIN
RD INSIDE SHUNLI INDUSTRIAL, THEN SUDDENLY A VEHICLE CAME OUT FROM
THE SIDE ROAD (WHERE THERE IS A STOP LINE BEFORE THEY TURN TO THE
MAIN RD) AND HIT ONTO MY VEHICLE REAR RIGHT PORTION
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Accident Photo
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KAIZENVIOTORS

KAIZEN MOTORS PTE. LTD,
68 Kakl Bukit Avenue f, #02-12 Ark@KB, Singapora 417896

UEN: 201502816H GST Reg No. 201502816H
Tel: (+65) 6384 1956 Fax: (+65) 6384 1957
Webpage: https://www kaizenmotors.com.sg

©) wirematon

Date : 12/04/2019
Vahicle No . GZ55808T
Modal © Nissan Cabstar
Requesting for List Price Mileage
Mo Job Description Qty Price/ Unit Amount
T REAR R/H TIRE 7§ 180,00 § 50T 180.00.%
2 REARR/HRIM 1 8 600.00 $ ~L  800.00 &€
3 LABOUR FOR DISMANTLING & REPLACING OF ACCIDENT £ 1.000.00 s ‘I.B-'DD,W._E"ZS;. L)
DAMAGED PARTS, INCLUDING CUTTING OFF, WELDING,
KNOCKING, REPAIRING, STRAIGHTENING, RESHAPE OF
REAR R/H PANEL, WHEEL GUARDS & CHASSIS FRAME = -
4 SPRAYPAINTING & PUTTY OF REAR BUMPER, REAR BOOT 5 900.00 5 900.00 iﬂ?’\.}
v, # Mﬂ‘m//
1' B (:-"-
i Y1 J :
i
i ! ;’M-"; rar ’?
WAl J7°
0 @ (07 ?,
| o
| o
Sub-Total H 2.680.00
GET T% -] 187.60
Grand Total ] 2.BET B0

Cooyright & KAIZEN MOTORS PTE. LTD



LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933

TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. Mo 199607198R GST Reg. No. 18-5607198-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

LONPAC INSURANCE BHD

300 BEACH ROAD

Ref : CS/LPC19005568/Uvd3n2

O

#17-04/07 THE CONCOURSESINGAPORE 199555 Date® 13-06-2019
Code: LPC2
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh.  GBE 6889M Veh. Inspected GZ 5588T
Policy No. Coverage (§) 0.00
Claim No. 18/19M19NCO0/021587 Excess (%) 0.00
Assign From GERALD POH Assign Date 28/03/2019
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model MISSAN CABSTAR (M) c.C 3153
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2008
Chassis No. JN1SF4F2320861188 Colour GOLD
Odometer 461687 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification NIL
General GOOD
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre [195R15 KENSEP & mm
L/H Front Tyre |195R15 KENSEP 8 mm
R/H Rear Tyre [155R12(D) KENSEP 6/6 mm
L/H Rear Tyre [155R12(D) KENSEP 6/6 mm
4, Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE O/S BODY.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5, General Information
Accident Date  23/03/201% |Inspactinn Date 03/04/2019
Survey held at  KAIZEN MOTORS (ENGINEERING) PTE. LTD
B8 KAKI BUKIT AVENUE 6 #02-12 ARK@KB SINGAPORE 417896
5a. Remarks
A)THE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.

5b. Estimate Days of Repair

ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR: 3 Working Days




' Pl V4 LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

M = BE B 51 Ubi Ave 1#01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
- TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. No. 159507198 GST Reg. No. 19-8607198-R Page No.:1 of 1

ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. GZ 5588T

: Estimate By | Our Adjusted
diti
Qty Description of Parts Condition Workshop (§) (8)
R c F
1|REAR R/H TIRE (SN) SERVICEABLE 180.00 -
1|REAR R/H RIM (SN) TO REPAIR SEE 600.00
LABOUR
780.00
LABOUR
LABOUR FOR DISMANTLING & REPLACING OF 1,000.00 500.00
ACCIDENT DAMAGED PARTS,INCLUDING CUTTING
OFF WELDING, KNOCKING,REPAIRING, STRAIGHTENING,
RESHAPE OF REAR R/H PANEL WHEEL GUARDS &
CHASSIS FRAME INCLUSIVE OF THE REPAIR OF REAR
R/H RIM
SPRAYPAINTING & PUTTY OF REAR BUMPER,REAR 00.00 500.00
BOOT.
1,900.00 1,000.00
GRAND TOTAL 2,680.00 1,000.00
RECOMMENDED COST OF REPAIRS | | 1,000.00/
Report Ref No. CS/LPC19005568/Uvd3n2
CHUA KANG SENG

Licensed Appraiser




