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Teamwork Garage Pte Ltd
53 Ubi Avenue 1 #01-23/24 Spore 408934

Paya Ubi Industrial Park

E-mail : claims@teamworkgarage.com
Register number : 201015366H
3RD PARTY CLAIM ESTIMATION

M/s India International Insurance RVehicle number SLL366P
64 Cecil Street #04-02 Make / Model HONDA ODYSSEY
I0B Building g oys Chassis number ~ JHMRC1890GC208559
Singapore 049711 L / f Accident date 23/3/19
M ﬂ L _Y Reference | 1903-40
Qty Particulars M Fae  77/1]l7 Unit Price - SGD $
PARTS REPLACEMENT - LIST ITEMS o
1 |FRONT BUMPER ~ 00 823.20 7
1 |FRONT BUMPER LOWER GARNIsH L H ~ (FY 186.00 /
1 |FRONT BUMPER REINFORCEMENT X # .~ D 342.00 765U
1 |FRONT BUMPEP LH RETAINER <~ 28.50 /
1 |FRONTGRILLE x  MN 330.00 X
1 |FRONT EMBLEM - LOGO X M/ 33.60 X
1 |FronT UPPER GRILLE ¥ M % 210.00 *
i |FRonTLHHEADLANP 7 A U 2684.40 77371
1 |FRONT LOWERGRILLE X M/ 180.30 X
1 |FRONT LH HEADLAMP BRACKET | 7 Ok 72.00 /
1 |FRONT FOG LAMP COVER /| 126.00 /
1 |FRoNTFOGLAMP T /1] , 342.00 1§21
1 |FRONT FENDER INNER SHIELD <N 186.00 /
1 |FRONT LH SHOCK ABSORBER X v 366.00 X
1 |FRONT LH KNUCKLE ARM X /A 342.00 X
1 |FRONT LH KNUCKLE ARM BEARING ¥ /I 210.00 X
1 |FRONT LH LOWER ARM ¢ N/ 680.40 X
7142.40
Less 20% 1428.48
Subtotal 5713.92
Balance C/F 5713.92
PARTS REPLACEMENT - SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1 seT|FRONT BUMPER cLIp ~ A/EC 79 60.00
1 SET|FRONT GRILLE cLIP —~  NE< 77 80.00
1 SET|FRONT FENDER INNER SHIELD cLIP -~ F/E€ 77 80.00
Subtotal 220.00
Balance C/F 5933.92
S/No LABOUR AND MISCELLANEOUS CHARGES
Balance B/F 5933.92
1 |CHECK FRONT WIRING AND LIGHTING SYSTEM 150.00 37
2 |CHECK WHEEL ALIGNMENT 200.00 ¥
3 |REMOVE AND REPLACE FRONT UNDERCARRIAGE PARTS 200.00 X
4 |PANEL BEATING ON AFFECTED AREAS 900.00 759
5 |SPRAY PAINTING ON AFFECTED AREAS 900.00 & %2
6 |APPLY ANTI RUST ON AFFECTED AREAS 150.00 J9
Subtotal 2500.00
Grand total 8433.92
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Teamwork Garage Pte Ltd
53 Ubi Avenue 1 #01-23/24 Spore 408934
Paya Ubi Industrial Park

Tel ; 6844 2475

E-mail : claims@teamworkgarage.com
Register number : 201015366H
REPAIR PERFORMA INVOICE

M/s India International Insurance HVehicle number SLL366P
64 Cecil Street #04-02 Make / Model HONDA ODYSSEY
I0B Building o Chassis number JHMRC1890GC208559
Singapore 049711 ( \! f’/ | Accident date 23/3/19
' J Reference 1903-40
Qty Particulars Unit Price - SGD $
PARTS REPLACEMENT - LIST ITEMS
1 |arpuctBox (AU 390.12 3/ & -
390.12 - )9,
Less 20% 78.02
Subtotal 312.10
Balance C/F 312.10
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Steve Chen (LKK Auto)

From: claims@teamworkgarage.com
Sent: Tuesday, July 09, 2019 3:46 PM
To: Steve Chen (LKK Auto)

Cc: TEAMWORK GARAGE CLAIMS'
Subject: RE: SLL366P Finalize

We confirm COR @ $3350 AND DOR @ 3 DAYS
TMWMM¢AMM}I ©
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Teamwork Garage Pte Lid

Blk 53 Ubi Avenue 1 #01-24 Paya Ubi Industrial Park
Singapore (488934)

Tel: 6844 2475|Fax: 6844 2474

From: Steve Chen (LKK Auto) [mailto:SteveChen@Ikkauto.com]
Sent: Thursday, May 9, 2019 8:44 AM

To: Darren <claims@teamworkgarage.com>

Subject: SLL366P Finalize

Dear Darren,
Kindly refer our finalize $3350 (L/S, before GST). 3 days.

Kindly confirm.

Thanks

Best Regards,
Steve Chen| Assistant Automotive Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants

Phone: 6256 3561 | Email: SteveChen@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Darren [mailto:c!aims@teamworkgarage.com]

Sent: Wednesday, May 08, 2019 11:08 AM
To: Steve Chen (LKK Auto)
Subject: RE: SLL366P Supplementary

Hi Steve,

Please see attached.

Please let us have the finalise amount soonest

Darren



