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Vic (LKKAuto)

From: Claims Dept of CTI <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>

Sent: Monday, 23 September, 2019 5:17 PM

To: Vic (LKKAuto); Admin A

Cc: Ong Chin Kiat; Alfred Toh; Chee So Chow; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto); 

mgt@autoshield.com.sg; nicholas_neo79@yahoo.com.sg

Subject: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SJC4126K (OI: SNM19D200138C02/6(ock) 

AND SFR6811X (TP : LKK REF - CC6/CTI19005543/Khb3 ) on 06.01.2019

Attachments: Re: Your Ref: SJC 4126K - ACCIDENT INVOLVING SJC 4126K AND SFR 6; REPORT OF 

SJC4126K.pdf

LKK    REF - CC6/CTI19005543/Khb3 

CTPIS REF – SNM19D200138C02/6(ock) 

 

Dear Vic 

 

We refer to your email pertaining to the above matter. 

 

Attach herewith Insured’s SAS report for your attention. 

 

Based on the accident scene photos (Insured is within the carpark lot and not half way out as alleged by the third party 

claimant) we are of opinion that our Insured’s version of accident is more credible although there was no video footage 

available. 

 

In view of the above, please proceed to reject the third party claim against our Insured’s motor insurance policy. 

 

 
Best Regards 
 
Alfred Toh    
Senior Executive 

Claims Department 
China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd. 
3 Anson Road #15-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079909 

DID : (65) 6389 6183 
FAX: (65) 6224 7478 

W: www.sg.cntaiping.com   |    FB: www.facebook.com/chinataipingsg/   |   WeChat: 太平
太平太平

太平狮

狮狮

狮城

城城

城 Taiping SG 

 
Disclaimer: This e-mail and any files transmitted with it is intended only for the named recipients and may contain confidential information. 
Any unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination of this message, either in whole or partial, is prohibited. If you are not the intended 
recipient, please notify the sender immediately. Please delete the e-mail and any copies of it thereafter. 
 

From: Vic (LKKAuto) [mailto:vicalpeh@lkkauto.com]  

Sent: Monday, 23 September, 2019 4:39 PM 

To: Claims Dept of CTI <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com> 

Cc: Alfred Toh <alfred.toh@sg.cntaiping.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Vic (LKKAuto) 

<vicalpeh@lkkauto.com>; Chong Boon Sen <boonsen.chong@sg.cntaiping.com> 

Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SJC4126K (OI: SNM19D200138C02/6(ock) AND SFR6811X (TP : 

LKK REF - CC6/CTI19005543/Khb3 ) on 06.01.2019 

 

Dear Alfred, 

 

We refer to the subject matter and to our telephone conversation earlier. 

 

As spoken, please find attached email from Insured and the TP documents. 
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Thank you. 

 
Best Regards, 

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary. 

 

 

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an 
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not 
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the 
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you. 
 


