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3/28/2019 Claim Portal

»
‘ LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD (TP) ~ Menu

Service Request Details 7&"&

Claim \ZQ ‘F'
S9MO1HUU &

Reference

None &
Loss Date VA

22 March 2019

Report Date
28 Mar 2019 9:16:00 AM

Request Date
28 March 2019

Due Date
28 March 2020

Vendor Name
LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD (TP)

Type of Loss
Third Party Vehicle Damage

Services
Pending verification - Direct Settlement
Actions

Next Step
Finish the work

Complete Work More w

Vehicle Information

Incident Vehicle Registration #
SKK261A

Make

TPVD MERCEDES / BENZ
https:/lvp.smartclaims.axa.com.sglclaim-portaVhtrnVindex-vendor-servioe—requests.html#lservice—requestsl?servioeRequestNumber:1 06825 1/2



3/28/2019 Claim Portal

»
. LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD (TP) ~
hY

Service Address

Primary Contact/Insured
LOH PENG KEONG
BLK 10 LORONG 7 TOA PAYOH, #17-205, 310010, Singapore

98534533
pengkeongl@yahoo.com

Claim Handler
ANG Richard

richard.angbs@axa.com.sg

Additional Instructions

Messages Invoices History Documents Assessment Metrics Notes

Menu

New Message

hﬂps:/lvp.smartclaims.axa.oom.sglclalm-portaIlhtml/lndex-vendor-servloe-requests.htmt#/service-requests/?servioeRequestNumbeﬁ1 06825

2/2



Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

From: CHUAN HO AUTO SERVICE <chuanhoautoservice@gmail.com>
Sent: Wednesday, 25 March 2020 11:55 AM

To: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

Subject: Re: SKK 261 A

Hi Ceclia,

As spoken please close the case.
Thank you.

Best Regards,

Sharin Lim

+65 9069 1985

Chuan Ho Auto Service

160 Sin Ming Drive, #07-09, Sin Ming Auto City, S 575722

El

On Tue, Mar 24, 2020 at 4:43 PM Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto) <CeciliaChong@]lkkauto.com> wrote:

Your Ref: SKK 261A Without Prejudice

Our Ref: CC4/ASM19005534/gb3

Dear Sirs/Madam,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SFT 8550A(AXA) & SKK 261A ON 22/03/2019

We refer to the above matter.

We are of the opinion that this is a case of conflicting versions. There is no concrete evidence(ie: Video

footage) yet to support either party's version. Enclosed herewith in this email is a copy of our insured's
accident report for your perusal.



3/25/2020 Claim Portal

LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD (TP) + Menu

& RE: Pls advise status of TP's claim TY.

Type
© Question

Message
Hi richard, TP inform to close the case. Thus, we will proceed to cancel the case as no survey has been done.

Thanks - CCL 25/03/2020

Reply

https://vp.smartclaims.axa.com.sg/claim-portal/html/index-vendor-service-requests.html#/service-requests/view-message/?serviceRequestNumbe... 1/1



