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51 UBIAVE 1, #01-25 PAYA UBI INDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL 1 (065) 62563561 FAX ; (065) 62564315

Your Ref: D1900207T6MFSH Date; 1/4/2019
Our Ref: CS/FCI18005423/Jtd3

The Motor Claims Department
Fi apital Insuran td

Dear Sir/Madam,

INITIAL INSPECTION REPORT OF VEHICLE NO, SLIN 6650T
Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the abovementioned vehicle
28/3/2019 at the premises of M/s Automotive Repair have the following to report: -

Workshop Estimate Amount : 83 5.585.40
Revised Estimate Amount . 5% 4.310.00
“Check” Items Amount : 5% 0.00
Market Value : 5%
LTA Reimbursement Value 1 5%
Nett Value 1 5%
FEETOe
Description of Damage: rear @ s
The vehicle sustained damages at the : !
ofs portion. A

Comments/ Present Status:
Damages Consistent.

Yours faithfully
Hwee Jie
Automotive Assessor



MS‘ F"-Sllca pltﬂi M5 First Capital Insurance Limited coseg b 2950000060 GST Feg, Mo M2 00016155

& Raffies Quay #21-00 Singapore 048580

Tel (656222 2311 Fax (B5) 6222 3547

[latis & Hober Underwlting Dept: 36 Robinson Roasd #LE-O1 City House Singapore 0BBBT Y
Tel: {65) 6507 3848 Fax (555507 3840

www msfirsteapital. com.sg

Date

Accident Date
Insured Vehicle
Survey Location
Contact Person.
Contact No.

Survey Type

Appointed
Surveyor

Contact Person

Contact Number.

MOTOR SURVEY ASSIGNMENT

26-03-2019 Our Ref No. D15002076MFSH
26-03-2019 Claim Type. Third Party
SHC3008Z Third Party Vehicle. SLNGE50T

38 WOODLANDS INDUSTRIAL PARK E1 #05-18
RAYMOND TAN
64688834/ 0 Fax No. 64622278

DIRECT SETTLEMENT:

LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTELTD

NA Fax No. 68416315
MA

FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT

Please submit to us the Tax Invoice together with letter of claim for Rental OR Loss of use (based on

NIMA Benchmark rates) together with your survey report.

THIRD PARTY SURVEY REQUEST D) B

Cc : Workshop

Cc : TP Solicitor

Officer Incharge

AUTOMOTIVE REPAIR w Ay
U D A“GI‘IHOH. N.!L ., ;}I\' li‘..-.-'\'*' ".

CENTRE PTE LTD
MNA, TP Solicitor Fax No. NA
EILEEN LEE

IMPORTANT NOTE

Kindly submit the survey report via CWS within 14 days for survey assignment and 7 days for re-inspection,

This is a computer genarated letter, no signature required




Denise Taz (LKKAuto)

From: Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 1 April 2019 3:32 PM

To: Admin-D (LKKAuto); 'CWS Motor Claims'; assignments
Ce: 'Eileen Lee'; SUR

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19002076MFSH/1
Attachments: PRELI ADVISED SLN 6650T.pdf

Dear Sir/Madam,

Enclosed preliminary revised of vehicle SLN 6650T

Best Regards,

Denise Tay | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email; denisetay@Iikkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

BIk 51, Paya Ui Industrial Park, Ubl Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5408533)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 27 March 2019 6:07 PM

To: 'CWS Motor Claims' <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg=; assignments <assignments@Ikkauto.com>
Ce: 'Eileen Lee' <EileenLee@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19002076MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Madam,
Thank you for the assignment.

Please be informed that vehicle is not in the workshop, repairer will arrange.

Best Regards,

Celine Fong
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408933)

From: CWS Motar Claims [mailto:cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg]
Sent: Wednesday, 27 March 2019 2:24 PM

To: ASSIGNMENTS@LKKAUTO.COM
Cc: CWS Motor Claims <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; Eileen Lee <EileenlLee @msfirstcapital.com.sg>
Subject: PRI: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19002076M FSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,



We refer to the above reference.
Please find attached the necessary documents for survey.
Kindly submit your report via CWS within the next 14 days.

Note: All the accident reports are uploaded into CWS for your perusal.

Best Regards,

Admin Team

Claim Workflow System

Motor Claims Department

MS First Capital Insurance Limited
Tel : 6507 3848

Fax : 6507 3849

PS: This is a system generated mail. Please do not reply to this mail.

. AVG This email has been checked for viruses by AVG antivirus software.
: WWW.avg.com
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> Back to OneMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars
Owner ID Type:

Owner 1D:

Vehicle Details

Wehicle No.:

Vehicle to be Exported:
Intended Deregistration Date:
Vehicle Make:

Vehicle Model;

Primary Colour:
Manufacturing Year:

Engine MNo.:

Chassis No.:

Maximum Power Output:
Open Market Value:

Original Registration Date:
Firs’i: Reglsti‘étlon Date:
Transfer Count:

Actual ARF Paid:

Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility:

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:
PARF Rebate Amount;
Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date:

COE Category:

COE Period(Years}:

QP Paid:

COE Rebate Amount:

Total Rebate Amount:

The information contained herein is correct as at 29 Mar 2019

PARF/COE Rebate Enguiry

Singapore NRIC
243227

SLM66S0T

No

29 Mar 2019
HOMNDA
VEZEL 1.5X A
Black

2016
L15B4404713
RU11204713
6.0 kW (128 bhp)
$22,846.00

12 May 2017
12 May 2017
0

$13,985.00

Yes
11 May 2027
$10,488.00

11 May 2027

A - Car up to 1600cc & $7kW (130bhp)

10

$52,000.00
$42,201.00
$52,689.00
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ARC

CO. Reg. No. : 201312913C

Automotive Repair Centre Pte Ltd

Estimate

3B Woodlands Industrial Park E1 ESTIMATE NO. :  EST1903-030
#05-18, Singapore 757700 DATE :  26-Mar-2019
Tel: 64688834  Fax: 64622278 POLICY NO. :  DIRECTASIA MT/00477781
E-mail; info@automotiverepaircentre, com, sg EHICLE REG. NO. - SLNHEDT notify
VEHICLE MAKE | HONDA "FEIZEL 1.5X A
TO  Motor Claim Department : - FORSURYEYOR ~ /%
MS First Capital Insurance Limited s -
36 Robinson Road #16-01 City House « Ng ilisgal m
Singapore 068877 « Supplementary item(s t and
Tel: 6507 3848, Fax: 65073849 P LR SRS S
Acknowledged by Repairer
ESTIMATE REPAIF COsTuE
NO. DESCRIPTION T QUANTITY——UNIT-COST TOTAL COST
SPARE PARTS
1 Front Door RH Buc ~ 1 5 980.00 | S 980.00
Z Frant Door Sash Tape Sticker RH Vidbe s 1 5 30,00 | 5 30.00
3 Frant Door Sub Seal RH 4 o Gwdfl x 1 5 30.00 | 5 30.00
4 Front Door Lower Seal RH Vi, 1 5 20,00 | % 20,00
5 Rear Door RH RBue - 1 5 980.00 | 5 980.00
& | Rear Door Sash Tape Sticker RH Yo 1 5 30.00 | % 30.00
7 | Rear Door Sub Seal Center RH CutT - 1 5 40.00 | § 40.00
8 Rear Door Rear Seal RH nn x 1 ] 2000 | 5 20.00
g Rear Door Lower Seal RH )) Ei - 1 5 20,00 | § 20.00
10 Rear Door Hinge Upper RH WA X 1 g 50.00 | S 50.00
11 Rear Door Hinge Lower RH o X 1 § 50.00 | § 50.00
12 Rear Wheel Arch Garnish RH G(f ~ 1 § 180.00 | § 180,00
13 Rear Bumper Panel RH Ru..” - X 1 5 200,00 | & 200,00
14 | Side Sill Garnish RH el s 1 5 380.00 | § 380.00
207 Dixoun] on fudi Total Spare Parts | § 3,010.00
SPECIAL NETT
Total Special Mett| § E
LABOUR
15 | Spray Painting Rear Bumper Panel RH, Fender RH & 2 Doors RH 1 $ 1,000.00 | $ 709 1,096.00
16 Repair, Replace and Refill Affected Accident Area 1 s 700.00 | § '{)QD e omii]
17 Transfer Door Fittling and Window Mechanism to New Door 2 5 80.00 | 5 (oD 168700
18 Repair and Respray Rear Rim RH 1 5 100.00 | § ép 196.00
19 Reset Fault Code 1 5 150.00| 5 1ZD 151;{00
20 | Wheels Computer Alignment 1 5 7000($ 6O 7000
21 Check and rectify electrical wiring 1 5 30,00 | § 30.00
Estimate prepared by: Raymond Tan Total Labour | § 2,210.00
The above is an estimate based on our inspection and does not cover any Amount Before Excess| § 3,220.00
e e L L ST N
the first inspection. Because of this, the above price are not guaranteed, Total Amount Payab '] 5,585.40
Quotation on parts and labour are current and subject to change.
Please arrange this vehicle to be surveyed soonest possible /Thakk you Hmjlh - Lkk
Page 1 of 1 i@' zif.sfl'ﬂ
P[? 54‘31

Tok.| ~ H39£72.L
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Uhi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park. Singapore 406933
TEL; 6256 3561 FAX: G256 4315
Rog. Mo 100807198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD Ref CS/FCI19005493/d3n2
41601 OITY HOUSESINGAPORE 068677 e NI\”||NM|||”,I"‘|
Code: FCI2
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SHC 30082 Veh. Inspected SLN 6650T
Policy No. Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. D19002076MFSH Excess (3) 0.00
Assign From  EILEEN LEE Assign Date 27/03/2019
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model HONDAVEZEL C.C 1498
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2017
Chassis No. RU11204713 Colour GREY
Odometer 31720 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification SPORTS RIM
General GOOoD
3 Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |215/60R18 DUNLOP & mm
L/H Front Tyre [215/60 R16 DUNLOP & mm
R/H Rear Tyre |215/60 R16 DUNLOP & mm
L/H Rear Tyre |215/60R16 DUNLOP & mm
4, Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE QIS BODY.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information
Accident Date  28/03/2019 Inspection Date 28/03/2019
Survey held at AUTOMOTIVE REPAIR CENTRE PTE LTD
38 WOODLANDS INDUSTRIAL PARK E1 #0518
SINGAPORE 757700
5a, Remarks
A)DAMAGES CONSISTENT TO ACCIDENT REPORT.
EITHE INSPECTION WAS COMDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
C)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.

5b. Estimate Days of Repair

ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR: 5 Working Days
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

£1 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R Page No.1 of 2
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SLN 6650T
Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Condition | =stmate B {53]
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|FRONT DOOR RH BUCKLED S80.00 980,00
1|FRONT DOOR SASH TAPE STICKER RH MECESSARY 30.00 30.00
1|FRONT DOOR SUB SEAL RH MOT NECESSARY 30.00 -
1IFRONT DOOR LOWER SEAL RH MOT NECESSARY 20.00 -
1|REAR DOOR RH BUCKLED 980.00 Q80.00
1|REAR DOOR SASH TAPE STICKER RH WECESSARY 30.00 30.00
1|REAR DOOR SUB SEAL CENTER RH CuT 40.00 40.00
1|REAR DOOR REAR SEAL RH NOT NECESSARY 20.00 -
1|REAR DOOR LOWER SEAL RH DEFORMED 20.00 20.00
1|REAR DOOR HINGE UPPER RH NOT NECESSARY 50.00 -
1|REAR DOOR HINGE LOWER RH WOT NECESSARY 50.00 -
1|REAR WHEEL ARCH GARNISH RH SCRATCHED 180.00 180.00
1|REAR BUMPER PAMEL RH TO REPAIR SEE 200.00 -
LABOUR
11SIDE SILL GARMNISH RH SCRATCHED 380.00 380.00
LESS 20% DISCOUNT - -528.00
3.010.00 2.112.00
LABOUR
SPRAY PAINTING REAR BUMPER PAMEL RH,FENDER RH 1,000.00 700.00
& 2 DOOCRS RH.
REFPAIR REPLACE AND REFILL AFFECTED ACCIDENT T00.00 B00.00
AREA.INCLUSIVE OF THE REPAIR OF REAR BUMPER
PANEL RH.
TRANSFER DOOR FITTING AND WINDOW MECHAMISM 160.00 100.00
TO HEW DOOR
REPAIR AND RESPRAY REAR RIM RH. 100.00 80,00
RESET FALULT CODE. 150.00 120.00
WHEELS COMPUTER ALIGNMENT, T0.00 60.00
CHECK AND RECTIFY ELECTRICAL WIRING, 30.00 30.00
2,210.00 1,670.00
GRAMND TOTAL 5,220.00 3,782.00

Report Ref No. CS/FCI19005493/Jtd3n2
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Page Mo..2 of 2
| RECOMMENDED COST OF REPAIRS | I 3,782.00|

Report Ref No. CS/FCI119005493/Jtd3n2

% % g‘
OMNG HWEE JIE ADRIAN LING WAI PING

Automotive Assessor B.Eng AMSOE,AMIRTE AMSAE-A,M.MATAI

Licensed Appraiser
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