Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 15 May 2019 11:14 AM

To: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Subject: FW: LOD - ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKQ 9168X & YOUR REF: GBH 9196T on 24.03.2019
Attachments: LOD SKQ 9168X.pdf

CS/CTI19005482/Avd3q2

From: Julie Johari <julie@skauto.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 15 May, 2019 11:12 AM

To: Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>; CS A Team <cs-a@lkkauto.com>; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com>
Cc: KY Leong <kyleong@skauto.com.sg>; Simon Koh <simon@skauto.com.sg>; SK Admin <admin@skauto.com.sg>; Vic

(LKKAuto) <vicalpeh@lkkauto.com>
Subject: LOD - ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKQ 9168X & YOUR REF: GBH 9196T on 24.03.2019

Dear Sir/Madam, "WITHOUT PREJUDICE"

Enclosed the final bill and relevant documents for your attention.

Kindly refer to attachment and revert back to us the soonest.

Breakdown as below:

Cost of Repair  :S$ 12,198.00

Loss of Rental :S$ 2,520.00 (18 days X S$140.00)

LTA Search :S 2.00

Total : SS 14,720.00

If acceptable, kindly forward your discharge voucher to us to enable our client to complete and sign.
We appreciate your early reply

Please do not hesitate to contact me should you have any queries thereof.

Best Regards,

Ms Julie
SK Automobile Pte Ltd (201500047H)
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