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Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

From: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)
Sent: Friday, 8 May 2020 10:56 AM
To: Lily Loi
Subject: RE: LOD - ACCIDENT INVOLVING SME7852G & SH6383M ON 21/03/2019 (INDIA) *** 

LKK REF: CC6/III19005464/Kja3

Without Prejudice 
 
Dear Lily, 
 
As no email receive at that point of time.  
 
However, content noted. 
 
Will proceed to close the case. 
 
Thanks  
 
 

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be 
made via email.  Submission of claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any 
inconvenience caused is much regretted. 
 
 
Best Regards, 

Cecilia Chong | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6749-4274 | email: CeciliaChong@lkkauto.com| fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

Save the Earth. Print only when necessary. 

 

From: Lily Loi <lily.loi@ow.sg>  
Sent: Friday, 8 May 2020 9:41 AM 
To: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto) <CeciliaChong@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: LOD - ACCIDENT INVOLVING SME7852G & SH6383M ON 21/03/2019 (INDIA) *** LKK REF: 
CC6/III19005464/Kja3 
 
Dear Cecilia, 
 
As per tele-conversation August last year, we had informed you that our client discharge from our side due keep remain 
the rejection of the liability from your principal. My client discharged from our side, then 28/09/2019 you send a 50% 
offer to us. Then now send G/S $1,400 offer is for what purpose? 
Please clarify. 
Thank you. 


